
FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER: 20050001YB BID OPEN DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2004 PAGE 1 OF  6
DESCRIPTION: INMATE CLOTHING COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF  CONTACT NAME: CHARLIE CROCKETT

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 404-730-5823
DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME 

THE LIBERTY STORE GOALTEX CORPORATION BOB BARKER PLANET INDUSTRIES TABB TEXTILE COMPANY, INC. NON-RESPONSIVE
OF VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDORS

PRODUCT
AND

OR ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: OTHER
SERVICES 5 EAST GENESEE STREET 830 WILLIS AVE PO BOX 429, 118 E. JONES ST 4410-A BANKERS CIRLCE 511 PLEASANT DRIVE/PO BOX 2707
DESIRED AUBURN, NEW YORK 13021 ALBERTSON, NY 11507 FUQUAY-VARINA, NC 27526 ATLANTA, GA 30360 OPELIKA, AL 36801-2707 INFORMATION

FAX: FAX: 516-294-9094 FAX: FAX: FAX:
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE: 315-252-1761 TELEPHONE: 516-294-9016 TELEPHONE: 919-552-3431 TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:

ITEM CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON:
MARTY GOLDMAN ROBERT GRUBMAN TODD BATCHELOR

DESCRIPTIONS DATE: 12/14/04 DATE: 12/14/04 DATE:  12/14/04 DATE: 12/14/04 DATE: 12/14/04
UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

SHIRTS, NAVY BLUE BOB BARKER TNS-SIZE
1. IMPRINTED NO BID NO BID $4.51 $94,710.00 $4.57

NON-IMPRINTED $4.18 $87,780.00 $4.44
PANTS, NAVY BLUE BOB BARKER TNT-SIZE

2. IMPRINTED $5.41 $113,610.00 $5.67
NON-IMPRINTED $5.08 $106,680.00 $5.17
SWEATSHIRTS, GRAY BOB BARKER SSGY-SIZE

3. IMPRINTED $7.33 $117,280.00 $6.21
NON-IMPRINTED $7.00 $112,000.00 $5.67
SHIRTS, TRUSTEE BOB BARKER TWS-SIZE

4. UNIFORMS WHITE $4.51 $27,511.00 NO BID  
IMPRINTED FULTON COUNTY JAIL
PANTS, TRUSTEE

5. UNIFORMS WHITE BLUE STRIPE NO BID NO BID NO BID
VERTICALLY IMPRINTED FULTON CO JAIL
JUMPSUIT ORANGE BOB BARKER OJS-SIZE

6. IMPRINTED NO BID NO BID $12.83 $56,452.00 NO BID

T-SHIRTS BOB BARKER 683-SIZE S-XL/3XL 1.37/2.57
7. IMPRINTED LIBERTY $3.87 $2.23 $118,190.00 XXL/4XL 2.43/2.80 $1.81

NON-IMPRINTED LIBERTY $2.20 $1.90 $100,700.00 S-XL/XXL 1.27/2.33/2.47/2.70 $1.37
BOB BARKER 217-SIZE

8. MENS BRIEFS LIBERTY $1.15 $1.29 $68,370.00 $1.17

BOB BARKER 621-SIZE
9. WOMENS BRIEFS LIBERTY $8.02 $0.73 $17,520.00 $1.00

ELSIE ESP-SIZE
10. SPORT BRAS WHITE NO BID $3.25 $42,250.00 NO BID  

GRAND TOTAL

TERMS

DELIVERY F.O.B.

NO OF BIDS MAILED: 187 BUYER'S NAME: CHARLIE CROCKETT DATE RECEIVED: 11/16/04

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED: 12 DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL): DATE COMPLETED: 12/14/04

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED MBE/FBE 0 PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: COMPLETED BY: LISA R. MCKINE

NO OF BIDS MBE/FBE MAILED 23 CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: DATE:

NO OF NO BIDS RECEIVED: 0 DATE:



FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER: PAGE 2 OF 6 
DESCRIPTION: COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT:   CONTACT NAME: 

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 
       DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME 

NON-RESPONSIVE
DESCRIPTIONS DATE: DATE: DATE:  DATE: DATE: 

UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
BOB BARKER 2155N-SIZE

11. BLUE TENNIS SHOE LIBERTY 2.29 HD TWEEN $3.80 3.75/2.43 67500/43,740.00 NO BID

BOB BARKER BB888-SIZE
12. SHOWER SHOE NO BID NO BID 1.34 $24,120.00 NO BID

BOB BARKER 1700-W
13. SOCKS NO BID NO BID .49 $14,700.00 NO BID

 

 

GRAND TOTAL

TERMS

DELIVERY F.O.B.

BID OPEN DATE: 



FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER: 20050001YB BID OPEN DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2004 PAGE 3 OF 6
DESCRIPTION: INMATE CLOTHING COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF   CONTACT NAME: CHARLIE CROCKETT

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 404-730-5823
DESCRIPTION 6. VENDOR NAME 7. VENDOR NAME 8. VENDOR NAME 9. VENDOR NAME 10. VENDOR NAME 

PRO CORR OUTFITTERS ATD AMERICAN CO ACME SUPPLY CO LTD LESLIE SCOTT, INC. ROBINSON TEXTILES, INC. NON-RESPONSIVE
OF VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDORS

PRODUCT
AND

OR ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: OTHER
SERVICES 2000 ZETTLER ROAD 135 GREENWOOD AVE 44 S BAYLES AVE STE  210 1631 WEST 2550 SOUTH 152 W. WALNUT ST. STE, 250
DESIRED COLUMBUS, OH 43232 WYNCOTE, PA 19095 PORT WASHINGTON, NY 11050 OGDEN, UTAH 84401 GARDENA, CA 90248 INFORMATION

FAX: FAX: FAX: FAX: FAX:
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE: 614-586-1117 TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: 801-622-5741 TELEPHONE:

ITEM CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON:
ALAN S. PRESSMAN SPENCER ZASLOW ZAHEER SHEIK EVAN B. TROMMER GARY LOVEMARK

DESCRIPTIONS DATE: 12/14/04 DATE: 12/14/04 DATE:  12/14/04 DATE: 12/14/04 DATE: 12/14/04
UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

SHIRTS, NAVY BLUE
1. IMPRINTED NO BID $6.24 ACME #6913AK $4.50 UNTPNV 3.97/4.77 RTVS-1/3.99 $83,790.00

NON-IMPRINTED $5.68 ACME #69134 $4.00 UNTPNV 3.67/4.47 RTVS-/3.64 $76,440.00
PANTS, NAVY BLUE

2. IMPRINTED NO BID $6.98 ACME #7713AK $4.75 UNPTNV 5.34/6.34 RTEP-1/5.26 $110,460.00
NON-IMPRINTED $5.88 ACME #7713A $4.25 UNPTNV 4.84/5.84 RTEP/4.56 $95,760.00
SWEATSHIRTS, GRAY

3. IMPRINTED $9.47 $151,520.00 $7.28 NO BID SSAH 4.99/5.99/8.99/13.99 NO BID
NON-IMPRINTED $6.28 SSAH 4.59/5.69/8.69/13.69
SHIRTS, TRUSTEE

4. UNIFORMS WHITE $8.97 $143,520.00 $6.38 NO BID RTVST/3.99/4.99 $243,390.00  
IMPRINTED FULTON COUNTY JAIL
PANTS, TRUSTEE

5. UNIFORMS WHITE BLUE STRIPE $5.50 $33,550.00 NO BID NO BID RTEPT 5.56 $33,916.00
VERTICALLY IMPRINTED FULTON CO JAIL
JUMPSUIT ORANGE

6. IMPRINTED 10.89 $47,916.00 $13.98 ACME #6941AK 11.00/DZ UNCVOR 8.89/10.89 RTC 11.37 $50,028.00

T-SHIRTS
7. IMPRINTED $3.43 $181,790.00 $3.38 NO BID TSWH 1.39/2.19/2.69 NO BID

NON-IMPRINTED $2.93 $155,290.00 $2.38 TSWH 1.14/1.94/2.44

8. MENS BRIEFS $1.21 $64,130.00 $0.94 ACME #9645A $0.75 BRLS 0.74/.97 NO BID

9. WOMENS BRIEFS $0.90 $21,600.00 $0.66 ACME #1660A $0.75 LBLS/BASP .49/.59 NO BID

10. SPORT BRAS WHITE $2.43 $31,590.00 $1.78 ACME #9734A $2.50 SHDSN $2.18  

GRAND TOTAL

TERMS

DELIVERY F.O.B.

NO OF BIDS MAILED: BUYER'S NAME: DATE RECEIVED: 

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED: DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL): DATE COMPLETED: 

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED MBE/FBE PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: COMPLETED BY: LISA R. MCKINE

NO OF BIDS MBE/FBE MAILED CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: DATE:

NO OF NO BIDS RECEIVED: DATE:



FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER: PAGE 4 OF 6
DESCRIPTION: COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT:   CONTACT NAME: 

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 
       DESCRIPTION 6. VENDOR NAME 7. VENDOR NAME 8. VENDOR NAME 9. VENDOR NAME 10. VENDOR NAME 

NON-RESPONSIVE
DESCRIPTIONS DATE: DATE: DATE:  DATE: DATE: 

UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

11. BLUE TENNIS SHOE $2.97 $53,460.00 $2.48 NO BID SABR 1.33 RTTS 2.21 $39,780.00

12. SHOWER SHOE $1.63 $29,340.00 $1.34 NO BID SKTP19 0.34 RTS 1.44 $25,920.00

13. SOCKS $0.53 $15,900.00 $0.44 $0.36 SKTW19 0.44

 

 

GRAND TOTAL

TERMS

DELIVERY F.O.B.

NO OF BIDS MAILED: BUYER'S NAME: DATE RECEIVED: 

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED: DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL): DATE COMPLETED: 

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED MBE/FBE PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: COMPLETED BY: LISA R. MCKINE

NO OF BIDS MBE/FBE MAILED CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: DATE:

NO OF NO BIDS RECEIVED: DATE:

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED: DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL): DATE COMPLETED: 

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED MBE/FBE PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: COMPLETED BY: LISA R. MCKINE

NO OF BIDS MBE/FBE MAILED CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: DATE:

BID OPEN DATE: 



BID NUMBER: 20050001YB BID OPEN DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2004 PAGE 5 OF 6
DESCRIPTION: INMATE CLOTHING COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF   CONTACT NAME: CHARLIE CROCKETT

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 404-730-5823
DESCRIPTION 11. VENDOR NAME 12. VENDOR NAME 13. VENDOR NAME 14. VENDOR NAME 15. VENDOR NAME 

OD TARAGIN & BROS, LLC GOLD WATER INDUSTRIES INC. NON-RESPONSIVE
OF VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDORS

PRODUCT
AND

OR ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: OTHER
SERVICES 1400 ALICEANNA ST. 17221 S. WESTERN AVE.
DESIRED BALTIMORE, MD 21231 GARDENA, CA 90247-5225 INFORMATION

FAX: FAX: FAX: FAX: FAX:
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:

ITEM CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON:
MICHELE SHAPIRO JACK WANG

DESCRIPTIONS DATE: 12/14/04 DATE: 12/14/04 DATE:  12/14/04 DATE: 12/14/04 DATE: 12/14/04
UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

SHIRTS, NAVY BLUE
1. IMPRINTED NO BID NO BID

NON-IMPRINTED
PANTS, NAVY BLUE

2. IMPRINTED
NON-IMPRINTED
SWEATSHIRTS, GRAY

3. IMPRINTED
NON-IMPRINTED
SHIRTS, TRUSTEE

4. UNIFORMS WHITE  
IMPRINTED FULTON COUNTY JAIL
PANTS, TRUSTEE

5. UNIFORMS WHITE BLUE STRIPE
VERTICALLY IMPRINTED FULTON CO JAIL
JUMPSUIT ORANGE

6. IMPRINTED

T-SHIRTS
7. IMPRINTED

NON-IMPRINTED

8. MENS BRIEFS GOLD WATER AP 1023 $0.74

9. WOMENS BRIEFS GOLD WATER AP 2022 $0.54

10. SPORT BRAS WHITE ELSIE #15 $2.92 NO BID  

GRAND TOTAL

TERMS

DELIVERY F.O.B.

NO OF BIDS MAILED: BUYER'S NAME: DATE RECEIVED: 

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED: DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL): DATE COMPLETED: 

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED MBE/FBE PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: COMPLETED BY: LISA R. MCKINE

NO OF BIDS MBE/FBE MAILED CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: DATE:

NO OF NO BIDS RECEIVED: DATE:



FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER: PAGE 6 OF 6
DESCRIPTION: COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT:   CONTACT NAME: 

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 
       DESCRIPTION 11. VENDOR NAME 12. VENDOR NAME 13. VENDOR NAME 14. VENDOR NAME 15. VENDOR NAME 

NON-RESPONSIVE
DESCRIPTIONS DATE: DATE: DATE:  DATE: DATE: 

UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

11. BLUE TENNIS SHOE GOLD WATER M9922L $2.24 RTTS 2.21 $39,780.00

12. SHOWER SHOE NO BID RTS 1.44 $25,920.00

13. SOCKS LOMBARDY $0.41 NO BID

 

 

GRAND TOTAL

TERMS

DELIVERY F.O.B.

NO OF BIDS MAILED: BUYER'S NAME: DATE RECEIVED: 

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED: DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL): DATE COMPLETED: 

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED MBE/FBE PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: COMPLETED BY: LISA R. MCKINE

NO OF BIDS MBE/FBE MAILED CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: DATE:

NO OF NO BIDS RECEIVED: DATE:

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED: DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL): DATE COMPLETED: 

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED MBE/FBE PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: COMPLETED BY: LISA R. MCKINE

NO OF BIDS MBE/FBE MAILED CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE: DATE:

NO OF NO BIDS RECEIVED: DATE:

NO OF NO BIDS RECEIVED: DATE:

BID OPEN DATE: 


