
FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER: 2005001YB BID OPEN DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2004 PAGE 1 OF  10
DESCRIPTION: UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR & DUTY GEAR COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF  CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 404-730-5807
DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME 

SAFETY SYSTEMS CORPORATION COMMAND UNIFORMS RELIANCE MANUFACTURING BATTERIES PLUS SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP INC. NON-RESPONSIVE
OF VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDORS

PRODUCT
AND

OR ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: OTHER
SERVICES 361 RANDY ROAD, UNIT 101 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE 4479 ATLANTA RD 2788 LAWRENCEVILLE HWY 10055 SEMINOLE BOULEVARD
DESIRED CAROL STREAM, IL 60188 ATLANTA, GA 30318 SMYRNA, GA 30080 DECATUR, GA 30033 SEMINOLE, FL 33772-2539 INFORMATION

FAX: FAX:404-603-4788 FAX: 770-432-8140 FAX:770-414-6980 FAX:404-691-5305
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE: 877-653-1103 TELEPHONE:404-603-4778 TELEPHONE: 770-434-8323 TELEPHONE:770-414-6980 TELEPHONE: 404-697-7233

ITEM CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: EDWARD WASHINGTON & ASSOC
MICHAEL B. ASIMOR DENNY BOGARD BRUCE DAVIS JANE WATTS STEVE OCHS

DESCRIPTIONS DATE: 12/01/04 DATE:  12/02/04 DATE: 12/02/04 DATE: 12/02/04 GEORGIA CORRECTIONAL IND.
LEATHER JACKET: MENS WOMENS MENS WOMENS MENS WOMENS MENS WOMENS MENS WOMENS
MANUFACTURER: TAYLOR TAYLOR TAYLOR LEATHER TAYLOR LEATHER NO BID NO BID TAYLOR TAYLOR

1. MODEL NUMBER: NO BID NO BID 4418 4418 4418RZ 4418RZ 4418RZ 4418RZ
PRICE PER EACH: 390.00 390.00 402.00 402.00 440.00 440.00
NYLON JACKET

2. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SPIEWAK SPIEWAK BLAUER MFG BLAUER MFG NO BID NO BID SPIEWAK SPIEWAK
MODEL NUMBER: 3609 3609 6125 6125 3609 3609
PRICE PER EACH: 110.00 110.00 98.25 98.25 98.70 98.70
DUTY JACKET

3. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SPIEWAK SPIEWAK SPIEWAK SPIEWAK NO BID NO BID SPIEWAK SPIEWAK
MODEL NUMBER: 5310 5310 5310 5310 S310 S310
PRICE PER EACH: 114.00 114.00 105.00 105.00 105.00 105.00
100% WOOL SWEATER:

4. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FECHHEIMER FECHHEIMER COMMANDO COMMANDO NO BID NO BID BLAUER BLAUER  
MODEL NUMBER: 709W 709W W800 BN W800 BN 210 210
PRICE PER EACH: 46.00 46.00 39.95 39.95 88.90 88.90
ACRYLIC/WOOL BLEND

5. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FECHHEIMER FECHHEIMER COMMANDO COMMANDO NO BID NO BID FECHHEIMER FECHHEIMER
MODEL NUMBER: 709W 709W P8000 BN P8000 BN 709 OR 809 709 OR 809
PRICE PER EACH: 46.00 46.00 34.95 34.95 51.95 51.95
100% POLYESTER TROUSERS

6. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FECHHEIMER FECHHEIMER ARMITEC ARMITEC NO BID NO BID MARTINS MARTINS
MODEL NUMBER: 38203/32235 38203W/95235 4500-3 L4500-3 31125-21282 31185-21482
PRICE PER EACH: 37.00/45.50 37.00-45.50 29.50 29.50 28.75 28.75
DACRON POLY 75/25 WOOL BLEND

7. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FECHHEIMER FECHHEIMER ARMITEC ARMITEC NO BID NO BID FECHHEIMER FECHHEIMER
MODEL NUMBER: 42289 45289 1600-3 L1600-3 42289 45289
PRICE PER EACH: 64.00 64.00 26.25 26.25 65.75 65.75
COTTON SHORTS

8. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID PROPPER PROPPER ARMITEC ARMITEC NO BID NO BID BLAUER BLAUER
MODEL NUMBER: F526038200 F526038200 1600-3 L1600-3 8841 8841
PRICE PER EACH: 26.50 26.50 26.25 26.25 72.95 72.95
100% POLYESTER LONG SLEEVE SHIRT

9. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FLYING CROSS FLYING CROSS ARMITEC ARMITEC NO BID NO BID MARTINS MARTINS
MODEL NUMBER: 33W78042 126R78042 500-4 2 500-4 23470/23472 23430/23432
PRICE PER EACH: 38.00 38.00 30.75 30.75 18.95 18.95
65% DACRON/RAYON BLEND LONG SLEVE

10. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FLYING CROSS FLYING CROSS ARMITEC ARMITEC NO BID NO BID FLYING CROSS FLYING CROSS  
MODEL NUMBER: 19W6604 103W6604 310-4 L310-4 19W6604/45W6600 103W6604/102W6600
PRICE PER EACH: 41.75 41.75 36.75 36.75 51.25 51.25

GRAND TOTAL

TERMS

DELIVERY F.O.B.

NO OF BIDS MAILED: 193 BUYER'S NAME: CHARLES LEONARD DATE RECEIVED: 11/16/04

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED: 6 DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL) DATE COMPLETED: 12/02/04

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED MBE/FBE 1 PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE COMPLETED BY: LISA R. MCKINE

NO OF BIDS MBE/FBE MAILED 6 CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE DATE:

NO OF NO BIDS RECEIVED: 2 DATE:

FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER: 2005001YB BID OPEN DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2004 PAGE 2 OF 10
DESCRIPTION: UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR & DUTY GEAR COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF   CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME 
SAFETY SYSTEMS CORPORATION COMMAND UNIFORMS RELIANCE MANUFACTURING INC BATTERIES PLUS SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP INC. NON-RESPONSIVE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
100% POLYESTER, SHORT SLEEVE:

11. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FLYING CROSS FLYING CROSS ARMITEC ARMITEC NO BID NO BID MARTINS MARTINS
MODEL NUMBER: 85R7804Z 176R7804Z 400-4 L400-4 22472/22470 22432/22430
PRICE PER EACH: 35.00 35.00 28.25 28.25 16.95 16.95
65% DACRON/RAYON BLEND SHORT SLEVE

12. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FLYING CROSS FLYING CROSS ARMITEC ARMITEC NO BID NO BID FLYING CROSS FLYING CROSS
MODEL NUMBER: 69R6604 153R6604 210-4 L210-4 69R6604-95R6600 153R6604/152R6600
PRICE PER EACH: 38.25 38.25 33.75 33.75 46.50 46.50
35% POLY COOLMAX COTTON SHORT SLE



13. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FLYING CROSS FLYING CROSS BLAUER BLAUER NO BID NO BID OLYMPIC OLYMPIC
MODEL NUMBER: 89R7004Z 89R7004ZZ 8130 8130 CMA252 CMA252
PRICE PER EACH: 47.50 47.50 41.75 41.75 75.95 75.95
100% POLYESTER SKIRT

14. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID FECHHEIMER ARMITEC NO BID NO BID MARTINS  
MODEL NUMBER: 3969SK 2700 X20428
PRICE PER EACH: 32.00 35.75 29.95
75%-25% POLY/WOOL BLEND SKIRT

15. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID FECHHEIMER ARMITEC NO BID NO BID MARTINS
MODEL NUMBER: 45289SK 2700CW X20428
PRICE PER EACH: 51.00 44.00 36.10
80-20% PLY/COTTON BLEND MATERNITY

16. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID RED KAP RED KAP NO BID NO BID RED KAP
MODEL NUMBER: TP23TN TP23TN TP 23TN
PRICE PER EACH: 13.00 11.75 14.75
BDU/ LONGSLEEVE 100% COTTON

17. MANUFACTURERER: 5.11/TATICAL 5.11/TATICAL ATLANCO ATLANCO ATLANCO ATLANCO NO BID NO BID PROPPER PROPPER
MODEL NUMBER: R04-72157 R04-62063 1541 1541 1310 1310 F545455001 F545455250
PRICE PER EACH: 38.06 35.19 23.00 23.00 22.75 22.75 22.45 22.45
PANTS 100% COTTON

19. MANUFACTURERER: 5.11/TATICAL 5.11/TATICAL ATLANCO ATLANCO ATLANCO ATLANCO NO BID NO BID PROPPER PROPPER
MODEL NUMBER: R04-74251-W28-44 R04-74251-W46-44 1541 1541 1324 1324 F520155001 F52055250
PRICE PER EACH: 35.19 42.37 23.00 23.00 22.75 22.75 22.45 22.45
COAT

20. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID NEESE NEESE NEESE NEESE NO BID NO BID NEESE NEESE  
MODEL NUMBER: 475C 475C 475C 475C 475RC 475RC
PRICE PER EACH: 55.00 55.00 51.00 51.00 64.70 64.70
JACKET

21. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID NEESE NEESE NEESE NEESE NO BID NO BID NEESE NEESE
MODEL NUMBER: 475J 475J 475J 475J 475RJ 475RC
PRICE PER EACH: 41.00 41.00 39.75 39.75 64.70 64.70
PANTS 

22. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID NEESE NEESE NEESE NEESE NO BID NO BID NEESE NEESE
MODEL NUMBER: 475ET 475ET 475 ET 475 ET 475ET 475ET
PRICE PER EACH: 25.00 25.00 24.25 24.25 28.15 28.15
NECKTIE

23. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID SAM BROOME S. BROOME NO BID BROOME
MODEL NUMBER: 900B0 90132, 45120
PRICE PER EACH: 2.80 3.25 5.25
BELT  

24. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 51 51 51 51 99 51
PRICE PER EACH: 23.00 23.00 21.95 21.95 33.95 28.95
HAT, STRAW:

25. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID ALBOUM ALBOUM ALBOUM ALBOUM NO BID NO BID STRATTON STRATTON
MODEL NUMBER: CAMP TRIPLE BRIM CAMP TRIPLE BRIM CAMPAIGN TRIPPLE CAMPAIGN TRIPPLE S50TBBR S50TBBR
PRICE PER EACH: 75.00 75.00 73.25 73.25 72.95 72.95
HAT, FUR TROOPER:

26. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID ALBOUM ALBOUM NO BID ALBOUM
MODEL NUMBER: TROOPER FUR TROOPER N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 14.75 13.75 15.85
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DESCRIPTION: UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR & DUTY GEAR COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF   CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME 
SAFETY SYSTEMS CORPORATION COMMAND UNIFORMS RELIANCE MANUFACTURING INC BATTERIES PLUS SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP INC. NON-RESPONSIVE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
HAT, BDU

27. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID ATLANCO ATLANCO NO BID PROPPER/ROTHCO
MODEL NUMBER: 3268 3268 F550512250/9446
PRICE PER EACH: 7.00 6.75 4.95
HAT PRESS

28. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID ALBOUM ALBOUM NO BID MARTINS
MODEL NUMBER: PRESS HAT PRESS 32947
PRICE PER EACH: 10.50 9.50 11.45
HANDBAGS LEATHER #1

29. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID ROMA ROMA NO BID ROMA
MODEL NUMBER: 7033 7033 7033
PRICE PER EACH: 47.00 46.75 47.45
HANDBAGS LEATHER #2

30. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID ROMA ROMA NO BID ROMA  
MODEL NUMBER: 7032 7032 7032
PRICE PER EACH: 47.00 47.00 47.45
VINYL

31. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID ROMA ROMA NO BID ROMA
MODEL NUMBER: 7021 7021 7031
PRICE PER EACH: 26.50 24.75 42.45
WALKING SHOE

32. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID THOROGOOD THOROGOOD THOROGOOD THOROGOOD NO BID THOROGOOD THOROGOOD
MODEL NUMBER: 834-6283 534-6013 8346283 8346013.00 834-6283 534-6013
PRICE PER EACH: 78.75 75.50 73.75 73.25 78.00 79.00
DRESS SHOE

33. MANUFACTURER: ROCKY ROCKY ROCKY ROCKY BATES BATES NO BID NO BID BATES BATES
MODEL NUMBER: R01-510 R01-210 511 211 1301 942 1301 942
PRICE PER EACH: 43.37 43.37 53.00 53.00 53.00 53.00 88.00 77.00
OXFORD

34. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID ROCKY ROCKY BATES BATES NO BID NO BID BATES BATES
MODEL NUMBER: 510 210 942M 942M 942M 742
PRICE PER EACH: 53.00 53.00 52.75 52.75 77.00 75.00
BOOT

35. MANUFACTURER: DANNER DANNER DANNER DANNER DANNER DANNER NO BID NO BID DANNER/ARCADIA DANNER/ARCADIA
MODEL NUMBER: DA1-21210 DA1-21210 42900/25200/21210 42900/25200/21210 42900 25200 42900/25200/21210 42910/25200/21210
PRICE PER EACH: 159.04 159.04 98.00/165.00/177.00 98.00/165.00/177.00 90.00 152.00 103.95/185.00/195.00 103.95/185.00/195.00
BADGES/CHEST

36. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID BLACKINTON BLACKINTON NO BID BLACKINTON  
MODEL NUMBER: B956 B-956 B-956, B448DE
PRICE PER EACH: 57.50 57.50 75.00
HAT

37. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID BLACKINGTON BLACKINTON NO BID BLACKINTON
MODEL NUMBER: B1264/B546 B-1477/B1264 B1264DE, B1477
PRICE PER EACH: 65.00 65.00 110.00
WALLET

38. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID BLACKINTON BLACKINTON NO BID BLACKINTON
MODEL NUMBER: B748DE B748 DE B748DE
PRICE PER EACH: 77.75 77.75 110.00
COLLAR

39. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID BLACKINTON BLACKINTON NO BID BLACKINTON
MODEL NUMBER: #10 10 10
PRICE PER EACH: 17.00 17.00 21.45
MAJOR

40. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID PREMIER PREMIER NO BID EISMAN & LUDMAR
MODEL NUMBER: PE1152 PE 1152 N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 42.25 4.25 10.95
CAPTAIN

41. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID PREMIER PREMIER NO BID EISMAN & LUDMAR
MODEL NUMBER: PE1127 PE 1127 N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 4.25 4.25 10.95
LIEUTENANT

42. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID PREMIER PREMIER NO BID EISMAN & LUDMAR
MODEL NUMBER: PE1101 PE 1101 N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 4.25 4.25 10.95
SERGEANT

43. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FL. EMBROIDERY A B EMBLEM NO BID FLA. EMBROIDERY
MODEL NUMBER: 9044 SGT FC N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 1.00 1.25 1.72
DEPUTY II

44. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FL. EMBROIDERY A B EMBLEM NO BID FLA. EMBROIDERY
MODEL NUMBER: 9040 DYFC N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 0.60 1.25 1.72



FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER: 2005001YB BID OPEN DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2004 PAGE 4 OF 10
DESCRIPTION: UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR & DUTY GEAR COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF   CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME 
SAFETY SYSTEMS CORPORATION COMMAND UNIFORMS RELIANCE MANUFACTURING INC BATTERIES PLUS SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP INC. NON-RESPONSIVE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
DEPUTY III

45. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FL. EMBRODERY A B EMBLEM NO BID FLA. EMBROIDERY
MODEL NUMBER: 9049 DY3FC N/A
PRICE PER EACH: .60 1.25 1.72
SHOULDER:

46. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FL. EMBRODERY A B EMBLEM NO BID FLA. EMBROIDERY
MODEL NUMBER: 9054 S FE N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 1.25 1.25 1.20
CLOTH BADGE

47. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID FL. EMBRODERY PREMIER NO BID FLA. EMBROIDERY
MODEL NUMBER: 9048 8 9055 FC N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 1.00 1.25 0.99
NAMEPLATE

48. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID BLACKINTON J KAUFMAN NO BID REEVES  
MODEL NUMBER: J-1 FULTON CO 500
PRICE PER EACH: 7.00 6.25 7.75
BUTTONS

49. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID WATERBURY WATERBURY NO BID WATERBURY
MODEL NUMBER: FULTON CO FULTON CO 1-16728-2434-1090
PRICE PER EACH: 0.75 0.62 0.60
TIE TACK

50. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID PREMIER IRA GREG NO BID SMITH & WARREN
MODEL NUMBER: FCSD FCSD N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 5.50 6.00 6.75
BADGE CASE

51. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID STRONG PREMIER NO BID SLIMLINE
MODEL NUMBER: 79300 FULTON CO N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 21.25 21.00 28.95
BELT KEEPER

52. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 65 65 65, 654, 62HS
PRICE PER EACH: 2.25 2.15 2.55/8.85
BELT DROP

53. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 070 0705 705
PRICE PER EACH: 113.00 110.00 127.50
MID-RISE

54. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND  
MODEL NUMBER: 6280 070 6280
PRICE PER EACH: 101.00 110.00 104.25
CARTRIDGE CASE

55. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 340 340 77
PRICE PER EACH: 23.00 21.00 29.50
BATON RING

56. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 675 675 6925
PRICE PER EACH: 6.00 5.50 10.95
FLASHLIGHT HOLDER

57. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 730 730 730-306
PRICE PER EACH: 7.50 7.35 10.95/25.50
KEY STRAP

58. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 168 168 168
PRICE PER EACH: 11.50 9.40 15.95
WHISTLE CHAIN

59. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID HWC HWC NO BID MARTINS
MODEL NUMBER: GP001 SC-1 26227
PRICE PER EACH: 2.00 4.00 2.25
RADIO POUCH

60. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 761 761 761
PRICE PER EACH: 31.50 30.75 35.75
RADIO CARRIER

61. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 760 760 760-4B-760
PRICE PER EACH: 12.00 11.75 13.95
HANDCUFF CASE

62. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 90HS 90 HS 90HS
PRICE PER EACH: 22.00 21.25 27.75



FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER: 2005001YB BID OPEN DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2004 PAGE 5 OF 10
DESCRIPTION: UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR & DUTY GEAR COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF   CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 404-730-5807
DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME 

SAFETY SYSTEMS CORPORATION COMMAND UNIFORMS RELIANCE MANUFACTURING INC BATTERIES PLUS SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP INC. NON-RESPONSIVE
UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

SAFETY VEST
63. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFETY FLAG SAFETY FLAG NO BID SERVICES & MATERIAL

MODEL NUMBER: SHERIFF SHERIFF BROWN 104296
PRICE PER EACH: 21.00 21.50 19.95
MAGAZINE POUCH

64. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 77 77 77
PRICE PER EACH: 25.50 24.75 29.95
GUN BELT

65. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARILAND NO BID SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER: 87 87 87
PRICE PER EACH: 46.50 44.50 55.75
BULLET PROOF VEST

66. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID PACA PACA NO BID US ARMOR  
MODEL NUMBER: KGSII Z611 TV2
PRICE PER EACH: 435.00 435.00 485.75
HANDCUFFS

67. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID SMITH & WESSON SMITH/WESSON NO BID S & W
MODEL NUMBER: M100 M100 100N
PRICE PER EACH: 24.85 24.50 30.25
RAID VEST

68. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID MIFFLIN VALLEY CAMTEX NO BID PREMIER
MODEL NUMBER: FCSD RAID VEST PTE-059
PRICE PER EACH: 72.00 75.00 106.50
IDENTIFICATION LANYARD

69. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID ATLANTA NOVELTY ATLANTA, NOVELTY NO BID LANYARD SOURCE
MODEL NUMBER: FCSD FCSD N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 7.00 7.00 4.95
FLASHLIGHT

70. MANUFACTURER: PRE-FOCUSED HALOGEN STREAMLIGHT STREAMLIGHT STINGER HP STREAMLIGHT LOU'S W/CHARGER
MODEL NUMBER: SL-20XP/LED SL20XP SL20-XP  PN 75503 SL-20XP PN 25011 N/A
PRICE PER EACH: 92.14 97.50 91.00 80.00 90.00 97.00/135.00
CONTINGENT PRICES:
PRICE PER SEWN ON PATCH/EMBLEM N/A
VENDOR IS REQUIRED TO PROVIDE ON NO BID 0.25
SHIRTS/JACKETS 2.75 2.50

PRICE PER SEWN ON PATCH/EMBLEM IF  
THEY ARE PROVIDED BY THE COUNTY NO BID 0.25 1.50 N/A 1.00

ARE THERE OTHER ITEMS/SERVICES FOR
WHICH YOU WILL OFFER CONTINGENT
PRICING? YES OR NO NO NO NO NO YES
IF YES, PLEASE SPECIFY IN DETAIL BELOW
STATING THE APPROPRIATE PRICING NO BID
TOTAL PRICING. N/A



FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER: 2005001YB BID OPEN DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2004 PAGE 6 OF 10
DESCRIPTION: UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR & DUTY GEAR COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF   CONTACT NAME: CHARLIE CROCKETT

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 404-730-5823
DESCRIPTION 6. VENDOR NAME 7. VENDOR NAME 8. VENDOR NAME 9. VENDOR NAME 10. VENDOR NAME 

SAFETY & SECURITY INT. NON-RESPONSIVE
OF VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDORS

PRODUCT
AND

OR ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: OTHER
SERVICES 1664 MALLORY LN
DESIRED BRENTWOOD, TN 37027 INFORMATION

FAX: 615-425-2440 FAX:404-603-4788 FAX: 770-432-8140 FAX:770-414-6980 FAX:404-691-5305
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE: 877-282-4536 TELEPHONE:404-603-4778 TELEPHONE: 770-434-8323 TELEPHONE:770-414-6980 TELEPHONE: 404-697-7233

ITEM CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: EDWARD WASHINGTON & ASSOC
JENNY DOAN OR NICOLE USSERY

DESCRIPTIONS DATE: 12/01/04 DATE:  12/02/04 DATE: 12/02/04 DATE: 12/02/04
LEATHER JACKET: MENS WOMENS MENS WOMENS MENS WOMENS MENS WOMENS MENS WOMENS
MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID

1. MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
NYLON JACKET

2. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
DUTY JACKET

3. MANUFACTURER: HORACE SMALL HORACE SMALL
MODEL NUMBER: HS 3321 HS 3321
PRICE PER EACH: $89.50 89.50
100% WOOL SWEATER:

4. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID  
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
ACRYLIC/WOOL BLEND

5. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
100% POLYESTER TROUSERS

6. MANUFACTURER: HORACE SMALL HORACE SMALL
MODEL NUMBER: SENTRY SENTRY
PRICE PER EACH: 35.50 35.50
DACRON POLY 75/25 WOOL BLEND

7. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
COTTON SHORTS

8. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
100% POLYESTER LONG SLEEVE SHIRT

9. MANUFACTURER: HORACE SMALL HORACE SMALL
MODEL NUMBER: SENTRY PLUS SENTRY PLUS
PRICE PER EACH: 28.00 28.00
65% DACRON/RAYON BLEND LONG SLEVE

10. MANUFACTURER: HORACE SMALL HORACE SMALL  
MODEL NUMBER: DEPUTY DELUXE DEPUTY DELUXE
PRICE PER EACH: 36.75 36.75

GRAND TOTAL

TERMS

DELIVERY F.O.B.

NO OF BIDS MAILED: BUYER'S NAME: CHARLES LEONARD DATE RECEIVED: 11/16/04

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED: DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL) DATE COMPLETED: 12/07/04

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED MBE/FBE PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE COMPLETED BY: LISA R. MCKINE

NO OF BIDS MBE/FBE MAILED CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE DATE:

NO OF NO BIDS RECEIVED: DATE:



FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER: 2005001YB PAGE 7 OF 10
DESCRIPTION: UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR & DUTY GEAR COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF   CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 404-730-5807
DESCRIPTION 6. VENDOR NAME 7. VENDOR NAME 8. VENDOR NAME 9. VENDOR NAME 10. VENDOR NAME 

SAFETY & SECURITY INT. NON-RESPONSIVE
UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

100% POLYESTER, SHORT SLEEVE:
11. MANUFACTURER: HORACE SMALL HORACE SMALL

MODEL NUMBER: SENTRY PLUS SENTRY PLUS
PRICE PER EACH: $26.00 26.00
65% DACRON/RAYON BLEND SHORT SLEVE

12. MANUFACTURER: HORACE SMALL HORACE SMALL
MODEL NUMBER: DEPUTY DELUXE DEPUTY DELUXE
PRICE PER EACH: $34.75 34.75
35% POLY COOLMAX COTTON SHORT SLE

13. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
100% POLYESTER SKIRT

14. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID  
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
75%-25% POLY/WOOL BLEND SKIRT

15. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
80-20% PLY/COTTON BLEND MATERNITY

16. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
BDU/ LONGSLEEVE 100% COTTON

17. MANUFACTURERER: ATLANCO ATLANCO
MODEL NUMBER: 1532 1532
PRICE PER EACH: 18.50 18.50
PANTS 100% COTTON

19. MANUFACTURERER: ATLANCO ATLANCO
MODEL NUMBER: 1523 1523
PRICE PER EACH: 18.50 18.50
COAT

20. MANUFACTURERER: NEESE NEESE  
MODEL NUMBER: 447C 447C
PRICE PER EACH: 47.50 47.50
JACKET

21. MANUFACTURERER: NEESE NEESE
MODEL NUMBER: 447J 447J
PRICE PER EACH: 31.75 31.75
PANTS 

22. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
NECKTIE

23. MANUFACTURERER: SMALL BROOME
MODEL NUMBER: 90129
PRICE PER EACH: 4.50
BELT

24. MANUFACTURERER: NO BID NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
HAT, STRAW:

25. MANUFACTURERER: STRATTON STRATTON
MODEL NUMBER: 540TB 540TB
PRICE PER EACH: 63.75 63.75
HAT, FUR TROOPER:

26. MANUFACTURERER: STRATTON
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH: 20.75

BID OPEN DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2004
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DESCRIPTION: UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR & DUTYGEAR COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT: SHERIFF   CONTACT NAME: 

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 
DESCRIPTION 6. VENDOR NAME 7. VENDOR NAME 8. VENDOR NAME 9. VENDOR NAME 10. VENDOR NAME 

SAFETY & SECURITY INT. NON-RESPONSIVE
UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

HAT, BDU
27. MANUFACTURER: ROTHCO

MODEL NUMBER: 9481
PRICE PER EACH: 5.00
HAT PRESS

28. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
HANDBAGS LEATHER #1

29. MANUFACTURER: BIANCHI
MODEL NUMBER: 5000
PRICE PER EACH: 155.00
HANDBAGS LEATHER #2

30. MANUFACTURER: BIANCHI  
MODEL NUMBER: 4440
PRICE PER EACH: 79.50
VINYL

31. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
WALKING SHOE

32. MANUFACTURER: THOROGOOD THOROGOOD
MODEL NUMBER: 834-6283 534-6013
PRICE PER EACH: 69.75 67.25
DRESS SHOE

33. MANUFACTURER: ROCKY ROCKY
MODEL NUMBER: 510 210
PRICE PER EACH: 41.75 41.75
OXFORD

34. MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
BOOT

35. MANUFACTURER: DANNER DANNER
MODEL NUMBER: 42900-25200-21210 25200W-21210W
PRICE PER EACH: 90.00/156.25/165.00 156.25/165.00
BADGES/CHEST

36. MANUFACTURER: BLACKINTON  
MODEL NUMBER: B 956
PRICE PER EACH: 66.00
HAT

37. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
WALLET

38. MANUFACTURER: BLACKINTON
MODEL NUMBER: B748DE
PRICE PER EACH: 87.50
COLLAR

39. MANUFACTURER: BLACKINTON
MODEL NUMBER: STYLE 10
PRICE PER EACH: 8.25
MAJOR

40. MANUFACTURER: PREMIER
MODEL NUMBER: PE 1052
PRICE PER EACH: 3.00
CAPTAIN

41. MANUFACTURER: PREMIER
MODEL NUMBER: PE 1027
PRICE PER EACH: 3.00
LIEUTENANT

42. MANUFACTURER: PREMIER
MODEL NUMBER: PE 1001
PRICE PER EACH: 3.00
SERGEANT

43. MANUFACTURER: PREMIER
MODEL NUMBER: 239
PRICE PER EACH: 3.00
DEPUTY II

44. MANUFACTURER: PREMIER
MODEL NUMBER: 239
PRICE PER EACH: 3.00

BID OPEN DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2004
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DESCRIPTION: COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT:   CONTACT NAME: 

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 
DESCRIPTION 6. VENDOR NAME 7. VENDOR NAME 8. VENDOR NAME 9. VENDOR NAME 10. VENDOR NAME 

SAFETY & SECURITY INT. NON-RESPONSIVE
UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

DEPUTY III
45. MANUFACTURER: PREMIER

MODEL NUMBER: 239
PRICE PER EACH: 3.00
SHOULDER:

46. MANUFACTURER: SYMBOL ARTS
MODEL NUMBER: CUSTOM
PRICE PER EACH: 5.50
CLOTH BADGE

47. MANUFACTURER: SYMBOL ARTS
MODEL NUMBER: CUSTOM
PRICE PER EACH: 5.50
NAMEPLATE

48. MANUFACTURER: BLACKINTON  
MODEL NUMBER: J4
PRICE PER EACH: 7.50
BUTTONS

49. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
TIE TACK

50. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
BADGE CASE

51. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
BELT KEEPER

52. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
BELT DROP

53. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
MID-RISE

54. MANUFACTURER: NO BID  
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
CARTRIDGE CASE

55. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
BATON RING

56. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
FLASHLIGHT HOLDER

57. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
KEY STRAP

58. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
WHISTLE CHAIN

59. MANUFACTURER: PREMIER
MODEL NUMBER: P4908
PRICE PER EACH: 3.50
RADIO POUCH

60. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
RADIO CARRIER

61. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
HANDCUFF CASE

62. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:

BID OPEN DATE: 
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DESCRIPTION: COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 
DEPARTMENT:   CONTACT NAME: 

      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 
DESCRIPTION 6. VENDOR NAME 7. VENDOR NAME 8. VENDOR NAME 9. VENDOR NAME 10. VENDOR NAME 

SAFETY & SECURITY INT NON-RESPONSIVE
UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

SAFETY VEST
63. MANUFACTURER: R & B FABRICATIONS

MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH: 31.25
MAGAZINE POUCH

64. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
GUN BELT

65. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
BULLET PROOF VEST

66. MANUFACTURER: US ARMOR  
MODEL NUMBER: 2X ADD 10% TERMINAL VELOCITY
PRICE PER EACH: 3X ADD 15% 450.00
HANDCUFFS

67. MANUFACTURER: SMITH WESSON
MODEL NUMBER: 100
PRICE PER EACH: 21.50
RAID VEST

68. MANUFACTURER: MAX TAC
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH: 68.75
IDENTIFICATION LANYARD

69. MANUFACTURER: NO BID
MODEL NUMBER:
PRICE PER EACH:
FLASHLIGHT

70. MANUFACTURER: STINGER STREAMLIGHT
MODEL NUMBER: SL 20XP/7500 25100-FLASHLIGHT
PRICE PER EACH: 57.00 74.25
CONTINGENT PRICES:
PRICE PER SEWN ON PATCH/EMBLEM
VENDOR IS REQUIRED TO PROVIDE ON 5.25
SHIRTS/JACKETS

PRICE PER SEWN ON PATCH/EMBLEM IF  
THEY ARE PROVIDED BY THE COUNTY 0.25

ARE THERE OTHER ITEMS/SERVICES FOR
WHICH YOU WILL OFFER CONTINGENT
PRICING? YES OR NO YES
IF YES, PLEASE SPECIFY IN DETAIL BELOW
STATING THE APPROPRIATE PRICING
TOTAL PRICING. UPON REQUEST

BID OPEN DATE: 


