
2/23/2005

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL
EARTH WRITE-NO. 2 PENCIL DOZEN $0.58 DOZEN $0.83 DOZEN $0.67 DOZEN $0.61 DOZEN $1.19
RETRACTABLE COMFORT MATE ULTRA (BLUE) EA $0.36 EA $0.54 EA $0.56 EA $0.36 EA $0.62
RETRACTABLE COMFORT MATE ULTRA (BLACK) EA $0.36 EA $0.54 EA $0.50 EA $0.36 EA $0.59
RETRACTABLE COMFORT MATE ULTRA FINE POINT (RED) EA $0.36 EA $0.54 EA $0.56 EA $0.36 EA $0.59
RETRACTABLE COMFORTMATE MEDIUM BALLPOINT (BLUE) EA $0.36 EA $0.54 EA $0.50 EA $0.36 EA $0.62
RETRACTABLE COMFORTMATE MEDIUM BALLPOINT (RED) EA $0.36 EA $0.54 EA $0.50 EA $0.36 EA $0.62
RETRACTABLE COMFORTMATE MEDIUM BALLPOINT (BLACK) EA $0.36 EA $0.54 EA $0.50 EA $0.36 EA $0.62
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT YELLOW EA $0.22 EA $0.39 EA $0.23 EA $0.23 EA $0.47
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT PINK EA $0.22 EA $0.39 EA $0.23 EA $0.23 EA $0.47
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT BLUE EA $0.22 EA $0.39 EA $0.36 EA $0.23 EA $0.47
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT GREEN EA $0.22 EA $0.39 EA $0.36 EA $0.23 EA $0.47
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT ORANGE EA $0.22 EA $0.39 EA $0.36 EA $0.23 EA $0.47
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT PURPLE EA $0.22 EA $0.39 EA $0.36 EA $0.23 EA $0.47
DRY ERASE STARTER SET SET $4.82 SET $6.69 SET $6.15 SET $6.83 SET $7.46
3" BINDER (BLACK) EA $2.98 EA $6.36 EA $5.85 EA $3.13 EA $5.27
2" BINDER (BLACK) EA $1.94 EA $4.11 EA $3.78 EA $2.13 EA $5.27
1" BLINDER (BLACK) EA $1.28 EA $2.90 EA $2.67 EA $1.37 EA $2.20
3" BINDER (WHITE) EA $2.98 EA $4.96 EA $4.57 EA $3.06 EA $4.65
2" BINDER (WHITE) EA $1.94 EA $3.55 EA $3.27 EA $2.08 EA $3.69
1" BLINDER (WHITE) EA $1.28 EA $2.17 EA $1.49 EA $1.34 EA $2.20
STANDARD STAPLES EA $0.38 EA $0.64 EA $0.42 EA $0.45 EA $0.84
JAW STYLE STAPLE REMOVER EA $0.18 EA $0.28 EA $0.17 EA $0.24 EA $0.68
DESK STAPLERS (BLACK) EA $1.96 EA $4.83 EA $4.44 EA $8.57 EA $5.87
3.3" D/HD DISKETTES (10 PER BOX) BOX $1.11 BOX $3.62 BOX NO BID BOX $3.33 BOX $3.94
7" SCISSORS EA $0.54 EA $0.87 EA $0.80 EA $1.14 EA $1.27

GRAND TOTAL:  
BIDS MAILED:         9  2 ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE:
BIDS RECEIVED:    9   DATE:

DATE:

BID DESCRIPTION:  OFFICE SUPPLIES
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT:  HUMAN SERVICES DEPARTMENT     CONTACT:

Prime Office Products
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VENDOR NAME
Boise Cascade Office Products

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME
Smith Office & Computer Supply

ADDRESS 
4800 Highlands Parkway 

Smyrna, GA 30082

ADDRESS
1009 S. 21st Avenue 
Hollywood, FL 33020

ADDRESS
105 Southfield Parkway     Suite 
300                        Forest Park, 

GA 30297

VENDOR NAME
Media South Computer Supplies

VENDOR CODE

BID TAB

 
404-730-5811

 OPENING DATE:

PC #:MALCOLM TYSON

PAGE NUMBER: 1 OF 6BID NUMBER:  05ITB39229YC
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VENDOR NAME
Freeman Forms & Supplies

VENDOR CODEVENDOR CODE

NO RESPONSE:
CHIEF ASSISTANT:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

NO-BIDS:
MALCOLM TYSON

     

ADDRESS
6021 Live Oak Parkway 

Norcross, GA 30093

ADDRESS
800 Doug Davis Drive       

Atlanta GA 30354

CONTACT: 

TELEPHONE:

Nancy Freeman Balkcom

404-768-2387
TELEPHONE:

770-437-8700 ext. 8234
TELEPHONE:
800-464-0874

TELEPHONE:
404-366-3121 ext. 289

TELEPHONE:
770-242-6200

CONTACT: 
Roslyn Salter

CONTACT: 
Bruce Kahn

CONTACT: 
Rosemary Willingham

CONTACT: 
Teresa Brown



2/23/2005

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL
TWO HOLE PUNCH EA $2.74 EA $3.50 EA $2.25 EA $5.17 EA $4.50
THREE HOLE PUNCH EA $2.83 EA $3.96 EA $2.24 EA $4.96 EA $4.94
MAGIC TAPE MULTIPACK 1" CORE PACK $13.23 PACK $17.14 PACK $14.79 PACK $18.26 PACK $14.98
TAPE DISPENSER W/ATTACHED CORE EA $5.96 EA $7.68 EA $7.23 EA $6.16 EA $7.98
1 1/2 X 2-POST IT NOTE PADS PACK $1.11 PACK $4.02 PACK $3.70 PACK $3.38 PACK $4.99
3 X 3 POST IT NOTE PADS PACK $2.76 PACK $9.60 PACK $8.83 PACK $7.83 PACK $8.55
3 X 5 POST IT NOTE PADS PACK $3.96 PACK $13.14 PACK $12.09 PACK $10.48 PACK $13.87
MULTI FLUID SMOOTH COVERAGE CORRECTION FLUID EA $0.40 EA $0.99 EA $0.82 EA $0.85 EA $0.97
AAA ALKALINE BATTERIES PACK $5.07 PACK $11.20 PACK $6.87 PACK $9.36 PACK $12.56
AA ALKALINE BATTERIES PACK $8.63 PACK $17.70 PACK $12.53 PACK $9.36 PACK $16.99
BUSINESS CARD FILE EA $8.81 EA $13.50 EA $12.72 EA $9.21 EA $14.99
PAPER CLIPS W DISPENSER SMALL PACK $1.00 PACK $2.50 PACK $2.07 PACK $2.43 PACK $4.14
JUMBO PAPER CLIPS BOX $0.30 BOX $0.40 BOX $0.31 BOX $0.31 BOX $0.53
SMALL BINDER CLIPS DOZ BOX $0.17 BOX $0.25 BOX $0.19 BOX $0.19 BOX $0.49
MEDIUM BINDER CLIPS DOZ BOX $0.38 BOX $0.55 BOX $0.39 BOX $0.46 BOX $0.65
JUMBO BINDER CLIPS DOZ BOX $1.04 BOX $1.55 BOX $0.99 BOX $1.17 BOX $1.84
HANGING FILE FOLDERS LETTER (25) BOX $4.93 BOX $5.46 BOX $4.65 BOX $3.96 BOX $4.49
HANGING FILE FOLDERS LEGAL (25) BOX $6.34 BOX $7.40 BOX $5.78 BOX $5.26 BOX $6.49
MANILA FOLDRS LETTER (100) BOX $6.44 BOX $8.66 BOX $6.90 BOX $8.87 BOX $5.55
MANILA FOLDRS LEGAL (100) BOX $7.85 BOX $7.86 BOX $6.67 BOX $5.55 BOX $6.49
EXPANDING REDROPE FILE POCKETS; 1 3/4" EXPANSION; LETTER BOX $11.50 BOX $21.22 BOX $13.75 BOX $21.25 BOX $30.79
EXPANDING REDROPE FILE POCKETS; 3 1/2" EXPANSION; LETTER BOX $12.00 BOX $21.22 BOX $14.40 BOX $24.25 BOX $27.45
EXPANDING REDROPE FILE POCKETS; 5 1/4" EXPANSION; LETTER BOX $5.90 BOX $8.90 BOX $6.85 BOX $8.50 BOX $14.11
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED   ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE:
BIDS RECEIVED:   DATE:

DATE:DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

NO RESPONSE:   
NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT:

     

CONTACT: 
  

CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: 

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
  

ADDRESS ADDRESS
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Boise Cascade Office Products Smith Office & Computer Supply Prime Office Products Media South Computer Supplies Freeman Forms & Supplies
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VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME

VENDOR CODE

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:

BID DESCRIPTION:    OFFICE SUPPLIES  
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT:     HUMAN SERVICES DEPARTMENT     CONTACT: MALCOLM TYSON PC #: 404-730-5811

BID TAB

BID NUMBER:  05ITB39229YC  OPENING DATE: PAGE NUMBER: 2 0F 6



2/23/2005

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL
EXPANDING REDROPE FILE POCKETS; 3 1/2" EXPANSION; LEGAL BOX $14.75 BOX $24.55 BOX $17.15 BOX $25.75 BOX $35.99
EXPANDING REDROPE FILE POCKETS; 5 1/4" EXPANSION; LEGAL BOX $6.60 BOX $11.20 BOX $7.81 BOX $11.40 BOX $18.93
BLUE CASSIFICATION FOLDERS BOX $24.84 BOX $44.00 BOX $36.93 BOX $36.93 BOX $55.99
YELLOW CLASSIFICATION FOLDERS BOX $24.84 BOX $44.00 BOX $36.93 BOX $36.93 BOX $55.99
2 PIECE FASTENERS (50) BOX $1.16 BOX $2.40 BOX $1.92 BOX $1.85 BOX $2.88
WHITE FILE LABELS BOX $12.59 BOX $26.70 BOX $21.00 BOX $19.98 BOX $28.99
ASSORTED FILE LABELS BOX $10.36 BOX $14.60 BOX $11.34 BOX $10.87 BOX $15.98
RULED NOTE PADS PACK $7.21 PACK $6.00 PACK $5.13 PACK $4.80 PACK $4.69
LEGAL NOTE PADS PACK $10.06 PACK $8.57 PACK $7.99 PACK $11.79 PACK $8.98
ASSORTED DOUBLE POCKET FOLDERS BOX $31.01 BOX $34.51 BOX $32.04 BOX $28.84 BOX $45.97
KRAFT CLASP ENVELOPES BOX $4.95 BOX $7.50 BOX $6.20 BOX $8.51 BOX $9.95
ADDRESS LABELS PACK $5.74 PACK $8.40 PACK $6.12 PACK $5.83 PACK $9.90
ADDRESS LABELS PACK $1.43 PACK $8.40 PACK $7.82 PACK $5.83 PACK $9.90
CLEAR MAILING LABELS PACK $13.79 PACK $35.70 PACK $26.98 PACK $25.68 PACK $32.73
CLEAR MAILING LABELS PACK $15.65 PACK $35.70 PACK $32.73 PACK $25.68 PACK $32.73
HEAVYWEIGHT CLASP ENVELOPES 9 1/2 X 12 BOX $6.27 BOX $8.00 BOX $6.87 BOX $6.07 BOX $8.48
HEAVYWEIGHT CLASP ENVELOPES 6X9 BOX $14.05 BOX $5.40 BOX $4.87 BOX $4.40 BOX $6.50
#10 WHITE ENVELOPES BOX $5.89 BOX $5.10 BOX $4.78 BOX $4.43 BOX $4.78
PRINTED FLAG SET-SIGNATURE PACK $1.88 PACK $3.25 PACK $2.72 PACK $1.92 PACK $3.76
8-TAB EXTENDED TAB INDEXES SET $0.29 SET $0.65 SET $0.59 SET $0.62 SET $0.76
        
        
        
  

GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED   ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE:
BIDS RECEIVED:   DATE:

DATE:DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

NO RESPONSE: MALCOLM TYSON 2/23/2005
NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT:

     

CONTACT: 
   

CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: 

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
   

ADDRESS ADDRESS
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Boise Cascade Office Products Smith Office & Computer Supply Prime Office Products Media South Computer Supplies Freeman Forms & Supplies
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VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME

VENDOR CODE

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:

BID DESCRIPTION:    OFFICE SUPPLIES  
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT:     HUMAN SERVICES DEPARTMENT     CONTACT: MALCOLM TYSON PC #: 404-730-5811

BID TAB
BID NUMBER:  05ITB39229YC  OPENING DATE: PAGE NUMBER: 3 OF 6



2/23/2005

QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL
EARTH WRITE-NO. 2 PENCIL DOZEN $0.38 DOZEN $0.41 DOZEN $0.60 DOZEN $0.59  
RETRACTABLE COMFORT MATE ULTRA (BLUE) EA $0.23 EA $0.27 EA $0.52 EA $0.37  
RETRACTABLE COMFORT MATE ULTRA (BLACK) EA $0.23 EA $0.27 EA $0.52 EA $0.37  
RETRACTABLE COMFORT MATE ULTRA FINE POINT (RED) EA $0.23 EA $0.27 EA $0.52 EA NO BID  
RETRACTABLE COMFORTMATE MEDIUM BALLPOINT (BLUE) EA $0.23 EA $0.27 EA $0.52 EA $0.37  
RETRACTABLE COMFORTMATE MEDIUM BALLPOINT (RED) EA $0.23 EA $0.27 EA $0.52 EA $0.37  
RETRACTABLE COMFORTMATE MEDIUM BALLPOINT (BLACK) EA $0.23 EA $0.27 EA $0.52 EA $0.37  
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT YELLOW EA $0.11 EA $0.13 EA $0.30 EA $0.26  
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT PINK EA $0.11 EA $0.13 EA $0.30 EA $0.26  
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT BLUE EA $0.11 EA $0.13 EA $0.30 EA $0.26  
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT GREEN EA $0.11 EA $0.13 EA $0.30 EA $0.26  
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT ORANGE EA $0.11 EA $0.13 EA $0.30 EA $0.26  
HI-LITER-FLUORESCENT PURPLE SET $0.11 SET $0.13 SET $0.30 SET NO BID  
DRY ERASE STARTER SET EA $3.30 EA $3.58 EA $6.83 EA NO BID  
3" BINDER (BLACK) EA $1.49 EA $1.49 EA $5.27 EA $2.94  
2" BINDER (BLACK) EA $1.29 EA $0.89 EA $3.40 EA $2.29  
1" BLINDER (BLACK) EA $0.89 EA $0.59 EA $1.99 EA $1.47  
3" BINDER (WHITE) EA $1.49 EA $1.40 EA $4.99 EA $2.94  
2" BINDER (WHITE) EA $1.29 EA $0.89 EA $3.40 EA $2.29  
1" BLINDER (WHITE) BOX $0.89 BOX $1.04 BOX $1.99 BOX $1.47  
STANDARD STAPLES EA $0.40 EA $0.43 EA $0.54 EA $0.43  
JAW STYLE STAPLE REMOVER EA $0.15 EA $0.17 EA $0.24 EA $0.27  
DESK STAPLERS (BLACK) BOX $1.74 BOX $4.63 BOX $5.05 BOX $3.68  
3.3" D/HD DISKETTES (10 PER BOX) EA $1.74 EA $2.63 EA $1.99 EA $1.53
7" SCISSORS BOX $0.50 BOX $1.00 BOX $1.14 BOX $0.57  
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED   ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE:
BIDS RECEIVED:   DATE:

DATE:DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:
NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT:

 
NO RESPONSE: MALCOLM TYSON 2/23/2005

    

CONTACT: 
George Pisciotta Kenneth C. Hart Jeff Michael Patriarca

CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: 

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
678-921-4242 404-629-4900 (local) 770-237-3440 1-800-634-4809

ADDRESS ADDRESS
975 Cobb Place Blvd      Suite 

211              Kennesaw, GA 
30144

1 Environmental Way 
Broomfield, CO 80021

PO Box 2103       Lawrenceville, 
GA 30046

100 Schelter Road 
Lincolnshire, IL 60069
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Quick Delivery Office Supply Corporate Express Go Wholesale Supply Quill Corporation
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VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME

VENDOR CODE

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:

BID DESCRIPTION:    OFFICE SUPPLIES  
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT:  HUMAN SERVICES DEPARTMENT     CONTACT: MALCOLM TYSON PC #: 404-730-5811

BID TAB
BID NUMBER:   05ITB39229YC  OPENING DATE: PAGE NUMBER: 4 OF 6



2/23/2005

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL
TWO HOLE PUNCH EA $1.55 EA $1.85 EA $2.91 EA $1.19  
THREE HOLE PUNCH EA $1.75 EA $1.30 EA $3.29 EA $1.69  
MAGIC TAPE MULTIPACK 1" CORE PACK $6.00 PACK $7.95 PACK $14.50 PACK $13.36  
TAPE DISPENSER W/ATTACHED CORE EA $3.70 EA $2.25 EA $3.00 EA $6.03  
1 1/2 X 2-POST IT NOTE PADS PACK $1.19 PACK $1.90 PACK $1.76 PACK $1.21  
3 X 3 POST IT NOTE PADS PACK $2.45 PACK $4.80 PACK $3.84 PACK $2.70  
3 X 5 POST IT NOTE PADS PACK $3.30 PACK $5.80 PACK $5.52 PACK $3.82  
MULTI FLUID SMOOTH COVERAGE CORRECTION FLUID EA $0.40 EA $0.60 EA $0.83 EA $0.70  
AAA ALKALINE BATTERIES PACK $3.00 PACK $4.98 PACK $9.30 PACK $4.89  
AA ALKALINE BATTERIES PACK $6.00 PACK $9.30 PACK $14.84 PACK $4.51  
BUSINESS CARD FILE EA $7.00 EA $6.40 EA $11.28 EA $13.49  
PAPER CLIPS W DISPENSER SMALL PACK $1.35 PACK $0.35 PACK $2.17 PACK $0.30  
JUMBO PAPER CLIPS BOX $0.25 BOX $0.26 BOX $0.32 BOX $2.99  
SMALL BINDER CLIPS DOZ BOX $0.15 BOX $0.18 BOX $0.21 BOX $0.12  
MEDIUM BINDER CLIPS DOZ BOX $0.34 BOX $0.42 BOX $0.48 BOX $0.27  
JUMBO BINDER CLIPS DOZ BOX $0.99 BOX $0.99 BOX $1.35 BOX $0.69  
HANGING FILE FOLDERS LETTER (25) BOX $3.25 BOX $2.55 BOX $4.59 BOX $3.89  
HANGING FILE FOLDERS LEGAL (25) BOX $3.95 BOX $3.25 BOX $6.19 BOX $5.91  
MANILA FOLDRS LETTER (100) BOX $3.49 BOX $5.10 BOX $4.10 BOX $9.20  
MANILA FOLDRS LEGAL (100) BOX $4.00 BOX $3.60 BOX $6.61 BOX $5.63  
EXPANDING REDROPE FILE POCKETS; 1 3/4" EXPANSION; LETTER BOX $7.99 BOX $7.25 BOX $18.95 BOX $13.70  
EXPANDING REDROPE FILE POCKETS; 3 1/2" EXPANSION; LETTER BOX $10.50 BOX $19.95 BOX $17.90 BOX $15.23  
EXPANDING REDROPE FILE POCKETS; 5 1/4" EXPANSION; LETTER BOX $4.00 BOX $3.75 BOX $7.55 BOX $7.17  
  

GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED   ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE:
BIDS RECEIVED:   DATE:

DATE:DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

NO RESPONSE: MALCOLM TYSON 2/23/2005
NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT:

    

CONTACT: 
   

CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: 

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
   

ADDRESS ADDRESS
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Quick Delivery Office Supply Corporate Express Go Wholesale Supply Quill Corporation
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VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME

VENDOR CODE

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:

BID DESCRIPTION:  OFFICE SUPPLIES  
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT:  HUMAN SERVICES DEPARTMENT     CONTACT: MALCOLM TYSON PC #: 404-730-5811

BID TAB
BID NUMBER:  05ITB39229YC  OPENING DATE: PAGE NUMBER: 5 OF 6



2/23/2005

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL

EXPANDING REDROPE FILE POCKETS; 3 1/2" EXPANSION; LEGAL BOX $9.00 BOX $9.46 BOX $22.60 BOX $17.53  

EXPANDING REDROPE FILE POCKETS; 5 1/4" EXPANSION; LEGAL BOX $3.98 BOX $3.95 BOX $9.50 BOX $8.70  
BLUE CASSIFICATION FOLDERS BOX $16.50 BOX $16.80 BOX $36.93 BOX $16.67  
YELLOW CLASSIFICATION FOLDERS BOX $16.95 BOX $16.80 BOX $36.93 BOX $16.67  
2 PIECE FASTENERS (50) BOX $0.85 BOX $1.25 BOX $2.58 BOX $1.13  
WHITE FILE LABELS BOX $6.25 BOX $13.76 BOX $22.44 BOX $3.20  
ASSORTED FILE LABELS BOX $6.25 BOX $7.43 BOX $12.26 BOX $3.07  
RULED NOTE PADS PACK $4.00 PACK $5.13 PACK $4.93 PACK $3.59  
LEGAL NOTE PADS PACK $5.00 PACK $4.45 PACK $7.19 PACK $4.41  
ASSORTED DOUBLE POCKET FOLDERS BOX $10.50 BOX $15.00 BOX NO BID BOX $5.14  
KRAFT CLASP ENVELOPES BOX $4.40 BOX $4.50 BOX $4.74 BOX $5.20  
ADDRESS LABELS PACK $4.00 PACK $3.21 PACK $8.66 PACK $1.99  
ADDRESS LABELS PACK $4.00 PACK $4.01 PACK $8.66 PACK $5.41  
CLEAR MAILING LABELS PACK $15.00 PACK $15.25 PACK $29.48 PACK $9.32  
CLEAR MAILING LABELS PACK $16.00 PACK $16.98 PACK $29.48 PACK $9.32  
HEAVYWEIGHT CLASP ENVELOPES 9 1/2 X 12 BOX $4.95 BOX $5.75 BOX $7.29 BOX $5.22  
HEAVYWEIGHT CLASP ENVELOPES 6X9 BOX $3.50 BOX $3.90 BOX $4.55 BOX $2.99  
#10 WHITE ENVELOPES BOX $3.50 BOX $5.60 BOX $4.30 BOX $4.27  
PRINTED FLAG SET-SIGNATURE PACK $1.99 PACK $1.77 PACK $2.72 PACK NO BID  
8-TAB EXTENDED TAB INDEXES SET $0.25 SET $0.30 SET $0.62 SET $0.47  
        
        
        
  

GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED   ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE:
BIDS RECEIVED:   DATE:

DATE:

BID TAB
BID NUMBER:  05ITB39229YC  OPENING DATE: PAGE NUMBER: 6 OF 6
BID DESCRIPTION:  OFFICE SUPPLIES  
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT:  HUMAN SERVICES DEPARTMENT     CONTACT: MALCOLM TYSON PC #: 404-730-5811
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VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME

VENDOR CODE

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:

VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME
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Quick Delivery Office Supply Corporate Express Go Wholesale Supply Quill Corporation
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE

ADDRESS ADDRESS
   

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
   

CONTACT: 
   

CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: 

     
NO RESPONSE: MALCOLM TYSON 2/23/2025
NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT:

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:


