BID TAB

BID NUMBER: 051TB43812YC ] OPENING DATE: 5/25/2005 | PAGE NUMBER: 1 OF 6
BiD DESCRIPTION: HARDWARE AND TOOLS
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS : MALCOLM TYSON : 404-730-5811
mental Tech Products | UnitedRentals | . M Hulsey |
RN SRR emmwm”\ P . S5 2 e i ¥ B
b . S 7 & mE ol W N
ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
3800 Jonesbore Road  Forest Park, {531 Central Park Avenue Scarsdale,] 2112 Faulkner Road, NF Atlanta, 866 ML King Jr. Drive  Atlanta, GA
30062 GA 30297 NY 10583-1018 GA 30324 30314
- | TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
- - - . | 770-5090158 678-575-3221 B00-431-1872 ext. 7317 404-634-2414 ext. 32 404-589-0708
- - s - CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:
. . o Patricia Mifler Shawn Doran Marge Ennis Marvin Hulsey Irvin Tucker
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED  |QTY UNIT$ TOTAL QTyY Unit § TOTAL Qry Unit $ TOTAL Q1Y Units TOTAL aTy Linit § TOTAL
1. Chainsaw Bar, 20" for Stihl 036, Part #38822 or
Approved Equal 5EA $59.8C 5EA No Bid 5EA Ng Bid 5 EA No Bid 5 EA 57141
2. Chainsaw Bar O, Guart; Sthl Par? #0781-516-5003 or
Approved Equal 24 QT8 $56.95 24 Gits No Bid 24 QTS Mo Big 24 QTS Na Bid 24 QTS $4.27
3. Duct Tape roll-2*; Nashua Part #398 or Approved Equalf200 Roil $4.99 200 Ralis $4.40 $680.00{200 Rall $2.29 200 Roll No Bid 200 Roil $3.95
4. Plastic Gas Cans-21/2 Gal. Self-Ventilating; Blitz Part
#50810 or Approved Equal 20 £EA $4.99 20 EA $24.25 $485.00[20 EA 1-82 20 EA No Bid 20 EA $399
5. Lubricant-WD-40, 8oz;Part #10008 or Approved Equal 120 CANS $1.99 20 Cans $2.20 $44.00|2¢ CANS $2.45 20 CANS Mo Bid 20 CANS $2.76
8. Saw Blades, Cured Concrete 147 x . 125x1"-20MM;
World Diamond Source, Inc. Part #DC-14-4N/20 or
Approved Equal 20 EA $255.00 20EA $236.50 $4,730.00: 20 EA No Bid 20EA No Bid 20 EA $185.71
7. Saw Biades, Ductile lron 12" X .1256x1°-20 MM; World |20 EA $259.00 20 EA $86.50 $1,730.00{20 EA No Bid 20 EA No Bid 20 EA $180.68
&, Conorete Mix, 60 Ib. Bags; Quickcrete Part #1102-60 or
Approved Equal 100 Bags $3.39 100 Bags $3.05 $305.001100 Bags No Bid 100 Bags No Bid 100 Bags $3.31
9. Mortar Mix, 80 Ib. Bags; Quickcrete Part #1102-80 or
Approved Equal 100 Bags $5.40 100 Bags $3.95 $395.00: 100 Bags No Bid 100 Bags No Bid 100 Bags $3.98
10, Sledge Hammer-Double Faced, 8 Ib.; Ames True
Tereper Part #1197900 or Approved Equal 20 EA $20.97 20 EA $12.20 $244.00/20 EA No Bid 20EA No Bid 20EA $16.95
11. Rim Ring Tool-30"; Ken-Tool Part #33223-30 or
Approved Equal 5 EA $18 99 5 EA MNo Bid & EA No Bid S EA No Bid 5 EA $21.43
12. Booster Cabies; Heavy Duty 500 Amps, Wire Gauge 4
AWG, 25Tt Cable length, Carol Part #425ULAC or
Approved Equal 1 Pairs $65.99 10 Pairs $27.20 $277.00{10 Pairs $3.99 10 Pairs No Bid 10 Pairs $69.00
13. Pipe Wrench, Aluminum-36°; Rigid Part #836/31110
or Approved Equal 10 EA $87.99 10 EA No Bid 10 EA $109.98 10 EA No Bid 10 EA $175.00
14. Pipe Wrench-14* Cast lron; Rigid Part #14/31020 or
Approved Equal 20EA $35.69 Z0EA $13.95 $278.00120 EA $19.99 20 EA No Bid 20 EA $35.00
15, Flashlight, Maglite-3 Cell D; Part #83D016 or
Approved Equal 20 EA $18.99 20 EA §17.15 $343.00|20 EA $14.49 20 EA No Bid 20EA $23.15
6. Wnommmwm_ Night Piercer 1, Haverhillg, Inc.; Parl
#1088V700v or Approved Equal $99.95 20 EA No Bigd No Bid 20 EA Nao Bid
BIDS MAILED: 25 NG RESPONSE: 18 ASSISTANT PURCGHASING AGENT: MALCOLM TYSON DATE; 5/25/2005
BIDS RECEWNED: 7 NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE:
: - e . : DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:

: e




BiD TAB

BID NUMBER: 08ITB43812YC OPENING DATE: 8/25/2005 PAGE NUMBER: 20F &

BID DESCRIPTION: HARDWARE AND TOOLS
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS : 404-730-5819

s e
S R
R

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:

- T : NTACT: : :
, W»@Ww\%ﬂ% F,@MMW&MWM CONTAC CONTACT: CONTACT CONTACT CONTACY
ESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED [QTY UNIT S TTOTAL ary UNIT$ TTOTAL o7y UNIT § TOTAL ary LINIT § TOTAL Qry UNITS ITOTAL
17. Flashlight Lantern w6V Battery, bveready Part
#MP109WBSQP or Approved Egual 30 EA $6.99 3C EA No Bid 3CEA $2.59 30 EA No Bid 30 EA 510,95
18, Phers, Griplock Jaw: Channet Lock Part #GL10 or
Approved Equal 20 EA $16.89 20 EA $6.50 $130.00{20 EA No Bid 20 EA No Bid 20 EA $19.95
19, Pliers, Linesman; Channel Lock Part #348 or
Approved Equat 20 EA $13.97 20 EA $16.90 $338.00}20 EA $14.48 20 EA No Bid 20 EA $25.00
20. Socket Drive Set, Prota 1/2°; Part #5412 pr
Anproved Equal 15 Sats $249.50 15 Sets No Bid 15 Sets No Bid 15 Sets No Bid 15 Sets $114,9¢
21, Marking Paint, Inverted, Blue, 18 oz. Cans; Rustoleum
or Approved Equat 200 Cans $6.49 200 Cans $3.13 $626.001200 Cans $2.30 200 Cans No Bid 200 Cans $7.95
22. Silver Paint, 156z Cans; rust-oleum Part #V2115 or
Approved Equal 200 Cans $6.49 200 Cans $3.70 $740.00200 Cans No Bid 200 Cans No Bid 200 Cans $5.95
23. Tape Measure-25'; Lufkin Part #2125 or Approved
Equal 20 EA $5.99 20 EA $4.85 $97.00120 EA $2.19 20 EA No Bid 20 EA $13.00

24, Extension Cords, 100'; Volt Rating 125, Cord 14

AWG/3; Coleman Cable Part #G01489-00-02 of
Approved Equal 10 EA $27.89 10 EA $30.80 $308.00110 EA $11.99 10 EA No Bid 10 EA $33.63

25. Surveyor Vest, Fluorescent Y Yellow, 2XL, Ocnomix;

Part #Lux-5SFS-2X or Approved Equal 100 EA $17.99 100 EA $12.70 $1,270.00/ 100 EA No Bid 100 EA No Bid 100 EA $20.37

26. Mirror, Pyramex Venture I Silver; Part #5B18708S or

Approved Equal 200 EA $4.79 200 EA $3.45 $690.00{200 EA No Bid 200 EA No Bid 200 EA No Bid

27. Gloves, Condor-Drivers-Leather XL Part #5AV28 of

Approved Equal 100 Pairs $8.99 100 Pairs 32.75 $275.001100 Pairs No Bid 100 Pairs No Bid 100G Pairs No Bid

28, Hard Hat, Full Brim 6-PL. Ratchet Suspension; Bullard

Part #303R or Approved Equal 40 EA $11.98 40 EA $12.50 $500.00{40 EA $5.08 40 EA No Bid 40 EA $6.99
23. Boots, Hip Wader, 327, Steel Toe Size 14; Onguard :
Part #86056 or Approved Equal 10 Pairs $48.9¢ 10 Pairs No Bid 10 Pairs No Bid 10 Pairs No Bid 10 Pairs $75.00

3C. Traffic Cones-28" High w/Reflective Collars; Service

and Materials Part #2196970 or Approved Equal 50 EA $17.65 50 EA $14.00 §760.00/50 EA No Bid 50 EA No Bid 50 EA $14.99

31, Respirator L 7700 Silicone Half Mask; North Part No.

7701R95L. or Approved Equal 25 EA $18.50 28 EA $16.65 $391.25125 EA $15.99 95 EA No Bid 25 EA No Bid

32. Cartridge-Organic Vapor, North of Approved Equal {160 EA $6.99 100 EA $4.40 $440.001100 EA $11.29 100 EA No Bid 100 EA No Bid

MO RESPONSE. ASSISTANT PUBGHASING AGENT. MALGOLM TYSON DATE; 5255005
_ —INOBIDS. CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE:
- = : _ I DEPT. AUTHORIZATION. DATE:




! BID TAB
IBID NUMBER: 05ITB43812YC W QPENING DATE: S25/2005 | PAGE NUMBFR: 30F 8

BID DESCRIPTION: HARDWARE AND TOOLS

REQUESTING DEPART . PUBLIC WORKS
W«WWMWWW%&W@E} - S : e AR
W %@%ﬁ%@%@ . ( ‘?,/gwwew\,Ww%w ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
mw« z@&ﬁm@%@@%@%a . . TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
&M&%@&%ﬂ%@%&%ﬂ% T - . CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:
... .
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED a7y UNIT S TOTAL Qry UNIT S TOTAL Qry UNITS TOTAL Qry URIT S TOTAL Qry UNIT$ |TOTAL
33. Shovel, Round Point wiFiberglass Handle; Nupia Part
#RP14LPT-E or Approved Equal 10 EA $39.50 10EA $6.38 $63.50110 EA $9.99 10 EA No Bid 10 EA $35.16
34, Shovel, Square Point w/Fiberglass Handle; Nupla Part
#S5P2L-E or Approved Equal 10 EA $31.75 10 EA $6.35 $63.50110 EA §$10.59 10EA No Bid 10 EA $29.31
35. Shovel, Square Point w/ash Wood Hardie; Ames Part )
#1309500 or Approved Equal 20 EA $29.85 20 EA $15.50 $310.00120 EA $4.19 20 EA No Bid 20 EA $12.37
36. Shovel, Round Point w/Ash Wood Handie; Ames Part
#1309500 or Approved Equal 20 EA $22.95 20 EA $15.50 $310.00{20 EA $4.19 20 EA No Bid 20 EA $23.41
37. Drain, Spade, 14"-Sharpshooter; Nupla Fart #55140-
£ or Approved Equal 20 EA $36.50 20EA £11.89 $237.80120 EA $6.69 20 EA No Bid 20 EA $30.43
PART H
CATALOG/PRICE SHEET
COMMUNITY GROUPS
1. Discount off catalog/price shest for Electrical Parts and
Supplies for items not listed above 0% Set per item % *25% No Bid price list will follow
2. Discount off catalog/price sheet for Building and
Carpeniry Supplies for items not listed above 0% Set per item % *25% Na Bid price fist wili follow
3. Discount off catalog/price sheet for Plumbing Supplies
for items not listed above 0% Set per item % *25% No Bid price list will follow
4, Piscount off catalog/price sheet for Lawn and Garden
Supplies for items not listed above 0% Sel per item % *25% No 8id 20%
5. Discount off catalog/price shest for Safety Gear and
Equipment for items not listed above 0-5% Set per flem % *25% Mo Bid 20%
8. Discount off catalog/price sheet for Hand Tools and
General Hardware for items not listed above 0% Set per item % *26% Mo Bid 20%
[ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: MALCOLM TYSON
CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE
DATE




BIiD TAB
| OPENING DATE; 5/25/2005 | PAGE NUMBER4 OF 6

BiD NUMBER: 05iT843812YC

EID DESCRIPTION: HARDWARE AND TOOLS
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS : : 404-730-58
oy g7 i ‘ % 2 3 Xk S y s
ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
2964 Ember Drive, Suite 114A 1721 Marietta Bivd Atlania, | 2672 Whites Mili Road Decatur,
Decatur, GA 30034-1524 GA 30318 GA 30032
TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
404-212-0777 678-725-2608 404-243-0483 404-589-0706
COMNTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTYACT:
- = o - Edward L. Johnson Chris Wells Ronaid Gomez
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED  |QTY UNIT 3 TOTAL Qry Unit $ TOTAL Qry Unit $ TOTAL Qry Lnit$ TOTAL Qry Unit § TOTAL

1. Chainsaw Bar, 20" for Stiht 036; Pant #38822 or
Approved Equal 5EA $30.00 S5EA No Bid 5 EA N Bid
2. Chainsaw Bar Oil, Quart; Stihl Part #6781-516-5003 or
Approved Equal 24 Q18 32.50 24 Qts No Bid 24 Qs No Bid
3. Duct Tape rol-2"; Nashua Pan #398 or Approved Equal{ 200 Roll $3.50 200 Rolls $3.2¢ 200 Rolls $4.34
4. Plastic Gas Cans-21/2 Gal. Seif-Ventilating; Blitz Part
#5081C or Approved Equai 20 EA $4.60 20 EA $2.68 20 EA No Bid
5. Lubricant-W-40, 8oz;Part #10008 or Approved Equal {20 CANS $2.05 20 Cans $1.92 20 Cans $2.87
6. Saw Blades, Cured Concrete 14" x . 125x1"-20MM:;
World Diamond Source, [nc. Part #DC-14-AN/20 or
Approved Equal 20 EA 590.00 20 EA $222.00 20 EA $13.33
7. Saw Blades, Ductile lron 12" x . 125x1%-20 MM; World {20 FA §150.00 20 EA $113.32 2C EA $11.53
8. Concrete Mix, 60 Ib. Bags; Quickcrete Part #1102-60 o7
Approved Equal 100 Bags $3.50 106 Bags No Bid 100 Bags $32.67
9. Mortar Mix, 60 Ib. Bags; Quickcrete Part #1102-60 or
Approved Equal 100 Bags $4.00 100 Bags No Bid 100 Bags No Big
10, Sledge Hammer-Double Faced, 8 Ib.; Ames True
Ternper Part #1187900 or Approved Equal 20 EA 15.00-30.00 20 EA $10.47 20 EA $51.20
11, Rim Ring Tool-30%; Ken-Tool Part #33223-30 or
Approved Equal 5 EA $21.00 5 EA No Bid 5EA No Bid
12. Booster Cables; Heavy Duty 500 Amps, Wire Gauge 4
AW, 25ft Cable length, Carol Part #425ULAC or
Approved Equal 10 Pairs $50.00 10 Pairs $31.38 10 Pairs $37.70
13. Pipe Wrench, Aluminum-36"; Rigid Part #836/31110
or Approved Equal 10 EA $144.00 1O EA $116.02 10 EA $171.98
14, Pipe Wrench-14" Cast lron; Rigid Part #14/31020 or
Approved Equal 20 EA $30.00 20EA $19.85 20 EA $33.53
15, Flashlight, Maghite-3 Celt D; Part #S3D016 or

20 EA $29.00 20 EA $14.74 20 EA $34.60
#1088V700v or Approved Equal 20 EA $32.00 20 EA $30.83 20 EA No Bid
GHAND TOTAL
BIDS MAILED NG RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: MALCOLM TYSON DATE: 5/25/2005
BIDS RECEIVED: NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE:
7 - = {DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TAB

BiD NUMBER: 0SITB43812YC OPENING DATE: 5/25{2005 PAGE NUMBER: 5 OF &
BID DESCRIPTION: HARDWARE AND TOOLS
TMENT: PUBLIC WORKS CONTACT: MALCOLM TYSON 404-730-5819

S A

- iz Grainger itie & Battle Distribution Inc. -
ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS B ol
. - - TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: : =
- - : : : : :
W%MM/MJWMW ywﬁ‘wm\m«»ﬁ%%% 2%;% @WV%@%@M@W@W% MWW%WW%%MM % CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED  IQTY UNIT $ TOTAL Qry UNIT$ ITOTAL QTY UNITS TOTAL ary UNIT § TOTAL ary UNITS [TOTAL
17. Flashlight Lantern w/6V Battery; Eveready Part
#MP10SWBSQP or Approved Equal 30 EA $14.00 30 EA $17.61 30 EA $5.20
18. Pliers, Griplock Jaw; Channel Lock Part #GL10 or
Approved Equai 20 EA $800.00 20 EA $6.51 20 EA $13.28
19. Pliers, Linesman; Channed Lock Part #348 or
Approved Egual 20 EA $22.00 20 EA $15.84 20 EA §8.28
20. Sockat Drive Set, Proto 1/2%; Part #54122 pr
Approved Equal 15 Sets $205.00 15 Seis $141.88 15 Sets $37.11
21. Marking Paint, Inverted, Blue, 18 oz. Cans, Rustoleum
or Approved Equal 200 Cans $4.00 200 Cans $2.34 200 Cans $4.27
22 Silver Paint, 160z Cans; rust-oleum Part #V2115 or
Approved Equal 200 Cans $5.00 200 Cans $3.21 200 Cans $4.67
23. Tape Measure-258"; Lufkin Part #2125 or Approved
Equal 20 EA $17.00 20 EA $11.96 20 EA $18.95
24. Extension Cords, 100", Vok Rating 125, Cord 14
AWG/3; Coleman Cable Part #G01489-00-02 or
Anproved Equal 10 EA $35.00 10 EA $26.46 10 EA $51.30
25, Surveyor Vest, Fluorescent ¥ Yellow, 2X1, Ocrnomix;
Part #Lux-83FS-2X or Approved Equal 100 EA  [33-37.00 100 EA $15.12 190 EA $17.77
26, Mirror, Pyramex Veniure Il Silver: Parl #8B1870S or
Approved Equal 200 EA $6.31 200 EA $4.42 200 EA No Bid
27. Gloves, Condor-Drivers-Leather XL; Part #5AV28 or
Approved Equal 100 Pairs $5.50 100 Pairs $3.63 100 Pairs $2.72
28. Hard Hat, Full Brim 6-Pt. Raichet Suspension; Builard
Part #3038 or Approved Equal 40 EA $12.00 40 EA $3.65 40 EA $10.84
29. Boots, Hip Wader, 32", Steel Toe Size 14; Onguarg
Part #86056 or Approved Equal 10 Pairs $45.00 10 Pairg $20.75 10 Pairs No Bid
30. Traffic Cones-28" High w/Reflective Collars; Service
and Materials Part #2196970 or Approved Equal 50 EA $17.50 50 EA $12.42 50 EA $17.18
31, Respirator L 7700 Silicone Half Mask; North Part No.
7701RY5L. or Approved Equal 25 EA $22.00 25 EA $25.05 25 EA $20.97
32. Cartridge-Organic Vapor, Nerth or Approved Equal  [100 EA $7.00 100 EA $5.55 100 EA $8.51
ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: MALCOLM TYSON DATE 5/25/2005
CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE
- DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE




BID TAB
BID NUMBER: 051TB43812YC | OPENING DATE: 5/26/2005 | PAGE NUMBER: 8 OF &

BID DESCRIPTION: HARDWARE AND TOOLS
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS
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_ m%&%%% %\w@ . TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
. ( ;

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED QY UNIT § TOTAL Qry UNIT § TOTAL ary UNIT$ TOTAL QTy UNIT§ TOTAL Q1Y UNITS ITOTAL
33. Shovel, Round Point wiFiberglass Handle; Nupla Part
#RP14LPT-£ or Approved Equal 10 EA $23.50 10EA $19.58 1GEA $16.18
34, Shovel, Square Point w/Fibergiass Handle; Nupla Part
#3P2L-E or Approved Equal 10 EA $24.00 10 EA $15.64 10 EA $16.18

35, Shovel, Square Point w/ash Wood Handie; Ames Fart
#1309500 or Approved Equal 20EA $13.00 20 EA $15.42 20EA $15.97
36, Shovel, Round Peint w/Ash Wood Handie; Ames Fart
#1309500 or Approved Equal 20 EA $21.00 20EA $13.97 20 EA $14.91
37. Drain, Spade, 14"-Sharpshocter; Nupla Part #5514D-
E or Approved Equal 20 EA $28.50 20 EA $18.18 20 EA No Bid

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS

CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:

PABT I

CATALOG/PRICE SHEET
COMMUNITY GROUPS

1. Discount off catatog/price shest for Electrical Parts and
Supplies for items not listed above 0-20% 0% N/A
2. Discount off catalog/price sheet for Building and
Carpentry Supplies for items not listed above 0-20% 10% N/A
3. Discount off catalog/price sheet for Plumbing Supplies
for items not listed above 0-20% 10% N/A
4. Discount off catalog/price sheet Tor Lawn and Garden
Supplies for fterms not fisted above 0-20% 10% N/A
5, Discount off catalog/price sheet for Safety Gear and
Equipment for items not listed above 0-20% 0% N/A
6. Discournt off catalog/price sheet for Hand Tools and
General Hardware for items not listed abave 0-30% 10% N/A

GRA
BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: MALCOLM TYSON DATE: S125/2005
BiDS RECEIVED: NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE:

T : = e > DEPT, AUTHORIZATION: DATE:
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