BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB45043YC OPENING DATE:  06/29/2005 | |PAGE 1 OF 4
1.VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME
z
o
NAPA AUTO PARTS JOHNSON INDUSTRIES i
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE m
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR §
SERVICES DESIRED z2
ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: % 2
5420 PEACHTREE IND BLVD |5944 PEACHTREE CORNERS EAST NORCROSS, § o
NORCROSS, GA 30071 GA 30071 = 8
22
TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: ’Z’
770-447-8233 770-441-1128 8
CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: %
o
DOUGLAS HOYEM ALEX HORN
VALVE PARTS & EQUIPMENT UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL|QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY NIT| TOTAL
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT $0.00
1. AKRON SERVICE IT #9108 NA NO BID
2. AKRON SERVICE KIT #9125 NA NO BID
3. AKRON SERVICE KIT #9110 NA NO BID
4. AKRON SERVICE KIT #9136 NA NO BID
5. AKRON SERVICE KIT #9127 NA NO BID
6. AKRON #7815, 1 1/2 SWING-OUT VAL NA NO BID
7. AKRON #7825, 2 1/2 SWING-OUT VAL NA NO BID
8. AKRON #7830 3" SWING-OUT VALVE NA NO BID
9. AKRON #7625, 2 1/2 SWING-OUT VAL NA NO BID
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED |NO RESPONSE: 0 ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED: 06/29/2005
BIDSR 2|NO—B|DS: 0 CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE COMPLETED: 07/06/2005
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: COMPLETED BY: LISA MCKINE




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB45043YC OPENING DATE: _ 06/29/2005 | IPAGE 2 OF 4
BID DESCRIPTION: FIRE
DEPARTMENT: [CONTACT: PC #: |

1.VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME % s 2
NAPA AUTO PARTS o8 % 228 z
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE & )§> mo % m g z
=1 [Z ]
VALVE PARTS & EQUIPMENT UNIT$ TOTAL QTY UNIT$ TOTAL QTY UNIT$ TOTAL|QTY UNIT$ TOTAL QTY NIT| TOTAL
PRECENTAGE DISCOUNT $0.00
1. AKRON SERVICE IT #9108 NA NO BID
2. AKRON SERVICE KIT #9125 NA NO BID
3. AKRON SERVICE KIT #9110 NA NO BID
4. AKRON SERVICE KIT #9136 NA NO BID
5. AKRON SERVICE KIT #9127 NA NO BID
6. AKRON #7815, 1 1/2 SWING-OUT VAL NA NO BID
7. AKRON #7825, 2 1/2 SWING-OUT VAL NA NO BID
8. AKRON #7830 3" SWING-OUT VALVE NA NO BID
9. AKRON #7625, 2 1/2, SWING-OUT VAL NA NO BID
PUMP PARTS & EQUIPMENT
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT $0.00 NO BID
1 AKRON #30 PITOT GAUGE NA NO BID
2. AKRON #33 TEST GAUGE NA NO BID
3. AKRON #34 TEST GAUGE NA NO BID
4. AKRON #9015 WATER FLOW TEST NA NO BID
5. AKRON #90, 1 1/2-2 1/2 DIE MODEL NA NO BID
6. AKRON #91, 1 1/2-2 1/2 TAP MODEL NA NO BID




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB45043YC OPENING DATE:  06/29/2005 | IPAGE 30F 4
1.VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME % s 2
NAPA AUTO PARTS JOHNSON INDUSTRIES o2 % 5<% z
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE & )§> mo % m g z
=1 [Z ]
UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL|QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY NIT| TOTAL
7. AKRON #75, 1 3/4 EXPANDER NA NO BID
8. AKRON #75, 5" EXPANDER NA NO BID
9. AKRON #89 HOSE CUTTER NA NO BID
AUTOMOBILE REPAIR PARTS

1. 42MT STARTER, REBUILT, SUCH 91-01-4166 $181.50 428000-1211 DENSO $247.75

WILSON
2. WATER PUMP, REBUILT RW1191X $85.12 NO BID

MIDLAND
3. VALVE COVER GASKET SET, VS39756 V539756 $5.99 NO BID

VICTOR
4. INJECTOR PUMP, NEW NA NO BID
5. BRAKE PADS EATON GN4311EG $31.68 NO BID

MIDLAND
6. OIL FILTER WIX 51799 1799 $17.68 LF3883 FLEETGUARD $10.89

1799/NAPA WIX
7. AIR FILTER, WIX 42253 2253 $31.50 AF979 FLEETGUARD $19.14

NAPA WIX
8. 1157 LIGHT BULBS 1157 $0.20 1157-GEN GE $0.21

WAGNER
9. HEADLIGHT NO. H4656 H4656 $3.07 H4656-GEN GE $3.45

WAGNER
10. FLASHER, HEAVY DUTY 50-262 $6.48 537-SIG SIGNAL STAT $7.49

TRUCK LITE

11. VALVE COVER FOR 1996 FORD V550311 $16.88 VS50462R FELPRO $33.29
12. HEATER A/C CONTROL NA NO BID
13. ELECTRIC FUEL SHUTOFF NA NO BID




BID TABULATION SHEET

‘PAGE 40F 4

BID NUMBER: 05ITB45043YC OPENING DATE:  06/29/2005 ‘
1.VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME % z < =
[eR=RuNY
NAPA AUTO PARTS JOHNSON INDUSTRIES z g 3 § § §
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE ’_’. rIn a 2
07 m
UNIT$ TOTAL QTY UNIT$ TOTAL QTY UNIT$ TOTAL|QTY UNIT$ TOTAL QTY NIT| TOTAL
14. WINDOW REGULATOR 1994 CROWN 665-3706 $46.49 NO BID
BALK AMP
15. DOOR HANDLE CABLE 1991 F-800 NA NO BID
16. HEATER A/C CONTROL 1996 CONT NA NO BID
17. COOLANT EXPANSION TANK 1996 NA NO BID
18. OIL COOLER 1979 C-800 WITH 3208 NA NO BID
19. ELECTRONIC TRANS SENDING UNIT NA NO BID
20. ANTI-LOCK BRAKE CONTROLLER NA NO BID
21. ANTI-LOCK BRAKE CONTROLLR NA NO BID
1993 SUBURBAN
22. HEATER A/C CONTROL HC 104 $10.99 15-72547 AC DELCO $85.58
1997 SUBURBAN ECHLIN
1 DISTANCE/ MILES FROM
5890 PLUMMER RD SW ATLANTA 4 MILES
2. CAN PROVIDE DELIVERY WITHIN 1
3. VENDOR AGREES TO EXTEND USE YES
OF THIS CONTRACT UNDER SAME
TERMS AND CONDITIONS




