BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 051TB47320YB-CC |OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 1 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: pC#

1.VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

5. VENDOR NAME

GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC.

[SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC

LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY

[COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES

DESIRED
JADDRESS ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS:
P.O. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE. NON RESPONSIVE VENDORS|
ROSSVILLE, GA. 30741-0458 [ATLANTA,GA. 30336 MARIETTA, GA 30066 ATLANTA, GA. 30318 AND OTHER INFORMATION
TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
ICONTACT: [CONTACT: (CONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON
1.TROUSERS
DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO | PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO | PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
1. A.100% POLYSTER TROUSERS
MEN'S (1A2) (1A2) (1A3) NO BID (1A1) MARTINS (1A2) 21248 (1A3) $27.75 (1A1) (1A2) (1A3) NO BID (1A1) FECHHEIMER (1A2) UD3900 (1A3) $32.00
WOMEN'S (1A4) (1A5) (1A6) NO BID (1A4) MARTINS (1A5) 21448 (1A6) $27.75 (1A4) (1A5) (1A6) NO BID (1A4) FECHHEIMER (1A5) UD3933 (1A6) $32.00
B.75% DACRON/25% WOOL BLEND TROUSERS
MEN'S (181) (182) (1B3) NO BID (181) MARTINS (182) 21818 (1B3) $43.55 (181) (182) (1B3) NO BID (181) FECHHEIMER (1B2) 42280 (183) $55.00
WOMEN'S (184) (185) (186) NO BID (184) MARTINS (185) 21898 (1B6) $43.55 (184) (1B5) (1B6) NO BID (1B4) FECHHEIMER (1B5) 42290 (186) $55.00
C. SIX POCKET UNIFORM TROUSER - 65%
POLYESTER/35% COTTON BLEND
MEN'S (ac1) (1c2) (1C3) NO BID (1C1) MARTINS (1C2) 33148 (1C3) $35.15 (acy) (1c2) (1C3) NO BID (1C1) FECHHEIMER (1C2) UD49300 (1C3) $45.00
WOMEN'S (1c4) (1C5) (1C6) NO BID (1C4) MARTINS (1C5) 33148 (1C6) $35.15 (1c4) (1c5) (1C6) NO BID (1C4) FECHHEIMER (1C5) UD49350 (1C6) $45.00
D. SIX POCKET UNIFORM TROUSER- 70%
POLYESTER/28% RAYON/2% LYCRA BLEND
MEN'S (1D1) (1D2) (1D3) NOBID (1D1) FECH (1D2) 39300 (1D3) $72.95 (1D1) (1D2) (1D3) NOBID (1D1) FECHHEIMER (1D2) 39300 (1D3) $71.00
WOMEN'S (104) (1D5) (106) NO BID (1D4) FECH (1D5) 39300 (106) $72.95 (1D4) (1D5) (106) NO BID (1D4) FECHHEIMER (1D5) 39350 (106) $71.00
E. MOTORCYCLE STYLE RIDING PANTS 75%
POLYESTER/25% WOOL BLEND
MEN'S (1E1) (1E2) (1E3) NO BID (1E))MARTINS (1E2) 21508 (1E3)$159.95 (1E1) (1E2) (1E3) NO BID (1E1) PETER JAY (1E2) 1851 (1E3) $142.00
WOMEN'S (1E4) (1E5) (1E6) NO BID (1E4) MARTINS (1E5) 21508 (1E6) $159.95 (1E4) (1E5) (1E6) NO BID (1E4) PETER JAY (1E5) 1851 (1E6) $142.00
F. BICYCLE PANTS-OLYMPIC UNIFORMS
MODEL OCP588S
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED 443[NO RESPONSE: 0|ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: Charlie Crockett COMPLETED BY DARLENE MCCRARY.
BIDS RECEIVED: 4|NO-BIDS: O|CHIEF ASSISTANT:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC |OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 2 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: pC#

1.VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

5. VENDOR NAME

GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC.

[SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC

LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY

[COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111

VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES
" " " " NON RESPONSIVE VENDORS|
[ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: P A ey
P.O. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
- ATI ANTA.GA. 30336 MARIETTA, GA 3006€ ATLANTA, GA. 3031
[ TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
CONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: (CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON
MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
MEN'S (F1) (1F2) (1F3) NO BID (1F1) OLYMPIC (1F2) OCP5885 |(1F3) $114.95 (1F1) (1F2) (1F3) NO BID (1F1) OLYMPIC (1F2) 0CP5885 (1F3) $95.00
WOMEN'S (1F4) (1F5) (1F6) NO BID (1F4) oL YMPIC (1F5) OCP5885 |(1F6) $114.95 (1F4) (1F5) (1F6) NO BID (1F4) oL YMPIC (1F5) 0CP5885 (1F6) $85.00
G. BICYCLE SHORTS - OLYMPIC UNIFORMS
HOLLYWOOD SHORTS, MODEL OHS147
MEN'S (161) (162) (1G3) NO BID (1G1) OLYMPIC (1G2) OHS147 (1G3) $74.57 (161) (162) (1G3) NOBID (1G1) OLYMPIC (1G2) OH5147 (1G3) $60.00
WOMEN'S (164) (1G5) (1G6) NO BID (1G4) OLYMPIC (1G5) OHS148 (1G6) $74.57 (1G4) (1G5) (1G6) NO BID (1G4) OLYMPIC (1G5) OH5147 (1G6) $52.00
H. UTILY TROUSERS-ROYAL ROBBINS 5.11
TACTICAL PLANT
MEN'S (1H1) (1H2) (1H3) NO BID (1H1) MARTINS (1H2) 33072 (1H3) $51.25 (1H1) (1H2) (1H3) NO BID (1H1) 511 TACT (1H2) 74251-055 (1H3) $39.50
WOMEN'S (1H4) (1H5) (1H6) NO BID (1H4) MARTINS (1H5) 33072 (1H6) $51.25 (1H4) (1H5) (1H6) NO BID (1H4) 511 TACT (1H5) 64355-055 (1H6) $39.50
I. SUPERVISOR TROUSER ) (112) (113) NO BID (112) (12) (113) (112) (112) (113) NO BID (112) RICE (112) AIC325 (113) $6.00
2. SHIRTS
DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO | PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO | PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
2 A.100% POLYSTER, SHORT SLEEVE
MEN'S |(2A1) (2A2) (2A3) NO BID (2A1) MARTINS |(2A2) 22464 (2A3) $15.75 (2A1) (2A2) (2A3) NO BID (2A1) FLYING CROSS (2A2) 87R78862 |(2A3) $33.00
WOMEN'S (2A4) (2A5) (2A6) NO BID (2A4) MARTINS (2A5)22454 (2A6) $15.75 (2A4) (2A5) (2A6) NO BID (2A4) FLYING CROSS (2A5) 177R78862 (2A6) $33.00
B. 100% POLYSTER, LONG SLEEVE
MEN'S (281) (282) (283) NO BID (2B1) MARTINS (2B2) 23424 (2B3) $18.75 (281) (282) (2B3) NO BID (2B1) FLYING CROSS (2B2) 34W78862 (283) $35.00
WOMEN'S |29 (285) (286) NO BID (2B4) MARTINS (2B5)23454 (2B6) $18.75 (2B4) (2B5) (2B6) NO BID (2B4) FLYING CROSS (2B5) 127178862 |(286) $35.00
C. 75% POLYESTER/25% WOOL BLEND
SHORT SLEEVE
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED 443[NO RESPONSE: 0|ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: Charlie Crockett COMPLETED BY DARLENE MCCRARY.
BIDS RECEIVED: 4|NO-BIDS: O|CHIEF ASSISTANT:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC |OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 3 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: pC#

1.VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

5. VENDOR NAME

GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC.

[SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC

LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY

[COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111

VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES
[ADDRESS ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: e RS VR EEES
AND OTHER INFORMATION
P.O. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
[ TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
ICONTACT: [CONTACT: (CONTACT: (CONTACT: (CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON
MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO | PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO | PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
MEN'S |ecn) (2c2) (2c3) NOBID (2C1) MARTINS (2c2) 22818 (2C3) $39.98 (2c1) (2c2) (2c3) NOBID (2C1) FLYING CROSS (2C2) 57R87867 |(2c3) $48.00
WOMEN'S (2c4) (1c5) (1C6) NO BID (2C4) MARTINS (1C5) 23858 (1C6) $39.98 (2c4) (1c5) (1C6) NO BID (2C4) FLYING CROSS (1C5) 157R87862 (1C6) $48.00
D. SIX POCKET UNIFORM TROUSER- 70%
POLYESTER/28% RAYON/2% LYCRA BLEND
MEN'S |2p1) (202) (2D3) NOBID (2D1) MARTINS (202) 23818 (2D3) $44.98 (201) (202) (2D3) NOBID (2C1) FLYING CROSS (2D2) 07W82867 |(203) $55.00
WOMEN'S (204) (205) (2D6) NO BID (2D4) MARTINS (25) 23858 (2D6) $44.98 (204) (205) (2D6) NO BID (2C4) FLYING CROSS (2D5)107W8762 (2D6) $55.00
E. UNIFORM POLO SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE-
COOL MAX, SHORT SLEEVE
MEN'S |2E1) (2E2) (2E3) NO BID (2E1) OLYMPIC (2E2)CMA252 (2E3) $93.78 (2E1) (2E2) (2E3) NO BID (2E1) BLAUER (2E2) 8130 (2E3) $51.00
WOMEN'S (2E4) (2E5) (2E6) NO BID (2E4) OPLYMPIC (2E5) CMA252 (2E6) $93.78 (2E4) (2E5) (2E6) NO BID (2E4) BLAUER (2E5) 8130 (2E6) $51.00
F. UNIFORM POLO SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE-
COOL MAX, LONG SLEEVE
MEN'S |eF) (2F2) (2F3) NO BID (2F1) OLYMPIC (2F2) CMS258 (2F3) $97.63 (2F1) (2F2) (2F3) NO BID (2F1) BLAUER (2F2) 8140 |(2F3) $54.00
WOMEN'S (2F4) (2Fs) (2F6) NO BID (2F4) OPLYMPIC (2F5) CMs258 (2F6) $97.63 (2F4) (2Fs) (2F6) NO BID (2F4) BLAUER (2Fs) 8140 (2F6) $54.00
G. BIKE PATROL/K-* SHIRTYCLE SHORT
SLEEVE-COOL MAX SHIRT, WITH REFLECTIVE
STRIPING AND "POLICE" ON BACK
MEN'S (261) (262) (263) NO BID (261) OLYMPIC (2G2) CBP515 (2G3) $66.89 (261) (262) (263) NO BID (261) BLAUER (262) 81304 (2G3) $59.00
WOMEN'S FGM (265) (2G6) NO BID (2G4) OLYMPIC (2G5) CBP815 (2G6) $66.89 (264) (265) (2G6) NO BID (2G4) BLAUER (2G5) 81304 ’gcs) $59.00
GRAND TOTAL
BIDS MAILED |NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:
BIDS RECEIVED: NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE COMPLETED:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 4 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: PC#
TVENDOR NAWE 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4 VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME
GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC [SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY [COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES
DESIRED
[ADDRESS ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: e
P.0. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR SW. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
TELEPHONE TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
CONTACT CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON
MFGT MODEL NO MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
H. BIKE PATROL/K-9 SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE-
COOL MAX SHIRT, WITH REFLECTIVE STRIPING
AND ‘POLICE' ON BACK
MEN'S (2H1) (2H2) (2H3) NO BID (2H1) OLYMPIC (2H2) BP59448 |(2H3) $73.00 (2H1) (2H2) (2H3) NO BID (2H1) BLAUER (2H2) 8140-4 (2H3) $63.00
WOMEN'S |@Ha) (2H5) (2H6) NO BID (2H4) PLYMPIC |(2Hs) BPSOA4s _|(2H6) $73.00 (2H4) (2H5) (2H6) NO BID (2H4) BLAUER (2H5) 8140-4 |26 s63.00
|. FORM FIT MOISTURE WICKING UNDERSHIRT
MEN'S lem (212) (213) NO BID (211) NO BID |@2) no BID (213) NO BID (211) UNDER ARMOUR (212) 5039 (213) $15.00 (211) UNDER ARMOR (212) 5039 |@3) s21.00
WOMEN'S (214) (215) (216) NO BID (214) NO BID (215) NO BID (216) NO BID (214) UNDER ARMOUR (215) 5039 (216) $15.00 (214) UNDER ARMOR (215) 5039 (216) $21.00
J. LOOSE FIT MOISTURE WICKING UNDERSHIRT
MEN'S (231) (232) (233) NO BID (231) NO BID (202) NOBID (233) NO BID (231) UNDER ARMOUR (232) 5084 (233) $18.00 (231) UNDER ARMOR (232) 5084 (233) $24.50
WOMEN'S |@39) (235) (236) NO BID (234) NO BID |@35) N0 BID (236) NO BID (2J4) UNDER ARMOUR (235) 5084 (236) $18.00 (234) UNDER ARMOR (235) 5084 |236) s24.50
K POLO SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE-PIQUE POLO
100% COTTON
MEN'S (2k1) (2k2) (2K3) NO BID (2K1)OUTER BANKS (2k2) 2100 (2K3)$11.75 (2k1) (2k2) (2K3) NO BID (2K 1) OUTER BANKS (2k2) 2100 (2K3) $21.00
WOMEN'S (2k4) (2ks) (2K6) NO BID (2K4)OUTERBANKS (2Ks) 2100 (2k6) $11.75 (2k4) (2Ks) (2K6) NO BID (2K4) OUTER BANKS (2K5) 2100 (2K6) $21.00
3. JACKS AND COATS
DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
A.BOMBER STYLE JACKET
MEN'S (3A1) (32) (3A3) NO BID (3A1) SPIEWAK (3A2) S310 (3A3) $107.25 (3A1) (3A2) (3A3) NO BID (3A1) FECHHEIMER (3A2) 58100 (3A3) $109.50
WOMEN'S (3A4) (3A5) (3A6) NO BID (3A4) SPIEWAK (3A5) 310 (3A6) $107.25 (3n9) (3A5) (3A6) NO BID (3A4) FECHHEIMER (3A5) 58100WM (3A6) $109.50
GRAND TOTAL
BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:
BIDS RECEIVED NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE COMPLETED:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC |OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 5 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: PC #

TVENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 7 VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME
GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC [SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC AW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY [COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES
[ADDRESS ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: P ey
.0 BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
CONTACT. CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON
MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH QTY NIT| TOTAL
B. MA-1 STYLE FLIGHT JACKET
MEN'S (381) (382) (383) NO BID (381) SPIEWAK (382) MA-L (383) $99.99 (381) (382) (383) NO BID (381) SPIEWAK (382) SMA-1 (383) $42.00
WOMEN'S (384) (385) (386) NO BID (384) SPIEWAK (385) MA-L (386) $99.99 (384) (385) (386) NO BID (384) SPIEWAK (385) SMA-1 (386) $42.00
_C LEATHER
UNIFORM JACKET
MEN'S (3c1) (3c2) (3C3) NO BID (3c1) TAYLOR (3c2) (3C3) $475.50 (3c1) (3c2) (3C3) NO BID (3c1) TAYLOR (3c2) 4418 (3C3) $410.00
WOMEN'S (3c4) (3c5) (3C6) NO BID (3c4) TAYLOR (3c5) (3C6) $475.50 (3c4) (3c5) (3C6) NO BID (3c4) TAYLOR (3C5) 4418WM (3C6) $325.00
D. DRESS BLOUSE COAT
MEN'S (301) (3D2) (3D3) NO BID (3D1) FECH (302) (3D3) $205.65 (3p1) (3D2) (3D3) NO BID (3D1) FECHHEIMER (3D2) 34801 (3D3) $185.00
WOMEN'S (304) (3D5) (3D6) NO BID (3D4) FECH (305) (3D6) $205.65 (3D4) (3D5) (36) NO BID (3D4) FECHHEIMER (3D5) 3489 WM (3D6) $160.00
E. LEATHER MOTORYCLE JACKET
MEN'S (3E1) (3E2) (3E3) NO BID (3E1) TAYLOR (3£2) (3E3)$478.55 (3E1) (3E2) (3E3) NO BID (3E1) TAYLOR (3E2) 44732 (3£3) $335.00
WOMEN'S (3E4) (3E5) (3E6) NO BID (3E4) TAYLOR (3E5) (3E6)$478.55 (3E4) (3E5) (3E6) NO BID (3E4) TAYLOR (3E5) 44732 (3E6) $325.00
F. WINDBREAKER
MEN'S (3F1) (3F2) (3F3) NO BID (3F1) MARTINS (3F2) 24558 (3F3) $13.45 (3F1) (3F2) (3F3) NO BID (3F1) HARTWELL (3F2) 201A (3F3) $21.50
WOMEN'S (3F4) (3F5) (3F6) NO BID (3F4) MARTINS (3F5) 24558 (3F6) $13.45 (3F4) (3F5) (3F6) NO BID (3F4) HARTWELL (3F5) 201A (3F6) $21.50
G. WINDBREAKER, WITH IMPRINT ON BACK
MEN'S (361) (362) (363) NO BID (3G1) MARTINS (3G2) 24558 (3G3) $17.95 (361) (362) (363) NO BID (3G1) HARTWELL (3G2) 201A (3G3) $24.50
WOMEN'S (364) (365) (366) NO BID (364) MARTINS (3G5) 2488/ (366) $17.95 (364) (365) (366) NO BID (364) HARTWELL (3G5) 201A (3G6) $24.50
GRAND TOTAL
BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT. DATE RECIEVED:
BIDS RECEIVED: NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE COMPLETED:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC |OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 6 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: P

1.VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

5. VENDOR NAME

GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC.

[SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC

LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY

[COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111

VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES
DESIRED NON RESPONSIVE VENDORS|
[ADDRESS ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: SNDOTLERIBECRMATIDN
P.0. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR SW. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
TELEPHONE TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
CONTACT. CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON
MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
H. BIKE PATROL JACKET-OLYMPIC NEW YORK
ZIP SLEEVE JACKET, MODEL ONY673
MEN'S (3H1) (3H2) (3H3) NO BID (3H1) OMPLYIC (3H2) ONY673 (3H3) $170.60 (3H1) (3H2) (3H3) NO BID (3H1) OLYMPIC (3H2) ONY673 (3H3) $170.00
WOMEN'S (3H4) (3H5) (3H6) NO BID (3H4) OMPLIC (3H5) ONK673 (3H6) $170.60 (3H4) (3H5) (3H6) NO BID (3H4) OLYMPIC (3H5) ONY673WM (3H6) $160.00
4. RAINWEAR AND OUTWEAR
DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
A. 48 INCH REVERSIBLE COLOR RAIN COAT
W/HOOD
MEN'S (4A1) (4A2) (4A3) NO BID (4A1) SPIEWAK (4A2) 5309V (4A3) $79.95 (4A1) (4A2) (4A3) NO BID (4A1) NEESE (4A2) 447RSC (4A3) $46.50
WOMEN'S (4A4) (4A5) (4A6) NO BID (4A4) SPIEWAK (4A5) 5309V (4A6) $79.95 (4A4) (4A5) (4A6) NO BID (4A4) NEESE (4A5) 447RSC (4A6) $46.50
B. 30 INCH REVERSIBLE COLOR RAIN JACKET
W/HOOD
MEN'S (4B1) (4B2) (4B3) NO BID (4B1) SPIEWAK (4B2) 5308V (4B3) $72.25 (4B1) (4B2) (4B3) NO BID (4B1) NEESE (4B2) 447RS) (4B3) $31.00
WOMEN'S (4B4) (4B5) (4B6) NO BID (4B4) SPIEWAK (4B5) 5308V (4B6) $72.25 (4B4) (4B5) (4B6) NO BID (4B4) NEESE (4B5) 447RSJ (4B6) $31.00
C. WATERPROOF BREATHABLE ALL
WEATHER COAT
MEN'S (ac1) (ac2) (4C3) NO BID (4C1) SPIEWAK (4c2) 1775 (4C3) $267.50 (4c1) (4c2) (4C3) NO BID (4C1) FECHHEIMER (4c2) 78140 (4C3) $260.00
WOMEN'S (4c4) (4c5) (4C6) NO BID (4C4) SPIEWAK (4C5) 1775 (4C6) $267.50 (4c4) (4c5) (4C6) NO BID (4C4) FECHHEIMER (4C5) 78140WM (4C6) $205.00
D. WATERPROOF BREATHABLE ALL
WEATHER TROUSERS
GRAND TOTAL
BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:
BIDS RECEIVED NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE COMPLETED:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION. DATE




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC |OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 7 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: pC#
1.VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME
GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC. LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY [COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES R
3 3 5 3 NON
[ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: AND OTHER INFORMATION
P.O. BOX 458 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
[ TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
CONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET KYLE PIPPIN \WILLIAM JOHNSON
MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
MEN'S (4D1) (4D2) (4D3) NO BID (4D1) SPIEWAK (4D2) 1755 (4D3) $118.40 (4D1) (4D2) (4D3) NO BID (4D1) FECHHEIMER (4D2) 78200 (4D3) $135.00
WOMEN'S (4D4) (4D5) (4D6) NO BID (4D4) SPIEWAK (4D5) 1755 (4D6) $118.40 (4D4) (4D5) (4D6) NO BID (4D4) FECHHEIMER (4D5) 78200 (4D6) $115.00
E. MOTORCYCLE RAIN JACKET
MEN'S (4E1) (4E2) (4E3) NO BID (4E1) NEESE (4E2) (4E3) $53.35 (4E1) (4E2) (4E3) NO BID (4E1) NEESE (4E2) 475M MID (4E3) $37.50
WOMEN'S (4E4) (4E5) (4E6) NO BID (4E4) NEESE (4E5) (4E6) $53.35 (4E4) (4E5) (4E6) NO BID (4E4) NEESE (4E5) 475MID (4E6) $36.00
F. MOTORCYCLE RAIN TROUSERS
MEN'S (4F1) (4F2) (4F3) NO BID (4F1) NEESE (4F2) (4F3) $34.30 (4F1) (4F2) (4F3) NO BID (4F1) NEESE (4F2) 475PID (4F3) $29.50
WOMEN'S (4F4) (4F5) (4F6) NO BID (4F4) NEESE (4F5) (4F6) $34.30 (4F4) (4F5) (4F6) NO BID (4F4) NEESE (4F5) 475PID (4F6) $29.50
5. SWEATERS
DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
A. SWEATER-RIB KNIT
W/HOOD
MEN'S |(_5Al) &AZ) &AG) NO BID |(5A1) AMERICAN AERO |(_5A2) B4000 &AZ) $48.75 EAl) &AZ) &AZ) NO BID EAl) FECHEIMER (5A2) 00700 |§A3) $45.50
WOMEN'S (5A4) (5A5) (5A6) NO BID (5A4) AMERICAN AERO _ [(5A5) B4000 (5A6) $48.75 (5A4) (5A5) (5A6) NO BID (5A4) FECHEIMER (5A5) 00700 (5A6) $45.50
B. SWEATER-JERSEY KNIT
MEN'S (5B1) (5B2) (5B3) NO BID (5B1) AMERICAN AERO _ [(5B2) B6000 (5B3) $47.25 (5B1) (5B2) (5B3) NO BID (5B1) FECHEIMER (5B2) 00820 (5B3) 50.00
WOMEN'S (5B4) (5B5) (5B6) NO BID (5B4) AMERICAN AERO  [(5B5) B6000 (5B6) $47.25 (5B4) (5B5) (5B6) NO BID (5B4) FECHEIMER (5B5) 00820 (5B6) $50.00
6. HATS AND HAT ACCESSORIES
DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
HATS:
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: [ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:

BIDS RECEIVED:

[NO-BIDS:

|CH\EF ASSISTANT:

|DATE COMPLETED:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 051TB47320YB-CC OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 8 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: P #

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES
DESIRED

1.VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

5. VENDOR NAME

GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC.

[SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC

LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY

[COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

[VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

ION RESPONSIVE VENDORS

|ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: 'AND OTHER INFORMATION
P.O. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
[ TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
ICONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON
MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
A.4 STAR CAP |6a1) |(6A2) |(6A3) NO BID (6A1) MIDWAY |(6A2) |(6A3) $44.50 (6A1) |(6A2) |(6A3) NO BID (6A1) MIDWAY |(6A2) 4-STAR |(6A3) $36.50
B. 4 STAR CAP W/WREATH (6B1) (682) (6B3) NO BID I(:Bn MIDWAY (6B2) (6B3) $81.88 I(:Bn (682) (6B3) NO BID I(:Bn MIDWAY (6B2) 4-STAR EMB (6B3) $45.00
C. TROOPER STYLE FUR HAT |6c1) |(6c2) |(6C3) NO BID (6C1) |(6c2) |(6C3) $16.55 (6C1) |(6c2) |(6C3) NO BID (6C1) ALBOUR |(6c2) FTAN (6C3) $16.50
D. 4 STAR CAP RAIN (6D1) (6D2) (6D3) NO BID (6D1) MIDWAY (6D2) (6D3) $2.45 (6D1) (6D2) (6D3) NO BID (6D1) PREMIER (6D2) (6D3) $3.00
7. CLOTHING ACCESSORIES
DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
A. TRAFFIC VEST (7A1) (7A2) (7A3) NO BID (7A1) CAROLINA SAFETY |(7A2) HV34SPR _|(7A3) $18.15 (7A1) (7A2) (7A3) NO BID (7A1) SAFETY FLAY (7A2) BLUE PD (7A3) $26.00
B. TRAFFIC VEST, ANSI CLASS 1 (7B81) (7B2) (7B3) NO BID (7B1) SPIEWAK (7B2) ANSI | (7B3) $38.45 (7B1) (7B2) (7B3) NO BID (7B1) SPIEWAK (7B2) 5900 (7B3) $46.50
C. TRAFFIC VEST, ANSI CLASS 2 (7c1) (7C2) (7C3) NO BID (7C1) SPOEWAK (7C2) ANSI I (7C3) $41.50 (7c1) (7c2) (7C3) NO BID (7C1) SPIEWAK (7C2) 5911 (7C3) $49.50
D. SOCKS,NKYLON (7D1) (7D2) (7D3) NO BID (7D1) MARTINS (7D2) 26626 (7D3) $3.75 (7D1) (7D2) (7D3) NO BID (7D1) JEFFERIES (7D2) 1075 (7D3) $3.25
E. SOCKS, HYPO-ALLERGENIC SOLE (7E1) (7E2) (7E3) NO BID (7E1) WEINBREENER __|(7E2) (7E3) $7.15 (7E1) (7E2) (7E3) NO BID (7E1) JEFFERIES (7E2) 1025 (TE3) $4.25
F. DRESS GLOVES, WHITE (7F1) (7F2) (7F3) NO BID (7F1) MARTINS (7F2) 26620 (7F3) $1.70 (7F1) (7F2) (7F3) NO BID (7F1) HATCH (7F2) WG1000 (7F3) $3.25
G. LEATHER (761) (762) (7G3) NO BID (7G1) HATCH (7G2)SCAOP (7G3) $19.55 (7G1) HATCH (7G2) SG20P (7G3) $16.05 (7G1) HATCH (7G2) SG20P (7G3) $17.00
H. TRAFFIC GLOVES (7H1) (7H2) (7H3) NO BID (7H1) HAMBURG (7H2) DTL (7H3) $8.95 (7H1) POLYGRENFEX (7H2) 3115 (7H3) $9.95 (7H1) DARMASCU (7H2) 3115 (7H3) $5.50
I. REFLECTIVE TRAFFIC GLOVES (711) (712) (713) NO BID (711) HATCH (712) (713) $13.40 (711) HATCH (712) DNR100 (713) $9.50 (711) DARMASCU (712) DNR100 (713) $14.50
J. MOTORCYCLE GLOVES (731) (732) (733) NO BID (791) HATCH (732) (733) $20.35 (791) HATCH (7J2) LR10 (733) $15.99 (71) HATCH (7J2) LR10 (733) $21.00
K. MOTORCYCLE GAUNTLETS-HATCH SG26G (7K1) (7K2) (7K3) NO BID (7K1) HATCH (7K2) SG26G (7K3) $28.60 (7K1) HATCH (7K2) SG26G (7K3) $21.25 (7K1) HATCH (7K2) G266 (7K3) $23.50
L. NECKTIE, CLIP ON (7L1) (7L2) (7L.3) NO BID (7L1) MARTINS (7L2) 26491 (7L3) $2.75 (7L1) (7L2) (7L.3) NO BID (7L1) SAM BROOME (7L2) 900 (7L3) $3.50
M. CROSS OVER STYLE TIE, SNAP (7M1 (7M2) (7M3) NO BID (7M1) MARTINS (TM2) 26631 (7M3) $2.75 (7M1) (7M2) (7M3) NO BID (7M1) SAM BROOME (7M2) 40080 (TM3) $3.50
N. DICKIE (7N1) (7N2) (7N3) NO BID (7N1) WATERBURY (7N2) 16816 (7N3) $5.35 (7N1) (7N2) (7N3) NO BID (7N1) SAM BROOME (7N2) PD50 (7N3) $7.00
0. METAL BUTTONS (701) (702) (703) NO BID (701) WATERBUY (702) (703) .85 (701) (702) (703) NO BID (701) WATER BORY (702) FULTON (703) $.75
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED |NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:
BIDS RECEIVED: |NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE COMPLETED:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC |OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 9 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: P #
1.VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME
GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC. [SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY [COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES
DESIRED NON RESPONSIVE VENDORS|
[ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: AND OTHER INFORMATION
P.O. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
[ TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
ICONTACT: [CONTACT: (CONTACT: (CONTACT: (CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON
8. PATCHES, INSIGNIA, NAMEPLATE AND BADGES
DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
A. FULTON COUNTY POLICE SHOULDER PATCH |8 |8A2) |(8A3) NO BID (8A1) MARTINS |(8A2) |(8A3) $1.49 (8A1) |(8A2) |(8A3) NO BID (8A1) FL. EMBROIDERY _|(8A2) F1 |(8A3) $1.75
B.F.C.P.D. SHOULDER PATCH WITH SWAT TEAM ROCKER (881) (882) (883) NO BID (881) MARTINS (882) (8B3) $1.58 (881) (882) (883) NO BID (8B1) FL. EMBROIDERY _[(8B2) F2 (8B3) $1.50
C.F.CP.D. SHOULDER PATCH WITH SWAT TEAM ROCKER-SUBDUED |8 |8c2) |(8c3) NO BID (8C1) MARTINS |(8c2) |(8C3) $1.49 (8C1) |(8c2) |(8c3) NO BID (8C1) FL. EMBROIDERY _|(8C2) F3 |8c3) $1.50
D. FULTON CO. SECURITY SHOULDER PATCH (8D1) (8D2) (8D3) NO BID (8D1) MARTINS (8D2) (8D3) $1.49 (8D1) (8D2) (8D3) NO BID (8D1) FL. EMBROIDERY _ |(8D2) F4 (8D3) $2.00
E. FULTON CO. CRIME SCRENE UNIT SHOULDER PATCH |8E1) (8E2) |(8€3) NO BID (8E1) MARTINS (8E2) |(8E3) $1.49 (8E1) (8E2) |(8€3) NO BID (8E1) FL. EMBROIDERY _|(8E2) F5 (8E3) $2.00
F. FULTON CO. CROSSING GUARD SHOULDER PATCH (8F1) (8F2) (8F3) NO BID (8F1) MARTINS (8F2) (8F3) $1.49 (8F1) (8F2) (8F3) NO BID (8F1) FL. EMBROIDERY _ |(8F2) F6 (8F3) $2.00
G. BADGE PATCH |8c1) |(852) |(8G3) NO BID (8G1) MARTINS |(8G2) |(8G3) $1.40 (8G1) |852) |(863) NO BID (8G1) FL. EMBROIDERY _|(8G2) F7 |(8G3) $1.50
H. POLICE OFFICER Il SLEEVE INSIGNIA (8H1) (8H2) (8H3) NO BID (8H1) MARTINS (8H2) (8H3) $1.35 (8H1) (8H2) (8H3) NO BID (8H1) FL. EMBROIDERY _ |(8H2) F8 (8H3) $1.30
I. DECTECTIVE | SLEEVE INSIGNIA |81) |(812) |(813) NO BID (811) MARTINS |812) |(813) $1.35 (1) |(812) |(813) NO BID (811) FL. EMBROIDERY __|(812) 9 |(813) $1.30
J. DECTECTIVE Il SLEEVE INSIGNIA (8J1) (8J2) (8J3) NO BID (8J1) MARTINS (8J2) (8J3) $1.35 (8J1) (8J2) (8J3) NO BID (8J1) FL. EMBROIDERY (8J2) 10 (8J3) $1.30
K. F.T.O. SLEEVE INSIGNIA |8k1) |(8K2) |(8K3) NO BID (8K1) MARTINS |(8K2) |(8K3) $1.35 (8K1) |(8K2) |(8K3) NO BID (8K1) FL. EMBROIDERY _|(8K2) 11 |(8x3) $1.00
L. SERVICE STRIPE (8L1) (8L2) (8L3NO BID (8L1) MARTINS (8L2) (8L3) $1.35 (8L1) (8L2) (8L3)NO BID (8L1) PREMIER (8L2) AIC 325 (8L3) $1.00
M. METAL RANK INSIGNIA-COLLAR: |8Mm1) |8m2) (8M3)NO BID (8M1) MARTINS |(8Mm2) |(8m3) $1.35 (eM1) |8m2) (8M3)NO BID (8M1) BLACKINTON (8M2) J SERIES |(8M3) $3.50
N. CLOTH RANK INSIGNIA: (PER PAIR) (8N1) (8N2) (8N3) NO BID (8N1) BLACKINGTON (8N2) (8N3) $1.35 (8N1) (8N2) (8N3) NO BID (8N1) EVERREADY (8N2) 7.5 (8N3) $7.50
0. NAMPLATES |8o1) |(802) |(803NO BID (801) BLACKINGTON __|(802) |(803) $7.50 (801) |(802) |(803NO BID (801) BLACKINTON |(802) 91 |(803) $7.50
P. POLICE BADGE-SILVER (8P1) (8P2) (8P3) NO BID (8P1) BLACKINGTON (8P2) (8P3) $40.30 (8P1) (8P2) (8P3) NO BID (8P1) BLACKINTON (8P2) B296 (8P3) $37.50
Q. POLICE BADGE-GOLD (8Q1) (8Q2) (8Q3) NO BID (8Q1) BLACKINGTON __|(8Q2) (8Q3) $44.75 (8Q1) (8Q2) (8Q3) NO BID (8Q1) BLACKINTON (8Q2) B296 (8Q3) $39.50
R. INVESTIGATOR BADGE ’:BRl) ’;RZ} ’;RG) NO BID (8R1) BLACKINGTON (8R2) ’;RG) $44.75 (8R1) ’;RZ) ’;RZ) NOBID (8R1) BLACKINTON ’;RZ) B957 ’;Ra) $34.00
GRAND TOTAL
BIDS MAILED |NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:
BIDS RECEIVED: |NO—BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE COMPLETED:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC |OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 10 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: PC#

DESIRED

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES

1.VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

5. VENDOR NAME

GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC.

[SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC

LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY

[COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

NON RESPONSIVE VENDORS|
[ADDRESS: IADDRESS: IADDRESS: IADDRESS: IADDRESS: AND OTHER INFORMATION
P.O. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.

[ TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:

800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228

ICONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: (CONTACT: [CONTACT:

PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON

8. PATCHES, INSIGNIA, NAMEPLATE AND BADGES

DESCRIPTION/TYPE

MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH

S. POLICE HAT BADGE-SILVER |8s1) |8s2) |(8s3) NO BID (851) BLACKINGTON __|(852) |(8S3) $54.48 (851) |(852) |(853) NO BID (8S1) BLACKINTON |(8s2) B720 |(853) $45.50
T. POLICE HAT BADGE-GOLD (8T1) (8T2) (8T3) NO BID |;T1) BLACKINGTON (8T2) (8T3) $58.95 |:BT1) (8T2) (8T3) NO BID |:BT1) BLACKINTON (8T2) B720 (8T3) $47.50
U. SECURITY BADGE-SILVER |(8u1) |(8U2) |(8U3) NO BID |@u1) BLACKINGTON __|(8U2) |(8U3) $41.40 |@u1) |8u2) |(8U3) NO BID |@u1) BLACKINTON |(8u2) B538 |(8u3) $27.50
V. SECURITY HAT BADGE-GOLD (8V1) (8V2) (8V3) NO BID (8V1) BLACKINGTON (8v2) (8V3) $46.45 (8V1) (8V2) (8V3) NO BID (8V1) BLACKINTON (8V2) B538 (8V3) $29.50
W. SECURITY HAT BADGE-NICKLE |8w1) |8w2) |(8W3) NO BID (8W1) BLACKINGTON __|(8W2) |(8W3) $8.95 (8w1) |8w2) |(8w3) NO BID (8Q1) BLACKINTON |(8W2) A6938 |(8w3) $12.00
X. SECURITY HAT BADGE GOLD (8X1) (8X2) (8X3) NO BID (8X1) BLACKINGTON (8X2) (8X3) $8.95 (8X1) (8X2) (8X3) NO BID (8X1) BLACKINTON (8X2) A6938 (8X3) $13.00
Y. RESERVE OFFICER TABS (PER PAIR) |8y1) |8v2) |8Y3NO BID |@v1) BLACKINGTON __ [(8Y2) |(8Y3) $2.25 |@v1) |®Y2) |(8Y3) NO BID |@v1) RICE (8Y2) AIC325 |8Y3) s1.50

GRAND TOTAL

BIDS MAILED

[NO RESPONSE:

ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT:

DATE RECIEVED:

BIDS RECEIVED:

|NO-BIDS:

CHIEF ASSISTANT:

DATE COMPLETED:

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

DATE:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC |OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 11 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: PC#
1.VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME
GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC. [SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY [COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES
DESIRED NON RESPONSIVE VENDORS|
[ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: AND OTHER INFORMATION
P.O. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
[ TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
ICONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: (CONTACT: [CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON
9. SHOES AND BOOTHS
DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
A. MILITARY STYLE HIGH GLOSS OXFORD
MEN'S (9A1) (9A2) (9A3) NO BID (9A1) MARTINS (9A2) 15616 (9A3) $67.95 (9A1) THOROGOOD (9A2) 831-6803 (9A3) 60.75 (9A1) BATES (9A2) 942 (9A3) $71.00
WOMEN'S |(9A4) |(9A5) |(9A6) NO BID (9A4) MARTINS |(9A5) 16621 |(9A6) $67.95 (9A4) THOROGOOD (9A5) 531-6103 (9A6) $59.50 (9A4) BATES |(9A5) 742 |(9A6) $69.50
B. UNIFORM ATHLETIC LEATHER r r |
MEN'S (9B1) |(oB2) |(9B3) NO BID |@1) MARTINS (9B2) 16800 |(9B3) $82.95 |@1) THOROGOOD |(9B2) 834-6333 |(9B3)$73.60 |@51) THOROGOOD |(9B2) 834-6333 (9B3) $83.00
WOMEN'S (9B4) (9B5) (9B6) NO BID (9B4) MARTINS (9B5) 16607 (9B6) $82.95 (9B4) THOROGOOD (9B5) 534-6333 (9B6) $71.05 (9B4) BATER (9B5) 769 (9B6) $71.00
C. COMBAT BOQT, HIGH TOP
MEN'S (9C1) (9C2) (9C3) NO BID (9C1) MARTINS (9C2) 15686 (9C3) $50.85 (9C1) THOROGOOD (9C2) 834-6087 (9C3) $47.00 (9C1) HI TECH (9C2) 8152 (9C3) $63.50
WOMEN'S (9c4) |(9cs5) |(9C6) NO BID (9C4) MARTINS (9C5) 15686 |(9C6) $50.85 (9C4) THOROGOOD |(9C5) 834-6087 |(9C6) $47.00 (9C4) HI TECH (9C5) 8159 (9C6) $63.50
D. COMBAT BOOT, LOW TOP r r r
MEN'S (9D1) |(9D2) |(9D3) NO BID |gm) MARTINS (9D2) 15686 |(9D3) $50.85 |QD1) |(9D2) |(9D3) NO BID |QD1) HI TECH (9D2) 8200 (9D3) $63.50
WOMEN'S (9D4) (9D5) (9D6) NO BID (9D4) MARTINS (9D5) 15686 (9D6) $50.85 (9D4) (9D5) (9D6) NO BID (9D4) HI TECH (9D5) 8201 (9D6) $63.50
E. WATERPROOF COMBAT BOOT
MEN'S (9E1) (9E2) (9E3) NO BID (9E1) ROCKY. (9E2) (9E3) $106.95 (9E1) (9E2) (9E3) NO BID (9E1) ROCKY. (9E2) 2080 (9E3) $115.00
WOMEN'S (9E4) (9E5) (9E6) NO BID (9E4) ROCKY. (9E5) (9E6) $106.95 (9E4) (9E5) (9E6) NO BID. (9E4) ROCKY. (9E5) 2080 (9E6) $115.00
F. MOTORCYCLE COMBAT BOOT r r r
MEN'S (9F1) (9F2) (9F3) NO BID (9F1) ROCKY (9F2) 2904 (9F3) $142.95 (9F1) (9F2) (9F3) NO BID (9F1) CHIPPER (9F2) 27950 (9F3) $198.50
WOMEN'S (9F4) ’(:FS) ’(:FG) NO BID (9F4) ROCKY (9F5) 2904 ’(:FG) $142.95 (9F4) ’(:FS) ’(:FG) NO BID (9F4) CHIPPER ’(:FS) 27950WM (9F6) $150.00
GRAND TOTAL
BIDS MAILED |NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:
BIDS RECEIVED: |NO—BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE COMPLETED:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 12 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: pC#

1.VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

5. VENDOR NAME

GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC.

[SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC

LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY

[COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111

VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES
PSR ION RESPONSIVE VENDORS
[ADDRESS ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: AND OTHER INFORMATION
P.O. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
[ TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
ICONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON
10. DUTY GEAR
DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO | PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO | PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH
A.BELT KEEPER (10A1) (10A2) (10A3) NO BID (10A1) SAFARILAND (102) (10 A3) 52.65 (10A1) SAF (10A2) 65 (10A3) $1.70 (10A1) SAFARILAND (10A2) 65 (103) $2.75
B. HIDDEN SNAP BELT KEEPER (1081) (1082) (10B3) NO BID (10B1) SAFARILAND (1082) (1083) $7.40 (1081) SAF (1082) 62 (1083) $4.67 (1081) SAFARILAND (10B2) 65HS (10B3) $5.50
C.KEY STRAP (10c1) (10c2) (10C3) NO BID (10C1) SAFARILAND (10C2) (10C3) $17.25 (10C1) SAF (10C2) 168 (10C3) $11.30 (10C1) SAFARILAND (10C2) 168 (10C3) $10.00
D. KEY STRAP-SILENT (10D1) (10D2) (103) NO BID (10D1) SAFARILAND (1002) (103) $23.25 (10D1) SAF (1002) 170 (10D3) $11.28 (10D1) SAFARILAND (10D2) 170 (10D3) $17.00
E. FLASHLIGHT HOLDER-STANDARD (10E1) (10E2) (10E3) NO BID (10E1) SAFARILAND (10E2) (10E3) $11.85 (10E1) SAF (10E2) 730 (10E3) $7.70 (10E1) SAFARILAND (10E2) 730 (10E3) $8.00
F. FLASHLIGHT HOLDER-SMALL (10F1) (10F2) (10E3) NO BID (10F1) SAFARILAND (10F2) (10F3) $27.15 (10F1) SAF (10F2) 306 (10F3) $18.59 (10F1) SAFARILAND (10F2) 306 (10F3) $22.50
BELTS:
G. TROUSER BELT1-3/4 INCH (1061) (1062) (1063) NO BID (10G1) SAFARILAND (10G2) (10G3) $30.45 (1061) SAF (1062) 51 (1063) $20.05 (10G1) SAFARILAND (1062) 51 (10G3) $23.00
H. VELCRO TROUSER BELT 1-1/2 INCH (10H1) (10H2) (10H3) NO BID (10H1) SAFARILAND (10H2) (10H3) $35.75 (10H1) SAF (10H2) 99 (10H3) $23.63 (10G1) SAFARILAND (10H2) 99 (10H3) $32.50
1. DUTY BELT 2-1/4 INCH (1011) (1012) (1013) NO BID (1011) SAFARILAND (1012) (1013) $60.85 (1011) SAF (1012) 87 (1013) $40.10 (10G1) SAFARILAND (1012) 87 (1013) $45.50
J. VELCRO DUTY BELT 2-1/4 INCH (10J1) (1032) (10J3) NO BID (10J1) SAFARILAND (10J2) (10J3) $65.10 (101) SAF (10J2) 94 (10J3) $42.88 (10G1) SAFARILAND (1032) 94 (10J3) $44.50
BALTKON HOLDER
K. ASP F26 INCH SIDEBREAK (10K1) (10K2) (10K3) NO BID (10K1) SAFARILAND (10K2) (10K3) $28.99 (10K1) ASP (10K2) 52633 (10K3) $22.10 (10K1) (10K2) 2633 (10K3) $25.50
L. ASP F21 INCH SIDEBREAK (10L1) (10L2) (10L3) NO BID (10L 1) SAFARILAND (10L2) (10L3) $24.99 (10L1) ASP (10L2) 52433 (10L3) $19.25 (10L1) (10L2) 2433 (10L.3) $24.50
ASP BATONS
M. ASP F268 (10M1) (10M2) (10M3) NO BID (10M1) SAFARILAND (10M2) (10M3) $66.96 (10M1) ASP (10M2) 52611 (10M3) $51.74 (10M1) (10M2) 52611 (10M3) $51.00
N. ASP F21B (10N1) (10N2) (10N3) NO BID (10N1) SAFARILAND (10N2) (10N3) $61.96 (10N1) ASP (10N2) 52411 (10N3) $48.10 (10N1) (10N2) 52411 (10N3) $48.00
HANDCUFF CASES:
O. FLAP CLOSURE (1001) (1002) (1003) NO BID (10P1) SAFARILAND (1002) (1003) $20.20 (1001) SAF (1002) 90 (1003) $21.00 (1001) (1002) 90 (1003) $27.00
P. OPEN TOP (10P1) (10P2) (10P3) NO BD (1001) SAFARILAND (10P2) (10P3) $25.38 (10P1) SAF (10P2) 090 (10P3) $16.95 (10P1) (10P2) 090 (10P3) $26.00
HOLSTERS:
Q. SAFARILAND 295 (10Q1) (1002) (10Q3) NO BID (1001) SAFARILAND (10Q2) 295 (1003) $146.25 (1001) SAF (10Q2) 205 (10Q3) $96.40 (1001) (10Q2) 205 (10Q3) $96.50
R. SAFARILAND 070 SS III (10R1) (10R2) (10R3) NO BID (10R1) SAFARILAND (10R2) 07055 (10R3) $139.50 (10R1) SAF (10R2) 070 (10R3) $91.95 (10R1) (10R2) 070 (10R3) $92.00
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED |NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:
BIDS RECEIVED: |NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE COMPLETED:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 13 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: pC#

1.VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

5. VENDOR NAME

GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC.

[SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC

LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY

[COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111

VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES
DESIRED NON RESPONSIVE VENDORS|

[ADDRESS ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: AND OTHER INFORMATION
P.0. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON

S. SAFARILAND 6280 (1051) (1052) (10S3) NO BID (10S1) SAFARILAND (10S2) 6280 (1083) $121.76 (10S1) SAF (10S2) 6280 (10S3) $81.55 (10S1) SAFARILAND (10S2) 6280 (10S3) $86.50

T. MAGAZINE oty (1072) |(873) NO BID (10T1) SAFARILAND (1072) (1073) $32.15 (10T1) SAF (1072) 77 (873) $22.30 (10T1) SAFARILAND (10T2) 77 |(873) $27.50

U. RADIO HOLDER (10U1) (10U2) (10U3) NO BID (10U1) SAFARILAND (10U2) (10U3) $33.60 (10U1) SAF (10U2) 762-5-13 |(10U3) $27.65 (10U1) SAFARILAND (10U2) 761 (10U3) $31.50

V. AEROL SPRAY HOLDER aov1) (10v2) (10v3) NO BID (10V1) SAFARILAND (10v2) (10v3) $31.80 (10v1) SAF (10v2) 38 (10V3) $20.99 (10V1) SAFARILAND (10v2) 38 (10V3) $25.50

GRAND TOTAL

BIDS MAILED

[NO RESPONSE:

ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT:

DATE RECIEVED:

BIDS RECEIVED:

|NO-BIDS:

CHIEF ASSISTANT:

DATE COMPLETED:

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

DATE;




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC |OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 14 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: PC#

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES

1.VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

5. VENDOR NAME

GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC.

[SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC

LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY

[COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

DESIRED NON RESPONSIVE VENDORS|

[ADDRESS: [ADDRESS: [ADDRESS: [ADDRESS: [ADDRESS: AND OTHER INFORMATION
P.O. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
[ TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
ICONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: (CONTACT: [CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON

11. NYLON DUTY GEAR

DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH

A. SAFARILAND #295-X-26X (11A1) (11A2) (11A3) NO BID (11A1) SAFARILAND (11A2) 205-X-26X__|(11A3) $146.25 (11A1) SAF (11A2) 295 (11A3) $96.40 (11A1) SAFARILAND (11A2) 295--26 (11A3) $96.50

B. SAFARILAND #070-X-16X (1181) (11AB2) (11AB3) NO BID (1181) SAFARILAND (11B2) 070-X16X _|(11AB3) $139.50 _ |(11B1) SAF (11AB2) 070 (11AB3) $91.95 (11B1) SAFARILAND (11AB2) 070XC-16 (11AB3) $92.50

C. SAFARILAND #6280-X-26X (1cy (11C2) 117C3) NO BID (11C1) SAFARILAND (11C2) 6280-5-26X |117C3) 121.76 (11C1) SAF (11C2) 6280 117C3) $81.55 (11C1) SAFARILAND (11C2) 628-X-26 117C3) $47.50

D. UNDER BELT #4325 (11D1) (11D2) (11D3) NO BID (11D1) SAFARILAND (11D2) 4325 (11D3) 19.80 (11D1) SAF (11D2) 4325 (11D3) $6.91 (11D1) SAFARILAND (11D2) 4325 (11D3) $22.50

E. DUTY BELT #4300 (11E1) (11E2) (11E3) NO BID (11E1) SAFARILAND (11E2) 4300 (11E3) 26.15 (11E1) SAF (11E2) 4300 (11E3) $18.99 (11E1) SAFARILAND (11E2) 4300 (11E3) $31.00

F. CUFF CASE-CLOSED #4250 (11F1) (11F2) (11F3) NO BID (11F1) SAFARILAND (11F2) 4250 (11F3) 26.15 (11F1) SAF (11F2) 4250 (11F3) $7.31 (11F1) SAFARILAND (11F2) 4250 (11F3) $14.00

G. DOUBLE CUFF CASE #4260 (1161) (1162) (117G3) NO BID (11G1) SAFARILAND (11G2) 4260 (117G3) 1827 (11G1) SAF (11G2) 4260 (117G3) $13.28 (11G1) SAFARILAND (11G2) 4260 (117G3) $20.00

H. MAGAZINE POUCH #4110 (11H1) (11H2) (11H3) NO BID (11H1) SAFARILAND (11H2) 4110 (11H3) $18.27 (11H1) SAF (11H2) 4110 (11H3) $14.99 (11H1) SAFARILAND (11H2) 4112 (11H3) $25.00

I. BELT KEEPERS(4) (111 (1112) (1113) NO BID (11L1) SAFARILAND (1112) 4200 (1113) $18.27 (11L1) SAF (1112) 4200 (1113) $6.51 (1111) SAFARILAND (1112) 4200 (1113) $10.00

J. BATON HOLDER #4201 (1191 (1132) (1133) NO BID (1191) SAFARILAND (1132) 4201 (1133) $20.75 (1191) SAF (112) 4208 (113) $11.95 (1191) SAFARILAND (112) 4201 (11J3) $13.00

K. FLASHLIGHT RING #4227 (11K1) (11K2) (11K3) NO BID (11K1) SAFARILAND (11K2) 4227 (11K3) $9.05 (11K1) SAF (11K2) 4227 (11K3) $4.52 (11K1) SAFARILAND (11K2) 4227 (11K3) $7.00

L. STINGER LIGHT HOLDER #4230 (11L1) (11L2) (11L3) NO BID (11L1) SAFARILAND (11L2) 420 (11L3) $6.35 (11L1) SAF (11L2) 4230 (11L3) $9.16 (11L1) SAFARILAND (11L2) 4230 (11L3) $15.00

M. RADIO CASE #4293 (11M1) (11M2) (11M3) NO BID (11M1) SAFARILAND (11M2) 4203 (11M3) $6.35 (11M1) SAF (11M2) 4293 (11M3) $14.90 (11M1) SAFARILAND (11M2) 4293 (11M3) $22.00

N. MACE CASE #4271 (11N1) (11N2) (11N3) NO BID (11N1) SAFARILAND (11N2) 4271 (11N3) $18.26 (11N1) SAF (11N2) 4271 (11N3) $9.95 (11N1) SAFARILAND (11N2) 4271 (11N3) $15.00

O. PAGER CASE #4275 (1101) (1102) (1103) NO BID (1101) SAFARILAND (1102) 4275 (1103) $26.90 (1101) SAF (1102) 4275 (1103) $9.30 (1101) SAFARILAND (1102) 4275 (1103) $14.00

P. SILENT KEY HOLDER#4236 (11P1) (11P02) (11P3) NO BID (11P1) SAFARILAND (11PO2) 4236 (11P3) $13.85 (11P1) SAF (11PO2) 4236 (11P3) $8.10 (11PA1) SAFARILAND __|(11PO) 4236 (11P3) $12.00

GRAND TOTAL

BIDS MAILED |NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:

BIDS RECEIVED: |NO—BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: DATE COMPLETED:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC |OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 15 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: PC#

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES

DESIRED

1.VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

5. VENDOR NAME

GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC.

[SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC

LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY

[COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

NON RESPONSIVE VENDORS|

|ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: AND OTHER INFORMATION
P.O. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
[ TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
ICONTACT: [CONTACT: [CONTACT: (CONTACT: [CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON

12. EQUIPMENT

DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO | PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO | PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH

FLASHLIGHTS:

A. 25,000 CP RECHARGEABLE (12A1) (12A2) (12A3) NO BID (12A1) SAFARILAND (12A2) NO BID (12A3) $12.89 (12A1) STREAMLIGHT (12A2) 25103 (12A3) $74.75 (12A1) STREAMLIGHT __ |(12A2) 5620XP (12A3) $97.50

B. BATTERY PACK SL-20XP/LED (12B1) (1282) (1283) NO BID (12B1) SAFARILAND (12B2) NO BID (1283) $11.15 (12B1) STREAMLIGHT (1282) 77175 (1283) $21.25 (12B1) STREAMLIGHT __ |(1282) 77175 (12B3) $26.50

C. 15,000 CP RECHARGEABLE (12c1) (12C2) 12C3) NO BID (12C1) NO BID (12C2) NO BID 12C3) NO BID (12C1) STREAMLIGHT (12C2) 76514 12C3) $69.50 (12C1) STREAMLIGHT __ [(12C2) POLYSTINGER __ |12C3) $87.50

D. BATTERY PACK POLYSTINGER (12D1) (1202) (12D3) NO BID (12D1) NO BID (12D2) NO BID (12D3) NO BID (12D1) STREAMLIGHT (12D2) 72175 (12D3) $11.95 (12D1) STREAMLIGHT __ [(12D2) 75175 (12D3) $15.50

E. 70 LUMEN/UV LED (12E1) (12€2) (12E3) NO BID (12E1) NO BID (12E2) NO BID (12E3) NO BID (12E1) STREAMLIGHT (12E2) 51002 (12E3) $23.95 (12E1) STREAMLIGHT __ [(12€2) M3 (12E3) $145.00

HAND GUFFS:

F. CHAIN (12F1) (12F2) (12F3) NO BID (12F1) NO BID (12F2) NO BID (12F3) NO BID (12F1) PEARLESS (12F2) 700N (12F3) 20.50 (12F1) sew (12F2) M100 (12F3) $25.00

G. HINGED (12G1) (1262) (12G3) NO BID (1261) NO BID (12G2)NOBID __|(12G3) NO BID (12G1) PEARLESS (12G2) 801N (12G3) 29.50 (1261) saw (12G2) M300 (12G3) $41.00

H. MAP BOOK (12H1) (12H2) (12H3) NO BID (12H1) NO BID (12H2) NO BID (12H3) NO BID (12H1) NO BID (12H2) 75175 (12H3) NO BID (12H1) AERO SURVEYS _ |(12H2) MAP (12H3) $71.00

1. BINOCULARS 211 (1212) (1213) NO BID (1211) NO BID (1212) NO BID (1213) NO BID (1211) BUSHNELL (1212) 132140 (1213) $76.25 (1211) KOTCHO (1212) 10266 (1213) $45.00

CITATION AND FORM HOLDERS:

J. LETTER SIZE (1211) (1232) (1213) NO BID (12131) NO BID (12J2) NO BID (1213) NO BID (12131) SAUNDERS (1232) FH2117 (1233) $27.25 (12131) SANDERS (12)2) RR8512 (1233) $22.00

K. CITATION SIZE (12K1) (12K2) (12K3) NO BID (12K1) NO BID (12K2) NO BID (12K3) NO BID (12K1) SAUNDERS (12K2) FH1204 (12K3) $17.95 (12K1) SANDERS (12K2) AHS7106 (12K3) $22.00

L. BADGE CASE W/IMPRINT (12L1) (12L.2) (12L.3) NO BID (12L1) NO BID (12.2) NO BID (12L3) NO BID (12L1) NO BID (12L2) NO BID (12L3) NO BID (12L1) STRONG (121.2) 79300 (121.3) $21.00

M. WHISTEL WITH CHAIN (12M1) (12M2) (12M3) NO BID (12M1) NO BID (12M2) NOBID __|(12M3) NO BID (12M1) NO BID (12M2) NO BID (12M3) NO BID (12M1) HAMBURGER (12M2)G-P CHAIN (12M3) $5.00

N.N. GA CRIMINAL & TRAFFIC LAW (12N1) (12N2) (12N3) NO BID (12N1) NO BID (12N2) NO BID (12N3) NO BID (12N1) NO BID (12N2) NO BID (12N3) NO BID (12N1) GOULD (12N2) 76 (12N3) $29.75

PORTABLE RADIO ACCESSORIES:

0. SHOULDER MIC (1201) (1202) (1203) NO BID (1201) NO BID (1202) NOBID __|(1203) NO BID (1201) NO BID (1202) NO BID (1203) NO BID (1201) EAR HUGGER (1202) MC100 (120P3) $59.00

P. TWO WAY HEADSET (12P1) (12P02) (12P3) NO BID (12P1) NO BID (12PO2) NOBID__|(12P3) NO BID (12P1) NO BID (12PO2) NOBID __|(12P3) NO BID (12P1) EAR HUGGER (12P2) $-4100 (12P3) $91.00

Q. ACOUSTIC TUBE EARPHONER (12Q1) (12Q2) (12Q3) NO BID (12Q1) NO BID (12Q2) NO BID (12Q3) NO BID (12Q1) NO BID (12Q2) NO BID (12Q3) NO BID (12Q1) EAR HUGGER (12Q2) S-2030 (12Q3) $29.50

R. ANTENNA (12R1) (12R2) (12R3) NO BID (12R1) NO BID (12R2) NO BID (12R3) NO BID (12R1) NO BID (12R2) NO BID (12R3) NO BID (12R1) MOTOROLA (12R2) 8505241006 (12R3) $31.80

S.BELTCLIP (11R1) (11R2) (11R3) NO BID (11R1) NO BID (11R2) NO BID (11R3) NO BID (11R1) NO BID (11R2) NO BID (11R3) NO BID (1251) MOTOROLA (1252) (12SR3) $12.50

GRAND TOTAL
BIDS MAILED |NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:

BIDS RECEIVED:

|NO-BIDS:

CHIEF ASSISTANT:

DATE COMPLETED:

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

DATE:




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47320YB-CC OPENING DATE: 11/1/2005 PAGE 16 OF 16
BID DESCRIPTION:UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, AND GEAR
DEPARTMENT: POLICE CONTACT: pC#

1.VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

5. VENDOR NAME

GT DISTRIBUTOR, INC.

[SUPERIOR UNIFORM GROUP DBA MARTINS SVC

LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY

[COMMAND UNIFORMS - 111

VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES
PSR ON RESPONSIVE VENDORS|

[ADDRESS ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: AND OTHER INFORMATION
P.0. BOX 458 4040 SHIRLEY DR S.W. 1257-H KENNESTON CIRCLE 1315-A CHATTAHOOCHEE AVE.
TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
800-241-8950 404-691-7558 770-799-1972 404-603-4228
CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:
PHILIP STREET RON KLEPNER KYLE PIPPIN WILLIAM JOHNSON

13. BODY ARMOUR AND ACCCESSORIES

DESCRIPTION/TYPE MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO__| PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO | PRICE PER EACH MFGT MODEL NO PRICE PER EACH

A.BODY ARMOR (13A1) (1342) (13A3) $399.87 EA (13A1) NO BID (13A2) NOBID __|(13A3) NO BID (13A1) SECONDCHANCE _|(13A2)MON 113295 _|(13A3) $425.00 (13A1) PACA (13A2) ES2 (13A3) 310.00

B. VEST CARRIER (1381) (1382) (1383) $64.95 EA (1381) NO BID (1382)NOBID _|(1383) NO BID (1381) SECONDCHANCE _|(1382) APEX (1383) $62.50 (1381) PACA (1382) POLY COTTON _|(1383) $45.00
[AMERICAN BODY ARMOR, XT2-2 $399.87 EA
VEST CARRIER ONLY:AMEICAN BODY [$64.95 EA

OPT.: VEST PAK WITH VEST, BAG & EXTRA CARRIER:

$454.95 PER PACK

GRAND TOTAL

BIDS MAILED

[NO RESPONSE:

ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT:

DATE RECIEVED:

BIDS RECEIVED:

|NO-BIDS:

CHIEF ASSISTANT:

DATE COMPLETED:

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

DATE;




