
FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID OPEN DATE:   11/21/06
COMMODITY:  REQUISITION #: 

 CONTACT NAME: 
      PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #: 

DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME 
FOSTER BUSINESS INTERIORS, INC. NON-RESPONSE

OF VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDORS
PRODUCT

AND
OR OTHER

SERVICES
DESIRED INFORMATION

FAX:   404-760-8673 FAX:   678-527-1051 FAX:  FAX:  
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE:  770-569-9777

ITEM CONTACT PERSON: ANN NEUHIERLCONTACT PERSON:   TM MORE CONTACT PERSON:  CHARLES 

DESCRIPTIONS DATE: DATE: DATE: DATE: 
DISCOUNT PER HOUR DISCOUNT PER HOUR DISCOUNT PER HOUR DISCOUNT PER HOUR DISCOUNT PER HOUR

A1 Discount from Steelcase list price 35-57% N/A No Bid

A2 Discount from Herman Miller List Price N/A N/A No Bid

A3 Discournt from approved equal product price list 15-59% 58.1% N/A 60-69%

A4 Discount from Florense list price 45-47% 55% N/A 0.53

A5 Discount from Superior list price 47-50% 50% N/A 0.53

A6 Discount from Hon list price 43-59% 43% N/A 0.35

A7 Discount from Kimball list price N/A N/A No Bid

A8 Discount from approved equal list 15-59% 50% N/A See Attached

A9 Discount from unlisted items needed to complete a 
coordinate interior design package 0-59% 40% N/A 35%

B Labor, flat rate for tearing down & rebuilding existing
workstation $45.00 $30.00 $24.00 No Bid

C Miscellaneous labor, unit cost per laborer per hour $45.00 $30.00 $24.00 No Bid  

D
Fulton Co. shall reimburse vendor for(pre approved) 
overtime hours & weekend hours at time & 1/2 actua
hourly rate

$67.50          
$90.00 p/h on 

Sun & Holidays
$45.00 $36.00 No Bid

E Design & Project management cost p/h p/project $65.00 $55.00 $35.00 95.00

F Warehouse space cost per sq. ft/month .70 SQ. FT. 0.75 SQ. FT. .60 SQ FT No Bid

G Furniture inventory $45.00 $25.00 $24.00 No Bid

 

NO. OF NOTIFICATIONS MAILED 43
NO. OF BIDS DOWNLOADED  NO RESPONSE: 0  ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:
NO. OF BIDS RECEIVED: 4 NO-BIDS: 0  DATE COMPLETED:     
NO. OF MBES NOTIFICATIONS MAILED: DATE:
NO OF MBES RECEIVED:

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

PRE AWARD TABULATION:                            
Futon Co. reserves the right to accept or reject 
any or all bids or any part thereof, & to waive 
technicalities.  This tabulation is NOT FINAL  or 
BINDING  & is subject to amendment at the 
discretion of Fulton Co. Govt.

11/21/06
CHIEF ASSISTANT:    Alonzo Arnold 11/29/06

    

DATE: 

ADDRESS

CONTACT PERSON:
TELEPHONE:  

NORCROSS, GA 30071

TELEPHONE:   770-268-6311

5055 OLD ELLIS POINTE, SUITE 0-2
ROSWELL, GA 30076

FAX:  770-569-2797

CONTACT PERSON:

ADDRESS

GRAEBEL ATLANTA MOVERS

ADDRESS
5105 AVALON RIDGE PKWY

TELEPHONE:  404-760-8700

GSI OFFICE ENVIORNMENT

ADDRESS
3145 AVALON RIDGE PLACE, SUITE 150

NORCROSS, GA 30071

TELEPHONE:  678-527-1025

730 PEACHTREE ST., SUITE 200
ATLANTA, GA 30308

ADDRESS

IVAN ALLEN WORKSPACE

PAGE 1 OF  1BID NUMBER:  06ITB47806YA-AA
DESCRIPTION:   MODULAR WORK STATION
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES


