
 



 



 



BID NUMBER:  06ITBVEHICLES07K-NH  Allan Vigil Ford  Carl Black Automotive  Bill Heard Chevrolet  Legacy Ford  PAGE 
#4  

DESCRIPTION  
RESPONSE  TOTAL  RESPONSE  TOTAL  RESPONSE  TOTAL  RESPONSE  TOTAL   

STANDARD, FULL SIZE    
CERTIFIED LEV    

9h  

2WD, LWB, 4100 Lb. Payload, 8 Cyl,    
 Min. 5.4 L    
 

Name and Model Number  
F250  F20  GMC TC 20903  CC20903  No Bid   

 
Engine Size  CID/LIT  Hp  

5.4  6.0  353  6.0  353  No Bid   
 

Add for Driver Air Bag  
INC    NC    Std    No Bid    

 
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes  

INC    NC    Std    No Bid    
 

Add for HD Alternator  
N/A    N/A    Std    No Bid    

 
Add for Extended CAB  

 $2,330.00    $3,827.00    $3,497.00   No Bid    
 

Add for Cruise  

 $337.00    $240.00    $210.00   No Bid    
 

Delivery (Calendar Days ARO)  
60-90    60-90    60-90    No Bid    

 
Unit Price F.O.B. Destination  

  $16,250.00    $189.00    $18,828.00   No Bid   
 STANDARD CERTIFIED LEV    
9i  

4WD, LWB, 1400 Lb. Payload, 8 Cyl    
 

Name and Model Number  
F150  F14  GMC TK 10903  CK10703  Ford F150 F14   

 
Engine Size  CID/LIT  Hp  

4.6  248  4.8  295  4.8  295  281/4.6  248   
 

Add for Driver Air Bag  
Inclu.    N/C    Std    Inclu.     

 
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes  

Inclu.    N/C    Std    Inclu.     
 

Add for HD Alternator  
N/A    N/A    Std    N/A     

 
Add for Extended CAB  

 $6,076.00    $4,814.00    $3,660.00    5,110.00    
 

Add for Cruise  

 $197.00    $240.00    $210.00    225.00    
 

Delivery (Calendar Days ARO)  
60-90    90-120    60-90    60-90     



 
Unit Price F.O.B. Destination  

  $17,048.00    $16,998.00    $18,099.00    15,787.00   
 STANDARD, FULL SIZE    
 CERTIFIED LEV    
9j  

4WD, LWB, 1600 Lb. Payload, 8 Cyl    
 Min 5.4 L    
 

Name and Model Number  
F150  F14  GMC TK 10903  CK10903  Ford F150 F14   

 
Engine Size  CID/LIT  Hp  

5.4  300  5.3L  315  4.8  295  330/5.4  300   
 

Add for Driver Air Bag  
Inclu.    N/C    Std    Inclu.     

 
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes  

Inclu.    N/C    Std    Inclu.     
 

Add for HD Alternator  
N/A    N/A    Std    N/A     

 
Add for Extended CAB  

 $3,409.00    $4,814.00    $3,660.00    4,100.00    
 

Add for Cruise  

 $197.00    $240.00    $210.00    225.00    
 

Delivery (Calendar Days ARO)  
60-90    60-90    60-90    60-90     

 Unit Price F.O.B. Destination    $17,664.00    $17,470.00    $18,345.00    16,808.00   
 STANDARD, FULL SIZE    
 CERTIFIED LEV    
9k  

4WD, LWB, 2600 Lb. Payload, 8 Cyl.    
 Min. 5.4.L    
 

Name and Model Number  
F150  F14  GMC TK 20903  CK20903  Ford F150  F14   

 
Engine Size  CID/LIT  Hp  

5.4  300  6.0  353  6.0  353  330/5.4  300   
 

Add for Driver Air Bag  
Inclu.    N/C    Std    Incl     

 
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes  

Inclu.    N/C    Std    Inclu     
 

Add for HD Alternator  
N/A    N/A    Std    N/A     

 
Add for Extended CAB  

 $3,409.00    $3,827.00    $3,497.00    4,100.00    



 
Add for Cruise  

 $197.00    $240.00    $210.00    225.00    
 

Delivery (Calendar Days ARO)  
60-90    60-90    60-90    60-90     

 Unit Price F.O.B. Destination    $18,700.00    $21,870.00    $21,599.00    17,594.00   
 STANDARD, FULL SIZE    
 PROPANE    
9l  

4WD, LWB, 2600 Lb. Payload, 8 Cyl,    
 Min 5.4 L    
 

Name and Model Number  
No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid   

 
Engine Size  CID/LIT  Hp  

No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid   
 

Add for Driver Air Bag  
No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid    

 
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes  

No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid    
 Add for HD Alternator  No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid    
 

Add for Extended CAB  
No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid    

 
Add for Cruise  

No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid    
 

Delivery (Calendar Days ARO)  
No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid    

 
Unit Price F.O.B. Destination  

 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   
 



 





 










