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Bid: RFQ 0860731 YB-MW - MOTORCYCLE PARTS AND REPAIRS

Close Date/Time: 3/18/08 at 2:00 p.m.

(40489360%88)
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Commodity Group Code Description

Bid Amount

1. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts

D

.t

10.

11

Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts

Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

Default Commodity Group 07012 Motoreycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcyele Parts

Stone Mountain Harley Davidson
Rear $184.78

$4.41

$6.19

$5.30

$17.76

$12.42

$10.04

$11.99

$16.21

No Bid

$40.63

Front 3$169.00

$114.91 including labor
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FULTON COUNTY PUBLIC BID OPENING PAGE 2
RFQ 0860731YB-MW MOTORCYCLE PARTS AND REPAIRS
OPENING DATE: 3/18/08 AT 2:00 P.M.
Commodity Number Code Description Bid Amount

13. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson Including Labor $28.92

14. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motoreycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson No Bid

15. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson No Bid

16. Defauit Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $62.36

17. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $40.63

18. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $325.00

19. Detfault Commodity Group 07012 Motoreycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $40.63

20. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcyele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $25.39

21. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motoreycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $194.88

22. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson No Bid

P
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. Defauit Commodity Group 07012 Motorcyele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $40.63
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FULTON COUNTY PUBLIC BID OPENING PAGE 3
RFQ 0860731YB-MW MOTORCYCLE PARTS AND REPAIRS
OPENING DATE: 3/18/08 AT 2:00 P.M.
Commodity Number Code Description Bid Amount
24. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $85.75

25. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $62.36

26. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcyele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson  Front $124.72 Rear $101.34

27. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motoreycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson  Front $93.54 Rear $116.93

28. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycie Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $77.95

29. Default Commodity Group 07612 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $163.70

30. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $210.47

31. Default Commodity Group 07612 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $77.95

(]
b2

. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $46.77
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. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorevcle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson N/A

34. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcyele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $350.67
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RFQ 0860731YB-MW MOTORCYCLE PARTS AND REPAIRS
OPENING DATE: 3/18/08 AT 2:00 P.M.

Commodity Number Code Description Bid Amount
35. Default Commeodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $50.67

36. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcyele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $432.62

37. Detault Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $152.00

38. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $38.98

39. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harlev Davidson No Bid

40. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motoreyele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $140.31

41. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcyele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $58.46

42. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $109.13

43. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson $7.95

44. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

45. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motoreyele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidsen 9:00 a.m. -7:00 p.m.
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REQ 0860731 YB-MW MOTORCYCLE PARTS AND REPAIRS
OPENING DATE: 3/18/08 AT 2:00 P.M.

Commodity Number Code Description Bid Amount

46. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motoreycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson 9:00 a.m. -7:00 p.m.

47. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson 11:00 ~ 5:00 p.m.

48. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorceycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson Hourly $77.95

49. Detault Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

50. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motorcycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

51. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motoreycle Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

52. Default Commodity Group 67012 Motoreyele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson
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. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motoreycele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson

54. Default Commodity Group 07012 Motoreyele Parts
Stone Mountain Harley Davidson MVP PROGRAM 11% - 15%
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