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10: 4044031 (40 From: (4v4/308300)
#.°.5 FULTON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
R
RIS LERNEY Page 1
id: RFQ: 08CR61383C-HAND TOOLS
Close Date/Time: 04/24/2007 14:00:00
| Commodity Group Code Description
Vendor Code Legal Name Bid Amount
DEFAULT COMMODITY CODE: 93641 HAND TOOLS
1. CORPORATE VISION, INC $255.00
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY 113.67
BEST TOOL SUPPLY 60.00
MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY 84.93
GRAINGER 86.55
ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY 50.10
W& S SUPPLY CO. INC 95.05
2. CORPORATE VISION, INC $355.00
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY 150.78
BEST TOOIL. SUPPLY 80.00
MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY 114,01
GRAINGER 123.51
ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY 117.00
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC 134.85
3. CORPORATE VISION, INC $415.00
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY 193.85
BEST TOOL SUPPLY 85.00
MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY 144.37
GRAINGER 151.00
ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY 109.15
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC 164.65
4. CORPORATE VISION, INC $ 685.00
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY 336.36
BLEST TOOL SUPPLY 180.00
MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY 245.55
GRAINGER 290.37
ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY 245.15
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC 284.90
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5.

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO.INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W& S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W& S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W &S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY

GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

§ 75.00
153.67
45.00
3436
43.77
44.10
37.75

$ 50.00
15.38
6.00
13.81
12.41
13.10
14.10

$ 58.00
20.67
9.00
19.89
17.90
16.70
20.25

$ 75.00
35.18
21.00
27.37
29.60
38.60
33.45

$ 20.00
3.64
2.00
2.41
3.05
3.90
3.14
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I1.

13.

14,

10. CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL. SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITWINC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAATOOL & SUPPLY

W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

12. CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

§ 20.00
3.55
3.50
2.99
6.76
4.40
355

$20.00
5.18
4.00
4.14
5.51
7.00
5.65

$ 20.00
3.44
4.50
4.30
5.35
5.75
4.65

$ 20.00
4.64
4.50
5.45
2.41
7.30
5.85

$20.00
5.86
7.00
5.46
6.63
8.65
7.00
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15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W& S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAATOOL & SUPPLY
W& S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W& S SUPPLY CO. INC

$115.00
34.50
8.00
32.70
33.40
56.00
36.50

$ 40.00
9.21
8.00
9.05
16.38
11.85
8.20

$ 40.00
10.93
10.00

9.50
18.96

11.85

8.80

$ 50.00
19.14
19.00
19.42
31.21
12.70
15.40

$ 60.00
22.66
15.00
22.36
20.14
19.85
20.25
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21.

22.

23.

24,

. CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W& S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W &S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

$ 60.00
10.07
9.00
14.08
10.65
13.50
9.85

$ 50.00
12.74
7.00
11.26
14.14
6.00
14.23

$ 50.00
11.53
9.00
12.21
13.29
7.85
16.50

$ 50.00
12.15
13.50
14.99
30.18
11.65
28.20

§ 88.00
29.09
25.00
40.84
46.30
37.00
59.95
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25.

26.

27.

28.

29.

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAATOOL & SUPPLY

W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W &S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

$ 50.00
18.35
12.00
18.9]
9.95
22.85

17.55

$ 55.00
21.08
24.00
21.82
10.68
26.40
20.30

$ 58.00
23.76
15.00
24.63
21.40
29.80
22.90

$ 70.00
34.04
18.00
3531
31.21
42.65
3275

$95.00
54.02
25.00
5549
48.77
67.70
52.05
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32.

33.

34.

. CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W& S SUPPLY CO. INC

. CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL. SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

[TW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

$ 51.00
8.47
8.00

16.27

16.60
10.45
17.20

$ 55.00
14.61
18.00

9.50
10.96
11.70
11.95

$ 105.00
64.27
50.00

NO RESP
100.16
76.50
61.90

$116.00

75.33

500.00
NO RESP

SPECIAL PRICE PENDING

89.65
72.55

$515.00
412.91
NOT IN CATALOG
NO RESP

SPECIAL PRICE PENDING

99.44
397.65
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35.

36.

37.

38.

39.

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W& S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY

W &S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY

W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAATOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY

W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

$ 60.00
27.27
15.00
27.88
45.54
3245
26.25

$ 90.00
52.89
29.00
5197
85.78
62.95
50.95

$ 55.00
21.85
11.50

NO RESP
35.87
26.00
21.05

$ 60.00
27.81
12.50

NO RESP
44.88
33.10
26.75

$ 191.00
13932
120.00

NO RESP
223.36
165.80
134.15
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40. CORPORATE VISION, INC $254.00
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY 192.35
BEST TOOL SUPPLY 140.00
MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY NO RESP
GRAINGER 319.28
ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY 228.90
W &S SUPPLY CO.INC 185.25
41. CORPORATE VISION, INC $ 53.00
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY 16.51
BEST TOOL SUPPLY 17.00
MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY 18.58
GRAINGER 15.61
ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY 22.30
W &S SUPPLY CO. INC 14.70
42. CORPORATE VISION, INC $ 53.00
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY 17.07
BEST TOOL SUPPLY 17.00
MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY 19.17
GRAINGER 16.13
ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY 23.00
W & S SUPPLY CO.INC 15.20
43. CORPORATE VISION, INC $ 10.00
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY 1.32
BEST TOOL SUPPLY 4.20
MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY 1.49
GRAINGER 1.24
ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY 1.80
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC 1.25
44. CORPORATE VISION, INC $ 10.00
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY 1.41
BEST TOOL SUPPLY 4.20
MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY 1.49
GRAINGER 1.24
ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY 1.80
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC 1.25
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45.

46.

47.

48.

49,

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY

W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W& S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W &S SUPPLY CO. INC

$ 35.00
10.35
10.00
12.43
9.04
14.60
9.60

$120.00
10.35
12.00
13.10
9.53
15.35
9.90

$ 58.00
8.36
14.00
25.50
22.67
NO BID
20.05

$ 58.00
20.81
10.00
18.93
18.12

NO BID
23.35

$ 64.00
36.25
15.00
20.48
17.85

NO BID
29.10
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50.

51

52.

54,

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAATOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W& S SUPPLY CO.INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL. SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

. CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOIL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

$77.00
34.94
20.00
45.01
34.01

NO BID
35.95

$82.00
34.94
14.00
35.54
31.18

NO BID
30.65

$92.00
46.12
18.00
54.44
37.57

NO BID
47.45

$ 75.00
15.16
16.00
29.08
24.55
NO BID
20.00

$ 150.00
79.31
60.00
109.73
83.40
NO BID
102.80
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55.

56.

57.

58.

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W &S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

CORPORATE VISION, INC

WHITE CAP CONSTRUCTION SUPPLY
BEST TOOL SUPPLY

MSC INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
GRAINGER

ITW INC, DBA AAA TOOL & SUPPLY
W & S SUPPLY CO. INC

$370.00
276.66
195.00
258.48
256.50
302.60
268.15

$ 255.00
195.68
195.00
193.32
175.25
209.25
182.70

$ 158.00
137.75
70.00
100.00
82.82
155.45
160.75

10 DAYS
5-7 DAYS
0-5 DAYS

3-5 DAYS

2 DAYS
3-10 DAYS
NOT LISTED

Opt-Out: Not Defined






