wi/lu/b6 vi:57 P rFage Zof 1/

oddl (30 From: (4647340.308)
To: 4v4

. iy From:  (AMABE%508) BB QAT o | of
Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
08DM61176YC — Glass and Glass Repair
Bid: RFQ 06/05/2008 0:00
- Close Date/Time: 14:00:
Ty Group Code Description ;
Commodity N . -Rid.Amount
1 Default Commodity Group
1. Window glass, 1/16 thick single strength glass, delivered
P&EGlass LLC $2.65
2. Window glass, 1/16 thick single strength glass, pick up
: P & E Glass, L1.C $ 161
; 3. window glass, 1/18 double strength glass, delivered
3 ' P & E Glass, LLC $3.15
4. Window glass, /18 double strength glass, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $2.35
5. Plate Glags — Clear , 3/ 16, delivered
P& E glass, LLC $5.80
6. Plate Glass — Clear » 3/16, pick up
P& EGlass, L1LC $3.75
7. Plate Glass — Bronze, 3/16, delivered
P& E Glass, LLC $ 8.56
8. Plate Glass - Brongze, 3/1 6, pick up
P& E Glass, LiC $5.89
9. Plate Glass Smoke, 3/16, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $8.56
10. Plate Glasg — Smoke, 3/16, pick up
P& EGlass, LLC 3589

Opt-Out: Not Defined



wi/lu/b6 vi:57 P rFage 3 oF 1/

oddl (30 From: (4647340.308)
To: 4v4

TON:  (MEIGEGE) 06/20/07 82:17 m Page 1 o )

TR NN

Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1

Bid: RFQ
T comty Close Date/Time:

Commodity Group Code Description .
e deNG0L COde  Leqal Name Bid Amount

14:00:00

1 Default Commodity Group

11. Plate Glass — Clear, 3/8, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $12.20

12. Plate Glags — Clear, 3/8, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $ 8.50

13. Plate Glags -- Bronze, 3/8, delivered
P&E Glass, LLC $16.50

14. Plate Glass Bronze. 3/8, pick up
P&E Glass, LLC $14.75

15. Plate Glass - Smoke, 3/8, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $16.50

16. Plate Glasg - Smoke, 3/8, pick up
P&E Glass, LLC $14.75

17. Plate Glasg - Clear, %, delivered
P&E Glass, LLC $589

18. Plate Glasg - Clear, %, pick up
P & E Glass, LiC $3.75

19. Plate Glass -~ Bronze, 4, delivered
P&E Glass, LLC $38.56

20. Plate Glass - Bronze, ! , pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $589

e e

| Opt-Out: Not Defined



wi/lu/b6 vi:57 P rFage 4 oF 1/

i (a0 From: (4647340.308)
lo: 4u4s

. 86728797 02:1TPN  Page | of 1
To: 4948921749 From: (#M48936508)

Page: 1

} Fulton County Public Bid Opening
# Bid: RFQ

:00:00
Close Date/Time: 14:00

Code  Description Bid Amoune |

R Y
Commodity Group 4a

1 Default Commodity Group
21. Plate Glass - Smoke, 4, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $ 8.56

22. Plate Glags — Smoke, %, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $5.50

23. Laminated Safety Plate Glasg — clear, 1/8, delivered
P&E Glass, L1LC 1o bid

24. Laminated Safety Plate Glass — clear, 1/8, pick up
P&E Glass, LLC no bid

S A

25. Laminated Safety Plate Glasg clear, 3/16, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC custorn order

26. Laminated Safety Plate Glass - clear, 3/16, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC custom order

27. Laminated Safety Plate Glass - clear, 3/8, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC custom order

28. Laminated Safety Plate Glass — clear, 3/8, pick up
P&E Glass, LLC custom order

29. Laminated Safety Plate Glags — clear, Y4, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $10.79

30. Laminated Safety Plate Glass clear, %, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $10.79

Opt-Out: Not Defined



2 oF 17
wi/lu/¥6 vi:95 Pl Fage

From: (4647340.308)

To: 4vaaaal (30

From: { : FoF
N NPRREI] f From: (MM8306558) 0672997 02:17 ™ Pagn | oF

Fulton County Public Bid Opening

Page: |
Bid: RFQ
FN COmT Close Date/Time: 14:08:00
& ”ty G:‘OUP Code ma¢riptim Big Bwﬁgs
1 Default Commodity Group
31. Laminated Safety Plate (ilass — clear, 7/32, delivered
P&E Glass, LLC $839
32. Laminated Safety Plate Glasg — clear, 7/32, pick up
P& E Glass, LLC $6.00
|
’ 33. Laminated Safety Sheet clear, 1/8, delivered
P& E Glass, LLC no bid
34. Laminated Safety Sheet — clear, 1/8, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC no bid

35. Laminated Safety

Sheet — clear, 3/1 6, delivered
P&E Glass, LLC

custom order
36. Laminated Safety Sheet —

clear, 3/16, pick up
P&E Glass, LLC custom order

37. Laminated Safety Sheet — clear, 3/8, delivered
PLE Glass, LLC custom order

38. Laminated Safety

Sheet - clear, 3/8, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC

custom order
39. Laminated Safety

Sheet - clear, Y4, delivered
P&E Glass, LLC

$862

40. Laminated Safety

Sheet - clear, %
P &E Glass, LLC

» pick up

$5.89

Opt-Out: Not Defined



0 WL:a3 Pl rFage b of 1/
oddl (30 From: (4647340.308) wi/la/v
To: 4v4

Fros: (494836508 02807 02: 1T Pags | oF

10! WESE I
Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
Bid: RFQ
T 1 Close Date/Time: 14:00:00

Commodity Group Code Description
e L0GOL COde_ | L0ga] Hame Bid Amount

1 Default Commodity Group

41. Wire Mesh Glass — clear, 1/8, delivered
P& E Glass, LLC no bid

42. Wire Mesh Glass- clear, 1/8, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC no bid

43. Wire Mesh Glass — clear, 3/16, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC no bid

44. Wire Mesh Glass - clear, 3/16, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC no bid

45, Wire Mesh Glass — clear, 3/8, delivered
P& E Glass, LLC no bid

46. Wire Mesh Glass — clear, 3/8, pick up
P&E glass, LLC no bid

47. Wire Mesh Glass - clear, %, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $14.45

48. Wire Mesh Glags — clear, %, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $11.24

49, Insulated gléss Pane -- clear, 1/8, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $9.50

30. Insulated Glass Pane - clear, 1/8, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $7.80

Opt-Out: Not Defined



0 WL:a3 Pl rFage ¢ oF 1/
oddl (30 From: (4647340.308) wi/la/v
To: 4v4

From: (4M8036550) 0672997 82:17 M Page I oF )

0 WM 7
Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
Bid: RFQ
Y Close Date/Time: 14:00:00

Commodity Group Code Dascription
e LNGOL, COdS . Legal Name : Bid Amount

1 Default Commodity Group

31. Insulated Glass Pane - clear, 3/ 16, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $10.00

52. Insulated Glasg Pane — clear, 3/18, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $825

53. Insulated Glass Pane -- clear, 3/8, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC custom order

54. Insulated Glass Pane — clear, 3/8, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC custom order

35. Insulated Glasg Pane — clear, %, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $10.00

56. Insulated Glass Pane clear, % , pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $82;5

57. Insulated Glasg Pane - clear, %, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $12.54

58. Insulated Glass Pane — clear, %, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $10.65

59. Insulated Glass Pane - clear, 1, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $12.54

60. Insulated Glass Pane ~ clear » 1, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $10.65

Opt-Out: Not Defined



: goF 17
To: 4vaaaal (30 From: (4647340.308) wi/lu/¥6 vi:95 Pl rage

10: WABHII 748 From: (ABABRIGSES) 06/20/87 02:17P  Page | of 3

Page: 1

Fulton County Public Bid Opening
* Bid: RFQ

N COmY Close Date/Timm: 14:00:00

Commodity Group Code Dascription ‘

1 Default CommodiltyMinwwp- plain, 1/8, delivered

62. Mirror - plain, 1/8, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $ 4.00

63. Mirror ~ plain, 3/16, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $11.23

64. Mirror — plain, 3/16, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $7.50

65. Mirror ~ plain, %, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $8.50

66. Mirror - plain, % , pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $5.00

67. Mirror - plain, %, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC no bid

68. Mirror — plain, % , pick up
P & E Glass, LLC no bid

69. Mirror — plain, 1, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC no bid

70. Mirror ~ plain, 1, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC no bid

71. Customer Tempered Glass Panes clear, 1/8, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $7.50

72. Customer Tempered Glass Panes — clear, 1/8, pick up
P& E Glass, LLC $5.50

Opt-Out: Not Defined



PN rage 3 of 1/
10: 4v4ga31 {38 From: (4v4/300308) ai/18/08 v.l:33
0:

WS FION:  (99A5S96558) 6/7209 02:17 P Page 1 oF |

Page: 1

Fulton County Public Bid Opening
* Bid: RFQ

14:00:00

AR LY Close Date/Time:
G Code Description
Commodity Group " Bid Amount
73. Customer Tempered Glass Panes - clear, 3/16, delivered
1 Defavlc Commoditp @rpipy e LLC $8.50

74. Customer Tempered Glass Panes — clear, 3/16, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $ 6.50

75. Customer Tempered Glass Panes - clear, 3/8, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $16.50

76. Customer Tempered Glass Panes — clear, 3/8, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $13.80

77. Customer Tempered Glass Panes ~ clear % , delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $38.50

78. Customer Tempered Glass Panes clear, % , pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $6.50

79. Customer Tempered Glass Panes - clear, % , delivered
P& E Glass, LLC no bid

80. Customer Tempered Glass Panes - clear, % , pick up
P & E Glass, LLC no bid

81. Float Glass — clear, 1/8, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $3.15

82. Float Glass - clear, 1/8, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $235

83. Float Glass — Clear, 3/16, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $ 8.56

84. Float Glass — Clear, 3/1 6, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $5.89

Opt-Out: Not Defined



F 17
/vo ui:94 Pl Fage 19 o

f13] From: (4647340.308) i/l |

To: 4uaaaal(

06,2847 02:1T M Fags {1 of |

sTﬂ - From: (4AB336508)
. s 1
, ; id Opening Page
Fulton County Public Bid Op
* Bid: RFQ /rime 14:00:00
lose Date/Time: .
waonn _ Cloe Tode Deseription Bid Amount
Commodity Group .
1 Default Commodity Group
85. Float Glass — clear, 3/8, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC 51220
86. Float Glass clear, 3/8, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC $850
87. Float Giass~clear, Y , delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $5.80
88. Float Glass-clear, % , pick up ‘
P & E Glass, LLC $3.75
89, Flat Glass-clear, % , delivered
P& E Glass, LLC custom order
90. Flpat Glass-clear, % |, pickup
P & E Glass, LLC custom order
91. Hourly rate for normal hours, Journeyman, one story
P & E Glass, LLC $33.00
92. Hourly rate for hormal hours, Journeyman, two/+stories
P & E Glass, LLC $41.50
93. Hourly rate for normal hours, Apprentice, one story
P & E Glass, LLC ' $30.00
94. Hourly rate for normal hours, Apprentice, two/+stories
P& E Glass, LLC $38.00
95. Hourly rate for work beyond normal hours, Journeyman, one story
P & E Glass, LLC $49.50

Opt-Out: Not Defined



34 PN rage 11 of 1/
10: 4v4ga31 {38 From: (4v4/300308) ai/10/08 v.l:34
0:

From: (%48936508) 06/28/87 92:17 pw Foge 1 of )

WO
Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
Bid: RFQ
T Closs Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code Description '
' Rid Amount.

1 Default Commodity Uroup

96. Hourly rate for work beyond normatl hours, J oumeyman, two/+storieg

P & E Glass, LLC $57.50
97. Hourly rate for work beyond normal hours, Apprentice, one story
P & E Glass, LLC $45.00
98. Hourly rate for work beyond normal hours, Apprentice, two/+stories
P & E Glass, LLC $53.00
99. Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 1/32, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC no bid
160. Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 1/32, pickup
P & E Glass, LLC no bid
101. Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 1/16, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $4.70
102. Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 1/16, pickup
P & E Glass, LLC $2.70
103. Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 1/8, delivered
P& E Glass, LLC $5.60
104, Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 1/8, pick up
P& E Glass, LLC $£3.60
105. Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 3/1 6, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC $6.15

Opt-0uk; »

Opt-Out: Not Defined



wi/lu/v6 vi:94 Pl rFage 1Z oF 1/

10: 4v4ga31 {38 From: (4v4/300308)
0:

10: 49483531749 From: (440906508) /2097 02:17P0  Pog 1 of |

Page: 1

' Fulton County Public Bid Opening
* Bid: RFQ

1 00:0
A Y Close Date/Time: 14:00:00

Commedity Group Code Dascription '
e Ve0gOE, COdg Legal Name Bid Amount

N

1 Dpefault Commodity Group

106, Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 3/ 16, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC $4.15
107, Acrylic Plastic Sheets~plexiglas, 3/8, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC $11.34
108, Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 3/8, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC $9.24
109, Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, % , delivered ‘

P & E Glass, LLC $6.15
110, Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 1 » pick up

P & E Glass, LLC $4.15
111, Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, ¥4, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC $15.50
112. Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 1 » pick up

P & E Glass, LLC $12.60
113, Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, % » delivered

P & E Glass, LLC $23.28
114, Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, %, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC $19.95
115, Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, 1, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC $29.92
116, Acrylic Plastic Sheets-plexiglas, I, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC $26.48

Opt-Out: Not Defined



: or 17
To: 4vaaaal (30 From: (4647340.308) wi/lu/v6 vi:94 Pl rage 13

To: WARg01749 From: (4945006589) V20T 01T Pam | oF |

Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
Bid: RFQ
R Y Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
c ty Group Code Description
Wdiv . Rig Amount |
1 Default Commodity Group

117. Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, 1/8, delivered

P & E Glass, LL.C $6.74
118. Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, 1/8, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC $£4.32
119, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, clear, 3/16, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC $9.00
120. Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, clear, 3/16, pickup

P & E Glass, LLC $6.70
121, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, clear, 3/8, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC $19.50
122, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic sheets, clear, 3/8, pickup

P & E Glass, LLC $15.00
123, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, clear, % , delivered

P & E Glass, LLC $9.55
124, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, clear, Y4 , pickup

P & E Glass, LLC $7.05
125, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, clear, 1, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC $25.00
126. Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, clear, % ; pickup

P & E Glass, LLC $22.00
127. Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, clear, %, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC custom order

Opt-Out: Not Defined



3o PNl Fage 14 or 1/
avasdsl (38 From: (4v4{3v98308) ai/1u/u8 vl
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To: Wessi e From:  (4048336500) V28T 8L Page | oF |
: i LI
Fulton County Public Bid Opening Fage
Bid: RFQ
Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
ity Group Code Description Bid Amount
1 pefault Commodity Group

128. Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, clear, % , pickup

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
120, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 1, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
130, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 1, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
131, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, back or red,1/8, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
132, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 1/8, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
133, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 3/16, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
134, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 3/16, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC cusiom order
135, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 3/8, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
136. Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 3/8, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
137, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, U4, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC custom order

Opt-Out: Not Defined



To: 4vaaaal (30
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Bid: REQ

wi/1u/46 vi:50 Pl rFage 1o oF 17

From: (4647340.308)

From: (4845036508) 06/20/07 Q1:17P%  Page 1 of

Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1

1 Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Cosmodity Group Code Description )
1 Default Commodity Group

138, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 4, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
139, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 12, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
140, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 12, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
141, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, %, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
142, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, % » pick up

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
143, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 1, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC custom order
144, Polycarbonate Lexan Plastic Sheets, black or red, 1, pick up

P & E Glass, LLC custor order
145, Bullet Proof, 1/8, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC no bid
146, Bullet Proof, 1/8, pick up

P& E Glass, LLC no bid
147, Bullet Proof, 3/ 16, delivered

P & E Glass, LLC no bid

Not Defined




wi/1u/46 vi:50 Pl rFage 16 oF 1/

10: 4v4ga31 {38 From: (4v4/300308)
0:

06/25/97 92:17 M Page T oF §

H s ,
- To: apa3i748 From: (483
. s 1
ic Bi ening Page:
Fulton County Public Bid Op
Bid: RFQ
14:06:00
: Close Date/Time:
PR oY Code Description Bid Amount | |
Commedity Group . .
odity Group
b Default o Bullet Proof, 3/16, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC no bid
149, Ballet Proof, 3/8, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC no bid
159, Bullet Proof, 3/8, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC no bid
151. Bullet Proof, 4, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC no bid _
152. Bullet Proof, 4, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC no bid
153. Bullet Proof, 1, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC custom order
154, Bullet Proof, 1, pick up
P&E Glass, LLC custom order
155, Bullet Proof, 11/4, delivered
P & E Glass, LLC custom order
156. Bullet Proof, 11/4, pick up
P & E Glass, LLC custom order
157 Hourly rate for normal hours, J ourneyman, one story
P & E Glass, LLC $33.00
158, Hourly rate for normal hours, Journeyman, two/+storieg .
P & E Glass, LLC $30.00
|

Opt-Out: Not Defined



To: 4vaaaal (30 From: (4647340.308) wi/1u/46 vi:50 Pl rFage 17 oF 1/

To: 4883174 From: (4M8900588) 06/28/47 @:1T P8 Page tof |

Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
Bid: RFQ
e Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code Description '

1 Default Commodity Group
159. Hourly rate for normal hours, Apprentice, one story
P&EClass LLC $41.00

160.  Hourly rate for normal hours, Apprentice, two/+stories
P & E Glass, LLC $38.00

161. Hourly rate for work beyond normal hours, Journeyman, one story
P & E Glass, LLC $49.50

162. Hourly rate for work beyond normal hours, Journeyman, two/+stories
P & E Glass, LLC $57.50

163. Hourly rate for work beyond normal hours, Apprentice, one story
P & E Glass, LLC $45.00

164. Hourly rate for work beyond normal hours, Apprentice, two/+ stories
P & E Glass, LLC $53.00

Opt-Out: Not Defined





