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Vellano Bros., Inc.

Cambridge Brass Limited

Fegerson Waterworks

HD Supply Waterworks, LTD.

Delta Municipal Supply Co.

Accu-Flo Meter & Brass

Bid# 09ITB68133A-DR

Bid Description: Small Water meter Inst.

120 Cusseta Rd. Bldg. B
Columbus, Ga. 31901

140 Orion Place
Cambridge , ON, Canada NIR-5V1

5457Technology PKWY.
Braselton, Ga. 30517

3710 B Atlanta Ind. PKWY.
Atlanta, Ga.30331

855 Marathon PKWY. Suite 3
Lawrenceville,Ga. 30046

8 Mashburn St.
Hawkinsville, Ga. 31036

Date: _September22, 2009 Petter Paskel-706-322-6160 Pat Werby- 519-621-5520 Bob McWhorter-770-967-1845 Susan Helms-404-691-0373 David Lyle-770-277-0211 Mark Alexender-478-783-4460
Item# Bid Items: Qy Unit Price Total Qty Unit Price Total Qy Unit Price Total Qy Unit Price Total Qy | Unit Price Total Qty | Unit Price Total
|. Copper Coupling
1] 150 |10.45 1,567.50 (150 9.95 150 9.48 150 (9.34 1,401 150 (9.77 1,465.50 150 9.82
Grip joint, copper coupling, 3/4" x 1"
(est. annual usage -150) 1.492.50 1,422 1,473.00
2 150 1,350.00 150 150 150 150 150
Grip joint, copper coupling, 3/4" x 3/4"
(est. annual usage -150) $9.00 no bid $8.16 1.224 8.04 1,206.00 8.64 1,296 8.45 1.267.50
150 150 150 150 150 150
Grip joint, copper coupling, 1" x 1" (est.
annual usage - 150) $10.35 1,552.50 $9.81 $1,471.50 $9.34 $1,401.00 $9.20 1,380.00 9.63 1,444.50 9.67 1,450.50
4 200 200 200 200 200 200
3-part union, flared copper coupling, 3/4"
X 3/4" (est. annual usage -200) $9.00 1,800.00 8.57 1,714.00 $8.16 1,632.00 $7.42 1,484.00 9.77 1,954 8.45 1,690.00
5 200 200 200 200 200 200
3-part union, flared copper coupling, 3/4"
x 1" (est. annual usage -200) $10.45 2,090.00 $9.95 1,990.00 $9.48 $1.896.00 $10.98 2,196.00 9.63 1.926 9.82 1,964.00
6 25 25 25 25 25 25
3-part union, flared copper coupling, 1" x
1" (est. annual usage -25) $11.00 275 $9.81 245.25 $9.34 $233.50 $12.98 324.50 9.63 240.75 9.67 241.75
7 25 25 25 25 25 25
3-part union, with grip joint cts, 1 %" x 1
%" (est. annual usage -25) 32 800 no bid $28.58 $714.50 $28.13 703.25 31.04 776 no bid
8 3-part union, with grip joint cts, 2" x 2" % % % 2 % 2
(est. annual usage -25) $45.50 1.137.50 no bid $38.59 $964.75 $37.99 949.75 40.54 1.013.50 39.94 998.5
9 100 100 100 100 100 100
Straight, copper coupling, 3/4" flair x
3/4", MIPT (est. annual usage -100) $6.60 660 $6.26 $626.00 $5.96 $596.00 $5.88 588.00 6.02 602 6.17 617
10, 100 100 100 100 100 100
Straight, copper coupling, 3/4" flare x
3/4", FIPT (est. annual usage -100) $6.50 650 $6.26 $626.00 $5.88 $588.00 $5.88 588.00 5.94 594 6.09 609
11 25 25 25 25 25 25
Copper coupling, 1"flair x 1", FIPT (est.
annual usage -25) $10.50 262.5 $9.46 $236.50 $9.01 $225.25 $8.87 221.75 9.1 2275 9.33 233.25
12, 25 25 25 25 25 25
Copper coupling, 1"flair x 1", MIPT (est.
annual usage -25) 9.95 248.75 $8.93 236.5 $8.52 213 8.38 209.50 8.77 219.25 9.33 233.25
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11. Corporation Stops
13 100 100 100 100 100 100
3/4" inlet with AWWA taper thread x 3/4"
compression outlet (est. annual usage -
100) $16.55 1,655 $15.72 $1,572.00 $14.99 $1,499.00 $14.75 1,475.00 15.42 1,542 15.51 1,551
14 100 100 100 100 100 100
1" inlet with AWWA taper thread x
1"compression outlet (est. annual usage -
100) 25 2,500 $23.78 2,378 $22.66 2,266 22.31 2,231.00 23.37 2,337 23.46 2,346
15, 50 50 50 50 50 50
1% inlet with MIPT x 1 2" grip joint cts
outlet (est. annual usage -50) $65.00 3,250 no bid $58.32 2,916 57.41 2,870.50 58.06 2,903 99.85 4,992.50
16 25 25 25 25 25 25
2" inlet with MIPT x 2" grip joint cts
outlet (est. annual usage -25) $115.00 2,875 no bid $96.46 $2,411.50 $94.96 2,374.00 97.35 2,433.75 31.65 791.25
111. Curb Stops
17 100 100 100 100 100 100
3/4" full port compression x 3/4"
compression outlet (est. annual usage -
100) $34.00 3,400 $32.09 3,209.00 $30.57 $3,057.00 $29.16 2,916.00 30.86 3,086 31.65 3,165
18, 20 20 20 20 20 20
3/4" full flare inlet x 3/4" FIPT outlet
(est. annual usage -20) $34.80 696 $29.58 591.60 $28.16 $563.20 $27.72 554.40 28.44 568.8 29.17 583.4
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19, 50 50 50 50 50 50
1" full port compression x 1"
compression outlet (est. annual usage -
50) $53.00 2,650 $47.75 $2,387.50 $45.49 $2,274.50 $43.85 2,192.50 45.91 2,295.50 47.09 2,354.50
20 25 25 25 25 25 25
1" full flare inlet X 1" FIP outletW/W
(est. annual usage -25) $46.95 1,173.75 $41.32 $1,033.00 $39.37 $984.25 $38.76 969.00 39.73 993.25 40.75 1,018.75
21 25 25 25 25 25 25
1% " FIPT inlet x 1 %2 " FIPT outlet (est.
annual usage -25) $81.00 2,025 $71.31 $1,782.75 $67.93 $1,698.25 $65.95 1,648.75 69.97 1,749.25 70.33 1,758.25
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22 25 25 25 25 25 25
2" FIPT inlet x 2" FIPT outlet (est.
annual usage -25) $118.00 2,950 $103.82 $2,595.50 $98.91 $2,472.75 $97.97 2,449.25 101.83 2,545.75 102.39 2,559.75
1V. Meter Couplings
23 1,000 1,000 1,000 1,000 1,000 1,000
3/4" x 12", straight meter coupling,
MIPT, with hex on barrel, (est. annual
usage -1000) no bid $24.02 $24.020.00 $22.89 $22,890.00 $22.54 22.,540.00 24.1 24,100 23.69 23.690
24 100 100 100 100 100 100
3/4" swivel nut x 3/4" MIPT x 2" length,
(est. annual usage -100) no bid no bid $4.36 $436.00 $4.29 429.00 4.69 469 6.2 620
V. Meter Flanges and Accessories
25, 50 50 50 50 50 50
1 1/2" FIPT inlet X 1 1/2" flange outlet
(est. annual usage 50) no bid $18.61 930.5 $17.73 886.5 17.45 872.50 18.89 944.5 18.35 917.5
26, 50 50 50 50 50 50
2" IP with set screws for brass or iron
pipe inlet x_flanged outlet (est. annual -50 no bid no bid $42.51 2,125.50 41.85 2,092.50 44.9 2,245 61 3,050
27
1% " meter test tee assembly with two
(2) ball valves (est. annual usage -20) 20 no bid 20[no bid 20[no bid 20 331.58 6,631.60 20 240.88 4,817.60 20 510 10,200
28,
2" meter test tee assembly with two (2)
ball valves (est. annual usage-20) 20[no bid 20[no bid 20[no bid 20 442.11 8,842.20 20 314.6 6,292 20 660 13,200
VI. Meter Setters
29
1-1/2" by-pass/ meter setter (est.
annual usage — 30) 30|no bid 30]|no bid 30]|no bid 30 331.58 9,947.40 30| 478.88 14,366.40 30 442 13,260
30,
2" by pass/ meter setter (est. annual
usage — 40) 40|no bid 40 no bid 40| no bid 40| $442.11 17,684.40 40| 44955 17,982 40 630 25,200
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31[3/4" x 3/4" x3/4" grip joint tee, all
connections suitable for plastic or copper
tube (est. annual usage -30) 30]no bid 30 no bid 30| $19.76 $592.80 30| $19.45 583.50 30 20.35 610.5 30 20.46 613.8
32
2" MIP X 1" flare X 1" flair X 1"flair MIP
(est. annual usage -25) 25|no bid 25 no bid 25| $61.09 $1,527.25 25| $76.36 1,909.00 25 52 1,300 25 250 6,250
VII. Brass Taping Saddles & Solid Saddles
33
6" Saddles x 2" tap (est. annual usage- (50) 50 86.8] $4,340.00 50| $78.12 $3,906.00 50| $74.47 3,723.50 50| $22.24 1,112 50 83.12 4,156 50 77.05 3,852.50
34
8" Saddles x 2" tap (est. annual usage-
(20) 20 98 1,960 20 $88.22 $1,764.40 20| $84.08 $1,681.60 20| $27.80 556.00 20 94.83 1,896.60 20 87.01 1,740.20
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35,
10" Saddles x 2" tap (est. annual usage-
(20) 20 125 2,500 20 112,49 $2,249.80 20| $107.22 $2,144.40 20| $36.68 733.60 20 120.16 2,403.20 20| 110.93 2,218.60
36,
12" Saddles x 2" tap (est. annual usage-
(30) 30 145.5 4,365 30| $128.04 $3,841.20 30| $122.14 | $3,664.20 30| $43.97 1,319.10 30 133.22 3,996.60 30 126.38 3,791.40
V111 Bushing (Reduce;
37
Brass hex bushing, 3/4" FIPT x 1" MIPT
(est. annual usage -200) 200 2.05 410 200 no bid 200| $3.87 $774.00 200 $1.75 350.00 200 3.44 688 200 16.9 3,380
38,
2" MIPT x 3/4" WIPT CC Threads (est.
annual usage -20) 20, 20 400 20| $17.14 $342.80 20| $18.16 $363.20 20| $17.88 357.60 20, 17.18 343.6 20, 18.31 366.2
39
2" MIPT x 1" WIPT CC Threads (est. annual
usage -20) 20 21.85 437 20 $18.56 $371.20 20| $19.66 $393.20 20| $19.35 387.00 20 18.85 377 20(no bid
40,
2" MIPT x 1 1/2" WIPT reducer (est. annual
usage -20) 20|no bid 20 no bid 20| $15.57 $311.40 20| $7.72 154.40 20 27 540 20(no bid
1X. Tee's
41
3/4" Tee's compression (est. annual usage -
30) 30 23.1 693 30 $20.75 $622.50 30| $19.76 $592.80 30| $19.45 583.50 30 20.75 622.5 30 20.46 613.8
42
2" Tee's (est. annual usage -25) 25 121 3,025 25| $110.44 $2,761.00 25| $105.24 | $2,631.00 25| $103.61 2,590.25 25 110.2 2,755 25| 108.92 2,723
X. Brass stock
3/4" x close length nipple (est. annual
43 |usage -100) 100 15 150 100 no bid 100 $1.25 125 100 1.21 121.00 100 1.16 116 100 4.67 467
44
3/4" x 12" nipple (est. annual usage - 100)| 100 9.25 925 100 no bid 100| $7.69 769 100 7.41 741.00 100 7.15 715 100 28.74 2,874
45
3/4" nipple coupling (est. annual usage -|
100) 100 1.95/195 100 no bid 100| $3.64 $364.00 100| $1.75 175.00 100 3.47 347 100 8.2 820
46,
3/4" 90 degree elbow (est. annual
usage - 50) 50 2.5 125 50 no bid 50 $4.15 $207.50 50 $2.16 108.00 50 3.92 196 50 9.66 483
47
1" x 12" nipple (est. annual usage - 50) 50 13.85 692.5 50 no bid 50| $11.53 $576.50 50| $11.11 555.50 50 10.6 530 50 43.2 2,160
48
1" nipple coupling (est. annual usage -
0) 50 2.95 147.5 50 no bid 50| $6.21 $310.50 50| $2.67 133.50 50 5.81 290.5 50 12.44 622
49
1" 90 degree elbow (est. annual usage -
50) 50 3.75 187.5 50 no bid 50| $6.74 $337.00 50| $3.35 167.50 50 6.38 319 50 14.74 737
50,
1% " x close length nipple (est. annual
usage - 100) 100 4.4 440 100 no bid 100| $3.62 $362.00 100| $3.48 348.00 100 3.4 340 100 13.52 1,352
51
1% " x4" nipple (est. annual usage - 100)| 100 8.45 845 100 no bid 100| $6.98 $698.00 100| $6.72 672.00 100 6.49 649 100 26 2,600
52
1% " x6" nipple (est. annual usage - 100)| 100 12.3 1,230 100 no bid 100| $10.30 $1,030.00 100| $9.94 994.00 100 9.58 958 100 38.56 3,856
53]
1% " x 12" nipple (est. annual usage -
100) 100)24.25 2,425 100{no bid 100 $20.00 2,000 100 19.49 1,949.00 100 10.72 1,072 100 75.64 7,564
54
1% " coupling (est. annual usage - 100) 100 6.1 610 100{no bid 100 13.34 1334 100 5.66 566/ 100 12.75 1,275 100 26.4 2,640
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1 % " 90 degree elbow (est. annual

55|usage - 100) 100(7.15 715 100{no bid 100 13.34 1,334 100 6.64 664 100 111.17 11,117 100 29.33 2,640
2" x close length nipple (est. annual

56|usage - 100) 100 6.55 655 100|no bid 100 5.51 551 100 5.31 531] 100 5.16 516 100 20.56 2,933

57] 2" x 4" nipple (est. annual usage - 100) 100 10.7 1,070 100{no bid 100 8.98 898| 100 8.65 865| 100 8.32 832 100 33.56 3,356

58| 2" x 6" nipple (est. annual usage - 100) 100 15.8 1.580 100|no bid 100 13.11 1311 100 12.77 1.277| 100 12.29 1.229 100 49.5 4,950

59| 2" x 12" nipple (est. annual usage - 100) 100 31.2 3,120 100{no bid 100 25.83 2,583| 100 25.16 2,516| 100 24.05 2,405 100 97.6 9,760

60| 2" coupling (est. annual usage - 100) 100 10 1,000 100]no bid 100 22.05 2,205| 100 9.32 932| 100 21.08 2,108 100 43.52 4,352
2" 90 degree elbow (est. annual usage -

61]100) 100 116 1,160 100]no bid 100 21.52 2,152| 100 10.82 1,082 100 20.59 2,059 100 47.72 4,772
TOTAL PRICE $ $70,971.00 $64,997.00 $95,137.30 $125,005.20 $150,192.30 $206,523.15

65

66
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