FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 20050008YB

BID OPEN DATE: DECEMBER 28, 2004
DESCRIPTION: STANDBY LANDSCAPE DESIGN & TREE PLAN ' COMMODITY:
DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENT & COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:

PAGE 1 OF 18
REQUISITION #:

CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

PHONE #: 404-730-5807

DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME
PROLANDSCAPES INC. CKB LANDSCAPE & CONSTRUCTION OAKWOOD A.P.C.I. GIBSON LANDSCAPE SERVICES LAWN TECH LANDSCAPINC NON-RESPONSIVE
OF VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDORS
PRODUCT
AND
OR ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: OTHER
SERVICES 3592 MCELROY ROAD 761 W. WESLEY CHAPEL RC 48 ARCADO ROAL 9200 TURNER ROAD 10866 FORREST RD
DESIRED DORAVILLE, GA 3034C FT. VALLEY, GA 3103C LILBURN, GA 30047-298¢ JONESBORO, GA 30236 GRANTVILLE, GA 3022C INFORMATION
FAX: FAX: 478-825-0961 FAX: 770-381-8421 FAX: 770-472-8625 FAX:
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: 478-827-047¢ TELEPHONE: 770-381-245€ TELEPHONE: 770-473-989% TELEPHONE:
ITEM CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON:
HUGH GLIDEWELL KEITH V. HOOGSTAD SCOTT ANDERSON TONY R. GIBSON KIMBERLY A. BURKETT
DESCRIPTIONS DATE: 12/28/04 DATE: 12/28/04 DATE: 12/28/04 DATE: 12/28/04 DATE: 12/28/04
ESTIMATED HOURS COSTS UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1. PROJECT DIRECTOR 25 HOURS $80.00 $875.00 $75.00 $1,250.00
$1,125.00
2. GEORGIA REGISTERED LANDSCAPE 200 HOURS $80.00 $19,000.00 $100.00 $20,000.00
ARCHITECT $16,000.00
3. LANDSCAPE CONTRACTOR 300 HOURS $20.00 $10,500.00 $50.00 $15,000.00
$6,000.00
4. LABORERS 300 HOURS $15.00 $5,700.00 $25.00 $4,500.00
$4,500.00
5. CLERICAL 25 HOURS $20.00 $450.00 $20.00 $500.00
$500.00
6.
7.
8.
9.
10.
GRAND TOTAL
TERMS
DELIVERY F.O.B.
NO OF BIDS MAILED: 248 BUYER'S NAME. CHARLES TEONARLC DATE RECEIVED: 12/28/04
NO OF BIDS RECEIVED: 7 DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL) DATE COMPLETED: 01/10/04
NO OF BIDS RECEIVED MBE/FBE 0 PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE COMPLETED BY: LISA R. MCKINE
NO OF BIDS MBE/FBE MAILEC 18 CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE
NO OF NO BIDS RECEIVED: 0
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CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

PHONE #: 404-730-5807

DESCRIPTION

DESCRIPTIONS

1. VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

[5. VENDOR NAME

PROLANDSCAPES, INC.

CKB LANDSCAPE & CONSTRUCTION

OAKWOOD A.P.C.I.

GIBSON LANDSCAPE SERVICES

LAWN TECH LANDSCAPINC

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

BOTANICAL NAME

UNIT PRICE

QUANTITY PRICE

UNIT PRICE QUANTITY PRICE

UNIT PRICE

QUANTITY PRICE

UNIT PRICE QUANTITY PRICE

UNIT PRICE QUANTITY PRICE

NON-RESPONSIVE

ACER BUERGERANUM
1. TRIDENT MAPLE:

SIZE: 2" -21/2"

QUANTITY: 150

$160.00

$24,000.00

$210.00 $31,500.00

$200.00

$30,000.00

$208.01 $31,202.10

$167.00 $25,050.00

ACER BUERGERANUM
2. TRIDENT MAPLE:

SIZE: 4"

QUANTITY: 4

$400.00

$1,600.00

$405.00 $1,620.00

$455.00

$1,820.00

$355.31 $1,421.24

$557.00 $2,228.00

ACER RUBRUM
3. RED MAPLE

3"-31/2"

QUANTITY: 10

$260.00

$2,600.00

$225.00 $2,250.00

$325.00

$3,250.00

$296.84 $2,968.42

$421.00 $4,210.00

ACER RUBRUM
4. RED MAPLE

4

QUANTITY: 31

$440.00

$13,640.00

$385.00 $11,935.00

$455.00

$14,105.00

$424.58 $13,161.83

$636.00 $19,716.00

ACER RUBRUM "OCTOBER GLORY"

5. OCTOBER GLORY RED MAPLE
2" - 2-1/2"
QUANTITY: 5

$160.00

$800.00

$210.00 $1,050.00

$185.00

$925.00

$190.70 $953.49

$159.00 $795.00

ACER RUBRUM "OCTOBER GLORY"

6. OCTOBER GLORY RED MAPLE
3"
QUANTITY: 16

$280.00

$4,480.00

$325.00 $5,200.00

$300.00

$4,800.00

$273.00 $4,368.07

$421.00 $6,736.00

ACER RUBRUM "OCTOBER GLORY"

7. OCTOBER GLORY RED MAPLE
3"-31/2"
QUANTITY: 7

$290.00

$2,030.00

$345.00 $2,415.00

$300.00

$2,100.00

$296.84 $2,077.89

$421.00 $2,947.00

ACER RUBRUM "OCTOBER GLORY"

8. OCTOBER GLORY RED MAPLE
3-1/2"-4
QUANTITY: 5

$320.00

$1,600.00

$550.00 $2,750.00

$385.00

$1,925.00

$381.29 $1,906.43

$532.00 $2,660.00

ACER RUBRUM 'ARMSTRONG'
9. COLUMNAR RED MAPLE

3" -31/2"

QUANTITY: 154

$300.00

$46,200.00

$390.00 $60,060.00

$315.00

$48,510.00

$279.53 $43,046.97

$532.00 $81,928.00

ACER RUBRUM "OCTOBER GLORY"

10. OCTOBER GLORY RED MAPLE
4
QUANTITY: 29

$440.00

$12,760.00

$585.00 $16,965.00

$515.00

$14,935.00

$480.91 $13,946.32

$636.00 $18,444.00

ACER TRUNCATUM
11. PURPLE BLOW MAPLE

2" -2-1/2"

QUANTITY: 150

$160.00

$24,000.00

$210.00 $31,500.00

$295.00

$44,250.00

$210.15 $31,522.61

$167.00 $25,050.00

BETULA NIGRA
12. RIVER BIRCH

11-12'

QUANTITY: 4

$140.00

$560.00

$195.00 $780.00

$220.00

$880.00

$186.31 $745.25

$127.00 $508.00

BETULA NIGRA
13. RIVER BIRCH

o

QUANTITY: 14

$140.00

$1,960.00

$210.00 $2,940.00

$173.60

$2,430.40

$169.00 $2,365.97

$127.00 $1,778.00

BETULA NIGRA "DURA HEAT"
14. RIVER BIRCH

12'-14'

QUANTITY: 2

$200.00

$400.00

$245.00 $490.00

$310.00

$620.00

$225.33 $450.66

$175.00 $350.00

CARPINUS BETULAS FASTIGATA
15. UPRIGHT EUROPEAN HORNBEAN

3" -3-1/2

QUANTITY: 150

$380.00

$57,000.00

$395.00 $59,250.00

$390.00

$58,500.00

$400.74 $60,110.00

$302.00 $45,300.00
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16.

CARPINUS CAROLINIANA
IRONWOOD

8'-10'

QUANTITY: 5

$150.00

$750.00

$185.00 $925.00

$255.00

$1,275.00

$249.06 $1,245.28

$95.00 $475.00

17.

CEDRUS DEODARA
DEODAR CEDAR
12'-14'

QUANTITY: 8

$580.00

$4,640.00

$525.00 $4,200.00

$710.00

$5,680.00

$597.74 $4,781.88

$398.00 $3,184.00

18.

CERCIDIPHYLUM JAPONICUM
KATSURA TREE

3"-31/2"

QUANTITY: 5

$350.00

$1,750.00

$395.00 $1,975.00

$590.00

$2,950.00

$348.79 $1,743.95

$318.00 $1,590.00

19.

CERCIDIPHYLUM JAPONICUM
KATSURA TREE

4

QUANTITY: 29

$600.00

$17,400.00

$475.00 $13,775.00

$690.00

$20,010.00

$480.91 $13,946.32

$532.00 $15,428.00

20.

CERCIS CANADENSIS
REDBUD

2" -

QUANTITY: 9

$180.00

$1,620.00

$165.00 $1,485.00

$175.00

$1,575.00

$186.31 $1,676.82

$131.00 $1,179.00

21.

CERCIS CANADENSIS
REDBUD

8'-10'

QUANTITY: 10

$150.00

$1,500.00

$165.00 $1,650.00

$195.00

$1,950.00

$162.48 $1,642.76

$51.00 $510.00

22.

CHIONANTHUS VIRGINICUS
FRINGE TREE

6'-7'

QUANTITY: 9

$180.00

$1,620.00

$165.00 $1,485.00

$265.00

$2,385.00

$190.59 $1,715.28

$119.00 $833.00

23.

CHIONANTHUS VIRGINICUS
FRINGE TREE

6'-8'

QUANTITY: 7

$180.00

$1,260.00

$175.00 $1,225.00

$265.00

$1,855.00

$190.59 $1,334.11

$191.00 $4,966.00

24.

CLADRASTIS LUTEA
AMERICAN YELLOW WOOD
o

QUANTITY: 26

$180.00

$4,680.00

$210.00 $5,460.00

$195.00

$5,070.00

$203.67 $5,395.44

$191.00 $4,966.00

25.

CORNUS FLORIDA
DOGWOOD

o

QUANTITY: 14

$140.00

$1,960.00

$210.00 $2,940.00

$170.00

$2,380.00

$169.00 $2,365.97

$151.00 $2,114.00

26.

CRYPTOMERIA JAPONICA
JAPANESE CRYPTOMERIA
12'-14'

QUANTITY: 18

$400.00

$7,200.00

$425.00 $7,650.00

$475.00

$8,550.00

$580.42 $10,447.54

$365.00 $6,570.00

27.

CRYPTOMERIA JAPONICA
JAPANESE CRYPTOMERIA
4

QUANTITY: 43

$380.00

$16,340.00

$625.00 $26,875.00

$375.00

$16,125.00

$883.56 $37,993.08

$556.00 $23,908.00

28.

CRYPTOMERIA JAPONICA
JAPANESE CRYPTOMERIA
6

QUANTITY: 358

$180.00

$64,440.00

$125.00 $44,750.00

$150.00

$53,700.00

$129.98 $46,533.20

$156.00 $55,848.00

29.

FAGUS GRANDIFLORA
AMERICAN BEECH

4

QUANTITY: 8

$400.00

$3,200.00

$585.00 $4,680.00

$470.00

$3,760.00

$615.05 $4,920.41

$532.00 $4,256.00

30.

FRAXINUS OXICARPA "RAYWOOD"

RAYWOOD ASH
45"
QUANTITY: 27

$800.00

$21,600.00

$655.00 $17,685.00

$605.00

$16,335.00

$654.07 $17,659.82

$668.00 $18,036.00
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1. VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

[5. VENDOR NAME

PROLANDSCAPES, INC.

CKB LANDSCAPE & CONSTRUCTION

OAKWOOD A.P.C.I.

GIBSON LANDSCAPE SERVICES

LAWN TECH LANDSCAPINC
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TOTAL

UNIT PRICE TOTAL

UNIT PRICE TOTAL

NON-RESPONSIVE

31.

FRAXINUS PENNSYLVATICA
GREEN ASH

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 10

$260.00

$2,600.00

$395.00 $3,950.00

$320.00

$3,200.00

$392.08 $3,920.80

$325.00 $3,250.00

32.

FRAXINUS PENNSYLVATICA
GREEN ASH

4

QUANTITY: 5

$400.00

$2,000.00

$525.00 $2,625.00

$550.00

$2,750.00

$480.91 $2,404.54

$477.00 $2,385.00

33.

GINKGO BILOBA
GINKGO

o

QUANTITY: 5

$200.00

$1,000.00

$210.00 $1,050.00

$215.00

$1,075.00

$177.66 $888.28

$199.00 $995.00

34.

GINKGO BILOBA "SARATOGA"
SARATOGA GINKGO

45"

QUANTITY: 72

$400.00

$28,800.00

$850.00 $61,200.00

$785.00

$56,520.00

$703.88 $50,679.27

$675.00 $48,600.00

35.

GLEDITSIA TRIACANTHOS 'INERMIS'
THORNLESS HONEY LOCUST
3"-31/2

QUANTITY: 12

$260.00

$3,120.00

$395.00 $4,740.00

$490.00

$5,880.00

$435.37 $5,224.44

$294.00 $3,528.00

36.

GLEDITSIA TRIACANTHOS 'INERMIS SKYL"

SKYLINE HONEY LOCUST
45"
QUANTITY: 26

$380.00

$9,880.00

$675.00 $17,550.00

$785.00

$20,410.00

$567.49 $14,754.68

$397.00 $10,322.00

37.

ILEX"NELLIE R. STEVENS"
NELLIE R. STEVENS HOLLY
6

QUANTITY: 15

$150.00

$2,250.00

$165.00 $2,475.00

$120.00

$1,920.00

$155.96 $2,393.33

$183.00 $2,745.00

38.

ILEX ATTENUATA SAVANNAH
SAVANNAH HOLLY

8'-10'

QUANTITY: 26

$180.00

$4,680.00

$225.00 $5,850.00

$195.00

$5,070.00

$240.40 $6,250.35

$238.00 $6,188.00

39.

ILEX OPACA
AMERICAN HOLLY
10'-12

QUANTITY: 6

$220.00

$1,320.00

$385.00 $2,310.00

$285.00

$1,710.00

$467.75 $2,806.52

$318.00 $1,906.00

40.

ILEX OPACA
AMERICAN HOLLY
6'-7'

QUANTITY: 28

$160.00

$4,480.00

$195.00 $5,460.00

$175.00

$4,900.00

$181.93 $5,094.01

$119.00 $3,332.00

41.

ILEX VOMITORIA "SHADOWS FEMALE"
YAUPON HOLLY

6'-7'

QUANTITY: 22

$150.00

$3,300.00

$245.00 $5,390.00

$160.00

$3,520.00

$138.64 $3,050.06

$95.00 $2,090.00

42.

JUNIPERUS VIRGINIANA
EASTERN RED CEDAR
12'-14'

QUANTITY: 11

$240.00

$8,400.00

$525.00 $5,775.00

$320.00

$3,520.00

$392.08 $4,312.88

$246.00 $2,706.00

43.

JUNIPERUS VIRGINIANA
EASTERN RED CEDAR
o

QUANTITY: 35

$160.00

$5,600.00

$165.00 $5,775.00

$170.00

$5,950.00

$156.88 $5,490.67

$143.00 $5,005.00

44.

JUNIPERUS VIRGINIANA "BRODIE"
BRODIE EASTERN RED CEDAR
8'-9'

QUANTITY: 68

$190.00

$12,920.00

$385.00 $26,180.00

$265.00

$18,020.00

$244.78 $16,645.23

$199.00 $13,532.00

45.

JUNIPERUS VIRGINIANA "BRODIE"
BRODIE EASTERN RED CEDAR
9'-10'

QUANTITY: 32

$240.00

$7,680.00

$485.00 $15,520.00

$280.00

$8,960.00

$303.25 $9,704.06

$246.00 $7,872.00
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CKB LANDSCAPE & CONSTRUCTION
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46.

JUNIPERUS VIRGINIANA "EMERALD SENT"

EMERALD SENTINEL EASTERN RED CED,
o
QUANTITY: 26

$240.00

$6,240.00

$225.00 $5,850.00

$240.00

$6,240.00

$212.29

$5,519.48

$143.00 $3,718.00

47.

KOELREUTERIA BIPINNATA
BOUGANVILLA GOLDEN RAINTREE
2"-2-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

$150.00

$75,000.00

$210.00 $105,000.00

$165.00

$82,500.00

$409.28

$204,642.38

$167.00 $83,500.00

48.

KOELREUTERIA PANICULATA
GOLDEN RAIN TREE

o

QUANTITY: 7

$140.00

$980.00

$210.00 $1,470.00

$210.00

$1,470.00

$203.63

$1,425.41

$151.00 $1,057.00

49.

KOELREUTERIA PANICULATA
GOLDEN RAIN TREE

45"

QUANTITY: 20

$400.00

$8,000.00

$585.00 $11,700.00

$420.00

$8,400.00

$574.01

$11,480.18

$557.00 $11,140.00

50.

LAGERSTROEMIA INDICA "GLENDORA WH"

GLENDORA WHITE CRAPE MYRTLE
2"-2-1/2"
QUANTITY: 54

$200.00

$10,800.00

$245.00 $13,230.00

$200.00

$10,800.00

$158.20

$8,542.95

$143.00 $7,722.00

51.

LIRIODENDRON TULIPIFERA
TULIP POPLAR

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 3

$220.00

$660.00

$385.00 $1,155.00

$250.00

$750.00

$279.53

$838.58

$294.00 $882.00

52.

LIRIODENDRON TULIPIFERA
TULIP POPLAR

4

QUANTITY: 37

$330.00

$12,210.00

$485.00 $17,945.00

$325.00

$12,025.00

$454.93

$16,832.54

$437.00 $16,169.00

53.

MAGNOLIA GRADIFLORA
SOUTHERN MAGNOLIA
12'-14'

QUANTITY: 20

$350.00

$7,000.00

$485.00 $9,700.00

$345.00

$6,900.00

$338.00

$6,759.90

$397.00 $7,940.00

54.

MAGNOLIA GRADIFLORA

BRACKEN'S BROWN BEAUTY STHRN MA!
6'-7'

QUANTITY: 32

$180.00

$5,760.00

$210.00 $6,720.00

$200.00

$6,400.00

$199.25

$6,375.84

$215.00 $6,880.00

55.

MAGNOLIA VIRGINIANA
SWEET BAY MAGNOLIA
8'-10'

QUANTITY: 5

$160.00

$800.00

$210.00 $1,050.00

$210.00

$1,050.00

$240.40

$1,201.99

$151.00 $755.00

56.

METASEQUOIA GLYPTOSTROPOIDES
DAWN REDWOOD

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 7

$340.00

$2,380.00

$395.00 $2,765.00

$285.00

$1,995.00

$279.53

$1,956.68

$278.00 $1,946.00

57.

MYRICA SERIFERA
WAX MYRTLE

6'-8'

QUANTITY: 25

$110.00

$2,750.00

$325.00 $8,125.00

$190.00

$4,750.00

$114.80

$2,870.04

$95.00 $2,375.00

58.

NYSSA SYLVATICA
BLACK GUM
2"-2-1/2"
QUANTITY: 3

$160.00

$480.00

$210.00 $630.00

$225.00

$675.00

$184.18

$552.53

$199.00 $597.00

59.

NYSSA SYLVATICA
BLACK GUM
3-1/2"-4"
QUANTITY: 3

$280.00

$840.00

$455.00 $1,365.00

$350.00

$1,050.00

$474.39

$1,423.16

$596.00 $1,788.00

60.

PINUS TAEDA
LOBLOLLY PINE
5

QUANTITY: 170

$28.00

$4,760.00

$395.00 $67,150.00

$30.00

$5,100.00

$51.14

$8,693.41

$34.00 $5,780.00




FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 20050008YB
DESCRIPTION: STANDBY LANDSCAPE DESIGN & TREE PLAN ' COMMODITY:
DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENT & COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:

BID OPEN DATE: DECEMBER 28, 2004

PAGE 6 OF 18

REQUISITION #:

CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD
PHONE #: 404-730-5807

DESCRIPTION

DESCRIPTIONS

1. VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

[5. VENDOR NAME

PROLANDSCAPES, INC.

CKB LANDSCAPE & CONSTRUCTION

OAKWOOD A.P.C.I.

GIBSON LANDSCAPE SERVICES+

LAWN TECH LANDSCAPINC

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

BOTANICAL NAME

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

NON-RESPONSIVE

61.

PINUS VIRGINIANA
VIRGINIA PINE
6'-8'

QUANTITY: 7

$38.00

$266.00

$125.00 $875.00

$40.00

$280.00

$123.46 $864.22

$92.00

$644.00

62.

PISTACIA CHINENSIS
CHINESE PISTACHIO
45"

QUANTITY: 19

$480.00

$9,120.00

$585.00 $11,115.00

$510.00

$9,690.00

$420.30 $7,985.73

$326.00

$163,000.00

63.

PLANTANUS ACERIFOLIA 'YARWOOD'

YARWOOD SYCAMORE
3"-3-1/2
QUANTITY: 500

$280.00

$140,000.00

$395.00 $197,500.00

$305.00

$152,500.00

$487.32 $243,658.88

$111.00

$1,870.00

64.

PRUNUS YEDOENSIS
YOSHINO CHERRY
o

QUANTITY: 17

$160.00

$2,720.00

$210.00 $3,570.00

$150.00

$2,550.00

$151.68 $2,578.59

$111.00

$5,772.00

65.

PRUNUS YEDOENSIS "AKEBONO"
AKEBONO YOSHINO CHERRY
2"-2-1/2"

QUANTITY: 52

$160.00

$8,320.00

$235.00 $12,220.00

$205.00

$10,660.00

$166.86 $8,676.76

$302.00

$2,416.00

66.

QUERCOS PHELLOS
WILLOW OAK

3"

QUANTITY: 8

$260.00

$2,080.00

$385.00 $3,080.00

$270.00

$2,160.00

$238.37 $1,906.98

$302.00

$604.00

67.

QUERCOS PHELLOS
WILLOW OAK
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 2

$260.00

$520.00

$385.00 $770.00

$270.00

$540.00

$279.53 $559.05

$509.00

$509.00

68.

QUERCOS PHELLOS
WILLOW OAK

4" 4-1/2"

QUANTITY: 1

$360.00

$360.00

$585.00 $585.00

$385.00

$385.00

$409.51 $409.51

$167.00

$1,169.00

69.

QUERCUS ACCUTISSIMA
SAWTOOTH OAK

o

QUANTITY: 7

$160.00

$1,120.00

$210.00 $1,470.00

$215.00

$1,505.00

$177.66 $1,243.59

$366.00

$183,000.00

70.

QUERCUS ACCUTISSIMA
SAWTOOTH OAK
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

$260.00

$130,000.00

$385.00 $192,500.00

$300.00

$150,000.00

$374.76 $187,381.88

$557.00

$12,811.00

71.

QUERCUS ACCUTISSIMA
SAWTOOTH OAK

4

QUANTITY: 23

$360.00

$8,280.00

$585.00 $13,455.00

$425.00

$9,775.00

$402.99 $9,268.67

$374.00

$3,740.00

72.

QUERCUS BICOLOUR
SWAMP WHITE OAK
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 10

$280.00

$2,800.00

$385.00 $3,850.00

$280.00

$2,800.00

$279.53 $2,795.26

$374.00

$5,236.00

73.

QUERCUS LYRATA
OVERCUP OAK
3"-3-1/2"
QUANTITY: 14

$260.00

$3,640.00

$385.00 $5,390.00

$350.00

$4,900.00

$270.87 $3,792.15

$437.00

$2,185.00

74.

QUERCUS LYRATA
OVERCUP OAK
3-1/2"-4"
QUANTITY: 5

$280.00

$1,400.00

$465.00 $2,325.00

$330.00

$1,650.00

$335.86 $1,679.29

$557.00

$10,583.00

75.

QUERCUS LYRATA
OVERCUP OAK

4

QUANTITY: 19

$320.00

$6,080.00

$585.00 $11,115.00

$385.00

$7,315.00

$402.99 $7,656.72

$557.00

$10,583.00




FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 20050008YB

BID OPEN DATE: DECEMBER 28, 2004

DESCRIPTION: STANDBY LANDSCAPE DESIGN & TREE PLAN ' COMMODITY:

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENT & COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:

PAGE 7 OF 18

REQUISITION #:

CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

PHONE #: 404-730-5807

DESCRIPTION

DESCRIPTIONS

1. VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

[5. VENDOR NAME

PROLANDSCAPES, INC.

CKB LANDSCAPE & CONSTRUCTION

OAKWOOD A.P.C.I.

GIBSON LANDSCAPE SERVICES

LAWN TECH LANDSCAPINC

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

BOTANICAL NAME

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

NON-RESPONSIVE

76.

QUERCUS MACROCARPA
BUR OAK

4

QUANTITY: 19

$360.00

$6,840.00

$585.00

$11,115.00

$405.00

$7,695.00

$515.54

$9,795.25

$366.00

$183,000.00

77.

QUERCUS NUTTALLI
NUTTALL OAK
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

$260.00

$130,000.00

$385.00

$192,500.00

$315.00

$157,500.00

$262.21

$131,104.00

$532.00

$1,596.00

78.

QUERCUS NUTTALLI
NUTTALL OAK
3-1/2"-4"

QUANTITY: 3

$280.00

$840.00

$485.00

$1,455.00

$370.00

$1,110.00

$335.86

$1,007.57

$596.00

$28,012.00

79.

QUERCUS NUTTALLI
NUTTALL OAK

4

QUANTITY: 47

$320.00

$15,040.00

$585.00

$27,495.00

$435.00

$20,445.00

$368.35

$17,312.61

$596.00

$2,384.00

80.

QUERCUS NUTTALLI
NUTTALL OAK
4"-4-1/2"

QUANTITY: 4

$320.00

$1,280.00

$585.00

$2,340.00

$455.00

$1,820.00

$374.87

$1,499.50

$326.00

$3,586.00

81.

QUERCUS PHELLOS
WILLOW OAK
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 11

$260.00

$2,860.00

$385.00

$4,235.00

$305.00

$3,355.00

$279.53

$3,074.78

$509.00

$1,527.00

82.

QUERCUS PHELLOS
WILLOW OAK

4

QUANTITY: 3

$360.00

$1,080.00

$585.00

$1,755.00

$395.00

$1,185.00

$402.99

$1,208.96

$557.00

$16,153.00

83.

QUERCUS PRINUS
CHESTNUT OAK
4

QUANTITY: 29

$420.00

$12,180.00

$585.00

$16,965.00

$395.00

$11,455.00

$567.49

$16,457.14

$557.00

$5,013.00

84.

QUERCUS RUBRA
NORTHERN RED OAK
4

QUANTITY: 9

$400.00

$3,600.00

$585.00

$5,265.00

$425.00

$3,825.00

$567.49

$5,107.39

$509.00

$4,581.00

85.

QUERCUS RUBRA
NORTHERN RED OAK
4" -4-1/2"

QUANTITY: 9

$400.00

$3,600.00

$585.00

$5,265.00

$445.00

$4,005.00

$574.01

$5,166.08

$310.00

$155,000.00

86.

QUERCUS SHUMARDII
SHUMARD OAK
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

$280.00

$140,000.00

$385.00

$192,500.00

$315.00

$157,500.00

$262.21

$131,104.88

$239.00

$1,195.00

87.

TAXODIUM DISTICUM
BALD CYPRESS
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 5

$240.00

$1,200.00

$385.00

$1,925.00

$265.00

$1,325.00

$244.89

$1,224.47

$167.00

$25,050.00

88.

TILIA CORDATA 'CORINTHIAN'
COMPACT LITTLE LEAF LINDEN
2"-2-1/2"

QUANTITY: 150

$180.00

$27,000.00

$285.00

$42,750.00

$235.00

$35,250.00

$383.31

$57,496.61

$477.00

$14,310.00

89.

TSUGA CANADENSIS
CANADIAN HEMLOCK
12'-14'

QUANTITY: 30

$300.00

$9,000.00

$650.00

$19,500.00

$415.00

$12,450.00

$398.60

$11,958.03

$239.00

$1,195.00

90.

TSUGA CANADENSIS
CANADIAN HEMLOCK
7-8

QUANTITY: 5

$200.00

$1,000.00

$425.00

$2,125.00

$310.00

$1,550.00

$162.48

$812.38

$636.00

$1,272.00




FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 20050008YB

BID OPEN DATE: DECEMBER 28, 2004

DESCRIPTION: STANDBY LANDSCAPE DESIGN & TREE PLAN ' COMMODITY:

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENT & COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:

PAGE 8 OF 18
REQUISITION #:

CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD
PHONE #: 404-730-5807

DESCRIPTION

DESCRIPTIONS

1. VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

[5. VENDOR NAME

PROLANDSCAPES, INC.

CKB LANDSCAPE & CONSTRUCTION

OAKWOOD A.P.C.I.

GIBSON LANDSCAPE SERVICES

LAWN TECH LANDSCAPINC

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

BOTANICAL NAME

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

NON-RESPONSIVE

ULMUS AMERICANA "PRINCETON"

91. AMERICAN ELM
4"-4-1/2"
QUANTITY: 2

$360.00

$720.00

$585.00

$1,170.00

$535.00

$1,070.00

$522.06

$1,044.12

$326.00

$163,000.00

ULMUS PARVIFLORA
CHINESE ELM
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

$280.00

$140,000.00

$415.00

$207,500.00

$305.00

$152,500.00

$374.76

$187,381.88

$636.00

$8,904.00

ULMUS PARVIFLORA
92. CHINESE ELM

4

QUANTITY: 14

$400.00

$5,600.00

$585.00

$8,190.00

$445.00

$6,230.00

$446.28

$6,247.86

$374.00

$187,000.00

ULMUS PARVIFOLIA 'EMERII
93. ALLEE ELM

3'-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

$320.00

$160,000.00

$415.00

$207,500.00

$395.00

$197,500.00

$504.63

$252,316.88

$103.00

$927.00

VITEX AGNUS CASTUS
94. CHASTE TREE

6'-8'

QUANTITY: 9

$160.00

$1,440.00

$185.00

$1,665.00

$185.00

$1,665.00

$138.64

$1,247.75

$437.00

$2,185.00

ZELCOVA SERRATA
95. ZELCOVA ELM

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 5

$280.00

$1,400.00

$415.00

$2,075.00

$400.00

$2,000.00

$279.53

$1,397.63

$636.00

$6,996.00

ZELCOVA SERRATA
96. JAPANESE ZELKOVA

4

QUANTITY: 11

$420.00

$4,620.00

$585.00

$6,435.00

$490.00

$5,390.00

$472.25

$5,194.74

NO BID

NO BID

FORSYTHIA X INTERMEDIA
97. FORSYTHIA

8-10 FEET

QUANTITY: 750

$35.00

$26,250.00

$24.00

$18,000.00

$17.50

$13,125.00

$55.47

$41,600.03

NO BID

NO BID

LOROPETALUM

98. CHINESE FRINGE-FLOWER
6-10 FEET
QUANTITY: 1250

$35.00

$43,750.00

$24.00

$30,000.00

$15.50

$19,375.00

$82.31

$102,883.13

NO BID

NO BID

RHUS TYPHINA OR GLABRA

99. STAGHORN OR SMOOTH SUMAC
10-15 FEET
QUANTITY: 900

$35.00

$31,500.00

$24.00

$21,600.00

$17.50

$7,500.00

$55.47

$49,920.03

NO BID

NO BID

RHUS TYPHINA OR GLABRA

100. STAGHORN OR SMOOTH SUMAC
15-25 FEET
QUANTITY: 750

$12.00

$9,000.00

$18.00

$13,500.00

$17.50

$3,750.00

$28.95

$21,711.60

NO BID

NO BID

OSMANTHUS HETEROPHYLLUS
101.HOLLY OSMANTHUS

6-10 FEET

QUANTITY: 3000

$11.00

$33,000.00

$18.00

$54,000.00

$14.50

$43,500.00

$17.26

$51,781.50

NO BID

NO BID

CALLICARPA AMERICANA
102.BEAUTYBERRY

4-6 FEET

QUANTITY: 2000

$11.00

$22,000.00

$18.00

$36,000.00

$17.00

$34,000.00

$16.65

$33,308.88

NO BID

NO BID

KERRIA JAPONICA
103. JAPANESE KERRIA

4-6 FEET

QUANTITY: 2000

$38.00

$76,000.00

$24.00

$48,000.00

$17.00

$34,000.00

$55.47

$110,933.40

NO BID

NO BID

VITEX AGNUS CASTUS
104.CHASTE TREE

10-12 FEET

QUANTITY: 1250

$12.00

$15,000.00

$21.00

$26,250.00

$15.00

$18,750.00

$28.08

$35,103.75

NO BID

NO BID




FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 20050008YB

BID OPEN DATE: DECEMBER 28, 2004

DESCRIPTION: STANDBY LANDSCAPE DESIGN & TREE PLAN ' COMMODITY:
DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENT & COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:

PAGE 9 OF 18
REQUISITION #:

CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

PHONE #: 404-730-5807

DESCRIPTION

DESCRIPTIONS

1. VENDOR NAME

2. VENDOR NAME

3. VENDOR NAME

4. VENDOR NAME

[5. VENDOR NAME

PROLANDSCAPES, INC.

CKB LANDSCAPE & CONSTRUCTION

OAKWOOD A.P.C.I.

GIBSON LANDSCAPE SERVICES

LAWN TECH LANDSCAPINC

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

NON-RESPONSIVE

BOTANICAL NAME

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE TOTAL

BERBERIS JULIANAE

105. WINTERGREEN BARBERRY
4-6 FEET
QUANTITY: 2000

$12.00

$24,000.00

$18.00 $36,000.00

$15.00

$30,000.00

$16.65

$33,308.88

NO BID NO BID

MAHONIA PINNATA
CLUSTER MAHONIA
4-6 FEET
QUANTITY: 2000

$13.50

$27,000.00

$18.00 $36,000.00

$15.00

$30,000.00

$16.65

$33,308.88

NO BID NO BID

PYRACANTHA KOIDZUMII
106. LOWDENSE PYRACANTHA

4-6 FEET

QUANTITY: 2000

$13.50

$27,000.00

$21.00 $42,000.00

$15.00

$30,000.00

$17.00

$34,001.52

NO BID NO BID

ROSA WICHURAIANA
107.KNOCK-OUT ROSE

8-16 INCHES

QUANTITY: 3000

$16.00

$48,000.00

$18.00 $54,000.00

$18.00

$54,000.00

$16.83

$50,482.80

NO BID NO BID

JUNIPERUS SPECIES
108. SEA GREEN JUNIPER

4-6 FEET

QUANTITY: 3000

$12.00

$36,000.00

$17.00 $51,000.00

$14.00

$42,000.00

$17.69

$53,080.20

NO BID NO BID

109. GATOR BAGS

35.00/BAG

$21.00

35.00/BAG

150.00/DAY TO REFILL

21.65/EACH

$30.00

110. WATERING TRUCK

65.00/HR

$750.00

500.00/DAY

26.09/HR

$50.00

111. OTHERS: SPECIFY

PINESTRAW

4.50/BALE

BOBCAT W/OPER

60.00/HR

PINESTRAW

6.00/BALE

DUMP TRUCK $50.00

HARDWOOD MULCH

30.00/CU YARD

BOBCAT $50.00




FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 20050008YB

BID OPEN DATE: DECEMBER 28, 2004

DESCRIPTION: STANDBY LANDSCAPE DESIGN & TREE PLAN ' COMMODITY:
DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENT & COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:

PAGE 10 OF 18

REQUISITION #:

CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

PHONE #: 404-730-5807

DESCRIPTION

OF
PRODUCT

OR
SERVICES
DESIRED

6. VENDOR NAME

7. VENDOR NAME

8. VENDOR NAME

9. VENDOR NAME

10. VENDOR NAME

ED CASTRO LANDSCAPE

NORTH GEORGIA LAND SERVICES

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR CODE

NON-RESPONSIVE

ADDRESS:
1125 OLD ELLIS ROAD
ROSWELL, GA 30076

ADDRESS:
155B MAULDIN DRIVE
ALPHARETTA, GA 30004

ADDRESS:

ADDRESS:

ADDRESS:

FAX: FAX:
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
ITEM CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON: CONTACT PERSON:
SHAWN CASE RANDY HUFFMAN
DESCRIPTIONS DATE: 12/28/04 DATE: 12/28/04 DATE: 12/28/04 DATE: 12/28/04 DATE: 12/28/04
ESTIMATED HOURS COSTS UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1. PROJECT DIRECTOR $50.00 30 HR
2. GEORGIA REGISTERED LANDSCAPE $100.00 80 HR
ARCHITECT
3. LANDSCAPE CONTRACTOR $50.00 30 HR
4. LABORERS $15.00 25 HR
5. CLERICAL $20.00 25 HR
6.
7.
8.
9.
10.
GRAND TOTAL
TERMS

DELIVERY F.O.B.

NO OF BIDS MAILED:

BUYER'S NAME: CHARLES LEONARLC

DATE RECEIVED: 12/28/04

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED:

DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL)

DATE COMPLETED: 01/10/04

NO OF BIDS RECEIVED MBE/FBE

PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE

COMPLETED BY: LISA R. MCKINE

NO OF BIDS MBE/FBE MAILED

CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE

NO OF NO BIDS RECEIVED:
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BID NUMBER: 20050008YB

BID OPEN DATE: DECEMBER 28, 2004

DESCRIPTION: STANDBY LANDSCAPE DESIGN & TREE PLAN ' COMMODITY:
DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENT & COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:
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REQUISITION #:
CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD
PHONE #: 404-730-5807

DESCRIPTION

DESCRIPTIONS

6. VENDOR NAME

7. VENDOR NAME

8. VENDOR NAME

9. VENDOR NAME

10. VENDOR NAME

ED CASTRO LANDSCAPE

NORTH GEORGIA LAND SERVICES

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

NON-RESPONSIVE

BOTANICAL NAME

UNIT PRICE QUANTITY PRICE

UNIT PRICE QUANTITY PRICE

UNIT PRICE

QUANTITY PRICE

UNIT PRICE

QUANTITY PRICE

UNIT PRICE

QUANTITY PRICE

ACER BUERGERANUM
TRIDENT MAPLE:
SIZE: 2" -21/2"
QUANTITY: 150

$195.53 $29,329.50

$167.00 $167.00

ACER BUERGERANUM
TRIDENT MAPLE:
SIZE: 4"

QUANTITY: 4

$557.00 $2,228.00

$550.00 $550.00

ACER RUBRUM
RED MAPLE
3"-31/2"
QUANTITY: 10

$421.00 $4,210.00

$420.00 $420.00

ACER RUBRUM
RED MAPLE

4

QUANTITY: 31

$633.15 $19,627.65

$550.00 $550.00

ACER RUBRUM "OCTOBER GLORY"

OCTOBER GLORY RED MAPLE
2" - 2-1/2"
QUANTITY: 5

$190.60 $953.00

$180.00 $180.00

ACER RUBRUM "OCTOBER GLORY"

OCTOBER GLORY RED MAPLE
3"
QUANTITY: 16

$421.00 $6,736.00

$375.00 $375.00

ACER RUBRUM "OCTOBER GLORY"

OCTOBER GLORY RED MAPLE
3"-31/2"
QUANTITY: 7

$421.00 $2,947.00

$375.00 $375.00

ACER RUBRUM "OCTOBER GLORY"

OCTOBER GLORY RED MAPLE
3-1/2"-4
QUANTITY: 5

$532.00 $2,660.00

$475.00 $475.00

ACER RUBRUM 'ARMSTRONG'
COLUMNAR RED MAPLE

3" -31/2"

QUANTITY: 154

$532.00 $81,928.00

$400.00 $400.00

10.

ACER RUBRUM "OCTOBER GLORY"

OCTOBER GLORY RED MAPLE
4
QUANTITY: 29

$636.00 $18,444.00

$635.00 $635.00

11.

ACER TRUNCATUM
PURPLE BLOW MAPLE
2" - 2-1/2"

QUANTITY: 150

$256.44 $38,466.00

$167.00 $167.00

12.

BETULA NIGRA
RIVER BIRCH
11-12'
QUANTITY: 4

$130.00 $520.00

$127.00 $127.00

13.

BETULA NIGRA
RIVER BIRCH
o

QUANTITY: 14

$130.00 $1,820.00

$127.00 $127.00

14.

BETULA NIGRA "DURA HEAT"
RIVER BIRCH

12'-14'

QUANTITY: 2

$244.09 $488.18

$175.00 $175.00

15.

CARPINUS BETULAS FASTIGATA
UPRIGHT EUROPEAN HORNBEAN
3" -3-1/2

QUANTITY: 150

$445.75 $66,862.50

$300.00 $300.00
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QUANTITY PRICE

UNIT PRICE

QUANTITY PRICE

16.

CARPINUS CAROLINIANA
IRONWOOD

8'-10'

QUANTITY: 5

$322.29 $1,611.45

$95.00 $95.00

17.

CEDRUS DEODARA
DEODAR CEDAR
12'-14'

QUANTITY: 8

$528.06 $4,224.48

$475.00 $475.00

18.

CERCIDIPHYLUM JAPONICUM
KATSURA TREE

3"-31/2"

QUANTITY: 5

$610.36 $3,051.80

$300.00 $300.00

19.

CERCIDIPHYLUM JAPONICUM
KATSURA TREE

4

QUANTITY: 29

$733.83 $21,281.07

$530.00 $530.00

20.

CERCIS CANADENSIS
REDBUD

2" -

QUANTITY: 9

$169.20 $1,522.80

$90.00 $90.00

21.

CERCIS CANADENSIS
REDBUD

8'-10'

QUANTITY: 10

$91.83 $918.30

$90.00 $90.00

22.

CHIONANTHUS VIRGINICUS
FRINGE TREE

6'-7'

QUANTITY: 9

$198.83 $1,789.47

$119.00 $119.00

23.

CHIONANTHUS VIRGINICUS
FRINGE TREE

6'-8'

QUANTITY: 7

$198.83 $1,391.81

$190.00 $190.00

24.

CLADRASTIS LUTEA
AMERICAN YELLOW WOOD
o

QUANTITY: 26

$207.06 $5,383.56

$190.00 $190.00

25.

CORNUS FLORIDA
DOGWOOD

o

QUANTITY: 14

$198.83 $2,783.62

$180.00 $180.00

26.

CRYPTOMERIA JAPONICA
JAPANESE CRYPTOMERIA
12'-14'

QUANTITY: 18

$610.36 $10,986.48

$600.00 $600.00

27.

CRYPTOMERIA JAPONICA
JAPANESE CRYPTOMERIA
4

QUANTITY: 43

$610.36 $26,245.00

$600.00 $600.00

28.

CRYPTOMERIA JAPONICA
JAPANESE CRYPTOMERIA
6

QUANTITY: 358

$198.83 $71,181.14

$180.00 $180.00

29.

FAGUS GRANDIFLORA
AMERICAN BEECH

4

QUANTITY: 8

$1,371.71 $10,973.68

$530.00 $530.00

30.

FRAXINUS OXICARPA "RAYWOOD"

RAYWOOD ASH
45"
QUANTITY: 27

$758.52 $20,480.04

$660.00 $660.00
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ED CASTRO LANDSCAPE

NORTH GEORGIA LAND SERVICES

DATE: 12/28/04
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31.

FRAXINUS PENNSYLVATICA
GREEN ASH

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 10

$325.18

$3,251.80

$300.00 $300.00

32.

FRAXINUS PENNSYLVATICA
GREEN ASH

4

QUANTITY: 5

$577.44

$2,887.20

$475.00 $475.00

33.

GINKGO BILOBA
GINKGO

o

QUANTITY: 5

$251.50

$1,257.50

$180.00 $180.00

34.

GINKGO BILOBA "SARATOGA"
SARATOGA GINKGO

45"

QUANTITY: 72

$857.29

$61,724.88

$675.00 $675.00

35.

GLEDITSIA TRIACANTHOS 'INERMIS'
THORNLESS HONEY LOCUST
3"-31/2

QUANTITY: 12

$363.44

$4,361.28

$275.00 $275.00

36.

GLEDITSIA TRIACANTHOS 'INERMIS SKYL"

SKYLINE HONEY LOCUST
45"
QUANTITY: 26

$667.98

$17,367.48

$470.00 $470.00

37.

ILEX"NELLIE R. STEVENS"
NELLIE R. STEVENS HOLLY
6

QUANTITY: 15

$183.00

$2,745.00

$180.00 $180.00

38.

ILEX ATTENUATA SAVANNAH
SAVANNAH HOLLY

8'-10'

QUANTITY: 26

$238.00

$6,188.00

$230.00 $230.00

39.

ILEX OPACA
AMERICAN HOLLY
10'-12

QUANTITY: 6

$318.00

$1,908.00

$310.00 $310.00

40.

ILEX OPACA
AMERICAN HOLLY
6'-7'

QUANTITY: 28

$200.00

$5,600.00

$110.00 $110.00

41.

ILEX VOMITORIA "SHADOWS FEMALE"
YAUPON HOLLY

6'-7'

QUANTITY: 22

$185.79

$4,087.38

$95.00 $95.00

42.

JUNIPERUS VIRGINIANA
EASTERN RED CEDAR
12'-14'

QUANTITY: 11

$281.13

$3,092.43

$240.00 $240.00

43.

JUNIPERUS VIRGINIANA
EASTERN RED CEDAR
o

QUANTITY: 35

$198.83

$6,959.05

$140.00 $140.00

44.

JUNIPERUS VIRGINIANA "BRODIE"
BRODIE EASTERN RED CEDAR
8'-9'

QUANTITY: 68

$203.63

$13,846.00

$210.00 $210.00

45.

JUNIPERUS VIRGINIANA "BRODIE"
BRODIE EASTERN RED CEDAR
9'-10'

QUANTITY: 32

$319.54

$10,225.28

$245.00 $245.00
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JUNIPERUS VIRGINIANA "EMERALD SENT"
46. EMERALD SENTINEL EASTERN RED CED. $346.29 $9,003.54 $160.00 $160.00

o

QUANTITY: 26

KOELREUTERIA BIPINNATA
47. BOUGANVILLA GOLDEN RAINTREE $239.29 $119,645.00 $165.00 $165.00

2"-2-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

KOELREUTERIA PANICULATA
48. GOLDEN RAIN TREE $257.13 $1,799.91 $151.00 $151.00

o

QUANTITY: 7

KOELREUTERIA PANICULATA

49. GOLDEN RAIN TREE $702.96 $14,059.20 $575.00 $575.00
45"
QUANTITY: 20

LAGERSTROEMIA INDICA "GLENDORA WH"
50. GLENDORA WHITE CRAPE MYRTLE $167.96 $9,069.84 $140.00 $140.00

2"-2-1/2"

QUANTITY: 54

LIRIODENDRON TULIPIFERA
51. TULIP POPLAR $300.98 $902.94 $275.00 $275.00

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 3

LIRIODENDRON TULIPIFERA
52. TULIP POPLAR $453.29 $16,771.73 $435.00 $435.00

4

QUANTITY: 37

MAGNOLIA GRADIFLORA
53. SOUTHERN MAGNOLIA $399.43 $7,988.60 $395.00 $395.00

12'-14'

QUANTITY: 20

MAGNOLIA GRADIFLORA
54. BRACKEN'S BROWN BEAUTY STHRN MA $221.46 $7,086.72 $185.00 $185.00

6'-7'

QUANTITY: 32

MAGNOLIA VIRGINIANA
55. SWEET BAY MAGNOLIA $239.29 $1,196.45 $160.00 $160.00

8'-10'

QUANTITY: 5

METASEQUOIA GLYPTOSTROPOIDES
56. DAWN REDWOOD $310.63 $2,174.41 $278.00 $278.00

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 7

MYRICA SERIFERA
57. WAX MYRTLE $185.79 $4,644.75 $115.00 $115.00

6'-8'

QUANTITY: 25

NYSSA SYLVATICA
58. BLACK GUM $274.96 $824.88 $180.00 $180.00

2"-2-1/2"

QUANTITY: 3

NYSSA SYLVATICA
59. BLACK GUM $596.00 $1,788.00 $540.00 $540.00

3-1/2"-4"

QUANTITY: 3

PINUS TAEDA
60. LOBLOLLY PINE $52.94 $8,999.80 $34.00 $34.00

5

QUANTITY: 170
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UNIT PRICE
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UNIT PRICE
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PINUS VIRGINIANA
61. VIRGINIA PINE $100.00 $700.00 $85.00 $85.00

6'-8'

QUANTITY: 7

PISTACIA CHINENSIS

62. CHINESE PISTACHIO $600.00
45"
QUANTITY: 19

$11,400.00 $585.00 $585.00

PLANTANUS ACERIFOLIA 'YARWOOD'
63. YARWOOD SYCAMORE $390.88

3"-3-1/2

QUANTITY: 500

$195,440.00 $325.00 $325.00

PRUNUS YEDOENSIS
64. YOSHINO CHERRY $167.96 $2,855.38 $120.00 $120.00

o

QUANTITY: 17

PRUNUS YEDOENSIS "AKEBONO"
65. AKEBONO YOSHINO CHERRY $176.88 $9,197.76 $120.00 $120.00

2"-2-1/2"

QUANTITY: 52

QUERCOS PHELLOS
66. WILLOW OAK $305.00 $2,440.00 $275.00 $275.00

3"

QUANTITY: 8

QUERCOS PHELLOS
67. WILLOW OAK $305.00 $610.00 $275.00 $275.00

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 2

QUERCOS PHELLOS
68. WILLOW OAK $509.00 $509.00 $500.00 $500.00
4" 4-1/2"

QUANTITY: 1

QUERCUS ACCUTISSIMA
69. SAWTOOTH OAK $203.63 $1,425.41 $165.00 $165.00

o

QUANTITY: 7

QUERCUS ACCUTISSIMA
70. SAWTOOTH OAK $366.00

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

$183,000.00 $325.00 $325.00

QUERCUS ACCUTISSIMA
71. SAWTOOTH OAK $558.00

4

QUANTITY: 23

$12,834.00 $550.00 $550.00

QUERCUS BICOLOUR
72. SWAMP WHITE OAK $374.00 $3,740.00 $375.00 $375.00

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 10

QUERCUS LYRATA
73. OVERCUP OAK $374.00 $5,236.00 $275.00 $275.00

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 14

QUERCUS LYRATA
74. OVERCUP OAK $450.00 $2,250.00 $425.00 $425.00

3-1/2"-4"

QUANTITY: 5

QUERCUS LYRATA
75. OVERCUP OAK $557.00

4

QUANTITY: 19

$10,583.00 $550.00 $550.00
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TOTAL

UNIT PRICE
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76.

QUERCUS MACROCARPA
BUR OAK

4

QUANTITY: 19

$557.00

$10,583.00

$550.00

$550.00

77.

QUERCUS NUTTALLI
NUTTALL OAK
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

$366.00

$183,000.00

$350.00

$350.00

78.

QUERCUS NUTTALLI
NUTTALL OAK
3-1/2"-4"

QUANTITY: 3

$532.00

$1,596.00

$435.00

$435.00

79.

QUERCUS NUTTALLI
NUTTALL OAK

4

QUANTITY: 47

$596.00

$28,012.00

$575.00

$575.00

80.

QUERCUS NUTTALLI
NUTTALL OAK
4"-4-1/2"

QUANTITY: 4

$596.00

$2,384.00

$575.00

$575.00

81.

QUERCUS PHELLOS
WILLOW OAK
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 11

$326.00

$3,586.00

$275.00

$275.00

82.

QUERCUS PHELLOS
WILLOW OAK

4

QUANTITY: 3

$509.00

$1,527.00

$475.00

$475.00

83.

QUERCUS PRINUS
CHESTNUT OAK
4

QUANTITY: 29

$659.75

$19,132.75

$558.00

$558.00

84.

QUERCUS RUBRA
NORTHERN RED OAK
4

QUANTITY: 9

$557.00

$5,013.00

$557.00

$557.00

85.

QUERCUS RUBRA
NORTHERN RED OAK
4" -4-1/2"

QUANTITY: 9

$515.00

$4,635.00

$557.00

$557.00

86.

QUERCUS SHUMARDII
SHUMARD OAK
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

$396.88

$198,440.00

$285.00

$285.00

87.

TAXODIUM DISTICUM
BALD CYPRESS
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 5

$292.79

$1,463.95

$290.00

$290.00

88.

TILIA CORDATA 'CORINTHIAN'
COMPACT LITTLE LEAF LINDEN
2"-2-1/2"

QUANTITY: 150

$248.21

$37,231.50

$180.00

$180.00

89.

TSUGA CANADENSIS
CANADIAN HEMLOCK
12'-14'

QUANTITY: 30

$1,015.09

$30,451.00

$475.00

$475.00

90.

TSUGA CANADENSIS
CANADIAN HEMLOCK
7-8

QUANTITY: 5

$239.00

$1,195.00

$240.00

$240.00
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ULMUS AMERICANA "PRINCETON"

91. AMERICAN ELM
4"-4-1/2"
QUANTITY: 2

$836.71

$1,673.42

$650.00

$650.00

ULMUS PARVIFLORA
CHINESE ELM
3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

$469.67

$234,835.00

$325.00

$325.00

ULMUS PARVIFLORA
92. CHINESE ELM

4

QUANTITY: 14

$636.00

$8,904.00

$635.00

$635.00

ULMUS PARVIFOLIA 'EMERII
93. ALLEE ELM

3'-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 500

$478.59

$239,295.00

$370.00

$370.00

VITEX AGNUS CASTUS
94. CHASTE TREE

6'-8'

QUANTITY: 9

$237.84

$2,140.56

$103.00

$420.00

ZELCOVA SERRATA
95. ZELCOVA ELM

3"-3-1/2"

QUANTITY: 5

$437.00

$2,185.00

$600.00

$600.00

ZELCOVA SERRATA
96. JAPANESE ZELKOVA

4

QUANTITY: 11

$726.80

$7,994.80

$14.00

$14.00

FORSYTHIA X INTERMEDIA
97. FORSYTHIA

8-10 FEET

QUANTITY: 750

$257.94

$193,455.00

$14.00

$14.00

LOROPETALUM

98. CHINESE FRINGE-FLOWER
6-10 FEET
QUANTITY: 1250

$257.94

$322,425.00

$14.00

$14.00

RHUS TYPHINA OR GLABRA

99. STAGHORN OR SMOOTH SUMAC
10-15 FEET
QUANTITY: 900

$257.94

$232,146.00

$14.00

$14.00

RHUS TYPHINA OR GLABRA

100. STAGHORN OR SMOOTH SUMAC
15-25 FEET
QUANTITY: 750

$30.66

$22,995.00

$14.00

$14.00

OSMANTHUS HETEROPHYLLUS
101.HOLLY OSMANTHUS

6-10 FEET

QUANTITY: 3000

$28.71

$86,130.00

$14.00

$14.00

CALLICARPA AMERICANA
102.BEAUTYBERRY

4-6 FEET

QUANTITY: 2000

$30.66

$61,320.00

$14.00

$14.00

KERRIA JAPONICA
103. JAPANESE KERRIA

4-6 FEET

QUANTITY: 2000

$228.62

$457,240.00

$16.00

$16.00

VITEX AGNUS CASTUS
104.CHASTE TREE

10-12 FEET

QUANTITY: 1250

$26.77

$33,462.50

$16.00

$16.00




FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 20050008YB

BID OPEN DATE: DECEMBER 28, 2004
DESCRIPTION: STANDBY LANDSCAPE DESIGN & TREE PLAN ' COMMODITY:
DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENT & COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:

PAGE 18 OF 18
REQUISITION #:

CONTACT NAME: CHARLES LEONARD

PHONE #: 404-730-5807

DESCRIPTION

DESCRIPTIONS

6. VENDOR NAME

7. VENDOR NAME

8. VENDOR NAME

9. VENDOR NAME

10. VENDOR NAME

ED CASTRO LANDSCAPE

NORTH GEORGIA LANDSCAPE

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE:

DATE: 12/28/04

DATE: 12/28/04

NON-RESPONSIVE

BOTANICAL NAME

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE TOTAL

BERBERIS JULIANAE

105. WINTERGREEN BARBERRY
4-6 FEET

QUANTITY: 2000

$26.77

$53,540.00

$14.00

$14.00

MAHONIA PINNATA
CLUSTER MAHONIA
4-6 FEET
QUANTITY: 2000

$28.71

$57,420.00

$14.00

$14.00

PYRACANTHA KOIDZUMII
106. LOWDENSE PYRACANTHA
4-6 FEET

QUANTITY: 2000

$31.63

$63,260.00

$18.00

$18.00

ROSA WICHURAIANA
107.KNOCK-OUT ROSE
8-16 INCHES
QUANTITY: 3000

$36.01

$108,030.00

$18.00

$18.00

JUNIPERUS SPECIES
108. SEA GREEN JUNIPER
4-6 FEET

QUANTITY: 3000

$23.36

$70,080.00

$14.00

$14.00

109. GATOR BAGS

$30.00

$30.00

110. WATERING TRUCK

$50.00

$225.00

111. OTHERS: SPECIFY

DUMP TRUCK
BOBCAT

$50.00
$50.00




