BID NUMBER: 05ITB37604YC

[ OPENING  2/16/2005 |

PAGE NUMBER: 1 OF 8

BID DESCRIPTION: DUCTILE IRON PIPE FITTING

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS | CONTACT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS PC #: [ 404-730-4214
o VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME
o US PIPE & FOUNDRY |AMERICAN CAST IRON PIPE[  FRANKIE THOMPSON ENT ESSENTIAL EQUIPMENT NATIONAL WATERWORKS > %
» % VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE % ;ZU
m 3 O m
2 (:3' ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS 0
Fn) z 3300 First Avenue North 3575 Koger Blvd PO BOX 960702 PO BOX 1045 2111 Moon Station Drive % g
n SID_I PO Box 10406 Suite 240 RIVERDALE, GA 30296- ATLANTA, GA 30301 Kennesaw, GA 30144 =z 0
H o Birmingham, Alabama Duluth. GA 30096 0702 8 |$.|
% 8 TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: g é
Q % 1-866-347-7473 770-381-3611 770-948-8337 404-246-0718 770-423-0585 32, %
0O
8 CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: g (;,U,
By J. D. Parsons Jeff McCullough Frankie Thompson Earnest Allen William L. Traynham
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED |QTY | UNIT |TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL
DUCTILE IRON: STANDARD PIP FITTINGS
1. MECHANICAL JINT FITTINGS (MJ) 3"-12" WITH
GASKETS, FASTENERS, GLANDS (ACCESS) TON NO BID TON NO BID TON NO BID TON NO BID TON $500.00
2. PUSH ON FITTINGS, 3"-12" WITH RESTRAINT
GASKETS, LUBRICANT (ACCESS) TON [NO BID TON |[NOBID TON NO BID EA NO BID TON $500.00
3. 16" MJ SLEEVE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $375.00
4. 16" MJ TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $775.00
5. 16" PUSH-ON TEE WITH RESTRAINT GASKETS
AND LUBRICANT (ACCESS) EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $775.00
6. 16" MJ 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $580.00
7. 16" PUSH-ON 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $470.00
8. 16" MJ 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $470.00
9. 16" PUSH-ON 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $470.00
10. 16" MJ 22.5° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $470.00
11. 16" PUSH-ON 22.5° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $470.00
12. 16" MJ SWIVEL HYDRANT TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $640.00
13. 16" SADLE X 12" MJ OUTLET W/PLUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $3,100.00
14. 18" MJ SLEEVE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $745.00
15. 18" MJ TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,545.00
16. 18" PUSH-ON TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,500.00
17. 18" MJ 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $995.00
18. 18" PUSH-ON 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $990.00
19. 18" MJ 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $820.00
20. 18" MJ PUSH-ON 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $820.00
21. 18" MJ 22.5 BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $850.00
22. 18" PUSH-ON 22.5° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $850.00
23. 20" MJ SLEEVE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $765.00
GRAND TOTAL: [
BIDS MAILED 5 NO RESPONSE: 0 ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS DATE: 2/16/2005
BIDS RECEIVED: 5 NO-BIDS: 0 CHIEF ASSISTANT: ALAN SIBERT DATE: 2/16/2005
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TAB

OPENING

BID NUMBER: 05ITB37604YC DATE: 2/16/2005 PAGE NUMBER: 2 OF 8

BID DESCRIPTION: DUCTILE IRON PIPE FITTING

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS | CONTACT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS PC #: [ 404-730-4214

VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME <
(rjn) o US PIPE & FOUNDRY |AMERICAN CAST IRON PIPE FRANKIE THOMPSON ENT ESSENTIAL EQUIPMENT NATIONAL WATERWORKS g =z
2 g (rg VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE % 8 g
009 o)
[,"; g % ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS § g %
o0Od >z
("}", 8 % TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: 5' 8 %
Py e) zZ4dZ
g o CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: ﬁ é
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED |QTY [UNIT $ |[TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ TOTAL |QTY[UNIT $ |TOTAL QTY UNIT$ |TOTAL

24. 20" MJ TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $765.00

25. 20" PUSH-ON TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,650.00

26. 20" MJ 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,125.00

27. 20" PUSH-ON 90° WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,125.00

28. 20" MJ 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $960.00

29. 20" PUSH-ON 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $960.00

30. 20" MJ 22.5° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $960.00

31. 20" PUSH-ON 22.5° BEND ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $960.00

32. 24" MJ SLEEVE WTH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,050.00

33. 24" MJ TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $2,450.00

34. 24" PUSH-ON TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $2,450.00

35. 24" MJ 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,775.00

36. 24" PUSH-ON 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,775.00

37. 24" MJ 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,370.00

38. 24" PUSH-ON 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $13.70

39. 24" MJ 22.5° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,420.00

40. 24" PUSH-ON 22.5° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,420.00

41. 24" MJ SWIVEL HYDRANT TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,730.00

42. 24" SADDLE X 12" MJ OUTLET W/PLUG & PLUG &

ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $4,650.00

43. 30" MJ SLEEVE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $2,540.00

44. 30" MJ TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $4,420.00

45. 30" PUSH-ON TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $4,420.00

46. 30" MJ 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $5,026.00

47. 30" PUSH-ON 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $5,026.00

GRAND TOTAL:

BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS DATE: 2/16/2005

BIDS RECEIVED: NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: ALAN SIBERT DATE: 2/16/2005

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TAB

BID NUMBER: 05ITB37604YC | OPENING 2/16/2005 | PAGE NUMBER: 3 OF 8
BID DESCRIPTION: DUCTILE IRON PIPE FITTING
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS | CONTACT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS PC #: | 404-730-4214
VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME <
@ o US PIPE & FOUNDRY |AMERICAN CAST IRON PIPE|  FRANKIE THOMPSON ENT ESSENTIAL EQUIPMENT NATIONAL WATERWORKS W =
2 % m VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE ; 8 g
009 oy
a g % ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS § (ﬁ @
oOd >z
5n> 8 2 TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: 6' 8 %
230 Z32z
Q T CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: ﬁ '$"
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED QTY [UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ |TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL
48. 30" MJ 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $3,050.00
49. 30" PUSH-ON 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $3,050.00
50. 30" MJ 22.5° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $2,801.00
51. 30" PUSH-ON 22.5° BEND WITH ACCCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $2,801.00
52. 30" MJ SWIVEL HYRANT TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $5,600.00
53. 30" SADDLE X 12" MJ OUTLET W/PLUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
54. 36" MJ SLEEVE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $4,400.00
55. 36" MJ TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $11,075.00
56. 36" MJ 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $5,011.00
57. 36" MJ 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $5,011.00
58. 36" MJ 22.5° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $5,011.00
59. 36" MJ SWIVEL HYDRANT TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
60. 36" SADDLE X 12" MJ OUTLET W/PLUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
61. 42" MJ SLEEVE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA 4,864.41 EA NO BID
62. 42" MJ TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA 16,498.34 EA NO BID
63. 42" MJ 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA 9,161.51 EA NO BID
64. 42" MJ 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA 6,873.26 EA NO BID
65. 42" MJ 22.5° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA 5,723.83 EA NO BID
66. 42" MJ SWIVEL HYDRANT TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
67. 42" SADDLE X 12" MJ OUTLET W/PLUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
68. 54" MJ SLEEVE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
69. 54" MJ TEE WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA 37,173.71 EA NO BID
70. 54" MJ 90° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA 17,650.12 EA NO BID
71. 54" MJ 45° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA 13,809.04 EA NO BID
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS DATE: 2/16/2005
BIDS RECEIVED: NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: ALAN SIBERT DATE: 2/16/2005
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TAB

BID NUMBER: 05ITB37604YC | OPENING 2/16/2005 | PAGE NUMBER: 4 OF 8
BID DESCRIPTION: DUCTILE IRON PIPE FITTING
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS | CONTACT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS PC #: [ 404-730-4214
VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME <
f.’n’ o US PIPE & FOUNDRY |AMERICAN CAST IRON PIPE FRANKIE THOMPSON ENT ESSENTIAL EQUIPMENT NATIONAL WATERWORKS g =
2 % g VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE % 8 g
000 T X0
a g % ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS § 2 %
oOd > Z
c",'; 3 2 TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: (:3' 8 %
P ie) Z4dz
8 i CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: % '$"
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED |QTY [UNIT $ |TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ TOTAL |QTY[UNIT $ |TOTAL QTY UNIT$ |TOTAL
72. 54" MJ 22.5° BEND WITH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA 10,366.87 EA NO BID
73. 54" MJ SWIVEL HYDRANT TEE WTH ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
74. 54" SADDLE X 12" MJ OUTLET W/PLUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
DUCTILE IRON: STANDARD FLANGED FITTINGS:
75. 3" FLANGE X FLANGE 90° BEND W/FULL FACE
GASKETS/FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $44.00
76. 4" FLANGE X FLANGE 90° WITH FULL FACE
GASKETS/FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $70.00
77. 6" FLANGE X FLANGE 90° WITH FULL FACE
GASKETS AND FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $98.00
78. 6" FLANGE X FLANGE 45° WITH FULL FACE
GASKETS AND FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $98.00
79. 6" FLANGE TEE WITH FULL FACE GASKETS AND
FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $153.00
80. 8" FLANGE X FLANGE 90° WITH FULL FACE
GASKETS AND FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $159.00
81. 8" FLANGE X FLANGE 45° WITH FULL FACE
GASKETS AND FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $153.00
82. 8" FLANGE TEE WITH FULL FACE GASKETS AND
FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $271.00
83. 10" FLANGE X FLANGE 90° WITH FULL FACE EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $259.00
84. 10" FLANGE X FLANGE 45° WITH FULL FACE
GASKETS AND FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $239.00
85. 10" FLANGE TEE WITH FULL FACE GASKETS AND
FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $422.00
86. 12" FLANGE X FLANGE 90° WITH FULL FACE
GASKETS AND FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $389.00
87. 12" FLANGE X FLANGE 45° WITH FULL FACE
GASKETS AND FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $345.00
88. 12" FLANGE TEE WITH FULL FACE GASKETS AND
FASTENERS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $583.00
89. 3" FLANGE X PLAIN END SPOOL PIECE 48" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $55.58
90. 4" FLANGE X PLAIN END SPOOL PIECE "48 EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $105.00
91. 6" FLANGE X PLAIN END SPOOL PIECE 72" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $155.00
92. 8" FLANGE X PLAIN END SPOOL PIECE 72" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $205.00
93. 10" FLANGE X PLAIN END SPOOL PIECE 72" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $290.00
94. 12" FLANGE X PLAIN END SPOOL PIECE 72" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $380.00
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS DATE:
BIDS RECEIVED: NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: ALAN SIBERT DATE:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TAB

BID NUMBER: 05ITB37604YC

|  OPENING

| PAGE NUMBER: 5 OF 8

BID DESCRIPTION: DUCTILE IRON PIPE FITTING

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS | CONTACT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS PC #: | 404-730-4214
VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME <
@ - US PIPE & FOUNDRY |AMERICAN CAST IRON PIPE|  FRANKIE THOMPSON ENT ESSENTIAL EQUIPMENT NATIONAL WATERWORKS W =
2 % m VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE Z 8 g
009 o)
moZ ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS § 2 %
oOd >z
(r,n) g 2 TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: 8 8 %
P Ne) P
Q T CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: ﬁ é
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED QTY [UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ |TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL
95. 16" FLANGE X PLAIN END SPOOL PIECE 72" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $605.00
WEDGE ACTION RETAINER GLANDS, UNI-FLANGE SERIES
1400, EBBA MEGALUG OR APPROVED EQUAL:
96. 4" RETAINER GLAND W/BREAK AWAY HEADS,
WEDGES & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $20.95
97. 6" RETAINER GLAND W/BREAK AWAY HEADS,
WEDGES & ACCES EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $24.80
98. 8" RETAINER GLAND W/BREAK AWAY HEADS,
WEDGES & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $34.53
99. 10" RETAINER GLAND W/BREAK HEADS,
WEDGES & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $49.86
100. 12" RETAINER GLAND W/BREAK AWAY HEADS,
WEDGES & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $53.49
101. 16" RETAINER GLAND W/BREAK AWAY HEADS,
WEDGES & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $97.55
102. 18" RETAINER GLAND W/BREAK AWAY HEADS,
WEDGES & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $138.19
103. 20" RETAINER GLAND W/BREAK AWAY HEADS,
WEDGES & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $170.59
104. 24" RETAINER GLAND W/BREAK AWAY HEADS,
WEDGES & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $201.52
105. 30" RETAINER GLAND W/BREAK AWAY HEADS,
WEDGES & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $544.60
106. 36" RETAINER GLAND W/BREAK AWAY HEADS,
WEDGES & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $696.89
SPLIT RING MEGALUG OR APPROVED EQUAL:
107. 3" SPLIT RING MEGALUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $30.00
108. 4" SPLIT RING MEGALUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $30.02
109. 6" SPLIT RING MEGALUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $42.11
110. 8" SPLIT RING MEGALUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $52.27
111. 10" SPLIT RING MEGALUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $70.41
112. 12" SPLIT RING MEGALUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $108.46
113. 16" SPLIT RING MEGALUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $267.81
114. 18" SPLIT RING MEGALUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $325.00
115. 20" SPLIT RING MEGALUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $409.96
116. 24" SPLIT RING MEGALUG & ACCESS EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $658.93
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS DATE: 2/16/2005
BIDS RECEIVED: NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: ALAN SIBERT DATE: 2/16/2005
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TAB

BID NUMBER: 05ITB37604YC | OPENING 2/16/2005 | PAGE NUMBER: 6 OF 8

BID DESCRIPTION: DUCTILE IRON PIPE FITTING

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS | CONTACT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS PC #: | 404-730-4214

VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME <
@ o US PIPE & FOUNDRY |AMERICAN CAST IRON PIPE|  FRANKIE THOMPSON ENT ESSENTIAL EQUIPMENT NATIONAL WATERWORKS W =
3 g m VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE Z 8 g
009 o)
moZ ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS § 2 %
oOd >z
(I'/I'I) g 2 TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: 8 8 %
Py Ne) z2d=
Q T CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: ﬁ é
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED QTY [UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ |TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL
DUCTILE IRON PIPE:

117. 3" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 200 FT FOOT |NO BID FOOT |NO BID FOOT NO BID FOOT |NO BID FOOT $8.35

118. 3" RETAINER TYPE GASKET, EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $38.00

119. 4" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 200FT FOOT $8.38 FOOT $8.89 FOOT $9.51 FOOT $9.60 FOOT $8.96

120. 4" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA $24.20 EA $24.20 EA $25.89 EA $26.14 EA $37.18

121. 6" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 500 FT FOOT $8.05 FOOT $8.54 FOOT $9.14 FOOT $9.22 FOOT $8.21

122. 6" DIAMETER WITH PROTECTO 401 COATING,

EST. USAGE, 2,000 FT FOOT $14.77 FOOT $14.64 FOOT $15.67 FOOT $15.81 FOOT $17.38

123. 6" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA $34.55 EA $34.55 EA $36.97 EA $37.31 EA $53.08

124. 8" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 2,000 FT FOOT $10.74 FOOT $11.40 FOOT $12.19 FOOT $12.37 FOOT $10.99

125. 8" DIAMETER WITH PROTECTO 401 COATING,

EST. USAGE, 500 FT FOOT $17.46 FOOT $17.52 FOOT $18.75 FOOT $18.92 FOOT $18.27

126. 8" RETAINER TYPSE GASKET EA $46.10 EA $46.10 EA $49.33 EA $49.79 EA $70.81

127. 10" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 500 FT FOOT $13.94 FOOT $14.71 FOOT $15.74 FOOT $15.89 FOOT $14.16

128. 10" DIAMETER WITH PROTECTO 401 COATING,

EST. USAGE, 200 FT FOOT $20.66 FOOT $20.86 FOOT $22.33 FOOT $22.53 FOOT $25.00

129. 10" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA $66.80 EA $66.80 EA $71.48 EA $72.14 EA $115.00

130. 12" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 2,000 FT FOOT $17.80 FOOT $18.89 FOOT $20.21 FOOT $20.40 FOOT $20.75

131. 12" DIAMETER WITH PROTECTO 401 COATING,

EST. USAGE, 500 FT FOOT $25.70 FOOT $26.09 FOOT $27.91 FOOT $28.18 FOOT $20.75

132. 12" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA $76.35 EA $76.35 EA $81.69 EA $82.46 EA $117.30

133. 16" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 500 FT FOOT $26.03 FOOT $27.61 FOOT $29.54 FOOT $29.82 FOOT $29.22

134. 16" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 500 FT FOOT $35.92 FOOT $36.70 FOOT $39.27 FOOT $39.64 FOOT $40.62

135. 16" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA $180.70 EA $180.70 EA $193.35 EA $195.16 EA $277.62

136. 18" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE 500 FT FOOT $30.25 FOOT $31.98 FOOT $34.21 FOOT $34.54 FOOT $35.99

137. 18" DIAMTER WITH PROTECTO 401 COATING,

EST. USAGE, 200 FT FOOT $40.70 FOOT $41.56 FOOT $44.47 FOOT $44.88 FOOT $50.00

138. 18" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA $218.25 EA $218.25 EA $233.53 EA $237.71 EA $335.31

139. 20" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 500 FT FOOT $35.22 FOOT $37.35 FOOT $39.97 FOOT $40.34 FOOT $38.50

140. 20" DIAMETER WITH PROTECTO 401 COATING,

EST. USAGE, 200 FT FOOT $58.68 FOOT $47.32 FOOT $50.63 FOOT $51.11 FOOT $60.00

141. 20" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA $253.05 EA $253.05 EA $270.76 EA $273.29 EA $549.19

BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS DATE: 2/16/2005

BIDS RECEIVED: NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: ALAN SIBERT DATE: 2/16/2005

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




BID TAB

BID NUMBER: 05ITB37604YC | OPENING 2/16/2005 | PAGE NUMBER: 7 OF 8
BID DESCRIPTION: DUCTILE IRON PIPE FITTING
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS | CONTACT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS PC #: | 404-730-4214
VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME <
2 o US PIPE & FOUNDRY |AMERICAN CAST IRON PIPE|  FRANKIE THOMPSON ENT ESSENTIAL EQUIPMENT NATIONAL WATERWORKS oz
2 % m VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE ; 8 g
009 oy
a g % ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS § (ﬁ @
oOd >z
5n> 8 2 TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: 6' 8 %
P Ne) P ]
Q T CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: ﬁ '$"
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED QTY [UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ |TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ [TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL
142. 24" DIAMTER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 200 FT FOOT $45.34 FOOT $48.09 FOOT $51.46 FOOT $51.94 FOOT $45.00
143. 24" DIAMETER WITH PROTECTO 401 COATING, EST.
USAGE, 200 FT FOOT $58.68 FOOT $60.49 FOOT $64.73 FOOT $65.33 FOOT $70.00
144. 24" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA $352.90 EA $352.90 EA $377.60 EA $381.13 EA $542.19
145. 30" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 500 FT FOOT $55.40 FOOT $70.50 FOOT $75.44 FOOT $76.14 FOOT NO BID
146. 30" DIAMETER PROTECTO 401 COATING, EST.
USAGE, 200 FT FOOT $73.51 FOOT $87.23 FOOT $93.34 FOOT $94.21 FOOT NO BID
147. 30" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA $800.00 EA $800.00 EA $856.00 EA $864.00 EA NO BID
148. 36" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 200 FT FOOT $75.02 FOOT $95.48 FOOT $102.16 FOOT $103.19 FOOT NO BID
149. 36" DIAMETER WITH PROTECTO 401 COATING,
EST. USAGE, 200 FT FOOT $95.97 FOOT $115.26 FOOT $123.33 FOOT $124.48 FOOT NO BID
150. 36" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA $9,996.00 EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
151. 42" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 100 FT FOOT $107.85 FOOT $120.60 FOOT $129.04 FOOT $130.25 FOOT NO BID
152. 42" DIAMETER WITH PROTECTO 401 COATING,
EST. USAGE, 100 FT FOOT $136.79 FOOT $152.78 FOOT $163.47 FOOT $165.00 FOOT NO BID
153. 42" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
154. 54" DIAMETER, ESTIMATED USAGE, 100 FT FOOT $184.57 FOOT $194.62 FOOT $208.24 FOOT $209.77 FOOT NO BID
155. 54" DIAMETER WITH PROTECTO 401 COATING,
EST. USAGE, 100 FT FOOT $237.17 FOOT $236.69 FOOT $253.26 FOOT $255.63 FOOT NO BID
156. 54" RETAINER TYPE GASKET EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID
157. GASKET LUBRICANT (SPECIFY CONTAINER SIZE) EA NO BID QUART $8.00 QUART $9.60 EA NO BID EA NO BID
STAINLESS STEEL FULL-CIRCLE TYPE REPAIR
CLAMPS (DIA. X LENGTH):
158. 6" X 12" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $92.76
159. 8" X 12" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $109.38
160. 8" X 20" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $183.13
161. 10" X 12" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $133.08
162. 10" X 20" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $224.24
163. 12" X 12" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $155.53
164. 12" X 14" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $193.26
165. 12" X 20" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $255.25
BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS DATE: 2/16/2005
BIDS RECEIVED: NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: ALAN SIBERT DATE: 2/16/2005
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:
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BID DESCRIPTION: DUCTILE IRON PIPE FITTING

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS | CONTACT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS PC #: | 404-730-4214

VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME <
iz o US PIPE & FOUNDRY |AMERICAN CAST IRON PIPE|  FRANKIE THOMPSON ENT ESSENTIAL EQUIPMENT NATIONAL WATERWORKS 0=
2 g m VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE Z 8 g
009 OAT
mo2 ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS 2 2 %
oOd >z
(T) S % TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: 8 8 %
T Do P
g o CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: ﬁ i
DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT OR SERVICES DESIRED QTY |UNIT $ |TOTAL QTY|UNIT $ [TOTAL  [QTY[UNIT $ TOTAL [QTY|UNIT $ |TOTAL |QTY UNIT$ |TOTAL

166. 16"X 20" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $900.00

167. 24" X 20" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,099.00

168. 36" X 20" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID

STAINLESS STELL FULL-CIRCLE SERVICE SEALS

WITH 1" CC THREAD (DIA X LENGTH):

169. 8" X 12" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $147.00

170. 10" X 12" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $155.00

171, 12" X 12" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $210.00

TAPPING SLEEVE: FULL MJ SOLID TAPPING

SLEEVE

172. 6" X 6" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $430.00

173. 8" X 6" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $525.00

174. 8" X 8" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $570.00

175. 10" X 6" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,005.00

176. 10" X 8" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,025.00

177. 10" X 10" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,100.00

178. 12" X 6" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,030.00

179. 12" X 8" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,099.00

180. 12" X 10" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,250.00

181. 12" X 12" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $1,299.00

182. 16" X 6" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $2,850.00

183. 16" X 8" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $2,850.00

184. 16" X 10" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $2,900.00

185. 16" X 12" EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA NO BID EA $2,900.00

BIDS MAILED NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: AL MICAH PHILLIPS DATE: 2/16/2005

BIDS RECEIVED: NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: ALAN SIBERT DATE: 2/16/2005

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: DATE:




