
7/13/2005

Item #  QUANTITY UNIT $ TOTAL QUANTITY UNIT TOTAL TOTAL QUANTITY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL QTY UNIT $ TOTAL

1-A

UniMax UX55 or Approved Equal, SOFT MOUNT 
COMMERCIAL WASHER 5 SETS OF FIREFIGHTER 
TURNOUT GEAR IN ONE WASHING. 1 9,154.00$                  $9,154.00 1 9,710.00$                         9,710.00$            $9,710.00 1 9,136.00$              $9,136.00

1-B

UniMac UX75 or Approved Equal, SOFT MOUNT 
COMMERCIAL WASHER 5 SETS OF FIREFIGHTER 
TURNOUT GEAR IN ONE WASHING. 1 11,759.00$                $11,759.00 1 12,540.00$                       12,540.00$          12,540.00$            1 -$                       11,634.00$          

2-A

DEHY - or Approved Equal, TURN OUT GEAR 
DRYER/DEHYDRATOR, CABINET/SYSTEM CAPABLE OF 
DRYING A MINIMUM OF 5 SETS AT A TIME, MUST BE NFPA 
COMPLIANT. ARCHIMEDES PRODUCTS INC. "THE 
DEHYDRATOR" 1 7,061.00$                  $7,061.00 1 NO BID NO BID 1 -$                       4,378.00$            

2-B

Cissell Fireman's Gear Dryer Cabinet or Approved Equal, 
TURN OUT GEAR DRYER/DEHYDRATOR, 
CABINET/SYSTEM CAPABLE OF DRYING A MINIMUM OF 5 
SETS AT A TIME, MUST BE NFPA COMPLIANT. 
ARCHIMEDES PRODUCTS INC. "THE DEHYDRATOR" 1 4,481.00$                  $4,481.00 1 4,520.00$                         4,520.00$            4,520.00$              1 -$                       -$                     

3-A
MAH8700A or Approved Equal, HEAVY DUTY 
RESIDENTIAL/LIGHT COMMERCIAL WASHER AND DRYER 1 1,413.00$                  $1,413.00 1 1,360.00$                         1,360.00$            1,360.00$              1 -$                       -$                     

3-B

MDG9700A or Approved Equal, HEAVY DUTY 
RESIDENTIAL/LIGHT COMMERCIAL WASHER AND DRYER 
FRONT LOAD. MAYTAG NEPTUNE GAS DRYER 1 1,094.00$                  $1,094.00 1 600.00$                            600.00$               600.00$                 1 -$                       -$                     

3-C

MDE 9700A or Approved Equal, HEAVY DUTY 
RESIDENTIAL/LIGHT COMMERCIAL WASHER AND DRYER 
FRONT LOAD. MAYTAG NEPTUNE ELECTRIC DRYER 1 1,017.00$                  $1,017.00 1 530.00$                            530.00$               530.00$                 1 -$                       -$                     

4-A
T357530-00035 or Approved Equal, REFRIGERATOR AND 
FREEZERS TRUE REFRIGERATOR STAINLESS STEEL 1 -$                           NO BID 1 -$                     NOT IN BID 1 -$                       -$                     

4-B
T49-7530-00049 or Approved Equal, REFRIGERATOR AND 
FREEZERS TRUE REFRIGERATOR STAINLESS STEEL 1 -$                           NO BID 1 -$                     NOT IN BID 1 -$                       -$                     

4-C
T23F-7530-00123 or Approved Equal, REFRIGERATOR AND 
FREEZERS TRUE REFRIGERATOR STAINLESS STEEL 1 -$                           NO BID 1 -$                     NOT IN BID 1 -$                       -$                     

4-D
MSB2654H or Approved Equal, REFRIGERATOR AND 
FREEZERS TRUE REFRIGERATOR STAINLESS STEEL 1 -$                           NO BID 1 -$                     NOT IN BID 1 -$                       -$                     

5-A
Cuber-CNE 256AS-1F or Approved Equal, SCOTSMAN 
CUBER 1 -$                           NO BID 1 -$                     NOT IN BID 1 -$                       -$                     

5-B HTB250 or Approved Equal, SCOTTSMAN STORAGE BIN 1 -$                           NO BID 1 -$                     NOT IN BID 1 -$                       -$                     
-$                      -$                       -$                     

Southeastern's bidder's bid has separte pricing for "Set in Place/ -$                       -$                     
Install Options.. Refer to their prcing page. -$                       -$                     

TOTAL BASE CONTRACT AMOUNT
BIDS MAILED 13 10 ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: MALCOLM TYSON DATE RECEIVED
BIDS RECEIVED: 3  DATE ENDED:

COMPLETED BY

BID TAB

BID NUMBER:  05ITB45706YC  OPENING DATE: PAGE NUMBER:  1 of 1

BID DESCRIPTION: LAUNDRY EQUIPMENT
 

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: FIRE     CONTACT:  PC #:
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VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME

VENDOR CODE

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:

VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME

TEXCHINE SOUTHEASTERN LAUNDRY EQUIPMENT TRI-STATE TECHNICAL SERVICES
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE

ADDRESS ADDRESS
207 BEAUFORT ST                                          
CHAPIN, SC 29036

1105 SHANA CIRCLE SUITE 1                                                                       MARIETTA, 
GA 30303                                

1800 LAKE PARK DR. SUITE 201                     
SMYRNA, GA 30080

TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE:
770-956-1179 770-928-0080 1-888-278-0106

CONTACT: 
PAUL W. DIXON CINDY W. RICHIE CHARLES MORRIS

CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: 

$35,979.00 $29,260.00 $25,148.00
NO RESPONSE:  8/3/2005
NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT: WILLIAM LONG 8/9/2005

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION: LISA MCKINE
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