FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 06IB47254YA
DESCRIPTION: JANITORIAL SERVICES
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID OPEN DATE: 02/23/06
COMMODITY:

PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:
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REQUISITION #:

CONTACT NAME:
PHONE #:

DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME
QUALITY CLEANING SERVICES ATLANTA BLDG MAINTENANCE, INC. GENERAL BLDG MAINTENANCE, INC. THE COLEMAN GROUP, INC. RITE WAY SERVICE, INC. NONE-RESPONSE
OF VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDORS
PRODUCT ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
OR 1325 UNION HILL IND CT, SUITE A 3835 PRESIDENTIAL PKWY, SUITE 20C 3201 ATLANTA IND'L PKWY, SUITE 207-C 6180 Atlantic Blvd, Suite F OTHER
SERVICES ALPHARETTA, GA 30004 ATLANTA, GA 30340 ATLANTA, GA 30331 Norcross, GA 30071
DESIRED INFORMATION
FAX: 770-489-6189 FAX: 770-475-7720 FAX: 770-452-7227 FAX: FAX: 770-263-7814
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE: 770-577-1219 TELEPHONE: 770-740-1613 TELEPHONE: 770-5678 TELEPHONE:  TELEPHONE: 770-248-9315
ITEM CONTACT CLIFFORD FEATHERSTONE CONTACT: JAMES MOREHEAD CONTACT : Hans J. Foraker CONTACT CONTACT
cliff.featherstone @innerharbour.net
DESCRIPTIONS W [BID BOND: YES EID BOND: YES BID BOND: YES BID BOND: YES
Gp A Gov't Ctr Complex MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADDLP/HR | MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQFT* | ADDLP/HR |[MONTHLY] ANNUAL $SQFT~ ADD'L P/HRIMONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* [ADD'L P/HR| MONTHLY | ANNUAL SISQFT ADD'L PIHR NO BIDS
Gp 12 Month Contract - 2006 NO BID $37,000.00 | $444,000.00 843 $13.00 | $44,236.92 | $530,843.04 $0.084; $11.78 NO BID)| $48,344.63 | $580,135.56 11016 $13.36
Gp 12 Month Renewal Opt - 2007 $37,000.00 | $444,000.00 843 $13.00 | $44,236.92 | $530,843.04 $0.084, $11.78 $48,344.63 | $580,135.56 1.1016 $13.36
Gp 12 Month Renewal Opt - 2008 $37,000.00 | $444,000.00 843 $13.00 | $44,236.92 | $530,843.04 $0.084, $11.78 $48,344.63 | $580,135.56 1.1016 $13.36
Min Req't FACILITY (Gp A Day Porters COSTP/HR|  COST PIYR] COSTP/HR|  COST PIYR] COSTP/HR|  COST P/YR| COSTP/HR|  COST P/YR| COSTPHHR|  COST P/YR]
S&‘;;rc" @ 40 hr/day 251 days/yr & 10,040 $13.25 | $133,030.00 $11.78 | $118,271.20 NO BID| $10.86 | $109,034.40
;';’Zuchfjﬁy @4 hrs/day 251 dayslyr & $13.25 | $13,303.00 $11.78 | $11,827.12 $10.86 | $10,903.44
Total $13.25 | $146,333.00 $11.78 | $130,098.32 $119,937.84
Group A Day Porters COST P/HR| _COST P/YR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006 NO BID| $12,194.41 | $146,333.00 $13.25 $10,841.53 $130,098.32 $11.78 NO BID| $9,994.82 | $119,937.84 $10.86
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007 $12,194.41 | $146,333.00 $13.25 $10,841.53 $130,098.32 $11.78 $9,994.82 | $119,937.84 $10.86
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008 $12,194.41 | $146,333.00 $13.25 $10,841.53 $130,098.32 $11.78 $9,994.82 | $119,937.84 $10.86
Group B Justice Facilities 999,878 sq f MONTHLY [ ANNUAL | _8/SQFT* | ADDLP/HR [MONTHLY] ANNUAL §ISQ FT* ADD'L PHR [MONTHLY[ ANNUAL | $/SQFT" | ADDLPHR | MONTHLY [ ANNUAL SISQFT* | ADDL PIHR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006 NO BID| $51,500.00 | $618,000.00 6180 $13.00 [ $77,690.13 | $932,281.56 $0.0777 $11.78 NO BID| $89,174.03 | $1,070,088.36 1.0702) $12.99
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007 $51,500.00 | $618,000.00 6180 $13.00 [ $77,690.13 | $932,281.56 $0.0777 $11.78 $89,174.03 | $1,070,088.36 1.0702 $12.99
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008 $51,500.00 | $618,000.00 6180 $13.00 [ $77,690.13 | $932,281.56 $0.0777 $11.78 $89,174.03 | $1,070,088.36 1.0702 $12.99
Min Req't FACILITY (Gp B Day Porters) $/HOUR| $ PER YEAR $/HOUR| $ PER YEAR| $/HOUR| $ PER YEAR| $/HOUR| $ PER YEAR]
ﬁi};ﬂﬁ;’:"es: FCC 56 hriday 251 daysiyr $13.65 | $186,242.00 $11.78 | $165,579.68 NO BID| $10.76 | $151,242.56
‘;;J!;?”e Court 32 hrs/day 251 daylyr 8,032 $13.25 | $106,424.00 $11.78 | $94,616.96 $10.76 | $86,424.32
Total $13.25 | $292,066.00 $11.78 | $260,196.64 $237,666.88
Group B Day Porters MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID| $24,388.83 | $292,666.00 $13.25 $21,683.05 $260,196.64 $11.78 NO BID| $19,805.57 | $237,666.88 $10.76
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $24,388.83 | $292,666.00 $13.25 $21,683.05 $260,196.64 $11.78 $19,805.57 | $237,666.88 $10.76
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008 $24,388.83 | $292,666.00 $13.25 $21,683.05 $260,196.64 $11.78 $19,805.57 | $237,666.88 $10.76
Group C: Central, Auburn, P'tree,
Mechanisville & MLK Libraries & Public MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|  MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|
Defender (346,595 sq')
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID $20,000.00 | $240,000.00 6884/ $13.00( $30,292.91)  $363,514.92] $0.0869 $11.78 $19,753.72| $237,044.64 .68 $14.00(  $42,163.40]  $505,960.80) 1.4514| $12.98|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $20,000.00 | $240,000.00 6884/ $13.00 $30,292.91)  $363,514.92] $0.0869 $11.78| $20,044.21 | $240,530.52 69 $14.50 $42,163.40|  $505,960.80 1.4514| $12.98|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $20,000.00 | $240,000.00 6884/ $13.00 $30,292.91|  $363,514.92] $0.0869 $11.78| $20,334.71 | $244,016.52 .70 $15.00 $42,163.40|  $505,960.80 1.4514] $12.98]
Min Req't FACILITY (Gp C Day Porters) $/HOUR $/YEAR| $/HOUR $/YEAR| $/HOUR $/YEAR| $/HOUR] $/YEAR|
Central Library $13.25 | $106,424.00 $11.78 | $94,616.96 12.50| $100,400.00 $10.84 | $87,066.88
Auburn Library $13.25 |  $6,651.50 $11.78 |  $5,913.56 12.50[  $6,275.00 $10.84 |  $5441.68
Public Defender $13.25 | $26,606.00 $11.78 | $23,654.24 12.50|  $25,100.00 $10.84 | $21,766.72
Total $13.25 | $139,681.50 $11.78 | $124,184.76 12.50| $131,775.00 $114,275.28
Group C Day Porters MONTHLY | ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) NO BID| $11,640.00 | $139,681.50 $13.25 $10,348.73 $124,184.76 $11.78 $10,981.25 | $131,775.00 $12.50 $9,522.94 | $114,275.88 $10.84
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $11,640.00 | $139,681.50 $13.25 $10,348.73 $124,184.76 $11.78 $11,025.18 | $132,302.16 $12.50 $9,522.94 | $114,275.88 $10.84
Group B 12 Month Conntract 2006 $11,640.00 | $139,681.50 $13.25 $10,348.73 $124,184.76 $11.78 $11,060.10 | $132,829.20 $12.50 $9,522.94 | $114,275.88 $10.84
(Group D) N Fulton Libraries (172,407 sq') MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR[ MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID $18,700.00 | $224,400.00 $1.30 $13.00 $15,085.61) $181,027.32] $0.0875 $11.78] NO BID| No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $18,700.00 | $224,400.00 $1.30 $13.00 $15,085.61) $181,027.32] $0.0875 $11.78] No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $18,700.00 | $224,400.00 $1.30 $13.00 $15,085.61) $181,027.32] $0.0875 $11.78] No Bid
(Group E) S Fulton Libraries (102,501sq") MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|  MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID, $14,700.00 | $176,400.00 1.720, $13.00( $8,968.84| $107,626.08] $0.0875 $11.78] NO BID, No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $14,700.00 | $176,400.00 1.720] $13.00( $8,968.84| $107,626.08] $0.0875 $11.78] No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $14,700.00 | $176,400.00 1.720, $13.00( $8,968.84] $107,626.08] $0.0875 $11.78] No Bid
(Group F) Other Offices No. (52,905 sq ') MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR[ MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|  MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID| $6,600.00 | $79,200.00 1.497 $13.00 | $4,840.81 |  $58,089.72 $0.0915 $11.78 NO BID| No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $6,600.00 | $79,200.00 1.497 $13.00 | $4,840.81 |  $58,089.72 $0.0915 $11.78 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $6,600.00 | $79,200.00 1.497 $13.00 | $4,840.81 |  $58,089.72 $0.0915 $11.78 No Bid
NO. OF NOTIFICATIONS MAILED: 25
NO. OF BIDS DOWNLOADED: 158|
NO. OF BIDS RECEIVED: 11
NO. OF *NO BIDS* RECEIVED: 3
NO. OF MBES NOFITICATIONS MAILED: 5
NO. OF MBES RECEIVED: 0
BUYER'S NAME: ALONZO ARNOLLC PRE AWARD TABULATION: DATE RECEIVED:
DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL) Fulton Co reserves the right to accept or reject any or all DATE COMPLETED: 2/28/06
bids or any part thereof & to waive technicalities. This
PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE tabulation is NOT FINAL or BINDING & is subject to COMPLETED BY: SMI
atthe ion of Fulton Co. Govt.
CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE DATE:




BID NUMBER: 061B47254YA
DESCRIPTION: JANITORIAL SERVICES

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID OPEN DATE: 02/23/06
COMMODITY:

PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:
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REQUISITION #:
CONTACT NAME:
PHONE #:

DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME
QUALITY CLEANING SERVICES ATLANTA BLDG MAINTENANCE, INC GENERAL BLDG MAINTENANCE, INC THE COLEMAN GROUP, INC. RITE WAY SERVICE, INC. NON-RESPONSIVE
oF VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDORS
PRODUCT ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
OR T325 UNION HILL IND CT. SUITE 7 3835 PRESIDENTIAL PKWY, SUITE 20C 3201 ATLANTA IND'L PKWY, SUITE 207-C 6180 Aflantic Bivd, SUEF OTHER
SERVICES ALPHARETTA, GA 3000¢ ATLANTA, GA 3034( ATLANTA, GA 30331 NOTCross. GA 30071
DESIRED INFORMATION
EAX: 770-489-618¢ EAX: 770-475:7720 EAX. 770-452-7227 EAX: EAX: 770-263-7814
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE: 7/0-577-1210 TELEPHONE: 770-740-1613 TELEPHONE. 770-5678 TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE. 770-248-9315
ITEM CONTACT CLIFFORD FEATHERSTONE CONTACT: JAMES MOREHEAD CONTACT : Hans J. Foraker CONTACT CONTACT
cif featherstone@innerharbour.ne
DESCRIPTIONS [BDEONDr B BONDL YES [E1D EOND: [E1D EOND- BID BOND:
(Group F) Offices So. (34,274 5') MONTHLY] ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* |ADD'L P/HR| MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* |ADD'L P/HRIMONTHLY] ANNUAL $SQFT" __ |ADDL P/HRMONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* [ADD'L P/HR| MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQFT* |ADD'L P/HR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID $5,000.00 $60,000.00 1.750 $13.00 $3,136.07 $37,632.84 $0.0915 $11.78 NO BID No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $5,000.00 | $60,000.00 1.750 $13.00 | $3,136.07 | $37,632.84 $0.0915 $11.78 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $5,000.00 | $60,000.00 1.750 $13.00 | $3,136.07 | $37,632.84 $0.0915 $11.78 No Bid
Min Req't FACILITY Gp F(So.) Day Porters $/HOUR | $/YEAR $/HOUR $/YEAR $/HOUR | $/YEAR $/HOUR | $/YEAR
Public Safely Center 8 hr/day 251 day/yr $13.25 $26,606.00 $11.78 $23,654.24 NO BID No Bid
2,0008 hrlyr
Total $13.25 $26,606.00 $11.78 $23,654.24 No Bid
Day porters (Group F) MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID $2,217.00 $26,604.00 $13.25 $1,971.19 $23,654.24 $11.78 NO BID No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $2,217.00 | $26,604.00 $13.25 $1,971.19 $23,654.24 $11.78
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $2,217.00 | $26,604.00 $13.25 $1,971.19 $23,654.24 $11.78
(Group G) St Citzens Svcs Ct (203,738 sq') MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADD/HR [MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SQFT ADD/HR [MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADD/HR | MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADD/HR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID $22,000.00 | $264,000.00 1.295 $13.00 $19,232.87 | $230,794.44 $0.0944 $11.78 $12,648.73 | $151,784.76 745 $14.00 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Oplion (thru 2007) $22,000.00 | $264,000.00 1.295 $13.00 $19,232.87 | $230,794.44 $0.0944 $11.78 $12,733.63 | $152,803.56 75 $14.50 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Oplion (thru 2005) $22,000.00 | $264,000.00 1.295 $13.00 $19,232.87 | $230,794.44 $0.0944 $11.78 $12,818.52 | $153,822.24 755 $15.00 No Bid
(Group G) Min Req't Day Porters $/HOUR $/YEAR| $/HOUR $/YEAR| $/HOUR $/YEAR| $/HOUR] $/YEAR|
ErOSV/Vydren sretr16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 4,016 $13.25 $53,212.00 $11.78 $47,308.48 $12.25 $49,196.00 No Bid
El‘asrlnypr TruittS hrs/day‘ 21 dayslyr, 1285 $13.25 $16,628.75 $11.78 $14,783.90 $12.25 $15,373.75 No Bid
l:)rOsg/)\;\;OOd 5 hrS/day' 251 days/yr, 1,255 $13.25 $16,628.75 $11.78 $14,783.90 $12.25 $15,373.75 No Bid
:':S(Isy.rDafl'\E“ 16 hrs/day‘ 21 dayslyr‘ 4016 $13.25 $53,212.00 $11.78 $47,308.48 $12.25 $49,196.00 No Bid
EdgewoodlAurhurn 5 h’/day' 251 days/yr, $13.25 $16,328.00 $11.78 $14,783.90 $12.25 $15,373.75 No Bid
1,255 hrslyr
So. Fulton (Fairburn) 16 hrs/day, 251
days/yr, 4,016 hfS/yI’ (TEMP CLOSED] N/A (TEMP CLOSED) $47,308.48 (TEMP CLOSED) (TEMP CLOSED)
l:lresv;/ylr-!unzons 5 hrS/day' 251 dayslyr, 1,255 $13.25 $16,628.75 $11.78 $14,783.90 $12.25 $15,373.75 No Bid
Palmetto 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1255 hrs/yr $13.25 $16,628.75 $11.78 $14,783.90 $12.25 $15,373.75 No Bid
N. Fulton (WBI'SBW) 5 hrS/day 251, dayslyr, $13.25 $16,628.75 $11.78 $14,783.90 $12.25 $15,373.75 No Bid
1,255 hrslyr
QLS 8 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 2,008 days/yr $13.25 $26,606.00 $11.78 $23,654.24 $12.25 $24,598.00 No Bid
l:)r.g/.y?enson 16 hrS/day' 251 days/yr, 4016 $13.25 $53,212.00 $11.78 $47,308.48 $12.25 $49,196.00 No Bid
Mills 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 4,016 hrs/yr $13.25 $53,212.00 $11.78 $47,308.48 $12.25 $49,196.00 No Bid
ﬁ?sl;;l:eaSt 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255 $13.25 $16,628.78 $11.78 $14,783.90 $12.25 $15,373.75 No Bid
Hapeville 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255 hrsly $13.25 $16,628.75 $11.78 $14,783.90 $12.25 $15,373.75 No Bid
Total $13.25 $425,696.00 $11.78 $378,467.84 $12.25 $344,372.00
Day Porters (Group G) MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY' ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID $35,474.66 | $425,696.00 $13.25 $31,538.99 $378,467.84 $11.78 $28,697.67 |$344,372.00 $12.25 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $35,474.66 | $425696.00 |  $13.25 $31,538.99 $378,467.84 $11.78 $20,404.65 |$353575.80 | $12.55 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Oplion (thru 2005) $35,474.66 | $425,696.00 $13.25 $31,538.99 $378,467.84 $11.78 $29,521.80 |$353,575.80 $12.60 No Bid
g;“;go"'sa,’;" Gt @ RETme (HEveD MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADD/HR |[MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SQFT ADD/HR [MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADD/HR | MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADD/HR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) $7,133.26 | $85,599.20 $1.34 $12.00 | $3,700.00 | $44,400.00 695 $13.00 | $5,845.02 | $70,140.24 $0.0915 $11.78 $5586.20 | $67,034.40 0875 $14.00 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $7,133.26 | $85,599.20 $1.34 $12.00 | $3,700.00 | $44,400.00 695 $13.00 | $5845.02 | $70,140.24 $0.0915 $11.78 $5749.20 | $68,990.40 09 $14.50 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $7,133.26 | $85,599.20 $1.34 $12.00 | $3,700.00 | $44,400.00 695 $13.00 | $5845.02 | $70,140.24 $0.0915 $11.78 $6,068.60 | $72,873.20 095 $15.00 No Bid
NG GF BIDS RECEIVED: DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL) DATE COMPLETED:

NO BIDS RECEIVED:

NO OF NONE RESPONSE:

PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE

COMPLETED BY:

CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE

DATE:

DATE:




BID NUMBER: 061B47254YA

BID OPEN DATE: 02/23/06
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NO OF NONE RESPONSE:

CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE

DESCRIPTION: JANITORIAL SERVICES COMMODITY: REQUISITION #:
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #:
DESCRIPTION 1. VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME 5. VENDOR NAME
QUALITY CLEANING SERVICES ATLANTA BLDG MAINTENANCE, INC GENERAL BLDG MAINTENANCE, INC THE COLEMAN GROUP, INC. RITE WAY SERVICE, INC. NON-RESPONSIVE
OF VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDORS
PRODUCT ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
OR 1325 UNION HILL IND CT, SUITE 2 3835 PRESIDENTIAL PKWY. SUITE 20C 3201 ATLANTA IND'L PKWY, SUITE 207-C 6180 Aflantic Blvd. Suite F OTHER
SERVICES ALPHARETTA, GA 3000/ ATLANTA, GA 3034( ATLANTA, GA 30331 Norcross, GA 30071
DESIRED INFORMATION
FAX: 770-489-618¢ FAX: 770-475-772C FAX: 770-452-7227 FAX: FAX. 770-263-7814
INDIVIDUAL LINE Tl ELEPHONE: 770-740-1613 TELEPHONE: 770-5678 TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: 770-248-9315
ITEM CONTACT CLIFFORD FEATHERSTONE CONTACT: JAMES MOREHEAD CONTACT : Hans J. Foraker CONTACT CONTACT
cliff.featherstone@innerharbour.ne
DESCRIPTIONS BID BOND: BID BOND: YES BID BOND: BID BOND: BID BOND:
(Group H) Min Req't Day Porters P/HOUR! P/YEAR $/HR[$/YEAR $/HR[$/YEAR $/HR[$/YEAR $/HR|$/YEAR
Abernathy Arts 1 & 24 hrs/day, 251 daysiyr, $8.00|  $8,032.00 $1325 | $13,303.00 $1178 | $11827.12 $1250 | $12,550.00 No Bid
1,004 hrslyr
nvre;;’E"d Arts 6 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 502 $8.00 |  $4,016.00 $13.25|  $6,651.50 $11.78 |  $5913.56 $1250 | $6,275.00 No Bid
E;Ty’:m"d House 2 hrs/day, 251 Days/yr, 503 $8.00|  $4,016.00 $1325 |  $6,651.50 $1178 | $591356 $1250 | $6,275.00 No Bid
South Fulton Arts 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, $8.00 | $32,128.00 $13.25 | $53,212.00 $11.78 | $47,308.48 $12.50 | $50,200.00 No Bid
4,016 hrslyr
ﬁ:’sl;;':weﬁ Arts 6 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,508 $8.00 | $12,048.00 $1325 | $19,954.50 $11.78 | $17,74068 $1250 | $18,825.00 No Bid
TOTAL $8.00 | $60,240.00 $13.25 | $99,772.50 $11.78 | $88,703.40 $12.50 |  $94,125.00 No Bid
Day Porters (Group H) MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) $5,020.00 | $60,240.00 $8.00 $8314.37 | $99,772.50 $13.25 $7,391.95 $88,703.40 $11.78 $7,530.00 | $94,125.00 $12.50 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $5,220.80 | $62,649.60 $8.32 $8,314.37 | $99,772.50 $13.25 $7,391.95 $88,703.40 $11.78 $7.875.13 | $94,504.50 $12.55 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $5429.632|  $65,155.56 $8.65 $8,314.37 | $99,772.50 $13.25 $7,391.95 $88,703.40 $11.78 $7,906.50 | $94,874.00 $12.60 No Bid
(Group |) Day Porters $ /HOUR $/ HOUR $/HOUR $/HOUR $/HOUR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) $12.00 $13.25 $11.78 $12.50 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $12.48 $13.25 $11.78 $12.55 No Bid
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $12.98 $13.25 $11.78 $12.60 No Bid
ING OF BIDS MAILED: BUYER'S NAME: DATE RECEIVED:
INO OF BIDS RECEIVED: DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL) DATE COMPLETED:
NO BIDS RECEIVED: PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE COMPLETED BY:
DATE:

DATE:




FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47254YA
DESCRIPTION: JANITORIAL SERVICES
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID OPEN DATE: 02/23/06

COMM

ODITY:

PAGE 4 OF 9

REQUISITION #:

CONTACT NAME:

PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #:
DESCRIPTION 6. VENDOR NAME 7. VENDOR NAME 8. VENDOR NAME 9. VENDOR NAME 10. VENDOR NAME
GA BLDG MAINTENANCE SVCS, INC. MID SOUTH CLEANING SERVICES, INC. 0OJS SYSTEMS, INC. BUILDING MAINTENANCE SERVICES, INC. GMI GROUP, INC. NONE-RESPONSE
OF VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDORS
PRODUCT ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
OR 2814 SPRING ROAD, SUITE 30€ 2459 ROOSEVELT HWY, SUITE A-8 P. 0. BOX 671744 1955 Vaughn Road, suite 10¢ 470 SATELITE BLVD, SUITE R OTHER
SERVICES ATLANTA, GA 30339 COLLEGE PARK, GA 30337 MARIETTA, GA 30006 Kennesaw, GA 30144 SUWANEE, GA 30024
DESIRED INFORMATION
FAX: FAX: 404-559-6145 FAX: 770-975-9387 FAX: 770-218-2996 FAX: 678-482-7106
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE: (678) 279-0012 TELEPHONE: 404-559-6131 TELEPHONE: 770-975-9343 TELEPHONE: 770-218-993  TELEPHONE: 678-482-5288
ITEM CONTACT: LARRY JOHNSON ICONTACT: JOE R. DENSON CONTACT: JOHN HEO CONTACT: PETE GROMPONE CONTACT: JOSEPH H. WOODSON, JR.
DESCRIPTIONS [BID BOND: CHECK [BID BOND: YES [BID BOND: BID BOND: YES [BID BOND: YES
Gp A Gov't Ctr Complex MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* |[ADD'L P/HR| MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* |[ADD'L P/HRIMONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SQ FT* ADD'L P/HRIMONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* |ADD'L P/HR[ MONTHLY ANNUAL $/SQ FT* |ADD'L P/HR| NO BIDS
Gp 12 Month Contract - 2006 NO BID N/A $31,231.00 | $374,772.00 0.7116/YR $11.95 | $31,335.00 | $376,020.00 $.7140 $12.65 NO BID
Gp 12 Month Renewal Opt - 2007 $31,231.00 | $374,772.00 0.7116/YR $12.45 [ $31,335.00 | $376,020.00 $.7140 $12.65 NO BID
Gp 12 Month Renewal Opt - 2008 $31,855.00 | $382,260.00 0.7258/YR $12.45 $31,335.00 | $376,020.00 $.7140 $12.65 NO BID
Min Req't FACILITY (Gp A Day Porters $/HOUR | $/YEAR $/HOUR $/YEAR $/HOUR | $/YEAR $/HOUR | $/YEAR
S:;‘;;rc" @40 hr/day 251 dayslyr & 10040 |\ gy N/A $9.75 $97,890.00 $12.65 | $127,006.00 NO BID
Public Safety @ 4 hrs/day 251 days/yr &
1,004 hrsiyr $9.75 $9,789.00 $12.65 $12,700.60 NO BID
Total $9.75 $107,679.00 $12.65 $139,706.60 NO BID
Group A Day Porters COST P/HR| COST PIYR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006 NO BID| N/A $8,973.00 $107,679.00 $9.75 $11,642.16 | 139706.60 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007 $9,433.00 $113,201.00 $10.25 $11,642.16 | 139706.60 $12.65 NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008 $9,433.00 $113,201.00 $10.25 $11,642.16 139706.60 $12.65 NO BID,
Group B Justice Facilities 999,878 sq f MONTHLY | ANNUAL $/SQ FT* ADD'L PHR |MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SQ FT* ADD'L PHR [MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SQ FT* ADD'LPHR | MONTHLY | ANNUAL $/SQ FT* ADD'L PHR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006 NO BID| N/A $52,106.00 | $625,272.00 0.6253/YR $11.95 | $59,493.00 | $713,916.00 $.7140 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007 $53,017.00 | $636,204.00 0.6374; $12.45 | $59,493.00 | $713,916.00 $.7140 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008 $53,017.00 | $636,204.00 0.6374] $12.45 | $59,493.00 | $713,916.00 $.7140 $12.65 NO BID
Min Req't FACILITY (Gp B Day Porters) $/HOUR| $ PER YEAR $/HOUR| $PER YEAR $/HOUR| $ PER YEAR| $/HOUR| $ PER YEAR]
Justice; Carnes; FCC 56 hr/day 251 days/yr
14,056 hrlyr NO BID| N/A $9.75 | $137,046.00 $12.65 | $177,808.40 NO BID
Juvenile Court 32 hrs/day 251 day/yr 8,032 $075| $78312.00 $12.65 | $101,604.80 NO BID
hrsiyr
Total $9.75 | $215,358.00 $12.65 | $279,413.20 NO BID
Group B Day Porters MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID| N/A $17,946.50 $215,358.00 $9.75 $23,284.43 | $279,413.19 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $18,866.83 $226,402.00 $10.25 $23,284.43 | $279,413.19 $12.65 NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008 $18,866.83 $226,402.00 $10.25 $23,284.43 | $279,413.19 $12.65 NO BID
(Stieityn € @ iEl, AT, PR, . MONTHLY ANNUAL $/SqFt| ADDSVCS| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|  MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|
Mechanisville & MLK Libraries & Public
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) $38,054.95  $456,659.45 1.31 $13.00 N/A] $23,175.00|  $278,100.00 0.7977/YR $11.95( $34,541.00 $414,492.00 $1.189) $12.65| NO BID!
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $39,006.33 | $468,075.94 1.34 $13.33 $23,175.00 | $278,100.00 0.7977/YR $12.45 | $34,541.00]  $414,492.00) $1.189) $12.65| NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $39,981.49 | $479,777.83 1.38 $13.66 $23,785.00 | $285,420.00 0.8187/YR $12.45 | $34,541.00]  $414,492.00) $1.189) $12.65| NO BID
Min Req't FACILITY (Gp C Day Porters) $/ HOUR $/YEAR] $/HOUR! $/YEAR] $/HOUR! $/YEAR] $/HOUR $/YEAR $/HOUR $/YEAR
Central Library $12.50 | $100,400.00 N/A; $9.75 $78,312.00 $12.65 | $101,604.80 NO BID
Auburn Library $1250 | $6,275.00 $9.75 $4,894.50 $12.65 |  $6,350.30 NO BID
Public Defender $12.50 | $25,100.00 $9.75 $19,578.00 $12.65 | $25,401.20 NO BID
Total $12.50 | $131,775.00 $9.75 $102,784.50 $12.65 | $133,356.30 NO BID
Group C Day Porters MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY | ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $10,981.25 | $131,775.00 $12.50 N/A; $8,565.38 $102,784.50 $11,113.02 | $133,356.30 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $11,255.78 | $135,069.38 $12.81 $9,004.62 $108,055.50 $11,113.02 | $133,356.30 $12.65 NO BID
Group B 12 Month Conntract 2006 $11,537.18 | $138,446.11 $13.13 $9,004.62 $108,055.50 $11,113.02 | $133,356.30 $12.65 NO BID
(Group D) N Fulton Libraries (172,407 sq') | MONTHLY ANNUAL| $/SqFt| ADDSVCS| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|  MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) $22,537.97|  $270,455.70 157 $13.00 N/A] $11,040.00]  $132,480.00 0.768| $11.95( $17,250.00| $207,000.00 $1.20 $12.65)  $17,106.05  $205,272.73 $1.1906 $12.10)
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $23,101.42 | $277,217.09 1.61] $13.33 $11,260.00 | $135,120.00 0.7837, $12.45 | $17,250.00] $207,000.00) $1.20) $12.65)  $17,106.05  $205,272.73 $1.1906 $12.10)
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $23,678.95 | $284,147.57 1.65, $13.66 $11,260.00 | $135,120.00 0.7837, $12.45 | $17,250.00] $207,000.00) $1.20 $12.65| $17,448.18 | $209,378.18 $1.2144 $12.34
(Group E) S Fulton Libraries (102,501sq") MONTHLY ANNUAL| $/SqFt| ADDSVCS| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|  MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) $13,399.48| $160,793.82| 157 $13.00]  $8,519.00 | $102,228.00 .9973 $15.00 | $6,816.00]  $81,792.00 0.798] $11.95( $13,700.00| $164,400.00 $1.603/ $12.65| NO BID!
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $13,734.47 | $164,813.67 1.61 $13.33 |  $8,519.00 | $102,228.00 .9973 $15.00 | $6,816.00 |  $81,792.00 0.798! $12.45 | $13,700.00] $164,400.00) $1.603! $12.65| NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $14,077.83 | $168,934.01 1.65 $13.66 |  $8,519.00 | $102,228.00 .9973 $15.00 | $6,845.00 |  $82,140.00 0.801] $12.45 | $13,700.00] $164,400.00) $1.603! $12.65| NO BID
(Group F) Other Offices No. (52,905 sq ') MONTHLY ANNUAL| $/SqFt| ADDSVCS| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR[ MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|  MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID| N/A NO BIED $4,825.00 | $57,900.00 $1.094) $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $4,825.00 | $57,900.00 $1.094 $12.65 NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $4,825.00 | $57,900.00 $1.094 $12.65 NO BID|
NO. OF NOTIFICATIONS MAILED:
NO. OF BIDS DOWNLOADED:
NO. OF BIDS RECEIVED:
NO. OF *NO BIDS* RECEIVED:
NO. OF MBES NOFITICATIONS MAILED:
NO. OF MBES RECEIVED:
BUYER'S NAME: ALONZO ARNOLC DATE RECEIVED:
DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL) DATE COMPLETED: 11/7/05
PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE COMPLETED BY: SMI
CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE DATE:




BID NUMBER: 05ITB47254YA BID OPEN DATE: 02/23/06 PAGE 5 OF 9
DESCRIPTION: JANITORIAL SERVICES COMMODITY: REQUISITION #:
CONTACT NAME:
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #: PHONE #:
DESCRIPTION 6. VENDOR NAME 7. VENDOR NAME 8. VENDOR NAME 9. VENDOR NAME 10. VENDOR NAME
GA BLDG MAINTENANCE SVCS, INC MID SOUTH CLEANING SERVICES, INC. OJS SYSTEMS, INC. BUILDING MAINTENANCE SERVICES, INC GMI GROUP, INC. NON-RESPONSIVE
OF VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDORS
PRODUCT ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
OR 2814 SPRING ROAD, SUITE 30€ 2459 ROOSEVELT HWY. SUITE A-8 P_0.BOX 671744 1955 Vauahn Road, suite 10 470 SATELITE BLVD, SUITE R OTHER
SERVICES ATLANTA, GA 3033¢ COLLEGE PARK, GA 30337 MARIETTA, GA 3000€¢ Kennesaw, GA 3014 SUWANEE, GA 30024
DESIRED INFORMATION
FAX: FAX: 404-559-614¢ FAX: 770-975-9387 FAX: 770-218-299€ FAX: 678-482-7106
INDIVIDUAL LINE TELEPHONE: (678) 279-0012 TELEPHONE: 404-559-6131 Tl TELEPHONE: 770-218-993 TELEPHONE: 678-482-5288
ITEM CONTACT: LARRY JOHNSON ICONTACT: JOE R. DENSON CONTACT: JOHN HEO CONTACT: PETE GROMPONE CONTACT: JOSEPH H. WOODSON, JR.
DESCRIPTIONS BID BOND: CHECK BID BOND: YES [BID BOND: BID BOND: YES BID BOND: YES
(Group F) Offices So. (34,274 sq') MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* |ADD'L P/HR| MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* |ADD'L P/HRIMONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SQ FT* ADD'L P/HRIMONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* |ADD'L P/HR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/SQ FT* |ADD'L P/HR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID $2,702.00 | $32,424.00 .9453 $1500 [NO BID $4,500.00 | $54,000.00 $1.575 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $2,702.00 | $32,424.00 .9453 $15.00 $4,500.00 | $54,000.00 $1.575 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $2,702.00 | $32,424.00 .9453 $15.00 $4,500.00 | $54,000.00 $1.575 $12.65 NO BID
Min Req't FACILITY Gp F(So.) Day Porters $/HOUR | $/YEAR $/HOUR | $/YEAR $/HOUR $/YEAR $/HOUR | $/YEAR $/HOUR $/YEAR
Public Safety Center 8 hriday 251 day/yr NO BID $9.25 $18,574.00 | NOBID $12.65 $25,401.20 NO BID
2,0008 hriyr
Total $9.25 $18,574.00 $12.65 $25,401.20 NO BID
Day porters (Group F) MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL | $/HOUR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID $1,547.84 | $18,574.08 $9.25 NO BID NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $1547.84 | $18,574.08 $9.25 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $1547.84 | $18,574.08 $9.25 NO BID
(Group G) Sr Citzens Svcs Ct (203,738 sq') [MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQFT* |ADD'L P/HR| MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADD/HR |[MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SQFT ADD/HR [MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADD/HR [ MONTHLY ANNUAL $/SQFT | ADD/HR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID N/A NO BID $23,900.00 | $286,800.00 $1.242] $1265| NOBID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007 $23,900.00 | $286,800.00 $1.242 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $23,900.00 | $286,800.00 $1.242 $12.65 NO BID
(Group G) Min Req't Day Porters MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQFT* |ADD'L P/HR] $/HOUR $/YEAR $/HOUR $/YEAR $/HOUR $/YEAR| $/HOUR| $/YEAR|
E;v;;dren srctr 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 4.016| o g N/A NO BID $12.65 $50,802.40 NO BID
Camp Truitt 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255 $12.65 $15,875.75 NO BID
hrsiyr
Dogwood 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255 $12.65 $15.875.75 NOBID
hrsfyr
H. G. Darnell 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 4,016 $12.65 $50,802.40 NO BID
hrsiyr
Edgewood/Aurburn 5 hr/day, 251 days/yr, $12.65 $15,875.75 NO BID
1,255 hrslyr
So. Fulton (Fairburn) 16 hrs/day, 251
dayslyr, 4,016 hrslyr (Temp Closeq $15,875.75 NO BID
New Horizons 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255 $12.65 $15.875.75 NOBID
hrsfyr
Palmetto 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1255 hrs/yr $12.65 $15,875.75 NO BID
N. Fulton (Warsaw) 5 hrs/day 251, days/yr, $12.65 $15,875.75 NO BID
1,255 hrslyr
QLS 8 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 2,008 days/yr $12.65 $25,401.20 NO BID
D.C. Benson 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 4,016 $12.65 $50,.802.40 NOBID
hrsfyr
Mills 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 4,016 hrs/yr $12.65 $50,802.40 NO BID
Southeast 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255 $12.65 $15.875.75 NOBID
hrsfyr
Hapeville 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255 hrs/yi $12.65 $15,875.75 NO BID
Total $12.65 | $374,192.55 NO BID
Day Porters (Group G) MONTHLY | ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL [ $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL | $/HOUR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID N/A NO BID $31,182.71 |$374,192.55 |  $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $31,182.71 |$374,192.55 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $31,182.71 | $374,192.55 $12.65 NO BID
g’;ggo"'séf;" Center & Hammond House |y o\riy vl ANNUAL | $/HOUR |ADD'L PIHR| MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADD/HR [MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SQFT ADD/HR [MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADD/HR | MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQFT | ADD/HR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID $4,954.00 | $59,448.00 .9306 $15.00 $4,248.00 | $50,976.00 0.798/YR $11.95 $3,800.00 | $45,600.00 $.76638 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $4,954.00 | $59,448.00 .9306 $15.00 $4,248.00 | $50,976.00 0.798/YR $12.45 $3,800.00 | $45,600.00 $.76638 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $4,954.00 | $59,448.00 .9306 $15.00 $4,312.00 | $51,744.00 0.0810 $12.45 $3,800.00 | $45,600.00 $.76638 $12.65 NO BID




BID NUMBER: 05ITB47254Y
DESCRIPTION: JANITORIA

A
L SERVICES

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID OPEN DATE: 02/23/06
COMMODITY:

PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:

PAGE 6 OF 9

REQUISITION #:
CONTACT NAME:
PHONE #:

DESCRIPTION 6. VENDOR NAME 7. VENDOR NAME 8. VENDOR NAME 9. VENDOR NAME 10. VENDOR NAME
GA BLDG MAINTENANCE SVCS, INC MID SOUTH CLEANING SERVICES, INC. OJS SYSTEMS, INC. BUILDING MAINTENANCE SERVICES, INC GMI GROUP, INC. NON-RESPONSIVE
OF VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDORS
PRODUCT ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
OR 2814 SPRING ROAD, SUITE 30€ 2459 ROOSEVELT HWY. SUITE A-8 P_0.BOX 671744 1955 Vauahn Road, suite 10 470 SATELITE BLVD, SUITE R OTHER
SERVICES ATLANTA, GA 3033¢ COLLEGE PARK, GA 30337 MARIETTA, GA 3000€¢ Kennesaw, GA 3014 SUWANEE, GA 30024
DESIRED INFORMATION
FAX: FAX: 770-975-9387 FAX: 770-218-2996 FAX: 678-482-7106
INDIVIDUAL LINE Tl HON 78] 2 TELEPHONE: 770-975-9343 TELEPHONE: 770-218-993 TELEPHONE: 678-482-5288
ITEM CONTACT: LARRY JOHNSON CONTACT: JOHN HEO CONTACT: PETE GROMPONE CONTACT: JOSEPH H. WOODSON, JR.
DESCRIPTIONS BID BOND: CHECK BID BOND: YES BID BOND: BID BOND: YES BID BOND: YES
(Group H) Min Req't Day Porters P/HOUR P/YEAR $/HR[$/YEAR $/HR[$/YEAR $/HR[$/YEAR $/HR|$/YEAR
Abernathy Arts 1 & 24 hrs/day, 251 daysiyr, NO BID)| $9.25|  $9,287.00 $9.75 |  $9,789.00 $12.65 | $12,700.00 NO BID
1,004 hrslyr
\A\/re;)tl’End Arts 6 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 502 $9.25|  $4,643.50 $9.75 |  $4,894.50 $12.65|  $6,350.30 NO BID
:ﬁ;?y?ond House 2 hrs/day, 251 Days/yr, 503 $9.25|  $4,64350 $9.75 |  $4,894.50 $12.65|  $6,350.30 NO BID
South Fulton Arts 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, $9.25 | $37,148.00 $9.75 |  $39,156.00 $12.65 | $50,802.40 NO BID
4,016 hrslyr
ES;;;TWES{ Arts 6 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,506 $9.25 | $13,930.50 $9.75 | $14,683.50 $12.65 | $19,050.90 NO BID
TOTAL $9.25 |  $69,652.50 $9.75 | $73,417.50 $12.65 |  $95,254.50 NO BID
Day Porters (Group H) MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL [ $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL | $/HOUR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID| $5,804.38 | $69,652.56 $9.25 $6,118.00 $73,416.00 $9.75 $7,937.87 | $95,254.50 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $5,804.38 |  $69,652.56 $9.25 $6,432.00 $77,184.00 $10.25 $7,937.87 | $95,254.50 $12.65 NO BID
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $5,804.38 |  $69,652.56 $9.25 $6,432.00 $77,184.00 $10.25 $7,937.87 | $95,254.50 $12.65 NO BID
(Group I) Day Porters $/HOUR $/HOUR $/HOUR $/HOUR $/HOUR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID| NI/A| $12.45 $12.65 NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $12.75 $12.65 NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $13.00 $12.65 NO BID|
ING OF BIDS MAILED: BUYER'S NAME: DATE RECEIVED:
NO OF BIDS RECEIVED: DEPARTMENT'S AUTHORIZATION (AWARD APPROVAL) DATE COMPLETED:
NO BIDS RECEIVED: PURCHASING AGENT'S/DEPUTY PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE COMPLETED BY:
NO OF NONE RESPONSE: CHIEF ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT'S SIGNATURE DATE:
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BID NUMBER 05ITB47254YA
DESCRIPTION: JANITORIAL SERVICES

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:
DESCRIPTION 11 VENDOR NAME 12. VENDOR NAME 13. VENDOR NAME 14, VENDOR NAME 15. VENDOR NAME
C&W ALL-PURPOSE CLEANING SVCS, INC. NON-RESPONSIVE
OF VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDORS
PRODUCT ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
OR [ 500 WENDELL COURT, SUITE 519 OTHER
SERVICES ATLANTA, GA 3033¢
DESIRED INFORMATION
FAX: FAX: FAX: FAX: FAX:
INDIVIDUAL LINE [TELEPHONE: 404-699-7311 TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE;
ITEM CONTACT: CARIS MOSES CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT
DESCRIPTIONS [BID BOND; YES TBID BOND: TBID BOND: TBID BOND: TBID BOND:
Gp A Gov't Ctr Complex MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* [ADD'L P/HR| MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* |[ADD'L P/HRIMONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SQ FT* ADD'L P/HR[MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQ FT* |[ADD'L P/HR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/SQ FT* |ADD'L P/HR| NO BIDS
Gp 12 Month Contract - 2006 NO BID
Gp 12 Month Renewal Opt - 2007
Gp 12 Month Renewal Opt - 2008
|| Min Req't FACILITY (Gp A Day Porters $/HOUR | $/YEAR $/HOUR $/YEAR $/HOUR | $/YEAR $/HOUR | $/YEAR
Govt Ctr @ 40 hr/day 251 days/yr & 10,040
hrsfyr @ Y Ve NOBID
Public Safety @ 4 hrs/day 251 days/yr &
1,004 hrslyr
Total
Group A Day Porters COST P/HR| COST PIYR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006 NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008
Group B Justice Facilities 999,878 sq f MONTHLY | ANNUAL $/SQ FT* ADD'L PHR [MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SQ FT* ADD'L PHR [MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SQ FT* ADD'L PIHR | MONTHLY ANNUAL $/SQ FT* ADD'L P/HR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006 NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008
Min Req't FACILITY (Gp B Day Porters) $/HOUR| $PER YEAR $/HOUR| $PER YEAR $/HOUR| $PER YEAR $/HOUR| $ PER YEAR
Justice; Carnes; FCC 56 hr/day 251 days/yr NO BID
14,056 hrlyr
Juvenile Court 32 hrs/day 251 day/yr 8,032
hrsfyr
Total
Group B Day Porters MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID| N/A| $12.65 NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $12.65 NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008 $12.65 NO BID
I\Gllrezigfi;\(/:iﬁre“;(alr:/lf:bLl:tr)nrla::i)eI;ezlPublic MONTHLY ANNUAL| $/SqFt| ADDSVCS| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|  MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR)
12 Month Contract (thru 2006)
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007)
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008)
Min Req't FACILITY (Gp C Day Porters) $/ HOUR| $/YEAR] $/HOUR $/YEAR] $/HOUR $/YEAR] $/HOUR| $/YEAR| $/HOUR| $/YEAR
Central Library NO BID|
Auburn Library
Public Defender
Total
Group C Day Porters MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY | ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008)
Group B 12 Month Conntract 2006
(Group D) N Fulton Libraries (172,407 sq') | MONTHLY ANNUAL| $/SqFt| ADDSVCS| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|  MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007)
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008)
(Group E) S Fulton Libraries (102,501sq') MONTHLY ANNUAL| $/SqFt| ADDSVCS| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|  MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007)
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008)
(Group F) Other Offices No. (52,905 sq ') MONTHLY ANNUAL| $/SqFt| ADDSVCS| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR| MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|  MONTHLY| ANNUAL $/SqFt|  ADD/HR|
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) NO BID|
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007)
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008)




FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION
BID NUMBER 05ITB47254YA
DESCRIPTION: JANITORIAL SERVICES
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:
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DESCRIPTION

OF
PRODUCT

OR
SERVICES
DESIRED

INDIVIDUAL LINE
ITEM

DESCRIPTIONS

11. VENDOR NAME

12. VENDOR NAME

13. VENDOR NAME

14. VENDOR NAME

15. VENDOR NAME

C&W ALL-PURPOSE CLEANING SVCS, INC.

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

ADDRESS

ADDRESS

ADDRESS

ADDRESS

ADDRESS

500 WENDELL COURT, SUITE 519

ATLANTA, GA 3033¢

FAX:
TELEPHONE:

FAX:
TELEPHONE: 404-699-7311

FAX:
TELEPHONE:

FAX:
TELEPHONE:

FAX:
TELEPHONE:

NON-RESPONSIVE
VENDORS

OTHER
INFORMATION

CONTACT: CARIS MOSES

CONTACT

CONTACT

CONTACT

CONTACT

[BID BOND:

[BID BOND:

[BID BOND:

[BID BOND:

BID BOND:

(Group F) Offices So. (34,274 sq')

MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQ FT*

ADD'L P/HR)|

MONTHLY

ANNUAL | $/SQ FT*

ADD'L P/HRJMONTHLY]|

ANNUAL

$/SQ FT*

ADD'L P/HRIMONTHLY|

ANNUAL | $/SQ FT*

ADD'L P/HR|

MONTHLY | ANNUAL

$/SQ FT*

ADD'L P/HR]|

12 Month Contract (thru 2006)

$5,785.45 | $69,425.41 2.02 $17.50

12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007)

$5,785.45 | $69,425.41 2.02 $17.50

12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008)

$5,785.45 | $69,425.41 2.02 $17.50

Min Req't FACILITY Gp F(So.) Day Porters

$/HOUR | $/YEAR

$/HOUR

$/YEAR

$/HOUR

$/YEAR

$/HOUR

$/YEAR

$/HOUR

$/YEAR

Public Safety Center 8 hr/day 251 day/yr
2,0008 hriyr

$17.50 |$35,140.00

Total

$17.50 | $35,140.00

Day porters (Group F)

MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR

MONTHLY | ANNUAL

$/HOUR

MONTHLY

ANNUAL

$/HOUR

MONTHLY | ANNUAL

$/HOUR

MONTHLY

ANNUAL

$/HOUR

12 Month Contract (thru 2006)

NO BID

12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007)

12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008)

(Group G) Sr Citzens Svcs Ct (203,738 sq')

MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQFT* |ADD'L P/HR]

MONTHLY

ANNUAL | $/SQFT

ADD/HR [MONTHLY|

ANNUAL

$/SQFT

ADD/HR [MONTHLY]

ANNUAL | $/SQFT

ADD/HR

MONTHLY | ANNUAL

$/SQFT

ADD/HR

12 Month Contract (thru 2006)

NO BID

12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007

12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008)

(Group G) Min Req't Day Porters

MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/SQFT* |ADD'L P/HR]

$/HOUR|

$/YEAR]

$/HOUR|

$/YEAR]

$/HOUR|

$/YEAR

$/HOUR|

$/YEAR

Bowden sr ctr 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 4,016
hrsfyr

NO BID

Camp Truitt 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255
hrsiyr

Dogwood 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255
hrsfyr

H. G. Darnell 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 4,016
hrslyr

Edgewood/Aurburn 5 hr/day, 251 days/yr,
1,255 hrslyr

So. Fulton (Fairburn) 16 hrs/day, 251
daysl/yr, 4,016 hrs/yr

New Horizons 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255
hrsfyr

Palmetto 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1255 hrsfyr

N. Fulton (Warsaw) 5 hrs/day 251, days/yr,
1,255 hrslyr

QLS 8 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 2,008 days/yr

D.C. Benson 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 4,016
hrsfyr

Mills 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 4,016 hrs/yr

Southeast 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255
hrsfyr

Hapeville 5 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,255 hrslyi

Total

Day Porters (Group G)

MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR

MONTHLY | ANNUAL

$/HOUR

MONTHLY

ANNUAL

$/HOUR

MONTHLY | ANNUAL

$/HOUR

MONTHLY

ANNUAL

$/HOUR

12 Month Contract (thru 2006)

NO BID

12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007)

12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008)

Group H - Art Center & Hammond House
(63,880 sq')

MONTHLY| ANNUAL | $/HOUR |ADD'L P/HR]

MONTHLY

ANNUAL | $/SQFT

ADD/HR [MONTHLY|

ANNUAL

$/SQFT

ADD/HR [MONTHLY]

ANNUAL | $/SQFT

ADD/HR

MONTHLY | ANNUAL

$/SQFT

ADD/HR

12 Month Contract (thru 2006)

$8,333.25 | $99,999.00 1.56 $17.50

12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007)

$8,333.25 | $99,999.00 1.56 $17.50

12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008)

$8,333.25 | $99,999.00 1.56 $17.50




FULTON COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 05ITB47254Y
DESCRIPTION: JANITORIA

A
L SERVICES

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID OPEN DATE: 02/23/06
COMMODITY:

PURCHASE CONTRACT (PC) #:

PAGE 9 OF 9
REQUISITION #:
CONTACT NAME:

PHONE #:

DESCRIPTION 11. VENDOR NAME 12. VENDOR NAME 13. VENDOR NAME 14. VENDOR NAME 15 VENDOR NAME
C&W ALL-PURPOSE CLEANING SVCS, INC. NON-RESPONSIVE
OF VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDORS
PRODUCT ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
OR ITE 519 OTHER
SERVICES ATLANTA, GA 3553(
DESIRED INFORMATION
E E F
INDIVIDUAL LINE H - - T T T
ICONTACT: CARIS MOSES CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT
DESCRIPTIONS [EID BOND. BID BOND: BID BOND: BID BOND; BID BOND:

(Group H) Min Req't Day Porters P/HOUR! P/YEAR $/HR[$/YEAR $/HR[$/YEAR $/HR[$/YEAR $/HR|$/ YEAR
Abernathy Arts 1 & 2 4 hrs/day, 251 daysl/yr,
1,004 hrslyr $17.50 | $17,570.00
West End Arts 6 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 502 $17.50 $8,785.00
Hrslyr
Hammond House 2 hrs/day, 251 Days/yr, 503 $17.50 $8.785.00
hrslyr
South Fulton Arts 16 hrs/day, 251 days/yr,
4,016 hrslyr $17.50 | $70,280.00
Southwest Arts 6 hrs/day, 251 days/yr, 1,506 $1750 | $26.355.00
hrslyr
TOTAL $17.50 | $131,775.00
Day Porters (Group H) MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR| MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY ANNUAL $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR MONTHLY | ANNUAL | $/HOUR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) $10,891.24 | $131,775.00 $17.50
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $10,891.24 | $131,775.00 $17.50
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $10,891.24 | $131,775.00 $17.50
(Group |) Day Porters $ /HOUR $/ HOUR $/HOUR $/HOUR $/HOUR
12 Month Contract (thru 2006) $17.50
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2007) $17.50
12 Month Renewal Option (thru 2008) $17.50




