BID TAB

BID NUMBER#:_ 06ITB50760YC [ OPENING T 67772006 | PAGE NUMBER:
BID DESCRIPTION: Landfill Maintenance
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS- CONTACT |
o VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE »Z
@) m Brown Management Services The A-Team Inc. Lesco Services % 2
g % VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME o r;ﬁ
m 3 = 7))
2 g ADDRESS _ ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ﬁ 8
% > 1129 Brett Dr., Suite C 56 SpringCrest Trail PO Box 242 o %
0 -|O-| Conyers, GA 30094 Lawrenceville, GA 30045 Lookout Mtn, TN 37350 ﬁ 51
o
o B TELEPHONE: TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE g ﬁ
E 8 770-785-3916 770-361-8799 423-822-2050 :f' %
O % CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: 2 %
= Hugh M. Brown Jr. Rick L. Moore Leslie D. Coffey %]
QTYUNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL
Site Fence s 350 | % 350 | % 270 $ 270 $ 3751 % 3.75
Hay Bales 1% 4251 % 4251 % 275 % 275 % 4.00 | $ 4.00 $ - $ -
Rip Rap s 50.00 [ $ 50.00 [ $ 40.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 75.00 [ $ 75.00 $ - $ -
Mowing & Vegetation
Control Morgan Falls (65)
Acres 1{$ 9,100.00 ($ 9,100.00 [$ 3,200.00 [$ 3,200.00 [ $ 19,500.00 [ $ 19,500.00 $ - $ -
Mowing & Vegetation
Control Merk Miles (39)
Acres 1/{$ 5,655.00($ 5,655.00($% 2,900.00($ 2,900.00($ 11,700.00 ($ 11,700.00
Lime Application Morgan
Falls (65 Acres) 1| $ 35,750.00 [ $ 35,750.00 [$ 2,000.00 [$ 2,000.00 [$ 13,000.00 [ $ 13,000.00 $ - $ -
Lime Application Merk
Miles (39 Acres) 1|$ 21,450.00 [ $ 21,450.00 [$ 2,000.00 ($ 2,000.00$ 8,000.00($ 8,000.00 $ = $ o
Seeding Morgan Falls (65
Acres) 1| $ 68,250.00 [ $ 68,250.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 [ $ 50,000.00 $ - $ -
Seeding Merk Miles (39
Acres) 1| $ 40,950.00 [ $ 40,950.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 $ - $ -
Erosion Control Mat 1 $ 040($ 040($ 013($ 013($ 020($ 0.20 $ - $ -
18 Inc MWSLF Final
Cover Material 1% 27.00 [ $ 27.00 [ $ 14.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 $ - $ -
6 Inch Topsoil s 10.75 | $ 10.75 | $ 730 % 730 $ 50.00 [ $ 50.00 $ = $ o
General fill Material 1% 20.00 [ $ 20.00 [ $ 14.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 $ - $ -
Waste Disposal (Inert) 1% 30.00 [ $ 30.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 50.00 [ $ 50.00 $ - $ -
Waste Disposal (Muncipal
Solid Waste) 1 $ 40.00 | $ 40.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 100.00 [ $ 100.00 $ = $ o
$ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
$ - $ - $ - $ - $ = $ =
$ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
GRAND TOTAL: $181,340.90 $37,180.88 $137,682.95 $0.00 $0.00|
BIDS MAILED 42|NO RESPONSE: ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: Malcolm Tyson DATE RECEIVED: 06/07/06
BIDS RECEIVED: 3 |NO-BIDS: [CHIEF ASSISTANT: WILLIAM LONG DATE COMPLETED: 06/08/06

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

COMPLETED BY: LISA MCKINE




