
CONTACT:

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR 
SERVICES DESIRED

TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ NON RESPONSIVE  

1. Tree Removal Services Regular Hours - 
Person /Hour $75.00 $12.50 NO BID Ben Landscaping Services

2 Tree Removal Services Regular After Hours -
Person/Hour $85.00 $12.50 NO BID

3. Tree Removal Services Weekends - 
Person/hour

 $85.00 $16.50 NO BID

4. Tree Removal Services Holidays - 
Person/Hour

 $85.00 $20.00 NO BID

5. Tree Removal Emergency Services - 
Person/hour

 $85.00 $24.50 NO BID

6. Stump Grinding per linear inch  $3.50 $1.25 NO BID

EQUIPMENT OWNED Accessible Hourly Rate OWNED Accessible Hourly Rate OWNED Accessible Hourly Rate OWNED Accessible Hourly Rate

1 BUCKET TRUCK YES YES 50 X $27.00 NO BID

2 CHIPPER YES YES 25 X $22.00 NO BID

3 LOG LOADERS YES YES 50 BOBCAT $40.00 NO BID

4 CHIPPER TRUCK YES YES 25 X $19.00 NO BID

5 PICK-UP TRUCK YES YES 15 X $5.00 NO BID

         

   

 

  

  

   

   

   

NO. OF NOTIFICATIONS MAILED 35
NO. OF BIDS DOWNLOADED 58 0 DATE RECEIVED:
NO. OF BIDS RECEIVED: 2 1 DATE COMPLETED:
NO. OF MBES NOTIFICATIONS MAILED: 5 DATE:

PRE AWARD TABULATION:                                                               
Fulton co. reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids or any 
part thereof & to waive technicalities.  This tabulation is NOT FINAL 
or BINDING & is subject to amendment at the discretion of Fulton Co
Govt. 

2. VENDOR NAME
CAPITOL TREE SERVICES, LLC

LILBURN, GA 30047

ADDRESS:

 

4145 ARCADIA INDUSTRIAL CIRCLE

 

4. VENDOR NAME

VENDOR CODE
BEN LANDSCAPING

VENDOR CODE

3. VENDOR NAME

BID TABULATION SHEET
PAGE 1 OF 1 OPEN DATE:  04/27/06BID NUMBER:   06ITBR48525YA-DR

 
5/4/2006

NON RESPONSIVE VENDORS 
AND OTHER INFORMATION

5. VENDOR NAME

VENDOR CODEVENDOR CODE

NO RESPONSE:
CHIEF ASSISTANT:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

NO-BIDS:

   
ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT:  DONALD RILEY

 

ADDRESS: ADDRESS:

CONTACT: 

TELEPHONE:TELEPHONE: 770-498-7000
 

TELEPHONE:  404-767-7381
 

TELEPHONE:
 

TELEPHONE:

CONTACT:  RON CONTACT: CONTACT:  RODNEY CASEY CONTACT:  CHRLES EDGE

ADDRESS:ADDRESS:

BID DESCRIPTION: TREE REMOVAL SERVICES
PC #: DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES     

1.VENDOR NAME
CASEY TREE EXPERTS

VENDOR CODE


