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=2 Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page 1
—
Bid: RFQ 0859849YB-MW BOOK BINDING SERVICES - LIBRARY
Close Date/Time: 2/5/08 AT 2:00 P.M.
Commodity Group Code Description Bid Amount

1. Defauit Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $60.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $8.95

The HF Group $8.00
2. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $40.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $6.65

The HF Group $7.25
3. Default Commodity Group: : 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation $60.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $3.00

The HF Group $6.25
4. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/Art Translation $30.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $3.50

The HF Group $5.75
5. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation $60.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $6.15

The HF Group $5.60
6. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation $80.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $6.34

The HF Group $6.60
7. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation No Bid

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $6.35

The HF Group $6.50
8. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation No Bid

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $3.50

The HF Group $5.75
9. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation No Bid

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $4.65

The HF Group $4.95

Opt-Out: *
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RFQ 0859849YB-MW BOOKBINDING SERVICES PAGE?2
Commodity Group Code Description Bid Amount

10. Default Commaodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation $10.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $.50

The HF Group £5.45
11. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation $20.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $.95

The HF Group $5.95
12. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation $30.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $1.00

The HF Group $6.75
13. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation $.50

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia No Bid

The HF Group $1.00
14. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation $80.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $2.00

The HF Group $6.50
15. Default Commeodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation No Bid

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $12.00

The HF Group $23.00
16. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation No Bid

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $10.00

The HF Group $28.00
17. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation $100.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $35.00

The HF Group $50.00
18. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation No Bid

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $2.25

The HF Group $1.50
19. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translation $120.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia 3.00 Minimum

The HF Group $3.50

Opt-Out: *
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Commodity Group Code Description Bid Amount

20. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding / Art Translations No Bid

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $1.00

The HF Group $1.00
21. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $50.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $2.00

The HF Group $1.50
22. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations No Bid

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $.60

The HF Group
23. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $4.00 per line

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia No Bid

The HF Group $1.00
24. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/Art Translations $4.00 per line

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $.60

The HF Group $.25
25. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations No Bid

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia No Bid

The HF Group $ 50
26. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $2.00 per line

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $.35

The HF Group $.15
27. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $2.00

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $.50

The HF Group $.50
28. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations No Bid

National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $1.25

The HF Group $1.00

Opt-Out: *
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Commodity Group Code Description Bid Amount

29. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services

Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $15.00
National Library Bindery Company of Georgia No Bid
The HF Group $3.00
30. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services
Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations No Bid
National Library Bindery Company of Georgia No Bid
The HF Group -0-
31. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services
Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $25.00
National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $1.00 per line
The HF Group $2.00
32. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services
Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations No Bid
National Library Bindery Company of Georgia N/C
The HF Group 0.0
33. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services
Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $25.00
National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $.30
The HF Group 0.0
34, Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services
Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $150.60
National Library Bindery Company of Georgia N/C
The HF Group 0.0
35. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services
Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $500.00
National Library Bindery Company of Georgia None
The HE Group 0.0
36. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services
Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations $1.00
National Library Bindery Company of Georgia .65
The HF Group 50
37. Default Commodity Group: 90820 Bookbinding Services
Classic Bookbinding/ Art Translations £700.00
National Library Bindery Company of Georgia $200.00
The HF Group $300.0

Opt-Out: *



