BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER#: 13ITB87973YB-TR OPENING DATE: | 5/14/2013 | PAGE NUMBER: lof4
BID DESCRIPTION: FIREFIGHTER UNIFORMS AND ACCESSORIES
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: Fire Department CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE =
ﬁ VS0000002480 NAFE880297-A SMYR666488-A V0000108003 2
» 8 VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME 3 ﬁ
m3 I3
2 g COMMAND UNIFORMS NAFECO SMYRNA POLICE DISTRIBUTORS T & T UNIFORMS, INC. Uniform Sales of America, Inc. o 2
rnn = ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS % ‘é’
g < 1315-A Chattahoochee Avenue Atlanta, 1515 West Moulton Street 630-B Windy Hill Road Smyrna, 285 A. North Main Street 1415 Trae Lane _ Lithia om
m3 Georgia 30318 Decatur, Alabama 35601 Georgia 30080 Jonesboro, Georgia 30236 Springs, Georgia 30122 g é
r;ﬁ g TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE g 8
°g (404) 603-4778 (256) 353-7100 (770) 434-1986 (770) 210-3399 (770) 944-0596 s
% CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: )z>
Mr. William Johnson Allan Estroff Ronda Jacobs Ryan Heiden Robert Yurman S
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL
1. Male firefighter pants — 200
Regular fit 400NX75NB $ 96.50 | $ 19,300.00 | $ 84.90 | $ 16,980.00 NO-BID $ 87.79 | $ 17,558.00 | $ 91.95 | $ 18,390.00
2. Male firefighter pants -
Relaxed fit 402NX75NB 70 $ 98.50 | $ 6,895.00 | $ 89.75 | s 6,282.50 NO-BID $ 87.79 | s 6,145.30 | $ 94.95 | $ 6,646.50
3. Female firefighter pants
401NX75NB 28 $ 96.50 | s 2,702.00 | $ 84.90 | s 2,377.20 NO-BID $ 87.79 | s 245812 [ $ 91.95 | $ 2,574.60
4. Short sleeve male fire
chief shirt 700NX45NB 135 $ 99.50 | $ 1343250 | $ 89.99 | s 12,148.65 NO-BID $ 86.30 | $ 11,650.50 | $ 94.95 | $ 12,818.25
5. Long sleeve male fire
X . 135
chief shirt 705NX45NB $ 109.50 | $ 14,782.50 | $ 10359 | s 13,984.65 NO-BID $ 96.30 | $ 13,000.50 | $ 109.75 | $ 14,816.25
6. Short sleeve female fire 20
chief shirt 701NX45NB $ 9950 | s 1,990.00 | $ 89.99 | s 1,799.80 NO-BID $ 8630 (s 1,726.00 | $ 94.95 | $ 1,899.00
7.Long sleeve female fire 28
chief shirt 706NX45NB $ 10950 | $ 3,066.00 | $ 10359 | s 2,900.52 NO-BID $ 9630 s 2,696.40 | $ 10975 | 8 3,073.00
8. Elbeco Paragon Plus
w/Nano P867 44 $ 2450 | s 1,078.00 | $ 29.90 | s 1,315.60 NO-BID $ 26.25 | $ 1,155.00 | $ 28.50 | $ 1,254.00
9. Elbeco Paragon Plus w/
NanoP877 44 $ 2750 |s 1,210.00 | $ 3249 |3 1,429.56 NO-BID $ 28.75 | $ 1,265.00 | $ 3150 | $ 1,386.00
10. Elbeco Paragon Plus
w/Nano P811/ 15 $ 2450 | s 367.50 | $ 29.90 | s 448.50 NO-BID $ 2550 | $ 382.50 | $ 28.50 | $ 427.50
11. Elbeco Paragon Plus
w/ NanoP801 a4 $ 2750 |s 1,210.00 | $ 3249 |3 1,429.56 NO-BID $ 29.00 | s 1,276.00 | $ 3150 | $ 1,386.00
12. Elbeco Tek Twill E820 40 $ 29.50 | s 1,180.00 | $ 3475 |'s 1,390.00 NO-BID $ 4150 | s 1,660.00 | $ 34.95 | $ 1,398.00
13. Elbeco Tek Twill 9820 5 $ 29.50 | s 14750 | $ 3475 | s 173.75 NO-BID $ 4150 | s 207.50 | $ 3495 | $ 174.75
14. Elbeco Tek Trop
E3230 5 $ 28.50 | s 14250 | $ 3125 |s 156.25 NO-BID $ 36.50 | $ 18250 | $ 2650 | $ 132.50
15. Elbeco Tek Trop 135 $ 28.50 | $ 384750 | $ 34.44 | s 4,649.40 NO-BID $ 36.50 | $ 492750 | $ 2650 | $ 3,577.50
16. E9320LC 15 $ 2550 | s 38250 | $ 2289 | s 34335 | $ 25.90 | s 38850 |$ 3400 |s 51000 | $ 2650 | 8 397.50
17. Propper BDU Trouser 50 $ 10950 | s 547500 | $ 99.94 | s 4,997.00 99.93 | s 49950 | $  115.00 | s 5,750.00 | $ 104.95 | $ 5,247.50
18. F5201-38-405 50 $ 109.50 | $ 5,475.00 | $ 99.94 | s 4,997.00 99.93 | s 499650 | $  115.00 | $ 5,750.00 | $ 10495 | $ 5,247.50
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED INO RESPONSE: DATE RECEIVED: 05/14/2013
BIDS RECEIVED: INO-BIDS: ]CONTACT: Terrence Reese DATE COMPLETED: 05/14/2013




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER#: 13ITB87973YB-TR OPENING DATE: [ 5/14/2013 I PAGE NUMBER: 20f4
BID DESCRIPTION: FIREFIGHTER UNIFORMS AND ACCESSORIES
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: Fire Department CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT
1=} VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE =
“ V50000002480 NAFE880297-A SMYR666488-A VC0000108003 zZ9
o 91!; VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME g z
2 = COMMAND UNIFORMS NAFECO SMYRNA POLICE DISTRIBUTORS T & T UNIFORMS, INC. Uniform Sales of America, Inc. = t_e)
g g ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS o 2
g 101 1315-A Chattahoochee Avenue Atlanta, 1515 West Moulton Street 630-B Windy Hill Road Smyrna, 285 A. North Main Street 1415 Trae Lane _ Lithia > (g
mz Georgia 30318 Decatur, Alabama 35601 Georgia 30080 Jonesboro, Georgia 30236 Springs, Georgia 30122 3
? 8 TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE % é
of (404) 603-4778 (256) 353-7100 (770) 434-1986 (770) 210-3399 (770) 944-0596 49
6‘ CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: % %
3 Mr. William Johnson Allan Estroff Ronda Jacobs Ryan Heiden Robert Yurman
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL
19. Flat Front Pants 2780 Flat 3
Front Pants $ 4750 | $ 142.50 | $ 49.94 | $ 149.82 43.68 $ 131.04 | $ 53.75 [ $ 161.25 | $ 4495 [ $ 134.85
20. Edwards Wool Blend
Flat Front Pants 8783 10
$ 4750 |s 475.00 | $ 49.94 | s 499.40 | $ 43.68 |3 436.80 | $ 53.75 | 3 537.50 | $ 44.95 | $ 449.50
21. Edwards Wool Blend
Straight Dress Skirt 9789
Edwards Wool Blend 15
Straight Dress Skirt 9789
$ 4750 |s 71250 | $ 49.94 | s 749.10 | $ 43.68 |3 65520 | $ 53.75 | 3 806.25 | $ 44.95 | $ 674.25
22. Edwards Pinpoint Oxford
1975-000 5
$ 2450 |s 12250 | $ 19.95 | s 9975 | $ 1743 | s 8715 $ 24.25 | $ 12125 | $ 1825 | $ 91.25
23. Edwards Pinpoint Oxford 20
5975-000
$ 2450 |s 490.00 | $ 19.95 | s 399.00 [ $ 1743 |3 34860 | $ 24.25 |3 485.00 | $ 1825 | $ 365.00
24. Spiewak Fleece S327 15 $ 99.50 | 3 1,492.50 | $ 94.00 | s 1,410.00 NO-BID $ 83.80 | 3 1,257.00 | $ 83.95 [ $ 1,259.25
25. Game Firefighter’s Zip 50
Turtleneck 870-T $ 64.50 | s 322500 | $ 4375 | $ 2,187.50 NO-BID $ 49.80 | s 2,490.00 | $ 4550 | $ 2,275.00
26. Horace Small APX Jacket
HS3342 30 NO BID $ 114.15 | s 3,424.50 NO-BID $ 11975 | 359250 [ $ 106.95 | $ 3,208.50
27. Anchor Hip Length Parka
02256 30 NO BID $ 179.00 | s 5,370.00 NO-BID $ 190.25 | s 5707.50 | $ 99.95|$ 2,998.50
28. Augusta Mock Turtleneck
797 30 NO BID $ 1350 |s 405.00 NO-BID $ 17.75 | s 532.50 | $ 1250 | $ 375.00
29. Gildan Ultra Cotton G200 200 $ 8.75 | % 1,750.00 | $ 899 | s 1,798.00 NO-BID $ 1185 [$ 2,370.00 [ $ 875|$ 1,750.00
30. High Viz 485MJD 14 $ 68.50 | $ 959.00 | $ 59.00 | $ 826.00 | $ 67.50 | $ 945.00 | $ 72.50 | $ 1,015.00 | $ 61.50 | $ 861.00
GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED 21 INO RESPONSE: 16 DATE RECEIVED: 05/14/2013
BIDS RECEIVED: 5 I NO-BIDS: 0 ]CONTACT: Terrence Reese DATE COMPLETED: 05/14/2013




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER#: 13ITB87973YB-TR OPENING DATE: 5/14/2013 I PAGE NUMBER: 30f4
BID DESCRIPTION: FIREFIGHTER UNIFORMS AND ACCESSORIES
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: Fire Department CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT
= VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE =
“ V50000002480 NAFE880297-A SMYR666488-A VC0000108003 29
@ % VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME 8 2
2 = COMMAND UNIFORMS NAFECO SMYRNA POLICE DISTRIBUTORS T & T UNIFORMS, INC. Uniform Sales of America, Inc. = 4
Q g ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS 3o
g [} 1315-A Chattahoochee Avenue Atlanta, 1515 West Moulton Street 630-B Windy Hill Road Smyrna, 285 A. North Main Street 1415 Trae Lane _ Lithia = %
mns Georgia 30318 Decatur, Alabama 35601 Georgia 30080 Jonesboro, Georgia 30236 Springs, Georgia 30122 § m
riﬁ 8 TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE )§> é
XS (404) 603-4778 (256) 353-7100 (770) 434-1986 (770) 210-3399 (770) 944-0596 =l 8
5‘ CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: (27 2
2 Mr. William Johnson Allan Estroff Ronda Jacobs Ryan Heiden Robert Yurman
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL
31. Anchor Double Breasted
Class A Jacket 226BL
6 $ 295.00 | $ 1,770.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 1,500.00 NO-BID $ 220.00 | $ 1,320.00 | $ 212.00 | $ 1,272.00
32. Anchor Double Breasted
Class A Jacket 226BL 6 $ 295.00 | $ 1,770.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 1,500.00 NO-BID $  220.00 |s 1,320.00 | $ 212.00 | $ 1,272.00
33. Achor Class A Trousers
ANC 229 6 $ 9450 |s 567.00 | $ 88.00 | s 528.00 NO-BID $ 82.00 | s 492.00 | $ 81.95|$ 491.70
34. Achor Class A Trouser ANC
729 6 $ 94.50 | $ 567.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 528.00 NO-BID $ 82.00 | $ 492.00 [ $ 81.95 | $ 491.70
35. Deluxe Bell Crown Dress
Cap (Fighter) 10 $ 59.50 | s 595.00 | $ 39.00 | s 390.00 NO-BID $ 65.00 | s 650.00 | $ 92.95 | $ 929.50
36. Deluxe Bell Corwn Dress
Cap (Lieutenant/Captain) 5 $ 64.50 | $ 32250 | $ 45.00 | $ 225.00 NO-BID $ 85.00 | $ 425.00 [ $ 92.95 | $ 464.75
37. Deluxe Bell Crown Dress
Cap (Cjief) 3 $ 6450 | s 19350 | $ 75.00 | s 225.00 NO-BID $ 95.00 | s 285.00 | $ 126.95 | $ 380.85
38. Polyester Veicro Tie 30123
(14.5") 10 $ 5.50 | $ 55.00 | $ 395 |s 39.50 | $ 430 |s 43.00 [ $ 7.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 450 [ $ 45.00
39. Polyester Velcro Tie 30123
8") 5 $ 550 | $ 2750 $ 395 |s 1975 | $ 430 |s 2150 [ $ 7.00 | 35.00 | $ 450 [ $ 22.50
40. Polyester Velcro Tie 30123
0") 12 $ 550 | $ 66.00 | $ 395 |s 47.40 [ $ 443 | s 5316 [ $ 7.00 | 84.00 | $ 450 [ $ 54.00
41. Baseball Cap 100 $ 950 [$ 950.00 | $ 1175 | s 1,175.00 NO-BID $ 15.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1195 | $ 1,195.00
42. Bates 8" E02320 50 $ 85.50 | $ 4,275.00 | $ 82.00 | s 4,100.00 | $ 80.00 | s 4,000.00 | $ 94.00 | s 4,700.00 | $ 9195 |$ 4,597.50
43. Bates 8" E02720 5 $ 8450 | s 42250 | $ 7115 |s 35575 | $ 80.00 | s 400.00 | $ 90.00 | s 450.00 | $ 9195 |$ 459.75
44. Thorogood 8" 834-6219 50 $ 75.00 | s 3,750.00 | $ 7179 | s 3,589.50 NO-BID $ 85.00 | s 4,250.00 | $ 7495 | $ 3,747.50
45. Thorogood 8" 834-6218 30 $ 7150 | $ 2,145.00 | $ 67.95 | $ 2,038.50 NO-BID $ 82.00 | $ 2,460.00 | $ 70.95 | $ 2,128.50
GRAND TOTAL: $0.00
BIDS MAILED 21 INO RESPONSE: 16 DATE RECEIVED: 05/14/2013
BIDS RECEIVED: 5 NO-BIDS: 0 ]CONTACT: Terrence Reese DATE COMPLETED: 05/14/2013




BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER#: 13ITB87973YB-TR OPENING DATE: I 5/14/2013 T PAGE NUMBER: | Zof4

BID DESCRIPTION: FIREFIGHTER UNIFORMS AND ACCESSORIES

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: Fire Department CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT CONTACT,
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE

VS0000002480 NAFE880297-A SMYR666488-A VC0000108003
VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME VENDOR NAME
COMMAND UNIFORMS NAFECO SMYRNA POLICE DISTRIBUTORS T & T UNIFORMS, INC. Uniform Sales of America, Inc.
ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS

a341S3a S3DINY3AS
Y0 1ONA0Yd 40 NOILdIMOS3a

NOILYWHOLNI ¥3HLO ANV
SHYOANIA FAISNOJSTH NON

1315-A Chattahoochee Avenue Atlanta, 1515 West Moulton Street 630-B Windy Hill Road Smyrna, 285 A. North Main Street 1415 Trae Lane _ Lithia
Georgia 30318 Decatur, Alabama 35601 Georgia 30080 Jonesboro, Georgia 30236 Springs, Georgia 30122
TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE
(404) 603-4778 (256) 353-7100 (770) 434-1986 (770) 210-3399 (770) 944-0596
CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:
Mr. William Johnson Allan Estroff Ronda Jacobs Ryan Heiden Robert Yurman
QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT$ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL
46. Bates Work E00932 25 $ 9450 | $ 2,362.50 | $ 90.71 | $ 2,267.75 88.45 $ 221125 | $ 102.50 | $ 2,562.50 | $ 10150 | $ 2,537.50
47. Bates Work E00752 5 $ 9450 | $ 47250 | $ 90.06 | $ 45030 [ $ 87.80 | $ 439.00 | $ 102.50 [ $ 512.50 | $ 100.50 | $ 502.50
48. Bates Dress E00942 50 $ 85.50 | $ 4,275.00 | $ 80.77 | $ 4,03850 [ $ 78.75 | $ 393750 | $ 92.25 | $ 4,612.50 | $ 90.50 | $ 4,525.00
49. Bates Dress E00742 14 $ 8350 | $ 1,169.00 | $ 7949 | $ 1,112.86 | $ 7775 | $ 1,088.50 | $ 91.25 | $ 1,277.50 | $ 88.95 | $ 1,245.30
50. Boston Leather Belt 6606
(Silver or Gold Buckle) 130 $ 18.50 | $ 2,405.00 | $ 1167 | $ 1,517.10 | $ 1137 [s 1,478.10 | $ 1525 |$ 1,982.50 | $ 1275 | $ 1,657.50
51. Nylon Survial Belt 20 $ 2950 | $ 590.00 | $ 2750 | $ 550.00 NO-BID $ 30.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 2995 | $ 599.00
52. FD Station Wear Jacket w/
optionalzip in liner 550MV -
Navey 130 $ 69.50 | $ 9,035.00 | $ 7940 | s 10,322.00 [ $ 47.00 | $ 6,110.00 | $ 60.75 | $ 7,897.50 [ $ 59.95 [ $ 7,793.50
53. Twill Jacket with fully lined
lightweight mylon; two side
packets, inner chest pocket, cell
phone pocket-black 25 $ 5450 |s 1,362.50 | $ 4125 |3 1,031.25 NO-BID $ 49.75 | s 124375 | $ 4895 | $ 1,223.75
GRAND TOTAL: $131,200.00 $132,672.52 $32,767.30 $136,598.32 $132,924.75|
BIDS MAILED 21 INO RESPONSE: 16 DATE RECEIVED: 05/14/2013
BIDS RECEIVED: 5 I NO BIDS: 0 ]CONTACT: Terrence Reese DATE COMPLETED: 05/14/2013




