
% Discount 

Offered QTY UNIT TOTAL

% Discount 

Offered UNIT TOTAL

% Discount 

Offered UNIT $ TOTAL % Discount Offered UNIT $ TOTAL % Discount OfferedUNIT $ TOTAL

PRICING of MATERIALS:

1. Adult trade hardcover fiction 47.50% 12,424 15.08$        187,353.92$        47.60% 15.05$           186,981.20$         47.00% 15.23$             189,217.52$         Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. Adult trade hardcover non-fiction 47.50% 6,171 13.94$        86,023.74$          47.60% 13.91$       85,838.61$           47.00% 14.07$        86,825.97$           Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

3. Adult trade paperback fiction 41.25% 1,856 9.94$          18,448.64$          42% 9.81$         18,207.36$           41.00% 9.98$          18,522.88$           Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

4. Adult trade paperback non-fiction 41.25% 5,049 12.61$        63,667.89$          42% 12.45$       62,860.05$           41.00% 12.67$        63,970.83$           Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

5. Adult mass market paperbacks 41.25% 1,500 5.12$          7,680.00$            42% 5.06$         7,590.00$             41.00% 5.14$          7,710.00$             Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

6. YA trade hardcover 47.50% 3,402 14.20$        48,308.40$          47.60% 14.17$       48,206.34$           47.00% 14.33$        48,750.66$           Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

7. YA trade paperback 41.25% 1,458 8.44$          12,305.52$          42% 8.33$         12,145.14$           41.00% 8.48$          12,363.84$           Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

8. Juvenile hardcover 47.50% 17,544 10.19$        178,773.36$        47.60% 10.17$       178,422.48$         47.00% 10.28$        180,352.32$         Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

9. Juvenile trade paperback 41.25% 3,096 7.04$          21,795.84$          42% 6.95$         21,517.20$           41.00% 7.07$          21,888.72$           Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

10. Juvenile mass market paperback 41.25% 1,500 4.26$          6,390.00$            42% 4.20$         6,300.00$             41.00% 4.28$          6,420.00$             Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

PRICING of SHELF READY 

SERVICES:

1. Physical processing 49,680 3.65$          181,332.00$   3.75$         186,300.00$    4.25$          211,140.00$    Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. Original cataloging 1,490 0 -$           -$                9.00$          13,410.00$      Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

3. Added copy cataloging 48,190 0 -$           -$                -$            -$                Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

4. Freight, shipping 54,000 0 -$           -$                -$            -$                Please see Discount sheet NO BID NO BID NO BID

GRAND TOTAL:

BIDS MAILED

BIDS RECEIVED:

16

4

(404) 329-4506

CONTACT:

Dietris Barnes

   1 of 1   

Daniel S. Sheehan

(513) 229-1529

CONTACT:

Karen Schmohe

VENDOR CODE

27500 Drake Road                                          

Farmington Hills, MI 48331

TELEPHONE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR NAME

CONTACT

VS0000001137

EBAC, INC

ADDRESS

2444 Miller Oaks Circle                                                         

Decautr, GA 30035

TELEPHONE

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR NAME

GALE CENAGE LEARNING

VS0000033843

CONTACT

ADDRESS

CONTACT:

TELEPHONE

ADDRESS

VS0000032808

INGRAM LIBRARY SERVICES, INC.

One Ingram Boulevard                                                               

La Vergne, TN 37086

VENDOR NAME

(800) 937-5300

NO-BIDS:      1 CONTACT: DATE COMPLETED:          09/11/2013

ADDRESS

2550 West Tyvola Road; Suite 300                                          

Charlotte, NC 28217

BAKER & TAYLOR, INC

BROD100088-A
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VENDOR CODE
VC0000100037

VENDOR NAME

TELEPHONE

(800) 775-7930 Ext:3212

BID TABULATION SHEET

PAGE NUMBER: BID NUMBER#:      13ITB88656YB-TR

BID DESCRIPTION:  

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT:                                                              ATLANTA-

FULTON PUBLIC LIBRARY SYSTEM            

CONTACT:

VENDOR CODE

OPENING DATE:   09/10/2013

BOOKS for ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS and JUVENILES

CONTACT

Jeffrey W. McDaniel
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 DATE RECEIVED:               09/11/2013NO RESPONSE:  11     

$812,079.31 $814,368.38 $860,572.74 NO BID

ADDRESS

BRODART COMPANY

CONTACT

500  Arch Steet                                              

Williamsport, PA 17701

TELEPHONE

(800) 233-8467

CONTACT:

Lisa Miosi

VENDOR NAME


