
OPENING DATE: 12/18/2008

QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL

HOT ASPHALTIC MIX PER TON

"B" Binder Course (19mm) 15,150 48.15$                      729,472.50$                       43.50$                  659,025.00$                           55.85$                          846,127.50$                                      57.95$               877,942.50$                    -$                   -$                              

"F" Surface Course, (9.5mm) 20,075 53.45$                      1,073,008.75$                    48.80$                  979,660.00$                           62.33$                          1,251,274.75$                                   61.95$               1,243,646.25$                 

"E" Surface Course (12.5mm) 25,075 49.95$                      1,252,496.25$                    47.00$                  1,178,525.00$                        56.76$                          1,423,257.00$                                   60.95$               1,528,321.25$                 

"G" Surface Course (4.75mm) 15,000 56.15$                      842,250.00$                       49.00$                  735,000.00$                           67.54$                          1,013,100.00$                                   63.95$               959,250.00$                    

"H" Surface Course 10,000 56.15$                      561,500.00$                       49.00$                  490,000.00$                           63.41$                          634,100.00$                                      64.95$               649,500.00$                    
Liquid Asphalt Cement, Grade 
AC20 4,100/gal NO BID -$                                    NO BID -$                                        NO BID -$                                                   5.00$                 20,500.00$                      

Liquid Asphalt Cement, Grade 
AC30 4,100/gal NO BID -$                                    NO BID -$                                        NO BID -$                                                   NO BID

Liquid Cut Back AC Emulsion 2,100/gal NO BID -$                                    NO BID -$                                        NO BID -$                                                   NO BID

Liquid Emulsion, Grade RC70 10,050/gal NO BID -$                                    NO BID -$                                        NO BID -$                                                   NO BID
Liquid Asphalt Emulsion, Grade 
SS1 4,075/gal NO BID -$                                    NO BID -$                                        NO BID -$                                                   NO BID

Liquid Asphalt Emulsion, Grade 
SS15 4,050/gal NO BID -$                                    NO BID -$                                        NO BID -$                                                   NO BID

Liquid Asphalt Emulsion, Grade 
RS-2 10,050/gal NO BID -$                                    NO BID -$                                        NO BID NO BID

-$                          -$                                    -$                      -$                                        

-$                          -$                                        -$                      -$                                        

-$                          -$                                        -$                      -$                                        

-$                          -$                                        -$                      -$                                        

-$                          -$                                        -$                      -$                                        

-$                          -$                                        -$                      -$                                        

GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED 75 ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT:CHARLIE CROCKETT
BIDS RECEIVED: 4

COMPLETED BY: SHARON ELLIS-KEELEY
NO-BIDS: 1 CHIEF ASSISTANT: CHERYL COCHRAN DATE COMPLETED: 12/18/2008

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

ADDRESS
1785 OAK ROAD                                       

P. O. BOX 306                                         
SNELLVILLE, GA 30078

CONTACT

VENDOR NAME
ER SNELL CONTRACTOR, INC.

VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE

THE LIONS GROUP, PAVING INC.C.W. MATTHEWS CONTRACTING CO.

1600 KENVIEW DRIVE                       
MARIETTA, GA 30060

ADDRESS
6075 LEE'S MILL RD.                                    

FOREST PARK, GA 30297

VENDOR CODE
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VENDOR CODE

VENDOR NAME

TELEPHONE
770-985-0600

ADDRESS

VENDOR NAME

BID TABULATION SHEET
1    of    1

CHARLIE CROCKETT

PAGE NUMBER: BID NUMBER# 09ITB64915A-CJC
BID DESCRIPTION:  HOT MIX - ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT:  PUBLIC WORKS

VENDOR NAME
METRO MATERIALS, INC.

CONTACT:

TELEPHONE

ADDRESS
2480 PLEASANTDALE RD.              

DORAVILLE, GA 30340

770-447-4578

TELEPHONE

N
O

N
 R

ESPO
N

SIVE VEN
D

O
R

S A
N

D
 

O
TH

ER
 IN

FO
R

M
A

TIO
N

VENDOR CODE

VENDOR NAME

ADDRESS

TELEPHONE
770-422-7520

TELEPHONE

404-763-3355

CONTACT:
CHRIS MCPHERSON

CONTACT:
MICHAEL KLEUCKLING

CONTACT:
MULUGETA ZELEKE

CONTACT:
DONALD B. STEWART, JR.

 DATE RECEIVED: 12/18/2008NO RESPONSE:
$3,054,977.50 $4,042,210.00 $4,321,731.75 $4,401,217.50 $0.00


