
 

CONTACT:

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR 
SERVICES DESIRED

UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT $ TOTAL UNIT $

1. Elliptical Cross-Trainer (95Xi) $3,445.00 $10,335.00 $3,299.00 $9,897.00 $3,795.00 $11,385.00 NO BID

2 Stari Climber (955si) $2,112.00 $4,224.00 $2,499.00 $4,998.00 $2,599.00 $5,198.00 NO BID

3. Upright Bike (95Ci) $1,723.00 $3,446.00 $1,799.00 $3,598.00 $2,599.00 $5,198.00 NO BID

4. Life Fitness Summit Trainer (95Li) $3,973.00 $7,946.00 $2,999.00 $5,998.00 $3,799.00 $7,598.00 NO BID

5. Pro2 Se Series Abdominal (PSABSE) $2,064.00 $2,064.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00 $2,599.00 $2,599.00 NO BID

6. Pro2 Se Series Biceps Curl (PSBCSE) $1,664.00 $1,664.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00 $2,499.00 $2,499.00 NO BID

7. Pro2 Se Series Back Extension (PSBESE) $2,264.00 $2,264.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 NO BID

8 Pro2 Se Series Chest Press (PSCPSE) $1,864.00 $1,864.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00 $2,599.00 $2,599.00 NO BID

9. Pro2 Se Series Assist Dip Chip (PSADCSE) $2,764.00 $2,764.00 $1,595.00 $1,595.00 $2,999.00 $2,999.00 NO BID

10. Pro2 Se Series Pectoral Fly/Rear Deltoid (PSFLYSE) $2,664.00 $2,664.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 NO BID

11. Pro2 Se Series Leg Extension (PLSESE) $1,817.00 $1,817.00 $1,899.00 $3,798.00 $2,899.00 $2,899.00 NO BID

12. Pro2 Se Series Lat Pull Down (PSPDSE) $1,797.00 $1,797.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00 $2,199.00 $2,199.00 NO BID

13. Pro2 Se Series Seated Row (PSRWSE) $1,930.00 $1,930.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 NO BID

14. Pro2 Se Series Seated Leg Curl (PSSLPSE) $1,864.00 $1,864.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00 $2,999.00 $2,999.00 NO BID

15. Pro2 Se Series Seated Leg Press ()SSLPSE) $2,964.00 $2,964.00 $1,999.00 $1,999.00 $4,299.00 $4,299.00 NO BID

16. Pro2 Se Series Shoulder Press ()SSPSE) $1,864.00 $1,864.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00 $2,599.00 $2,599.00 NO BID

17. Pro2 Se Series Triceps Extension (PSTESE) $2,130.00 $2,130.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00 $2,499.00 $2,499.00 NO BID

18. Life Fitness Fit Series Hip Adduction/Hip Abduction ( $2,130.00 $2,130.00 $1,999.00 $1,999.00 $2,099.00 $2,099.00 NO BID

19. Life Fitness Power Rack: (CSPR) $1,215.00 $1,215.00 $895.00 $895.00 $950.00 $950.00 $657.77 $657.77

20. Life Fitness club Series Adjustable Utility Bench (CS $482.00 $482.00 $285.00 $285.00 $399.00 $399.00 NO BID

GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED  ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:
BIDS RECEIVED:  DATE COMPLETE

DATE:

1.VENDOR NAME
Fitco Fitness Georgia LLC

VENDOR CODE

2. VENDOR NAME
ProMaxima Manufacturing, LTD

P. O. BOX 71655

Marietta, GA 3007

5310 Ashbrook

ADDRESS:

Houston, TX 77081

ADDRESS:

1425 Oakbrook Pkwy #100
Norcross, GA 30093

4. VENDOR NAME
Flaghouse, Incorporated

VENDOR CODE

ADDRESS:

Fitness Resource, Inc.
VENDOR CODE

3. VENDOR NAME

ADDRESS:

PC #: 

BID NUMBER:  07ITB56737A CJC
BID DESCRIPTION: FITNESS WORKOUT 
DEPARTMENT: PARKS & RECREATION     

BID TABULATION SHEET
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NON RESPONSIVE 
VENDORS AND OTHER 

INFORMATION

5. VENDOR NAME

VENDOR CODE

ADDRESS:

VENDOR CODE

NO RESPONSE:
CHIEF ASSISTANT:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

NO-BIDS:

     

601 Flaghouse Drive
Hasbrouck Heights, NJ 07604

CONTACT: 

TELEPHONE:TELEPHONE: (770) 304-3494
 

TELEPHONE:  (800) 231-6652
 

TELEPHONE: 678-277-2650
 

TELEPHONE: 800-793-7900

CONTACT:  Kimber Vietti CONTACT:  Andrew StrausCONTACT: CONTACT: 



 

CONTACT:

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR 
SERVICES DESIRED

UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

21 Life Fitness Club Series Hexagon Dumbbell Rack (CS $514.00 $1,028.00 $195.00 $390.00 $349.00 $698.00 $122.36 $244.72

22 Life Fitness Club Series Flat Utility Bench: (CSFB) $224.00 $224.00 $85.00 $85.00 $219.00 $219.00 $82.43 $82.43

23 Life Fitness Club Series Olympic Flat Bench (CSOFB $514.00 $514.00 $325.00 $325.00 $399.00 $399.00 NO BID

24 Life Fitness Club Series Olympic Incline Bench (CS)I $608.00 $608.00 $325.00 $325.00 $499.00 $499.00 NO BID

25 Life Fitness Club Series Olympic Plate Tree (CSPT) $224.00 $672.00 $110.00 $330.00 $199.00 $199.00 $67.71 $203.13

26
Hampton Pro-Style Dumbbells W/ Contoured 
Handles (5-50 lbs) 10 Pairs $550.00 $550.00 $665.36 $665.36 $825.00 $825.00 NO BID

27
Hampton Pro-Style Dumbbells W/ Contoured 
Handles (55-100 lbs) 10 Pairs $1,550.00 $1,550.00 $1,875.12 $1,875.12 $1,495.00 $1,495.00 NO BID

28 Life Fitness Signature Abdominal Bench (LISABC) $773.00 $773.00 $895.00 $895.00 $1,099.00 $1,099.00 NO BID

TOTAL PRICE  $63,347.00 $58,942.48 $74,547.00 $1,192.05

DELIVERY FEE  $6,150.00 $7,195.00 INCLUDED

GRAND TOTAL  $69,497.00 $64,177.48 $81,742.00 $1,192.05

 

        
 

  
 

 

  

  

   

   

   

GRAND TOTAL:
BIDS MAILED  ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DATE RECIEVED:
BIDS RECEIVED:  DATE COMPLETE

DATE:

SEE ALTERNATE LEGEND

Freight=$3,450; Install=$1,785 - Total 
$5,235

DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

NO RESPONSE:  
NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT:

CONTACT: 

     

CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:  Kimber Vietti CONTACT: 

TELEPHONE:
   

TELEPHONE: (770) 304-3494 TELEPHONE:  (800) 231-6652 TELEPHONE: 678-277-2650 TELEPHONE: 800-793-7900

Marietta, GA 3007
Houston, TX 77081 Norcross, GA 30093 Hasbrouck Heights, NJ 07604

P. O. BOX 71655 5310 Ashbrook 1425 Oakbrook Pkwy #100 601 Flaghouse Drive

VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE

ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS: ADDRESS:

5. VENDOR NAME

NON RESPONSIVE 
VENDORS AND OTHER 

INFORMATION

Fitco Fitness Georgia LLC ProMaxima Manufacturing, LTD Fitness Resource, Inc. Flaghouse, Incorporated
VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE VENDOR CODE

1.VENDOR NAME 2. VENDOR NAME 3. VENDOR NAME 4. VENDOR NAME

BID DESCRIPTION:  

DEPARTMENT:      PC #:

BID TABULATION SHEET
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