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DEVELOPMENT AND PUBLIC SAFETY AGENCY
INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

TO: Jerome Noble, Director
Purchasing Department

FROM:  Alfféd R. Moore, Director
Emergency Services Department

DATE: February 20, 2008

SUBJECT: Quote No. 08DMS59937YC
Telephone Headsets/Replacement

Reference is made
Headsets/Replacement.

to Quote No. 08DM59937YC for the year 2008 Telephone
A review of the bid responses by staff resulted in the following

recommendation: Lexair Electronics, 4807B Koger Blvd. Greensboro, NC 27407, the overall
lowest responsive and responsible bidder, be awarded the contract for Telephone

Headsets/Replacement for the year 2008.
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To: 4048931738
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From:

(40489360%88)

Fulton County Public Bid Opening
O0DM59937YC - Telephone Headsets / Replacement

Page: 1

Bid: REQ 02/07/2008 _
AT COTY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group - Code Pescription Cid Amont |

Vendor ©

1 Default Commodity Group

1. Hourly Labor Rate per manhole

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

. Universal Modular Adapter M12 — New

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Plug Prong Adapter P10 — New
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.

Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Ine.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

. Universal Modular Adapter M12 - Repair

$ 0.00
$42.00
§ 0.00
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

$ 63.60
$64.20
$66.30
$69.00
$79.00
$69.00
$95.00

$44.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
$54.00
no bid
no bid

$58.30
$58.85
560.77
$63.25
$69.00
563.00
$93.00
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From:

(40489360%88)

#

Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: )
Bid: RFQ
SN COMNTY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
i Description
Commodity GroupL Nam:k:ﬂ:le p ‘ 14 Amount

Vendo

1 Default ComBodPiugGPPRg Adapter P10 - Repair

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solution, Inc.

Encore Polaris Headset P91-UI0P — New
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.

Liberty Communications, Inc.

Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc
Synergy Telcom, Inc
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

. Encore Polaris Headset P91-U10P — Repair

Encore Polaris Headset POIN — U10P — New

Lexair Electromics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

$44.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
$49.00
no bid
no bid

§75.79
§76.50
$79.01
$82.25
$93.00
$81.99
$95.00

$43.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
$54.00
no bid
no bid

$91.75
$92.02
$95.03
$98.90
$109.00
$98.00
$109.00
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To: 4048931738 From:
04/02/08 02:12 PM Page 4 of 15

(40489360%88)

Fulton County Public Bid Opening

Page E

Bid: RFQ
RS LY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commadity Group Code Description ’
vendor C L. Namg : Bid Amount

10.

L.

12.

1 Default ComBodiiiGF¢Wlaris Headset POIN-U10P — Repair

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc,
Synergy Telcom, inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Encore Polaris Headset P101-U10P - New
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc,.

Liberty Communications, Inc.

Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Encore Polaris Headset P101-U10P — Repair
Lexair Electroncis

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.

Liberty Communications, Inc.

Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Encore Polaris Headset PIOIN-UTOP — New
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.

Liberty Communications, Inc.

Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

$43.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
$65.00
no bid
no bid

$92.75
$93.62
$96.69
$101.65
$112.00
$99.00
$140.00

$43.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
$75.00
no bid
no bid

$101.76
$102.72
$106.08
$110.40
$121.00
$109.00
$150.00
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(40489360%88)

e '
Fulton County Public Bid Opening Paf;&%
Bid: RFQ
T Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
: Code Description .
Cor:;::d;t}’csgc’up Leqal Na , Bid Amount
1 Dpefault Commodity Group

13. Encore Polaris Headset PI0IN-U10P — Repair
Lexair Electronics $43.00
Call One $42.00
Headset Experts $45.00
Phone Supplements, Inc. $49.00
Liberty Communications, Inc $75.00
Synergy Telcom, Inc. no bid
Telecom Solutions, Inc. no bid

14. Supra Plus Headset H251 — New
Lexair Electronics $44.87
Call One $42.26
Headset Experts $43.65
Phone Supplements, Inc $45.45
Liberty Communications, Inc. $58.00
Synergy Telcom, Inc. $45.00
Telecom Solutions, Inc. $65.00

15. Supra Plus Headset H251 — Repair
Lexair Electronics $36.00
Call One $42.00
Headset Experts $35.00
Phone Supplements, Inc. $39.00
Liberty Communications, Inc. $39.00
Synergy Telcorn, Inc. no bid
Telecom Solutions, Inc. no bid

16. Supra Plus Headset H251N — New
Lexair Electronics $56.40
Call One $53.50
Headset Experts $55.25
Phone Supplements, Inc. $57.50
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* Bid: RFQ

From:

(40489360%88)

Fulton County Public Bid Opening

Page: 6

Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
i iption
Commodity Group Code Descrip L4 smount
Vendo L Nam i

1 Default Commodif¥.HXPERmmunications, Inc.

17.

Synergy Telcom. Inc.
Telecom Solations, Inc.

Supra Plus Headset H251N — Repair

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications
Synergy Telcom, Inc
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

18. Supra Plus Headset H351N — New

19.

20,

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Supra Plus Headset H351N — Repair

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Starset Polaris Headset P31-U10P — New

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.

$69.60
$57.20
$72.00

$36.00
$42.00
$35.00
$39.00
$45.00
no bid
no bid

$59.09
$57.24
$59.12
$61.55
$74.00
$61.25
£85.00

$36.00
$42.00
$45.00
$39.00
$54.00
no bid
no bid

$67.31
$67.94
$70.17
$73.05
$84.00
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From:
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Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page:(g—?
Bid: RFQ
OGS COmNTY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
i iption
Commodity Group Code Degcrip -
Vendor C 1 Name : Bid Amoun

21.

22,

23.

24,

1 Default Commodity Group

Synergy Telcom
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Starset Polaris Headset P31-U10P — Repair

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Tristar Polaris Headset P81-UL10P - New

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Tristar Polaris Headset P81-U10P — Repair

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inec.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Tristar Polaris Headset — PRIN-L10P — New

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

£72.65
$100.00

$36.00
$42.00
$35.00
$39.00
$59.00
no bid
no bid

$71.50
$83.83
$83.98
$87.40
$96.00
$86.99
$121.00

$43.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
$59.00
no bid
no hid

$91.71

$97.37

$100.55
$104.65
$118.00
$104.00
$100.00
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From:

(40489360%88)

Fulton County Public Bid Opening

pPage: f’{

Bid: RFQ
FON COmTY Close Date/Time: 14:60:00
Commodity Group Code Description Wy .

ven Code 1. 1l Na
25. Tristar Polaris Headset — PSIN-UI10P — Repair

1 Default Commodis¥af*RWfctronics

26.

27.

28.

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Mirage Polaris Headset P41-UI0P — New
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.

Liberty Communications, Inc.

Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Mirage Polaris Headset P41-U10P — Repair
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.

Liberty Communications, Inc.

Syenrgy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Encore Headset Family H?1 — New
Lexarr Blectronics

Call One _

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc

Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

$43.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
£69.00
no bid
no bid

$67.31
$67.94
$70.17
$73.05
$84.00
$72.65
$85.00

$36.00
$42.00
$35.00
$39.00
$59.00
no bid
no bid

$56.71
$57.24
$59.12
$61.50
$74.00
$61.25
$85.00
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To: 4048931738 From:
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Bid: RFQ
SR LOMTY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00

(40489360%88)

Fulton County Public Bid Opening

page: g/

Commodity Group Code Description

Bid Amount _ .J

yendor Code  Legal Namg

1 Default Commodity Group
29. Encore Headset Family H91 — Repair
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

30. Encore Headset Family H91N — New
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

31. Encore Headset Family H91N — Repair
Lexair Electronics
Calll One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

32. Encore Headset Family H101 — New
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

$43.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
$49.00
no bid
no bid

$67.84
$68.48
$70.72
$73.60
$85.00
§73.25
$105.00

$43.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
$49.00
no bid
no bid

$69.43
$70.08
$72.38
$73.35
$84.00
$74.99
$103.00
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To: 4048931738 From:
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(40489360%88)

: Fulton County Public Bid Opening
* Bid: RFQ

Page: q

AT CONTY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
. Code Description
Commodity Group od P _ Bid Amount _
vendor Code Legal Name

1 Default ComggditicfiPPPeadset Family H101- Repair
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

34. Encore Headset Family H10IN — New
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, [nc.
Liberty Communications, Inc
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

35. Encore Headset Family H10IN — Repair
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc

36. Supra Headset Family H51 — New
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc,

$43.00
$42.00
$45.00
$46.00
$49.00
no bid
no bid

$78.44
$79.18
$81.77
£85.10
$94.00
$84.66
$120.00

$43.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
$59.00
no bid
no bid

$46.11
$46.54
$48.07
$49.45
$58.00
$49.99
$70.00

Opt-Out: »
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To: 4048931738
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(40489360%88)

Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: {¢)
Bid: RFQ
T SONY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code Descnpt@n i .

vender Cod

eqal Nam

1 Default ComBPdSHHSF M8adset Family H51 - Repair

38.

39.

40.

Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Soluations, Inc.

Supra Headset Family H5IN — New
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.

Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Supra Headset Family H5IN - Repair
Lexair Electronics

Call one

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.

Liberty Communications, Inc

Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Supra Headset Family H61 — New
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.

Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

$36.00
$42.00
$38.00
$39.00
$39.00
no bid
no bid

$58.30
$58.85
$60.77
$63.25
$68.00
$62.99
$80.00

$36.00
$42.00
$38.00
$39.00
$44.00
no bid
no bid

$60.42
$60.99
$62.98
$65.55
$75.00
$65.25
$80.00

Opt-Out: %
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To: 4048931738 From:
04/02/08 02:15 PM Page 12 of 15

(40489360%88)

Fulton County Public Bid Opening page: (i
Bid: RFQ
T Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code Descrlptlén b4 Amoun

| vendor Code Legal Name

1 Default CongpddtipGF Pifadset Family H61 — Repair
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, inc.

42. Supra Headset Family H6IN — New
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
[iberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

43. Supra Headset Family H6IN — Repair
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

44. Starset Headset Family H31 — New
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Selutions, Inc.

$36.00
$42.00
$35.00
$39.00
$49.00
no bid
no bid

$569.96
$70.62
$72.93
$75.90
$86.00
$75.50
§100.00

$36.00
$42.00
$38.00
$39.00
$49.00
no bid
no bid

$54.47
$52.96
$54.70
$56.95
$69.00
$36.65
$78.00

Opt-ut: »
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To: 40488931738 From: (4042936588
04/02/08 02:15 PM Page 13 of 15
Fulton County Public Bid Opening page: [~
8id: RFQ
AR oY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity G:O“PL Na Code Description Bid Amount _

Vendo

46.

47.

48,

1 pefault Commodity Group
45,

Starset Headset Family H31 — Repair
Ledxair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc

Liberty Communications, Inc.

Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Selutions, Inc.

Starset Headset Family H31N — New
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc

Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Starset Headset Family H31N — Repair
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.

Liberty Communications, Inc.

Synergy Telcom, Inc,

Telecom Solutions, Inc.

Tristar Headset Family H81 — New
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.

Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.

Telecom Solutions, Inc

$36.00
$42.00
$£35.00
$39.00
$49.00
no bid
no bid

$63.60
$64.20
$66.30
$69.00
$84.00
$68.99
$97.00

$36.00
£42.00
$35.00
$39.00
$59.00
no bid
no bid

$58.83
$63.13
$65.19
$67.85
$78.00
$67.50
$95.00

Opt-Qut: *
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Page 14 of 15

From:

Fulton County Public Bid Opening

(40489360%88)

Bid: RFQ
A CONETY close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Coromodity Group Code Description s Amnt
vendor Code al Nam ‘ i

1 pefault Commodity Group

49. Tristar Headset Family H81 — Repair
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

50. Tristar Headset Family H81N - New
Lexair Electronics

Call One

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

51. Tristar Headset Family H81N — Repair
Lexair Electronics

Call one

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

52. Mirage Headset Family H41 — New
Lexair Electronics

Call one

Headset Experts

Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

$43.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
$49.00
no bid
no bid

$67.84
$72.76
$75.14
$£78.20
$88.00
$77.99
$100.00

$43.00
$42.00
$45.00
$49.00
$59.00
no bid
no bid

$48.23
$48.68
§50.28
$52.35
$69.00
§52.00
$80.00

Opt-Out:

Opt-Out:
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04/02/08 02:168 PM Page 15 of 15

From:

(40489360%88)

. »
Fulton County Public Bid Opening page: {4
Bid: RFQ
SUTON CODNTY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code pescription b o
Vendor Cod al Name .

1 pefault Commodity Group

53. Mirage Headset Family H41 — Repair
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

54. Cable Ass. Midi, Amp 40702-01 — New
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

55, Cable Ass. Midi, Amp 40702-01 - Repair
Lexair Electronics
Call One
Headset Experts
Phone Supplements, Inc.
Liberty Communications, Inc.
Synergy Telcom, Inc.
Telecom Solutions, Inc.

$36.00
$42.00
$35.00
$39.00
$49.00
no bid
no bid

$10.60
$ 8.20
$11.95
$ 9.00
$14.00
$ 8.99
$18.00

no hid
no bid
no bid
no bid
$12.00
no bid
no bid
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