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Fulton County Public Bid Openin Page: 1
t 08‘6\/1 2772C — Meter EFeaders gﬂiforms aqe

M6277
Bid: RFQ
Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code Dascription
Vendor Code leqal Name Bid Amount

I Defaultr Commodity Group

1. Jacket, Hartwell, 2105a-435, XXL , Qty-1 Unit price  Total price
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $36.25/¢ca $36.25
Optima Uniforms $38.75/ea $38.75
Safety & Security International, LLC $33.09/ea $33.09
Image Wear Uniforms $33.75

2. Jacket, Hartwell, 2105a-435, XXL, Qty - 6
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $37.50/ea $225.00
Optima Uniforms $38.75/¢a $232.50
Safety & Security International, LLC $34.29/¢ca $205.74
Image Wear Uniforms $202.50

Police Rainwear Jacket & Pant Set, Neese, 475AJ & 475PT, L, Qty-1

(ad

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $54.95/ea $54.95
Optima Uniforms $45.00/ea $45.00
Safety & Security International, LLC $56.26/ea $56.26
Image Wear Uniforms $55.75

4. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RDN, 32x32, Qty-2

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ea $40.50
Optima Uniforms $19.25/ea $38.50
Satety & Security International, LL.C $16.37/ea $32.74
Image Wear Uniforms $41.60
s
pt-ouk: »

Opt-Out: Not Defined
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To: 4vaaaal (30 From:
R 06/29/97 @2:17 Pt Pogs 1 of 1
Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
: Bid: REFQ
RS SNNY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Coomodity Group Code Description
N ‘
—.8id Amount
1 Defaulr CommodieyoGddupis, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RDN, 33 x32, Qty - 2
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ea $40.50
Optima Uniforms $19.25/ea $38.50
Safety & Security International, LLC $16.37/ea 832,74
Image Wear Uniforms $41.60

6. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-2 14RDN, 34x34, Qty - 4

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ea $81.00
Optima Uniforms $19.25/ea $77.00
Safety & Security International, LLC $16.37/ea $65.48
Image Wear Uniforms $83.20

7. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RDN, 38x32, Qty - 2

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc §20.25/ea $40.50
Optima Uniforms $19.25/ea $38.50
Safety & Security International, LLC $16.37/ea $32.74
Image Wear Uniforms $41.60

8. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RDN, 38x36, Qty - 3

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ea $60.75
Optima Unifomrs $19.25/ea $57.75 .~
Safety & Security International, LLC no bid no bid
Image Wear Uniforms $62.40

9. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-2 I4RDN, 40x32, Qty - 5

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.257%a $101.25
Optima Uniforms 519.25/¢ca $ 96.25
Safety & Security International, LLC $16.37/ea $81.85
Image Wear Uniforms $104.00
Opt-Out: »

Opt-Out: Not Defined
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Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
. ‘Bid: RFQ
NS COY Close Date/Tima: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code Description
Na —2id Amount
1 Default Commodity Group

10. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RDN, 40x34, Qty- 1
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ea $20.25
Optima Uniforms $19.25/ea $19.25 .~
Safety & Security, International LLC no bid no bid
Image Wear Uniforms $20.80

11. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RDN, 44x32, Qty - 2
Red the Uniform Tatlor, Inc §22.25/ea $44.50
Optima Uniforms $21.25/ea $42.50
Safety & Security International, LLC $17.98/ea $35.96
Image Wear Uniforms $46.50

12. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RKH, 32x32, Qty - 2
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ca $40.50
Optima Uniforms $19.25/¢a $38.50
Safety & Security International, LLC $16.37/ea $32.74
Image Wear Uniforms $41.60

13. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RKH, 33x30, Qty - 4
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ea $81.00
Optima Uniforms $19.25/¢a 877.00
Safety & Security International, LL.C $16.37/ca $65.48
Image Wear Uniforms $83.20

Opt-Out: =

Opt-Out: Not Defined
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Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
Bid: RFQ
A LY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commmodity Group Code Description
Y N :
Bid Amount

1 Qefault Commodity Group

14. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RKH, 33x32, Qty - 2

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ca $40.30
Optima Uniforms $19.25/ca $38.50
Safety & Security International, LLC $16.37/ca $32.74
Image Wear Uniforms $41.60

15. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RKH, 34x34< Qty - 4

Red the Uniform Tatlor, Inc $20.25/ea $81.00
Optima Uniforms $19.25 $77.00
Safety & Security International, LLC $16.37/ea $65.48
Image Wear Uniforms $83.20

16. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RKH, 36x32, Qty -3

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $£20.25/ea $60.75
Optima Uniforms $19.25/ea §57.75
Safety & Security Intemational, LLC $16.37/ea $49.11
Image Wear Uniforms $62.40

17. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RKH, 38x32, Qty -2

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ea $40.50
Optima Uniforms $19.25/ea $38.50
Safety & Security International, LLC $16.37/¢ca $32.74
Image Wear Uniforms $41.60
pt-Out: » §

Opt-Out: Not Defined
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_ Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
Bid: RFQ
Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Cods Description
N _ .
.Bid Amount
1 Default Comk8da{iysorBapts, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RKH, 38x36, Qty - 3
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ca $60.75
Optima Uniforms $19.25/¢a $57.75v7
Safety & Secunity International, LLC no bid no bid
Image Wear Uniforms 562.40
19. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RKH, 40x32, Qty - 2
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ea £40.50
Optima Uniforms $19.25/ea £38.50
Safety & Security Intemational, LLC $16.37/ea $32.74
Image Wear Uniforms $41.60
20. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RKH, 42x32, Qty - 1
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.25/ea $20.25
Optima Uniforms $19.25/ea $19.25
Safety & Security Intermational, LLC $1637/ca §16.37
Image Wear Uniforms §20.80
21. Cargo Pants, Dickies Work Wear, 23-214RKH, 44x32, Qty - 2
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $22.25/ea $44.50
Optima Uniforms $21.25/ea $42.50
Safety & Security International, LLC $17.98/¢ca $35.96
Image Wear Uniforms $46.50
22. Tactical / Training Trouser, Tact Gear, T7510K, 40x34, Qty - 3
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $31.10/ea $93.30
Optima Uniforms $29.00/ea $87.00
Safety & Security International, LLI.C $25.18/ea $75.54
$88.83

Image Wear Uniforms

Opt-Out: #

Opt-Out: Not Defined
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24.

]

From: (4B42740471) /10746 0l:94 Pl

. Police BDU, Trouser, TRU-SPEC, 1979, 33x30, Qty - 2

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $24.85/ea
Optima Uniforms $28.25/¢ca
Safety & Security International, LLC $19.64/ea

Image Wear Uniforms

Police BDU-Trouser, TRU-SPEC, 1979, 34x30, Qty - 8

Red the Uniform Tatlor, Inc $24.85/ea
Optima Uniforms $28.25/ea
Safety & Security International, LLC $19.64/ca

Image Wear Uniforms

. Police BDU-Trouser, TRU-SPEC, 1979, 34x34, Qty - 2

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $24.85/ea
Optima Uniforms $28.25/ea
Safety & Security International, LLC $19.64/ea

Image Wear Uniforms

. Police BDU-Trouser, TRU-SPEC, 1979, 36x32,Qty - 6

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $24.85/ea
Optima Uniforms $28.25/ea
Safety & Security International, LLC $190.64/ea

Image Wear Uniforms

Opt-Out: Not Defined

$49.70
$56.50
$39.28
$51.50

$5198.80
$226.00
$157.12
$206.00

$49.70
£56.50
$36.28
$51.50

$149.10
$169.50
$117.84
$154.50
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_ Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
Bid: REQ
AONGEY | Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code Description
N : Bid Amount

1 Dpefault Commodity Group
27. Police BDU-Trouser, TRU-SPEC, 1979, 38x32, Qty - 6

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $24.85/¢a $149.10
Optima Uniforms $28.25/ea $169.50
Safety & Security International, LLC $19.64/ea $117.84
Image Wear Uniforms $154.50

28. Police BDU-Trouser, TRU-SPEC, 1979, 38x36, Qty - 3

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $24.85/¢a $74.55
Optima Uniforms §28.25/ea $84.75
Safety & Security International, LLC $19.64/ea $58.92
Image Wear Uniforms 8§77.25

29. Police BDU-Trouser, TRU-SPEC, 1979, 40x32, Qty - 4

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $24.85/¢a $ 9940
Optima Uniforms $28.25/ea $113.00
Safety & Security International, LLC $19.64/ea 8 78.56
Image Wear Uniforms $103.00

30. Police BDU- Trouser, TRUSPEC, 1979, 40x34, Qty - 2

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $24.85/ea $49.70
Optima Uniforms $28.25/¢a $56.50
Safety & Security International, LLC $19.64/ea $36.28
Iimage Wear Uniforms $51.50

31. Police BDU — Trouser, TRU-SPEC, 1979, 42x32, Qty -4

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $24.85/ea $99.40
Optima Uniforms $28.25/¢a $113.00
Safety & Security International, [.1.C $19.64/ca $ 78.56
Image Wear Uniforms $103.00
i
pt-0ut: »

Opt-Out: Not Defined
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Fulton County Public Bid Opening page: 1
Bid: RFQ
T Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code Description
> Bid Amoynt

1 Default Commodity Group

32. Police BDU- Trouser, TRU-SPEC, 1979, 44x32, Qty -2

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $27.05/ea $54.10
Optima Uniforms $28.35/ea $56.70
Safety & Security International, LLC §21.43/ea $42.86
Image Wear Uniforms $54.50

33. Shirts, Jerzees, J300 Adult, L, Qty - 3

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $18.85/ea $56.55
Optima Uniforms $11.25/ea $33.75
Safety & Security International, LLC $ 8.18/ea $24.54
Image Wear Uniforms $24.18

34, Shirts, Jerzees, J300 Adult, XL, Qty - 3

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $18.85/ea $£56.55
Optima Uniforms §$11.25/ca $33.75
Safety & Security [nternational, LLC $ 8.18/ea $24.54
Image Wear Uniforms $24.18

35. Sharts, Jerzees, J300 Adult, XXL, Qty - 8

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $10.85/¢ca $158.80
Optima Uniforms $12.95/ea $103.60
Safety & Security International, LL.C 510.07/ea § 80.56
Image Wear Uniforms $ 77.20

36. 300 Adult, XXXL, Qty - 11

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.85/ea $229.35
Optima Uniforms $13.25/ca S145.75
Safety & Security International, LLC $10.07/ea §110.77
Image Wear Uniforms $106.15
pt-0nt: * E

Opt-Out: Not Defined
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e

_ Fulton County Public Bid Opening page: 1
Bid: RFQ
T | Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code Description
Vendox Code Legal Name __Bid Amount |

1 Defaulr Commodity Group

37. Shirts, Jerzees, J300 Adult, L, Qty - 1

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $18.85/¢ea $18.85
Optima Uniforms $11.25/ca $11.25
Safety & Security International, LLC S 8.57¢a $ 8.57
Image Wear Uniforms § 8.06

38. Shirts, Jerzees, J300 Adult, XL, Qty- 6

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $18.85/ea $113.10
Optima Uniforms $t1.25/ea $ 67.50
Safety & Security International, LLC S 8.57/ea $ 51.42
Image Wear Uniforms $ 48.36

39. Shirts, Jerzees, J300 Adult, XXL, Qty - 11

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $19.85/ea $218.35
Optima Uniforms $12.95/ea $142.45
Safety & Security International, LLC $10.57/ea §116.27
Image Wear Uniforms $106.15

40. Shirts, Jerzees, J300 Aduit, XXXL, Qty - 10

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $20.85/¢a $208.50
Optima Uniforms $13.25/ea $132.50
Safety & Security Intemational, LLC $10.57/ca $105.70
Image Wear Uniforms S 96.50

4]. Shirts, Jerzees, J300 Adult, XXXXXL, Qty -5

Red the Uniform Tailor, In¢ $23.85/ea $119.25
Optima Uniforms $25.00/ea $125.00
Safety & Security International, LLC $10.57/%a $52.85
Image Wear Uniforms $48.25
1
i
Opt-0ut: #

Opt-Out: Not Defined
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Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
Bid: RFQ
FOENS 2OY Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code Description
e} N .
Bid Amount |
1 Default Commodity Group

42. Shirts, Jerzees, J300 Adult, L, Qty - 1
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $10.15/ea $10.15
Optima Uniforms $ 8.65/ea $8.65
Safety & Security International, LLC $7.39/a $7.39
Image Wear Uniforms §7.25

43. Shirts, Jerzees, J28LS Adult, XL, Qty -2
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $10.15/ea $20.30
Optima Uniforms $ 8.65/ea $17.30
Safety & Security International, LLC $7.3%ea $14.78
Image Wear Uniforms $14.50

44. Shirts, Jerzees, J29LS Adult, XX1., Qty - 6
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $12.15/ea $72.90
Optima Uniforms $10.65/ea $63.90
Safety & Security International, LLC $9.12/ca $54.72
Image Wear Uniforms $52.50

45. Shirts, Jerzees J29LS Adult, XXXL, Qty - 12
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $12.15/ea $145.80
Optima Uniforms S11.65/¢ca §139.80
Safety & Security International, LL.C § 9.12/a $109.44
Image Wear Uniforms $105.00

46. Shirts, Jerzees, J29LS Adult, XXXXXL, Qty - 5
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $15.15/¢ca $75.75
Optima Uniforms $17.75/ea $88.75
Safety & Security International, LLC nobid

$43.75 7

Image Wear Uniforms

pt-0ut: »

Opt-Out: Not Defined




lo: 4845931 (56 From: (4vaz/du4(1) wi/10/46 Bl :30 Pil Fage 1Z of 1/
LW BT Pogs | oF |

Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
Bid: RFQ
R Y Closes Date/Time: 14:00:00
Camydity Group Code Description
Na . .
Bid Amount

1 Default Commodity Group
47, Shirts, Jerzees, J29LS, Adult, L, Qty - 1

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $10.15/ea $10.15
Optima Uniforms $ 8.65/ca $ B.65
Safety & Security International LLC $ 6.99¢a $ 6.99
Image Wear Uniforms $ 7.25

48. Shirts, Jerzees, J29LS Adult, XL, Qty - 3

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc £10.15/ea $30.45
Optima Uniforms $ 8.65/ea §25.95
Safety & Security International LLC $ 6.99/a $20.97
Image Wear Uniforms $21.75

49. Shirts . Jerzees, J29LS Adult, XXL, Qty - 7

Red the uniform Tailor, Inc $12.15/ea $85.05
Optima Uniforms $10.65/ea $74.55
Safety & Security International LLC $ 8.4%9/ea $59.43
Image Wear Uniforms $61.25

50. Shirts, Jerzees J29LS, Adult, XXXL, Qty - 10

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $12.15/ea $121.50
Optima Uniforms S$11.65/¢ea $116.50
Safety & Security International LLC $ 8.49ea S 84.90
Image Wear Uniforms $ 87.50

51. Shirts, Gildan. 3800 Adult, L, Qty - 3

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $15.35/ea $46.05
Optima Uniforms $14.00/ea $42.00
Safety & Security International LLC $10.51/ea $31.53
Image Wear Uniforms $31.56
Opt-Ot: » !

Opt-Out: Not Defined



To: 4vaaaal (30

52.

53.

54.

55.

56.

From: (4B42740471)

Shirts, Gildan, 3800 Adult, XL, Qty - 2

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc

Optima Uniforms

Safety & Security International LLC
Image Wear Uniforms

Shirts, Gildan, 3800 Adult, XXL, Qty -3

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc

Optima Uniforms

Safety & Security International LLC
Image Wear Uniforms

Shirts, Gildan 3800 Adult, XXXL, Qty - 5

Red the Uniform Tatlor, Inc

Optima Uniforms

Safety & Security International LLC
Image Wear Uniforms

Shirts, Gildan, 3800 Adult, XXXXL, Qty - 1

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc

Optima Uniforms

Safety & Security International LLC
[mage Wear Uniforms

Shirts, Gildan, 3800 Adult, L, Qty - 1

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc
Optima Uniforms

Safety & Security Uniforms
Image Wear Uniforms

Opt-Out: Not Defined

/10746 0l 50 P

$15.35/ea
$14.00/ea
$10.51/ea

$18.60/ea
$17.00/ea
§13.3%7/ea

518.60/ea
$17.50/ea
$13.37/ea

$21.90/ea
$19.95/ea
$i8.74/ea

$15.35/ea
$14.00/ca
$10.85/ea

$30.70
$28.00
$21.02
521.04

$55.80
$51.00
$40.11
$37.05

$93.00
$87.50
$66.85
$61.75

$21.90
$19.95
$18.74
$§12.35

$15.35
$14.00
$10.85
$10.52

rFage 13 oF 17
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Fulton County Public Bid Opening Page: 1
Bid: RFQ
_ Closa Date/Time: 14:00:00
Commodity Group Code Description
Na Bid Amount

1 Dpefault Commodity Group
57. Shirts Gildan, 3800 Adult, XL, Qty - 3

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc S15.35/ea $76.75
Optima Uniforms $14.00/ea $70.00
Safety & Security Uniforms $10.85/ea $54.25
Image Wear Uniforms $52.60

58. Shirts, Gildan, 3800 Adult, XXL, Qty - 4

Red the Uniform Tatlor, Inc £18.50/ea $111.00
Optima Uniforms $§17.00/ca $102.00
Safety & Security International LLC $13.93/ca $ B3.58
Image Wear Uniforms § 74.10

59. Shirts, Gildan, 3800 Adult, XXXL, Qty - 5

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $18.50/¢ca $92.50
Optima Uniforms $17.50/ea $87.50
Safety & Security International LLC $13.93/ea £69.65
Image Wear Uniforms $£61.75

60. Shirts, Gildan 3800 Aduit, XXXXL, Qty - 1

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $21.50/ea $21.50
Optima Uniforms $19.95/ea $19.95
Safety & Security International LLC $18.74/ea $18.74
Image Wear Uniforms $12.35

61. Sweatshirts . Jerzees, J4662-M, XL, Qty - 4

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $13.35/ea §53.40
Optima Uniforms $15.00/ca $60.00
Safety & Security International LLC §10.26/ea $41.04
Image Wear Uniforms $41.72
x
Ipt-ut: »

Opt-Out: Not Defined
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Fulton County Public Bid Opening page: 1
Bid: RFQ
AESOENY | Close Date/Time: 14:00:00
Cammcdity Group Cods Description
Y Bid Amount
1 Defaulr Commodity Group

62. Sweatshirts, Jerzees, J4662-M, XXL, Qty - 2
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $16.60/ca $33.20
Optima Uniforms §$17.75/¢ea $35.50
Safety & Security International LLC $13.07/ea $26.14
Image Wear Uniforms $25.00

63. Sweatshirts, Jerzees, J4662-M, XXXL, Qty - 3
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $16.60/ea £49.80
Optima Uniforms $17.75/ea $53.25
Safety & Security International LLC $13.07/ea $30.21
Image Wear Uniforms $37.50

64. Sweatshirts, Jerzees, 4662-M, L, Qty- 3
Red the Uniform tailor, Inc ‘ $12.45/ea $37.35
Optima Uniforms $15.00.ca $45.00
Safety & Security International LLC § 9.50/ea $28.50
Image Wear Uniforms $31.29

65. Sweatshirts, Jerzees, 4662-M, XL, Qty - 2
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $12.45/ca $24.90
Optima Uniforms $15.00/ea $30.00
Safety & Security International LLC $ 9.50/ea $19.60
Image Wear Uniforms 320.86

66. Sweatshirts, Jerzees, 4662-M, XXL, Qty -5
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc Si5.40/ca $77.00
Optima Untforms $17.75/¢a $88.75
Safety & Security International LLC $12.21/ea $61.05
Image Wear Uniforms $62.50

Opt-Out: »

Opt-Out: Not Defined
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Fulton County Public Bid Opening
Bid: RFQ

T " Closs Date/Time:

1

4:00:00

Page: 1

Commodity Group
n

68.

69.

Code Cascription

1 Default Commodity Group

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc

Optima Uniforms

67. Sweatshirts, Jerzees, 4662-M, XXXL, Qty-4

Safety & Security International LLC

Image Wear Uniforms

Sweatshirts, Gildan, 12500, XL, Qty - 1

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc

Optima Uniforms

Safety & Security International LLC

Image Wear Uniforms

Sweatshirts, Gildan, 12500, XXL, Qty-7

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc

Optima Uniforms

Safety & Security International LLC

Image Wear Uniforms

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc

Optima Uniforms

- Sweatshirts, Gildan, 12500, XXXL, Qty - 6

Safety & Security International LLC

Image Wear Uniforms

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc

Optima Uniforms

. Sweatshirts, Gildan, 12500, XL, Qty - |

Safety & Security International LLC

Image Wear Uniforms

$15.40/ea
$17.75/ea
$12.21/ea

$21.90/ea
S i 9.75/563
$15.35/ea

$25.70/ea
$22 25/ea
$18.31/ea

$25.70/eq
$23.25/ea
S18.31/ea

$21.90/ea
$19.75/ea
$16.15/¢a

$61.60
$71.00
$48.84
$50.00

$21.90
319.75
$15.35
$17.95

$179.90
$155.75
$128.17
$133.00

$154.20
$139.50
$109.86
$114.00

$21.90
$19.75
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517.95
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72. Sweatshirts, Gildan 12500, XXL, Qty -5
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $25.70/ea £128.50
Optima Uniforms §22.25/ea S111.25
Safety & Security International LLC $19.12/ea § 95.60
Image Wear Uniforms $ 65.00

73. Sweatshirts, Gildan 12500, XXX, Qty - 7
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc £25.70/ea $179.90
Optima Uniforms $23.25/ea $162.75
Safety & Security [nternational LL.C $19.12/ea $133.84
Image Wear Uniforms $114.00

74, Caps, Anvil, AN158, Qty -4
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $7.45/ea $29.80
Optima Uniforms $7.00/ea $28.00
Safety & Security International LLC $8.34/ea $33.36
Image Wear Uniforms $ 6.35

75. Caps, Anvil, AN176, Qty - 3
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $7.45/ea $22.35
Optima Uniforms $6.75/¢ca $20.25
Safety & Security International LLC $8.45/¢a $25.35
Image Wear Uniforms S 6.25

76. Knit Cap, Yupoong, 1501, Qty - 4
Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc $2.10/ca  $ 840t
Optima Uniforms $7.25/ea $29.00
Safety & Security international LLC no bid no bid
Image Wear Uniforms $26.00
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