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BID TABULATION SHEET 
JANITORIAL SERVICES FOR FULTON COUNTY FACILITIES 

 
08ITB62261YC-BL 
DATE:  JULY 30, 2008             
Purchasing Agent:  William E. Long, Jr, CPPB, Chief Assistant Purchasing Agent  
TOTAL NUMBER OF BIDDERS:                

 
CONTRACTOR’S  NAME BID BOND 

YES/NO 
GROUP F - OFFICE 
NORTH 
 

GROUP G - SENIOR 
CITIZEN CENTERS  
 

GROUP G DAY 
PORTER 
 

American Facility Services  $93,600.00 $306,000.00 $458,952.00 
RiteWay Services  $90,709.08 $252,784.56 $379,406.58 
Tamk Enterprises  $54,156.00 No Bid $481,920.00 
Alpha Nursing Services, Inc.  $79,357.50 $234,298.70 $119,664.00 
Good Success Company  No Bid  $269,792.40 $352,153.00 
Dream Team Services, Inc.  $78,792.00 $151,600.00 No Bid 
Little Cleaning Services  No Bid $292,556.02 $395,982.15 
Nations Janitorial Services  $61,200.00 $32,400.00 No Bid 
A Action Incorporated  $97,005.40 $233,996.65 $426,047.40 

The bid amounts listed above have been read from the bid submittals for each vendor and have not been verified for accuracy.  The accuracy of the bid amounts are listed on the actual bid  
tabulation sheet.  


