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Introduction

This manual has been created as a guide to help you understand and direct you
through the On-line Bidding process. On-line Bidding is a procurement sourcing and
solicitation tool that enables purchasing agents to electronically send informal bid
opportunities via email. Fulton County requires that vendors are registered through the
Fulton County Vendor Self Service System before they can respond to a quote on-line.
On-line bidding then, in turn, allow registered vendors to electronically respond to the
bid opportunity. On-line bidding allows vendors to submit their responses in a secure
environment, allowing registered vendors to receive automatic email notifications while
permitting vendors to keep track of quote status throughout the process. Our desire is
that this manual will assist you with submitting your bid on-line.



HOW TO RESPOND

TO A QUOTE ON-LINE




Section 1
How to Respond to a Quote On-line

2 Welcome To Fulton County AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service: LOGIN - Microsoft Internet Explorer

File Edt ‘iew Favorites Tools  Help ﬂ.
\ A ) ; : Y

& Beck e - @ @ \'_lj pSearch . Favorites @ E:r__(:' = o] - J (18 ﬁ .‘3

Address @http:,1',1'Fultonvendorselfservice.co.Fultun.ga.us,lwebapijSSPRODJ’Advantage V| GU Liks ™ @ T @ Snaglt H &

Y7 - G ~ web Search [ Bookmarks~ [settings = | B mal = @y vahoo! - ‘ EJanswers ~ [fiGames ~ ] antipyr

: ‘Welcome To Fulkon County &M3...,

o Add Tah
£ 2 FULTON COUNTY, GA

|3

Welcome to Fulton County
Vendor Self Service System

The Fulton County Vendor Self-Service system enables vendors to register and maintain information about their organization for

the purpose of deing business with the County and receive notifications of business opportunities via the Internet,

Enter your User
Name here

Guests

resitored U Click on Register
.gManage fmy accourt REgiSter here |f yOU need tO
. Activate my sccount reglster

. Add my company
. Add my location to existing account
. Create Uszer D for existing account

Uzer Mame

Pazsuard

Public Access .

. Yiewr Posted Solicitations
.« Wiewr vencor to vendaor solictation comments

Click on Enter your
Login here Password
here

@ 53 Local intranet

18 yahoo! Mes,., = deparmertal,.. G windowsMe... | O On-line Eiddi,,, eTa .., ’(f. 11:01 AM

(1.0) LOG-IN

» Enter the following URL address:
http://fultonvendorselfservice.co.fulton.ga.us

» Registered vendors should enter User Name and Password,
and click on “Login”.

» If you are not a registered vendor, click on “Register” to
perform the registration process.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 1



Section 1
How to Respond to a Quote On-line

22 AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor, Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer

File Edit “ew Favorites Tools Help

@Back < L) @ @ \:h pSearch *Favurites @ Bv .‘; I.'V_J?I v I_J ﬂ

Address @http:,l',l'l?z.lﬁ.193‘192;’webapp;’VSSTEST,I’Advantage 3 Go | Links *
= FULTON CO[JNTY, GA Home  Help  Accessibility  Logoutjd
~

AMS ADVANTA Ca
Welcome to the Fulton County Vendor Self Service

System

This site is divided into the following areas:

q . Business Opportunities - Search through Fulton County's solicitations.
Click on Business susiess Spporumtes J Y

Op portun ities « My Bids - You may view, edit, or check the status of bids you have submitted.

« Account Maintenance - Gives you the opportunity to maintain your account information.

« Forms and Additional Information - Provides the most frequently requested forms for
vendor registration (e.g. W-9, BID General Terms & Conditions).

The links at the top will allow you to move between the main areas of our system.

|€

@ Done ® Internst

3 Fulton Caurty R AMS ADVANTAGE Ye... S L a0 | S &) 100 AN

(1.1) BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES

» Click on “Business Opportunities” to obtain a list of all quotes.

On-line Bidding for Quotes
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How to Respond to a Quote On-line

M AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer,

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help

N ( .. ; - i
eBack = -_d B @ (b pSearch “?/\{Favnr\tes @ E;?v o= Iy_;l - ﬂ
address | @] hitp:172.,16,193.192{webapp/¥35TEST Advantage

‘ULTON COUNTY, GA o A

v Go Links **

c=achrsolt  Business Opportunities

View Commodit'

help & advice
P Ienu

This section provides access to the information about the various business opportunities currently
available.

Search for Solicitations view and respond to Request For Quotes (RFQs)
through the standard solicitation process here. You cannot respond to Invitation To Bids
(ITBs) and Request for Proposals (RFPs) solicitation online. Click here to download ITBs

or RFPs from Fulton County's website.

Click on Search
for Solicitations

. View Com modity History Search our clatabase for information about our last

ten purchases of a given commodity.

Page Mavigations

° Internet

S g | D &)z

ADYANTAGE Ve, ..

(1.2) SEARCH FOR Solicitations

» Click “Search for Solicitations” to see a listing of Request for
Quotes (RFQs).

On-line Bidding for Quotes



Section 1
How to Respond to a Quote On-line

2 AMS ADVANTAGE Yendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer,
File

Edit “iew Favorites Tools  Help

@Back © -\_:/l @ @ \/_;j pSearch *Favorites @ Eggv .,,__\?_,. Iﬂ_f| < l_»J ﬁ

&] http:/f172. 16,193,192} webapp/YSSTEST)Advantage v B G Lnks ¥ @convert - [ Select

Address

Home Help Accessibility Logout

fitional Information

Forn

oportunities Wy Bids ount Maintenance

~ Business Opportunities

\Sw Search for Solicitations
iewy Commodity History

help & advice

heny

Allows you to search Fulton Caunty's anline solicitations. View and respond to Reguest Far Quotes (RFQ=) through the standard solicitaion
process here. Click here to download ITBs or RFPs frarm Fulton County's website. Ve provide an "On-Line Bidding For Guates Training
Manual” that will assistyou with submitting your bid an-line. Click here to download the manual. Fulton County currently does not use any
discounts; please disregard that sectian.

Under Solicitation column RFQ.... stands for Quotes Click on drop down
arrow here, and
select Open

Brovyze Clear

Commodities:l Status : | Open v
g Find
Departments : Avvarded

Closed

Open
Cancelled

Click on
B rowse here Solicitation Addendum

Description

v REE-230-09CTESS49Y A1 2 =) Purchazing C
RE@-230-09RH11111Y.8-3 2 Office Supplies Purchasing L
RF2-230-09RH1 2545y 8-2 1 Office furniture Purchasing L
RF3-181-09CTESFEOA-1 Paper copies Arts & Culture 1
RF G- 220-05R0ES5196-1 LEATHER, HIGH BACK CHAIRS, BLACK - INFORMATICON TECHMOLOGY  Information Technaloogy 1
RF&-230-09G5 0L INETRAIMING-B-1 Thizs Guote is for Training OMLY PLEASE DONOT GUOTE Purchazing )
RF&-320-08R0E55208-1 HP LASERJET P20550M PRIMTER - POLICE DEPARTMEMT Police 1
RF2-470-09RHESSS] &1 Breakroom Furniture Superior Court-Clerk 1
RFG-520-00-LIME-BIDDIMG-1 02-1 Exhaust Hozes for 12 morths. Genetal Services r
RF3-540-09RHESSS0Y A1 40 Yo Roll Off Containers Public Works B

Firqil =reey I I\Inﬂl | Hqil 2 b

& ® Internet

(1.3) SEARCHING FOR QUOTES BY STATUS

» Click on the Status drop down arrow button, and select “Open”,
then click on “Browse”.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 4



Section 1
How to Respond to a Quote On-line

3 AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer, z|
File Edit View Favorikes Tools  Help a’

@Back - J @ @ \/_h pSearch *Favontes @ D}_zv “*_\ﬁ l.'?_l—l < I_J ﬂ

address | €] http:f172.16.193, 192 fwebapp{¥S5TEST Advantage

FULTON COUNTY, GA Home  Help  Accessiniity  Logourhdl

v Go Links **

SearcchforSolic | g o qrch for Solicitations

View Commodit

help & advice | |,

Allows you to search Fulton County's online solicitations. View and respond to Request For
Quotes (RFQs) through the standard solicitaion process here. Click here to download ITEs or
RFPs from Fulton County’'s website.

Browse Clear

Commodities : | Status:[ ¥

Click on the

open Reqguest
P q Departments : |
for Quote
(RFQ) that yOU Solicitation Addendum Description
WISh tO v RFGQ-230-06-VENDOR-TRAIMNIMNG-1 This Quote is For YWendor Crientation Training Purpose
RFE-210-055C450581C-2 1 Meter Readers Uniforms 2005
respond tO RFQ-183-06-DJ-TRAIN-01-1 Orientation Solictation
REQ-270-0647241-BR-1 ||
RFQ-220-06-PLEASE TEST-002-1 Test to see if you can see the Solicitation Responses
RFQ-220-06-PLEASE TEST-001-2 1 Testto see if you can see the Solicitation Responses
RFQ-540-h2Y 106-1 Citizens University ©On-Line Quote demo
% < P AR TR e T A S S, 3
a # Internet

S g BT &) 103 a0

(1.4) SELECT QUOTE

» Select the quote that you desire to view. You can only respond to
guotes that have an “Open” status.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 5
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How to Respond to a Quote On-line

F Home Help Accessibility Logout

ditional Informeation

33 Opportunities My Bids ccount Maintenance  Forms and Ad

n King

ws Opportunities
el Suliin: Solicitation Details View

Wigwy Commadity Histor

help & advice

henu

Click Create Response to respond to Open Request For Guotes (RFQs). Click here to download ITBs and RFPs from Fulton County's websi- |

Questi and Ananers Bulletin Board Pre-Qualified Vendors Motice of Intent to Award Motice of Amard Public Bid Reading Auction Bids Addendum Histony

Create RESPOI‘ISE Please openfteview Attacliment prior to creating your response

Click here to
Create
Response

Salicitation DSROB4513E $ C“Ck here to
Salicitation: 03ROA4E138 Open

Solicitation Type: Request for Quotes Status: Awarded

Description: ANIMAL SERVICES EQUIPMENT-Department of Health & Wellness  Issued Date: 104242008 Attac h ment
Closing Date: 10/31/2008
Closing Time: 14:00
Time Leth: Expired

Requesting Office: Fulton County Phone: 904-730-1288

lzsuing Offica: Fulton County Phone: 404-7320-1262

Contzct Infor mation

Rodney Dority Phone: 404-612-5221
Email: mdney. dority@fultoncountyga.gow F ax: 4048931734

<

® Internet

(1.5) CREATE A RESPONSE

» Open and Review Attachment. The attachment contains detalil
information regarding the quote specifications.

» Then click on, “Create Response” to open the Response
Summary.

On-line Bidding for Quotes



Section 1
How to Respond to a Quote On-line

= AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer
File Edit View Favorites Tools Help 'E.

@Back =~ -J @ @ \’_h pSearch *Favorites @ &%v :\; |!)_.F| < I_J ﬁ

Links > @Convert = Select

Address | @] hktp:fj172.16, 193,192 webapp/SSTEST/Advantage M E

Home  Help  Accessibility  Logout

pportunities by Bids urt Mairtenance Forms an onal Information

SR - 230- ESR01281000000000014- 1- New- Draft

Step 2 Commodity Response

Step 3: Criteria Responses ~wSolicitation v
Document History Solicitation Summary Informeation
Document Reference T .
Future Triggerin Solicitation : 09RHT1111%A Addendum : 2
Solicitation Type : RFG Close Date : 12731010
Saolicitation Description © Office Supplies Close Time : 14:00
|s=uing Office © Purchasing Fhone : 404-612-4216
Reguesting Office : Purchasing Fhone : 404-612-5809
Buyer : Raodney Dority FPhone : 404-612-5821
Furchasing Fax: 404-893-1734
rodney. dority@fultoncountyga.gov Status - Open
PHo Bid
lick the "Mo Bid"link to the left if you do not wish to respond at this time, please set the Response Type MO BID' and
rovide & reason in the comment field
Top
[ save [ unde | attachwents | Submit [ Gy [ cioss ]
Menu
@ Done 0 Inkernet

(1.6) SOLICITATION SUMMARY

» Review the solicitation summary information.

» Please note: Solicitation Number, Solicitation Description,
Addendum, Close Date, Close Time and Buyer Contact
Information.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 7



Section 1
How to Respond to a Quote On-line

22 AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer,

File Edit view Favorites Tools Help

@Back 2 d @ @ \kh psaarch \:::{Favor\tes @ E’?<' :_\Tr" ET |_,J ﬂ

Address%@ Links ™ ﬁCUnvert - Select
FULTON COUNTY, GA Home  Help  Accessiilty  Logout

King L= bty Bidds  Account Maintenance  Forms and Addtional Infc

" Step 1: Response SUmMary
Solicitation Summary
[o Biie)
Step 2 Commodity Response:
Step 3: Criteria Responzes
Document History
Document Reference H .
Future Triggering CI|Ck Step 2.
Solicitation . 310
Solicitation Description Comm0d|ty oo

Izsuing Office H-612-5814

Requesting Office Response here H-612-5814
Buyer: f-612-5821

[-B93-1734

rodney.dority@fultoncountyga. ooy Status : Open

- =ho Bid
lick the "Mo Bid"link to the left if you do not wish to respond &t this time, please set the Response Type 'NO BID' and
rovide & reason in the comment field

Click here to apply this Response Type & Comments
Response Type : | Bid v to =il of the Commodity Lines. Tour requast may.
take 3 moment to process

Bid
Comments - [Alternate

[ save Y uno | Attachments | Submt | ey | Ciose ]

' Inkernet

] ¥ -
4 start s & 4 on-ine Bidding For ... | 0 Log of Daily Departm... | [B] Inbox - Microsoft Out... /3§ AMS ADVANTAGE Ye... & EWS,2 20

(1.7) COMMODITY RESPONSE

» If you want to respond to RFQ, click on “Step 2: Commodity
Response”.

» If you do not want to respond to RFQ at this time, please turn to
page 17, for instructions on how to respond as a No Bid for entire
quote.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 8



Section 1

How to Respond to a Quote On-line

=8 SUMMmar

oY clEe L Mespeinee sy )
~ Step 2 Commodity Responss SR - 230- ESR02141000000000037- 1- New- Draft

count Mairtenance

Forms and Additional Infarmation

Home Help Accessibility Logout

Commocty Information
Commadity Responze
Step 3: Criteria Responses

Click on

Commodity
Information
here

C

rwCommodity Information
Commoddity Information Summary

1
Group : of
1

1
Line : of

Line Type : Itern
Total Price

Group Description : Default Commodity Group

Commodity Specifications :

lity : 800
Boo

ity R

I
ommoddity detsils. Enter the Unit Pricg

Click on the
Attachment button
here if you want to

licable.

Click Next here to
move to next line
item.

—_ Meny

CIICk here to Reqguested Quantit.yi 24.0 SmeIt documents Wlth :|
expand Reguested Unit: EA
. Linit Price : ’— yOUI' response
Commodity R
elivery Days from Award
Response pa
workspace res M
[ save [  Undo [ Attachwents | Submi [ Copy [ Cloze )

(1.8) ENTERING RESPONSE

» Click on “Commodity Information” to display detail
specifications about line items.

» Click on “Commodity Response” to enter unit price, number
of delivery days.

» If you do not want to respond to line item(s), please turn to
page 17, for instructions on how to respond as No Bid for line

item(s).

» Click “Next” to display the next line item in the upper right
corner, if “Next” is underlined this indicates that the quote has
multiple lines, then repeat the above steps for each line item.

» Click on the Attachment button located at the bottom of the
screen if you would like to submit a document with your
response. Ex. Attachments (samples, references, certifications,
licenses and etc.)

» If you do not want to submit an attachment with your response,
please turn to page 15, and proceed with steps.

On-line Bidding for Quotes




Section 1
How to Respond to a Quote On-line

) AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer z|
File Edit ‘“ew Favorites Tools Help 'a'

@Back @ ‘J @ @ \’_h pSearch *Favorites @ E»Ev Li_\ﬁ [#] - I_J ﬁ
Address | @] http:/{172.16,193,192/webapp/¥SSTEST [Advantage v Eeo nks ¥ @gConvert - [ Select

FULTON COUNTY, GA o Accessibilly  Logout

Clenn King i Cpportunities:

hiy Bicls

Step 1. Response Summary.
" Step 2 Commodity Response Aﬂachments

Commacty Information
Commodity Response Meny
s
Document Histo F.’st Nmyp: Date | User ID | Primary State
Document Reference et Fre Headt La
Future Triggering
pload Download Delete Restore
Click on Upload i
Twpe : -
p o Description :
h ere Diate
UserlD:
Primary State :
Return to Document
Wiew Attachment History
@ Done 0 Irternet

E Inboi fion e ANTAGE Ye...

(1.9) ATTACHMENTS

» Click on “Upload”, to upload the document(s) you want to
attach to your response.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 10
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23 AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer

File Edit View Favorites Tools  Help

eBack 2 -J @ @ \/_:j pSearch *Favorites {‘3 Bv .{_; ET |_J ﬁ

Address | &) hetp://172.16.193. 192}webappfvSSTEST Advant age v GD Links »  @gConvert + [ Select
FlJLTON CO[JNTY, GA Home Help Accessibility Logout

-court Maintenance  Forms and Additionsl Information

enn King

Step 1: Response Summary:
~ Step 2 Commodity Response
|~ i8R & LOMMOGH, HESRONIS
Commacity Information Upload Attachment
Commodity Response
Sten 3: Critetia Responzes Upload Cancel

Document History

Document Reference Attachment File - | | Browse.. \]\I
i i P -

Future Triggering Deseription - I Cllck On

Aftachment Type : Browse here

Menu

& Dore  Internet

(1.10) UPLOAD ATTACHMENT

» Click on “Browse” to view the document(s) you want to upload.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 11



Section 1

How to Respond to a Quote On-line

Choose file

3

by Fecent
Documents

=
[

Dezktop

J

by Documents

98

My Computer

by M ebwark,
Flaces

L

Look in; |'==u-' TRAVELDRIVE [F:)

E
x|

~| « @&k E

Crulh

ILIAEP 2009

I-)Bonding and Insurance
@CONTRACTORS PERFORMAMNCE REPORT
IDATABASE

l,i'lHP' L1200 PCLG Driver

@INTERNAL PURCHASING FORMS

[C7)Java Downloads For All Operating Syskems - Sun Micrasystems_Files
Ihlogin_files

lﬂf‘-’lr. Maare

[y Office 2007

lji'l'-.-'ENDDR WORKSHOP TRAINING 2010_Files
E #OBITBE2305YE-BR.

] 1-2-75 D9RFP100YE-ER. ORGANIZATIONAL ASSESSMENT OF THE POLICE DE
05, 11,09

Click on
Open here

&) a
File name: || ﬂ
Files of type: |,-i‘-.|| Files [*.%] j Cancel

(1.11) CHOOSE FILE

» Choose the file(s) you want to attach to your response, then
click on “Open”.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 12
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AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer | X
File Edit View Favorites Tools Help ﬁ.
Qui- © 1 [ G P Foreone @3- 5% 8- UK
address FQ http:f{172.16.193, 192/ webapp{VSSTEST /Advantage v| Go  Liks > @gConvert + [ Select

Pop-ups temporatily allowed. To always allow pop-ups From this site, click here. .. x

Help Accessibility Logout

FULTON COUNTY, GA Home

King

ourt Maintenance  Forms and Additional Information

® You have 1 message. Click here to view the message.
Solicitation Summary:
| soictalonsunmare . pload Attachment

Sten 3 Commodie Response Menu

Upload Cancel

Attachment File : [F\1-2-78 D9RFP1 00VE-BR ORGANIZATIONAL ASSES [ Browse. |

Description |

Atachment Type | | Standard %

O Inkernet

(1.12) UPLOADED ATTACHMENT

» Click on “Upload” to upload the document you selected.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 13



Section 1
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23 AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer

File Edit View Favorites Tools  Help

@Back 2 -.J @ @ \/_:j pSearch *Favorites @ Bv .L_; ET |_J ﬁ

ﬂddress@http:,i,l’l?2.16‘193.192,l’webapp,l’VSSTEST,l’ndvantage v| EJco ks ® @gConvert - [PRSelect

Pop-ups tempararily allawed, To always allow pop-ups From this site, click here. ..

FULTON COUNTY, GA Home

Fo

»

Help Accessibility Logout

onal Information

| soetdonsuntery . Attachments

Step 2 Commodity Response Menu
T Step 3 Crilotia Responzes - -
i 3 Gl Tl e File Name Type Date | User ID | Primary State

Document History
Document Reference

Future Triggering First Prev Mext Last

~ 1-2-78 D9RFP100YE-BR ORGANIZATIONAL ASSESSMEMT OF THE POLICE DEPARTMENT #2 02 11 08.doc  Standard 24240 trainll  RMew

Upload Download Delete Restore

L 1-2-T8 D9RFR100YE-BR ORGANIZATIONAL ASSESSMENT OF THE POLICE
" DEPARTMEMT #2 02 11 09.doc

Type - 1
Date: 211210

File Name
Description :

User D train01
Prifmary State : 0 Click on Return
ye———— to Document
here.

) Internet
M2, 1000am

(1.13) LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

» In yellow is the list of documents that have been uploaded.

» To return to Commodity Response, click on “Return to
Document”.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 14



Section 1
How to Respond to a Quote On-line

FULTON COUNTY, GA ot Ay Lot

me |

Step 1: Response Sumimar:
+ Step 2 Commodiy Responze SR - 230- ESR02141000000000037- 1- New- Draft
Information

Commodity Response
Step 3: Criteria Responses First Prev Go To Nest Last
Document History r*Commodity Information
Document Reference Commacity Information Summary
Future Triggering

1 Line Type : Iterm

Group : '13f Tatal Frice :

Group Description : Default Commodity Group

1
Line : of
]

Commodity : 30024
Boots, Rubber, Safety Toe
Commadity Specifications

el lity Res|
Commodity detsilz. Enter the Unit Price &Delivery Days, Cortract Information, or Discount offerel . .
Requested Quantity : 25.00000 Reaponse Type | Bid Click Submit
Requested Unit : EA here
Unit Price I
camments :

Delivery Days from Award:l ‘

o /

[ save J  unde | Attachments | Submt [ Gy [ Close ]

Menu

(1.14) SUBMITTING RESPONSE

> After responding to all line items, click on “Submit” located at the
bottom of the screen.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 15



Section 1
How to Respond to a Quote On-line

2 AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer |Z|
L

File Edit ‘iew Favorites Tools  Help

eBack @ -\_;l @ @ \/_h pSearch ‘-iL{‘Favorites @ ﬁv .{_; Iy_'ﬂ v LJ ﬂ

fiddress | @] hitp: /172,16, 193, 192/webappNSSTEST/Advantags vige ks

-=_: FlJ LTON CO[JNTY, GA Home Help Accessibility Legout

= |5

o 1T PR L]~ @ You have 1 message. Click here to view the message.

seachiscle | pagnonse Submitted

View Commodit

help & advice
£ Ienu

Your response has been processed. Thank you.

Click any link to continue.

@ Done 0 Internet

73 A5 ADVANTAGE Ve .. A g | S &)

(1.15) RESULTS
» The Response Submitted screen is displayed.

» If your quote was submitted successfully without errors you will
ONLY have one (1) message.

» If you have more than one (1) message, please contact the
buyer for further assistance.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 16
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Section 2

How to Respond to a Quote or Line Item as No Bid

FULTON COUNTY, GA

g

Accessibility

hiy Bids  Account Maintenance  Forms and Additional Information

Step 1: Response SUMmary.

Solicitation Sumtnar

SR - 230- ESR0O2031000000000019- 1- New- Draft

o Bid

| Document History

Document Reference

Future Triggering

Click on “No
Bid” here

&

Step 2 Commadity Response
Step 3: Criteria Responses

-wSolicitation 1
Eolicitation Summsary Information
Solicitation : 09RH12345YA Addendurm 1
Solicitation Type - RFQ
Solicitation Description : Office furniture Cl|ck on Response
Issuing Office : Purchasing
Requesting Office : Purchasing Type drOp dOWﬂ
Buyer : Rodney Dari
’ e | arrow button here to
Furchasing )
weneyeorivg/ - Change Bid to No
i Bid here. _
Click the "Mo Bid"link to the lett if ynu% 0 BID' andd |
rovide & resson in the comment field
Click here t Ly thiz B T i i
Respaonse Type : | Mo Bid [4 tolacll ofe;aeoczl:npmodilts Lie::;r:fs:urvr?u CIICk Su bm It
take 3 momert to process h
ere
Bid
Comrents - [Alternate
o

[ sae unio Y atechmests [ Swms [ cepy [ cios= ]

(2.0) RESPONDING TO AN ENTIRE QUOTE AS NO BID

>

If you do not want to respond to an entire quote, click on
“No Bid”, to expand section. Then click on the Response
Type drop down arrow button and select “No Bid”.

In the Comments box, please provide your reason(s) for not
bidding on RFQ.

Then click on, “Click here to apply this Response Type and
Comments to all of the Commodity Lines. Your request
may take a moment to process”.

Clicking on the above underlined statement applies your
response type and comments to all of the commaodity lines for
the entire quote.

Then click “Submit”.

On-line Bidding for Quotes
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Section 2
How to Respond to a Quote or Line Item as No Bid

Click Next to
move to next
line item here

ULTON COUNTY, GA

ingy

1255 Opportuniies My Bids  Account Mairtenance  Farms and Additional Infor

SPONSE SUMMar
~ Step 2 Commodty Responze SR - 230- ESR0214 1000000000037 - 1- New- Draft
Commodity Information
Commodity Response
Step 3: Criteria Responses
Document History r*Commodity Information
Document Reference Commacity Information Summary
Future Triggering 1

First Prewv Go To Mext Last

Line Type : Iterm

Group : '131 Total Price :

Group Description : Default Commodity Group

1
Line : of
]

Commodity : 30024
Boots, Rubber, Safety Toe
Commadity Specifications

el lity Res|
Commodity detailz. Enter the Unit Price &Delivery Days, Cortract Information, or Discount offered as applicable.

Requested Quantity: 25.00000 Response Type -

Requested Unit : EA

Lnit Price
Delivery Days from Award :

comments

[ save J  unde | Attachments | Submt [ Gy [ Close ]

(2.1) RESPONDING TO LINE ITEMS AS NO BID

» If you do not want to respond to specific line item(s). For that line
item in the Commodity Response section, click the Response
Type drop down arrow button and select “No Bid”.

» Inthe Comments box, please provide your reason(s) for not
bidding on RFQ.

» Then click on “Next” to proceed to next line item.

»  After responding to all line items as a Bid or No Bid, please turn
back to page 9 and proceed with steps.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 18
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Section 3
How to Confirm Quote Acceptance

Home Help Accessibility Logout

0 ditional Information
@ You have 1 message. Click here to view the message.

Search for Solictations H
Wiewy Commodity Histary Response SmelttEd q

help & advice

hleny

Click on My Bids
here.

been processed. Thank you.

Click any link to continue.

O Inkernet

(3.0) MY BIDS

» To confirm quote acceptance, click on “My Bids”.

On-line Bidding for Quotes 19



Section 3
How to Confirm Quote Acceptance

£ Fl TON CO[JNTY, GA Home Help Accessibility Logout

= and Addtional Information

&ocount Maintenance  Fo

Glenn King
AMS ADVANTAGE

My Bids

Meny

Browse Clear

Response D | Solicitation : |

Created By I Closing Date |
Response Status v

Closing
Date

Created | Response | Response

Response 1D Solicitation

+ SR8 ESRO9Z20500000000417 4 ESRO9220800000000417  traind 0972272008  20083-TRANMNG-OLB-01  Closed 1203152008 1
SR 240FSR10020800000000457 4 ESR10020800000000457  traindd Drraft 100202008 O0SRDEZ9428 Closed 10032005 1
SR 18 ESR100205000000004591  ESRA0020500000000453  traindd Drraft 10022008 2008/0LB-TRAMMG-01  Closed 1203152008 1
SR.520 ESR10020800000000460,0  ESR10020800000000480  traindd Draft 10022008  2008-TRAMMNG-OLB-02 Closed 120312008 1
SR 18 FSR10020500000000461 1 ESRA0020500000000481  traindd Draft 10022008 2008-TRAMMNG-OLB-01  Closed 1203152008 1
SRA18ESR100708000000004741  ESR1007 0800000000474 traindd Drraft 10072008 2008-TRAMMG-OLE-01  Closed 12653152008 1
SR 18 ESR10070500000000475 1 ESRA0070S00000000475  traindd Drraft 10072008 2008-TRAMMNG-OLB-01  Closed 1203172008 1
SR.118ESR1003080000000047 91  ESR10050800000000479  traindd Draft 1002008 2008-TRAMMG-OLE-01  Closed 1203152008 1
SR 0FSR10090500000000492 1 ESRA0030500000000452  traindd Draft 100952008 ORCREH 02C Clozed 104052008 1
SR,310ESR100908000000004954  ESR10090800000000495 traindi Drraft 10/09/2008 OBCREH02C Closed 104052005 1

First Prew Mest Last .

Click on Last
here if 5
underlined v
| 3
.EI 0 Internet

(3.1) SUBMITTED BIDS

» A list of bids you responded to will be listed.

» To confirm your most recent response was accepted. Click on
“Last” to be directed to the last page.
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Section 3
How to Confirm Quote Acceptance

uuuuuu

uuuuuuu A NI LA £, LD 120, LPA AELEPP V3D ED 1 MUY Ly

TON COUNTY, GA Logout

1 HIRG

AMS ADVANTAGE

My Bids The Response
Status column is
located here

Browese Clear

] /[
Response D :| Salicitation :|
Created By:l Closing Date
Response Status

Closing | Cloging

Link To Regponse Response ID Solicitation | Status

~ BR2G0,ESRO2041 000000000020,1  ESRO2041000000000020  traind Accepted 020472010 0RHT111YA Open 1203102010 1400000
SR230, ESRO2041 000000000021 1 ESRO2041 000000000021 traindd Accepted 020472010 03RHI1111YA Open 120312010 1400000
First Prew Mext Last

(3.2) RESPONSE STATUS

» In the Response Status column it should show “Accepted”.
This is confirmation that your quote was submitted and
accepted.

» If the Response Status does not show, “Accepted”, please
contact the buyer who is the contact person for the RFQ.
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Section 4
Navigating Through the System

Home

Help Accessibility Logout

FULTON COUNTY, GA

me, trainone trainone B Ipportunities

My Bids  Accourt Maintenance  Forms and Additionsl Informstion

~ Business Opportunities wehsite,
Search for Solicitstions

iewy Commadty History

Browyze Clear
Commodities * | Status :
Depar‘tments 4.0 I 4.1 4.2
Solicitation Addendum Description
¥ RFO-S20-07RGSST146% A -1 Map Books - Atlants Metropaolitan Series
RFP-999-07SC57S03-YE-1 Cost Allocation Plan
RFP-999-07SCS7 51 6-YE-1 A-133 Single Audit Services
REB-220-07 MBS 3678-TR-1 Linu Erterprise Servers
RFB-320-07ITBSY 355 B-BR-1 F'0& ITE for High Performance, High Speed Pursuit Tires and
RFP-520-07RFPST454K-0u-4 3 Aszzet Management System Sudit RFP
RFB-520-07ITBSE006Y &-DRER-2 1 Locks, Door Hardware and Locksmith Services
RFE-330-07 CTSY 54681 Orffice Furniture
RFE-405-07RHS /8494 -1 DRUG TESTIMNG URINE CURS 2007 5 Panel W) THC ORI COC AMP A
RF2-330-07RDS/5108-2 1

[=

Firsti Previ Nex‘ti Lasti
< T

&) B Internet

|

4.0 Solicitations — This column list is where the quote number is listed.

4.1 Addendum - This column is used to keep track of revisions in the form of an
“Addendum” made to the quotes.

4.2 Description - This column is used to identify the quote and/or provide a brief
description of the quote.
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Section 4
Navigating Through the System

2 AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer
Fle Edit Yiew Favortes Tools Help "'I

@Back - \_/J @ @ h /ﬁ Seatch \t}i"\?Favorites @ [j;<v :’\', ] - _J 0! ﬁ :3

v B s > &~

Accessibility

Address |@ hittp:ff172.16,193, 192/ webapp/¥SSTEST/Advantage

FULTON COUNTY, GA N

Accourt Mairtenance  Forme and Additionsl Information

Help Logout

come, trainone trainone ities  hdy Bids

+ Business Opportunities
Search for Solictations ltl ons

“igw Commacity Histary

help & advice

Meny

unty's online solicitations. View and respond to Reguest For Quotes (RFQS) through the standard solicitaion process
Bs or RFPs from Fulton County's website.

| Find JEEER

Publizshed Closing | Clogsing | Prequalifieu
Date Time List ‘

2008 Online Bicding Training Adobe Software Courty Manager 011E82008 Cpen 1203102008 14:00:00

Thiz Buate iz for Training OKNLY PLEASE DOMOT GUOTE Purchasing 03142007 Cloged 120312007 1400:00 false

Addendum Desceription

Department

For Onling Training Purpose ONLYIPLEASE DO NOT QUOTE  Palice 031452007 Cloged 1203172007 1400:00 falze
Prirt, Reprographic & Mail Services Genetal Services 0853072007 Closed 10042007 11:00:00 falze
Medical Examiner 082972007 Cloged 100372007 11:00:00 falze
Traffice Signal Equipment Public Warks 032802007 Cloged 10032007 11:00:00 falze
Election day technicians for the 2005 Elections Redis & Elect 08/3002007 Cloged 090262007 11:00:00 falze
Emergency services  0D8/30/2007 Closed  09/26/2007 11:00:00 false
Tree Plarting Public Works 082772007 Closed 0902602007 11:00:00 false
Likrary 0552572007 Cloged 0902572007 11:00:00 false

4.3 Department - Identifies the user department requesting the service or
commaodity.

4.4 Published Date - Identifies the date that quotes are posted for public viewing and
response.

4.5 Status - Identifies if the quote is open or closed. Once a quote is closed no
responses can be accepted.

4.6 Closing Date - Identifies the last day that responses will be accepted.

4.7 Closing Time - Identifies the time for responses. No quote will be accepted after
the closing date and time has expired.

4.8 Prequalified List - Identifies if a prequalification is required. The word “true”
indicates prequalification is required, the word “false” indicates no prequalification
IS needed.
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Section 4
Navigating Through the System

E Yendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer

Fle Edit Yiew Favortes Tools Help :ﬂ'
@Back M ‘J @ @ \:h pSearch *Favorites @ D/r-‘q' "_\ﬁ" Iy_f| - l_J (v] M8 ﬁ .ﬁ
Address | ] http:{172, 16,193,192} webapp/¥SSTEST Advantage v ks ” @

Logout

+ Business Opportunities

ffm“ s Search for Solicitations
iew Commodity History

help & advice

Meny

Allowes you to search Fulton County's online solicitations. View and respond to Request For Quotes (RFQs) through the standard solicitaion process
here. Click here to download ITBs or RFPs fram Fulton County's website.

Browee Clear

Cammadities I Status:m_ 4.9
Departments | I

Solicitation Addendum Description Department. Pu:l:t::ed Status CI

v RFGE-118-2008/0L8-TRAINMG-01-1 2008 Online Bidding Training Adobe Software Courty Manager OTHE2008 Open 125

RFG-230-0MLINE TRAIMMG-07-1 This Guate is for Training OMLY PLEASE DONOT QUOTE Purchazing 034472007 Closed 125

RFG-320-OMLINE TRAIMMG-7-1 For Crline Training Purpose OMLY! PLEASE DO MOT QUCTE  Pdlice 031472007 Cloged 1282

RFP-520-07RFPSTF 7Y A-CC-1 Print, Reprographic: & Mail Services General Services 08/30/2007  Closed 101

RFB-340-07ITBSTESTC-BL-1 Mecdical Examiner 08/29/2007 Closed 10/

RFB-540-07TBS7ES3C-BL-1 Traffice Signal Equipment Public Works 0872972007 Closed 1010

RFB-265-07 5577 7oy C-AP1 Election day technicians for the 2008 Elections Regis & Elect 0873072007 Closed 097

RFB-333-07SCa77 74Y C-AP1 Emergency services  OSS02007 Clozed 0982

RFP-540-07RFPSTE19-4C-1 Tree Plarting Puslic: Yorks 082712007 Closed 094

RFB-650-07ITBS76546-BR-1 Likrary 08/25/2007 Closed 098
Fir | izt | Next | Last |

hd
| 3
@ ® Irtemet

4.9 Search for Quotes by Status — The System provides vendors an option to view
for Quotes that are Awarded, Closed, Opened, and/or Cancelled.
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Section 4
Navigating Through the System

23 AMS ADVANTAGE Yendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer
File Edit VYiew Favorites Toaols Help z'\

@Back - -J @ @ /;j pSearch *Favorites -&3 E/r:_(:' :\; I.V_;I - l_J ﬂ
address | @] http:f/172.16.193.192)webapp/VSSTEST/Advantage v EJeo  lnks ¥ SBgcomwert - [Select
FlJLTON CO[J—NTY’ GA Home Help Accessibility Logout

King usi i Ao haintenance arl nal Information

+ Business Opportunities
Seatch for Soiohstions Solicitation Details View

gy Commadity Histar

410 411 412 413

Clitn vicqc noaphas w ysopund to Open Request For QUows uy waop. wlich us spe uewinload ITBs and RFPs from Fulton County's websi
v v | A

Questi and Anawerz Bulletin Board Fre-Qualified Wendors Motice of Intent to Sward Motice of Auvard Public Bid Reading Auction Bids Addendum Histo
Create Response |

Please openfieview Attachment prior to creating your response =

4.14

Menu

Solicitation DIRHA1111% 4

Solicitation: 09RH11111A Amendment: 2

Solicitation Type: Request for Quotes Status: Open

Deseription: Office Supplies Izzued Date: 5972009
Clozing Date: 12/21/2010
Closing Time: 100
Time Left: 237 Days

Requesting Office: Purchasing Fhone: 404-612-5209

Izzuing Office: Purchazing Fhone: 404-612-4216

Cortact Inforrmation *

Rodney Dority Fhone: 404-612-5321
Email: rodney. darityi@fultoncountyga. gow Fasx: 404-893-1734

i<

4.10 Question and Answers — Allows you to ask questions and provide answers
directly to the Buyer.

4.11 Bulletin Board — Allows Vendors to communicate with other vendors.
4.12 Notice of Intent to Award - Informs vendors they are considered for award.

4.13 Notice of Award — Informs vendors that the Quote has been awarded and to
whom.

4.14 Addendum History — Keeps a history of all Addenda associated with Quote.

4.15 Create Response — Allows Vendors to respond to open Quotes.
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Section 4
Navigating Through the System

ANTAGE Yendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer.
File Edit View Favorites Tools Help a’

@Back @ -J @ @ \J_h pSearch *Favorites @ &2v “‘_\ﬁ I:ﬂ_}| = \_J ﬁ

Address @http:.f.l’l?Z.16.193.192,l’webapp,l’VSSTEST,l’Advantage A Go
i leLTON CO[JNTY, GA Home Help Accessibility Logout

Links > @Convert + [P0 Select

pportunities ds urt Maintenance  Forms and Additional Information

" Step 1: Response Summary
Solicitation Sumtmary SR - 230- ESRO1281000000000014- 1- New- Draft

- wSolicitation v
Solicitation Summary Information
Future Triggerin Solicitation : 09RHTT111YA Addendum ;2
Solicitation Type : RFQ Cloge Date : 1273110
Solicitation Description ; Office Supplies Cloge Time : 14:00
Issuing Office : Purchasing Fhone : 404-612-4216
Requesting Office : Purchasing Fhone : 404-612-5809
Buyer . Rodney Darity Fhone : 404-612-5821
Furchasing Fax: 404-893-1734
rodney. dorityE@fultoncountyya.goy Status . Open
PHo Bid

lick the "Mao Bid"link to the left if you do not wish to respond st this time, pleaze set the Response Type "N BID' and
provide a reazon in the comment field

[ save Y umo | Attackwents | Submt | py [ close ]

Menu

# Internet

4.16 Solicitation Summary — Provides summary information on the Quote (who,
what, when, and where).

4.17 No Bid — To be used if vendors wish to not bid on a particular line item or
Quote.
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Section 4
Navigating Through the System

COUNTY, GA o

ortunties

Help Accessibility Logout

by Bids  Account Maintenance  Forms & dlelitional Information

" Step 2 Commodity Response SK - 230- ESR0214 1000000000037 - 1- New- Draft

Commodity Information

Commodity Response
Step 3: Criteria Responses
Document History rwCommaodity Information
Document Reference Commodity Information Summary
Future Triggering 1

First Prew Go To Mext Last

Line Type : ltem

4.18 g Group:?f Total Price :

Group Description : Default Commodity Group

1
Line : of
]

Commaodity : 80024
Boots, Rubher, Safety Toe
Coammodity Specifications

wCommodity Resy
ommodity details. Enter the Unit Price &Delivery Days, Contract Information, or Discount offered as applicakle.

Reguested Quantity - 25.00000 Response Type ©

Feguested Lnit: EA
Unit Price I

Delivery Days from Avward I

Comments

[ save | undo Y attachwents | Submt | Copy  J  ciose ]

4.18 Commodity Information — Provides information on each item listed in the
Quote.

4.19 Commodity Response — Allows vendors to enter the Unit Price, Delivery b/c
Days, Contract Information, or Discount offered as applicable.
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Section 5
Miscellaneous Navigational Features

i AMS ADVANTAGE Vendor Self Service - Microsoft Internet Explorer

Sile  Edit View Favorites Tools  Help o

@Back 7 J @ @ \’_h pSearch ‘-‘?/r\\'g‘Famrites @ D}R' ; o] -~ \_J ﬁ

GD Links ® @~

Help  Accessibility

wdress (] hitp://172,16,193. 192 fwebapp/VSSTEST /Advartage

for Solicital
s Welcome to the Fulton County Vendor Self Service

System

This site is divided into the following areas:
« Business Opportunities - Search through Fulton County's solicitations.
« My Bids - You may view, edit, or check the status of bids you have submitted.

+ Account Maintenance - Gives you the opportunity to maintain your account information.

« Forms and Additional Information - Provides the most frequently requested forms for
vendor registration (e.g. W-9, BID General Terms & Conditions).

The links at the top will allow you to move between the main areas of our system.

@ Internet

@ on-ling bidding ov...

5.0 My Bids- This option is where vendors can select to view, edit, or
check the status of bids they have submitted. You can link to any of
the responses by clicking on the desired response link under the Link
to Response column. You will only be able to make changes to
responses that you created and have not previously been withdrawn.
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Section 5
Miscellaneous Navigational Features

5.1 My Bids Toolbar

r Edi T.Ilﬁa-:.'ﬁwen-tsT Submit ] r Copy T Cloze ]

= Edit-Changes the mode of a document from read-only to editable.

= Attachments- Allow you to upload and attach files created in other
applications (for example, Excel spreadsheets and Word documents),
to Advantage

» Withdraw- The user (Vendor) has chosen to withdraw a response.
For this to happen the response must have already been accepted,
the solicitation must be open.

» Copy - Used to create a new document from an exiting document of
the same document.

» Close- Closes the currently opened document. If any unsaved
changes have been  made to the document, you are prompted to
save their changes before the document is closed.
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Section 5
Miscellaneous Navigational Features

5.2 Solicitation Response Toolbar Features

r Save T Unda T.-flﬂachmﬁn-tsT Subrmif T copy T Cioze ]

= Save- You are required to explicitly save the changes to the database
by selecting the save option on the page.

» Undo - Restores an existing document to its last saved condition
during data entry.

= Attachments- Allow you to upload and attach files created in other
applications (for example, Excel spreadsheets and Word documents),
to Advantage

» Submit — Commits any updated/changes to the database if there are
no errors.

» Copy - Used to create a new document from an exiting document of
the same document.

» Close- Closes the currently opened document. If any unsaved
changes have been  made to the document, you are prompted to
save their changes before the document is closed.
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FREQUENTLY ASKED QUESTIONS (FAQ's)

Below are some FAQ’s:

Q: How do I get a User ID and Password?

A: You can create your User ID and Password through vendor registration.

Q: Can I view quotes without logging into the system?

A: Yes, by clicking on Public Access.

Q: Can I respond to a quote if I'm not a registered vendor?

A: No, only registered vendors can respond to quotes online.

Q: How do | respond to quotes online if | do not own a computer?

A: Local Libraries, Kiosk located in the lobby of the Department of Purchasing &
Contract Compliance

Q: How will I be notified of quotes?

A: You will be notified by email based upon quotes using the commodity code(s)
you selected during registration.

Q: How will I be notified if awarded?

A: Awarded vendor(s) will receive an email and purchase order.

Q: How can | view Notice of Award?

A: By clicking on Notice of Award on Solicitation Details View page.

Q: Can a quote be withdrawn?

A: Yes, prior to closing date and time.

Q: How can | change my unit price or contract amount after acceptance?

A: After quote has been accepted you can change your pricing by clicking on My
Bid and click on the response to be changed and click edit.

Q: How will I be notified of addendum?

A: There are two (2) ways you can be notified (1) Vendors will be notified by
email, if you have responded to quote. (2) If the commodity code is being
used that you selected during registration.

Q: If I need help, who will assist me?

A: You can call the person listed as the contact person for the quote.

Q: Can | submit a faxed quote instead of quoting on-line?

A: No, effective September 1, 2008, quotes will only be accepted on-line.
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FREQUENTLY ASKED QUESTIONS (FAQ's)

(Continued)

How will I know the total number of lines in the quote?
The Commodity Summary page will state the number of lines to be quoted.

How do | get to the next line in the quote?
Click, on Next in the upper right hand corner of the page.

Will my comments be viewed?
Yes, comments are viewed on the tabulation sheet.

Where can | get a copy of the tabulation sheet?
Tabulation sheets can be viewed or downloaded from the County’s website.

How can | change my quote once it has been accepted?

By clicking on My Bids and retrieving the original quote and clicking on Edit
and going to Step 2, Commodity Response page and make the necessary
changes.

zQ 20 20 20 20
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